
Bid #IND2122200B1 - Water Meters and Repair Parts

Creation Date   Dec 29, 2020 End Date Feb 10, 2021 2:00:00 PM EST

Start Date Jan 25, 2021 9:10:59 AM EST Awarded Date   Not Yet Awarded

Empire Pipe Orlando LLC $87,688.65    (34/34 items)

 Bid Contact  James Mathis  Address 40 Keyes Court
jmathis@empirepipe.com Sanford, FL 32773
Ph 877-295-2409   
Fax 407-295-2455

 Supplier Code VC0000108153
 Bid Notes   We understand the bid was a group bid. But there was only one group. This eliminates for full and complete

competitive bidding process. We are still submitting a bid and can provide quality AWWA approved water
meters that will meet Broward County's metering needs. As well as exceed your current meter standards.

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: We understand the bid was a group bid. But there
was only one group. This eliminates for full and complete competitive
bidding process. We are still submitting a bid and can provide quality
AWWA approved water meters that will meet Broward County's
metering needs. As well as exceed your current meter standards.

 Item #  Line Item Unit Price     Qty/Unit Total Price 

 IND2122200B1- Group 1: Meter, 5/8 Inch lead free brass positive $0.00     2200 / $0.00  
-01-01  displacement - First Offer each

Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: NO BID
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: NO BID

Model Name: NO BID
Part Number: NO BID
Delivery (Calendar Days): NO BID
Warranty Main Case (Years): NO BID

 IND2122200B1- Group 1: Meter, 3/4 Inch lead free brass positive $0.00     10 / each $0.00  
-01-02  displacement - First Offer

Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: NO BID
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: NO BID

Model Name: NO BID
Part Number: NO BID
Delivery (Calendar Days): NO BID
Warranty Main Case (Years): NO BID

 IND2122200B1- Group 1: Meter, 1 Inch lead free brass positive $0.00     150 / each $0.00  
-01-03  displacement - First Offer

Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: NO BID
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: NO BID

Model Name: NO BID
Part Number: NO BID
Delivery (Calendar Days): NO BID
Warranty Main Case (Years): NO BID

 IND2122200B1- Group 1: Meter, 1 1/2 Inch lead free brass flanged ends $0.00     15 / each $0.00  
-01-04  positive displacement with test p - First Offer

Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: NO BID
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: NO BID

Model Name: NO BID
Part Number: NO BID
Delivery (Calendar Days): NO BID
Warranty Main Case (Years): NO BID

 IND2122200B1- Group 1: Meter, 2 Inch lead free brass flanged ends $0.00      15 / each $0.00  
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-01-05  I positive displacement with test port - First Offer I I 
Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: NO BID
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: NO BID

Model Name: NO BID
Part Number: NO BID
Delivery (Calendar Days): NO BID
Warranty Main Case (Years): NO BID

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter, 5/8 Inch lead free brass multi-jet - First $43.50  

I 
   1 / each

-01-06  Offer I 
$43.50  

Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: B12-A11A030101A1
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: MASTER METER

Model Name: B12
Part Number: B12-A11A030101A1
Delivery (Calendar Days): 45 DAYS
Warranty Main Case (Years): 2/25 YEARS
Accuracy Warranty 20 years. 

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter, 1 Inch lead free brass multi-jet - First $75.25      1 / each

-01-07  Offer I I 
$75.25  

Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: B16-A11A030101A1
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: MASTER METER

Model Name: B16
Part Number: B16-A11A030101A1
Delivery (Calendar Days): 45 DAY
Warranty Main Case (Years): 2/25 YEARS
Accuracy Warranty 20 years. 

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter, 1 1/2 Inch lead free brass flanged ends $268.35      100 / each $26,835.00  

-01-08  multi-jet with a test port - First Offer I I 
Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: M21-A00A030101A1
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: MASTER METER

Model Name: M21
Part Number: M21-A00A030101A1
Delivery (Calendar Days): 45 DAYS
Warranty Main Case (Years): 2/25 YEARS
Accuracy Warranty 20 years. 
NO TEST PORTS. 
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 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter, 2 Inch lead free brass flanged ends $358.95      100 / each $35,895.00  

-01-09  multi-jet with a test port - First Offer I I 
Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: M23-A00A030101A1
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: MASTER METER

Model Name: M23
Part Number: M23-A00A030101A1
Delivery (Calendar Days): 45 DAYS
Warranty Main Case (Years): 2/25 YEARS
Accuracy Warranty 20 years. 
NO TEST PORTS. 

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter, 3 Inch lead free brass hydrant meter $0.00      15 / each $0.00  

-01-10  with hydrant couplings turbine - First Offer I I 
Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: NO BID
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: NO BID

Model Name: NO BID
Part Number: NO BID
Delivery (Calendar Days): NO BID
Warranty Main Case (Years): NO BID

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter, 3 Inch lead free brass turbine with bolt- $1,301.80      1 / each

-01-11  on strainer and test port - First Offer I I 
$1,301.80  

Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: T32-A2A030101A1
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: MASTER METER

Model Name: T32
Part Number: T32-A2A030101A1
Delivery (Calendar Days): 60 DAYS
Warranty Main Case (Years): 2/1 YEAR
TEST PORT NOT PER SPEC. 

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter, 4 Inch lead free brass turbine with bolt- $1,680.00      1 / each $1,680.00  

-01-12  on strainer and test port - First Offer I I 
Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: T33-A2A030101A1
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: MASTER METER

Model Name: T33
Part Number: T33-A2A030101A1
Delivery (Calendar Days): 60 DAYS
Warranty Main Case (Years): 2/1 YEAR
TEST PORT NOT PER SPEC. 

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter, 6 Inch lead free brass turbine with bolt - $2,665.00      1 / each $2,665.00  

-01-13  on strainer and test port - First Offer I I 
Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: T34-A2A030101A1
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: MASTER METER
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Model Name: T34
Part Number: T34-A2A030101A1
Delivery (Calendar Days): 60 DAYS
Warranty Main Case (Years): 2/1 YEAR
TEST PORT NOT PER SPEC. 

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter, 8 Inch lead free brass turbine with bolt- $3,965.00  

I 
   1 / each $3,965.00  

-01-14  on strainer and test port - First Offer I 
Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: T35-A2A030101A1
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: MASTER METER

Model Name: T35
Part Number: T35-A2A030101A1
Delivery (Calendar Days): 60 DAYS
Warranty Main Case (Years): 2/1 YEAR
TEST PORT NOT PER SPEC. 

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter, 10 Inch lead free brass turbine with bolt- $4,347.00      1 / each $4,347.00  

-01-15  on strainer and test port - First Offer I I 
Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: W36-E5A080101A1
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: MASTER METER

Model Name: W36
Part Number: W36-E5A080101A1
Delivery (Calendar Days): 60 DAYS
Warranty Main Case (Years): 2/1 YEAR
NO TEST PORT. 

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter Reclaimed, 5/8 Inch lead free brass $44.50  

I 
   10 / each $445.00  

-01-16  multi-jet - First Offer I 
Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: B12-A11F030101A1
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: MASTER METER

Model Name: B12
Part Number: B12-A11F030101A1
Delivery (Calendar Days): 60 DAYS
Warranty Main Case (Years): 2/25 YEAR

Accuracy Warranty 20 years. 

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter Reclaimed, 3/4 Inch lead free brass $44.50  

I 
   1 / each $44.50  

-01-17  multi-jet - First Offer I 
Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: B13-A11F030101A1
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: MASTER METER

Model Name: B13
Part Number: B13-A11F030101A1
Delivery (Calendar Days): 60 DAYS
Warranty Main Case (Years): 2/25 YEAR

Accuracy Warranty 20 years. 
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 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter Reclaimed, 1 Inch lead free brass multi- $76.25      2 / each $152.50  

-01-18  jet meter - First Offer I I 
Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: B16-A11F030101A1
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: MASTER METER

Model Name: B16
Part Number: B12-A11F030101A1
Delivery (Calendar Days): 60 DAYS
Warranty Main Case (Years): 2/25 YEAR

Accuracy Warranty 20 years. 

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter Reclaimed, 1 1/2 Inch lead free brass $268.35      1 / each $268.35  

-01-19  flanged ends multi-jet with test por - First Offer I I 
Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: M21-A00F030101A1
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: MASTER METER

Model Name: M23
Part Number: M21-A00F030101A1
Delivery (Calendar Days): 60 DAYS
Warranty Main Case (Years): 2/25 YEAR

Accuracy Warranty 20 years. 
No Test Port. 

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter Reclaimed, 2 Inch lead free brass flanged $358.95      1 / each $358.95  

-01-20  ends multi-jet with test port - First Offer I I 
Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: M23-A00F030101A1
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: MASTER METER

Model Name: M23
Part Number: M23-A00F030101A1
Delivery (Calendar Days): 60 DAYS
Warranty Main Case (Years): 2/25 YEAR

Accuracy Warranty 20 years. 
No Test Port. 

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter Reclaimed, 3 Inch lead free brass turbine $1,301.80  

I 
   1 / each $1,301.80  

-01-21  with bolt-on strainer and test p - First Offer I 
Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: T32-A2F030101A1
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: MASTER METER

Model Name: T32
Part Number: T32-A2F030101A1
Delivery (Calendar Days): 60DAYS
Warranty Main Case (Years): 2/1 YEAR
TEST PORT NOT PER SPEC. 

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter Reclaimed, 4 Inch lead free brass turbine $1,680.00      1 / each $1,680.00  

-01-22  with bolt-on strainer & test por - First Offer I I 
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Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: T33-A2F030101A1
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: MASTER METER

Model Name: T33
Part Number: T33-A2F030101A1
Delivery (Calendar Days): 60 DAYS
Warranty Main Case (Years): 2/1 YEAR
TEST PORT NOT PER SPEC. 

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter Reclaimed, 6 Inch lead free brass turbine $2,665.00      1 / each $2,665.00  

-01-23  with bolt-on strainer & test por - First Offer I I 
Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: T34-A2F030101A1
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: MASTER METER

Model Name: T34
Part Number: T34-A2F030101A1
Delivery (Calendar Days): 60 DAYS
Warranty Main Case (Years): 2/1 YEAR

TEST PORT NOT PER SPEC. 

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter Reclaimed, 8 Inch lead free brass turbine $3,965.00      1 / each $3,965.00  

-01-24  with bolt-on strainer & test por - First Offer I I 
Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: T35-A2F030101A1
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: MASTER METER

Model Name: T35
Part Number: T35-A2F030101A1
Delivery (Calendar Days): 60 DAYS
Warranty Main Case (Years): 2/1 YEAR

TEST PORT NOT PER SPEC. 

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter Fire Service, 10 Inch X 2 Inch lead free $0.00      1 / each $0.00  

-01-25  brass with test port - First Offer I I 
Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: ALTERNATE
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: ALTERNATE

Model Name: ALTERNATE
Part Number: ALTERNATE
Delivery (Calendar Days): ALTERNATE
Warranty Main Case (Years): ALTERNATE

I Alt 1 $8,500.00  I    1 / each I $8,500.00  

Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: O307-E1D09
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: MASTER METER

Model Name: O307 OCTAVE
Part Number: O307-E1D09
Delivery (Calendar Days): 45 DAYS
Warranty Main Case (Years): 10 YEARS

10 YEAR ACCURACY WARRANTY, FM/UL APPROVED 
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 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter Fire Service, 8 Inch X 2 Inch lead free $0.00      1 / each $0.00  

-01-26  brass with test port - First Offer I I 
Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: Alternate
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: Alternate

Model Name: Alternate
Part Number: Alternate
Delivery (Calendar Days): Alternate
Warranty Main Case (Years): Alternate

I Alt 1 $6,450.00  I    1 / each I $6,450.00  

Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: O306-M1D09
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: MASTER METER

Model Name: O306 OCTAVE
Part Number: O306-M1D09
Delivery (Calendar Days): 45 DAYS
Warranty Main Case (Years): 10 YEARS

10 YEAR ACCURACY WARRANTY, FM/UL APPROVED 

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter Fire Service, 6 Inch X 2 Inch lead free $0.00      1 / each $0.00  

-01-27  brass with test port - First Offer I I 
Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: Alternate
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: Alternate

Model Name: Alternate
Part Number: Alternate
Delivery (Calendar Days): Alternate
Warranty Main Case (Years): Alternate

I Alt 1 $4,700.00  I    1 / each I $4,700.00  

Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: O305-M1D09
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: MASTER METER

Model Name: O305 OCTAVE
Part Number: O305-M1D09
Delivery (Calendar Days): 45 DAYS 
Warranty Main Case (Years): 10 YEARS

10 YEAR ACCURACY WARRANTY, FM/UL APPROVED 

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter Fire Service, 4 Inch X 1 1/2 Inch lead free $0.00      1 / each $0.00  

-01-28  brass with test port - First Offer I I 
Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: Alternate
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: Alternate

Model Name: Alternate
Part Number: Alternate
Delivery (Calendar Days): Alternate
Warranty Main Case (Years): Alternate

I Alt 1 $2,454.00  I    1 / each I $2,454.00  

Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: O304-M1D09
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: MASTER METER

Model Name: O304 OCTAVE
Part Number: O304-M1D09
Delivery (Calendar Days): 45 DAYS
Warranty Main Case (Years): 10 YEARS

10 YEAR ACCURACY WARRANTY, FM/UL APPROVED 

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter Fire Service, 3 Inch X 1 Inch lead free $0.00      1 / each $0.00  

-01-29  brass with test port - First Offer I I 
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Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: Alternate
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: Alternate

Model Name: Alternate
Part Number: Alternate
Delivery (Calendar Days): Alternate
Warranty Main Case (Years): Alternate

  I Alt 1 $2,070.00  I    1 / each I $2,070.00  

Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: O303-M1D09
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: MASTER METER

Model Name: O303 OCTAVE
Part Number: O303-M1D09
Delivery (Calendar Days): 45 DAYS
Warranty Main Case (Years): 10 YEARS

10 YEAR ACCURACY WARRANTY, FM/UL APPROVED 

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter Residential Fire Service, 2 Inch lead free $0.00  

I 
   1 / each

I 
$0.00  

-01-30  brass multi-jet - First Offer

Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: NO BID
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: NO BID

Model Name: NO BID
Part Number: NO BID
Delivery (Calendar Days): NO BID
Warranty Main Case (Years): NO BID

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter Residential Fire Service, 1 1/2 Inch lead $0.00      1 / each $0.00  

-01-31  free brass multi-jet - First Offer I I 
Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: NO BID
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: NO BID

Model Name: NO BID
Part Number: NO BID
Delivery (Calendar Days): NO BID
Warranty Main Case (Years): NO BID

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter Residential Fire Service, 1 Inch lead free $0.00      1 / each $0.00  

-01-32  brass multi-jet - First Offer I I 
Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: NO BID
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: NO BID

Model Name: NO BID
Part Number: NO BID
Delivery (Calendar Days): NO BID
Warranty Main Case (Years): NO BID

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter residential Fire Service, 5/8 Inch lead free $0.00      1 / each $0.00  

-01-33  brass positive displacement - First Offer I I 
Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: NO BID
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: NO BID

Model Name: NO BID
Part Number: NO BID
Delivery (Calendar Days): NO BID
Warranty Main Case (Years): NO BID

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Discount off of list price - $5,000 - First Offer 42.00%      1 / contract 42.00%  

-01-34  I I 
Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Delivery (Calendar Days): 60 DAYS

Warranty (Years): VARIES

  Lot Total: $87,688.65  

Fortiline, Inc. $256,735.90    (34/34 items)

 Bid Contact Julie Cline  Address 7025 Northwinds Drive, NW
jordan.mccall@fortiline.com Concord, NC 28027
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Ph 704-788-9813   
Fax 813-626-7773

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

 Item #  Line Item Unit Price     Qty/Unit Total Price 

 IND2122200B1- Group 1: Meter, 5/8 Inch lead free brass positive $39.95     2200 / $87,890.00  
-01-01  displacement - First Offer each

Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: Zenner

Model Name: ZPD
Part Number: PPD02
Delivery (Calendar Days): 30 days ARO
Warranty Main Case (Years): 25 yrs

 IND2122200B1- Group 1: Meter, 3/4 Inch lead free brass positive $67.00     10 / each $670.00  
-01-02  displacement - First Offer

Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: Zenner

Model Name: ZPD
Part Number: PPD04
Delivery (Calendar Days): 30 days ARO
Warranty Main Case (Years): 25 yrs

 IND2122200B1- Group 1: Meter, 1 Inch lead free brass positive $93.65     150 / each $14,047.50  
-01-03  displacement - First Offer

Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: Zenner

Model Name: ZPD
Part Number: PPD07
Delivery (Calendar Days): 30 days ARO
Warranty Main Case (Years): 25 yrs

 IND2122200B1- Group 1: Meter, 1 1/2 Inch lead free brass flanged ends $275.00     15 / each $4,125.00  
-01-04  positive displacement with test p - First Offer

Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: Zenner

Model Name: ZPD
Part Number: PPD09
Delivery (Calendar Days): 30 days ARO
Warranty Main Case (Years): 25 yrs

 IND2122200B1- Group 1: Meter, 2 Inch lead free brass flanged ends $364.50     15 / each $5,467.50  
-01-05  positive displacement with test port - First Offer

Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: Zenner

Model Name: ZPD 
Part Number: PPD12
Delivery (Calendar Days): 30 days ARO
Warranty Main Case (Years): 25 yrs 

 IND2122200B1- Group 1: Meter, 5/8 Inch lead free brass multi-jet - First $40.95     1 / each $40.95  
-01-06  Offer

Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: Zenner

Model Name: PMN
Part Number: PMN02
Delivery (Calendar Days): 30 days ARO
Warranty Main Case (Years): 25 yrs

 IND2122200B1- Group 1: Meter, 1 Inch lead free brass multi-jet - First $93.65     1 / each $93.65  
-01-07  Offer

Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: Zenner

Model Name: PMN
Part Number: PMN07
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Delivery (Calendar Days): 30 days ARO
Warranty Main Case (Years): 25 yrs

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter, 1 1/2 Inch lead free brass flanged ends $225.00  

I 
   100 / each

I 
$22,500.00  

-01-08  multi-jet with a test port - First Offer

Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: Zenner

Model Name: PMN
Part Number: PMN09
Delivery (Calendar Days): 30 days ARO
Warranty Main Case (Years): 25 yrs

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter, 2 Inch lead free brass flanged ends $285.00  

I 
   100 / each $28,500.00  

-01-09  multi-jet with a test port - First Offer I 
Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: Zenner

Model Name: PMN
Part Number: PMN12
Delivery (Calendar Days): 30 days ARO
Warranty Main Case (Years): 25 yrs

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter, 3 Inch lead free brass hydrant meter $1,950.00      15 / each $29,250.00  

-01-10  with hydrant couplings turbine - First Offer I I 
Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: Zenner

Model Name: 3
Part Number: PHD305-RP
Delivery (Calendar Days): 30 days ARO
Warranty Main Case (Years): 25 yrs

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter, 3 Inch lead free brass turbine with bolt- $1,000.00      1 / each $1,000.00  

-01-11  on strainer and test port - First Offer I I 
Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: Zenner

Model Name: ZTBM w/ strainer
Part Number: PMTB03
Delivery (Calendar Days): 30 days ARO
Warranty Main Case (Years): 25 yrs

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter, 4 Inch lead free brass turbine with bolt- $1,550.00  

I 
   1 / each

I 
$1,550.00  

-01-12  on strainer and test port - First Offer

Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: Zenner

Model Name: ZTBM w/ strainer
Part Number: 4
Delivery (Calendar Days): 30 days ARO
Warranty Main Case (Years): 25 yrs

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter, 6 Inch lead free brass turbine with bolt - $2,580.00  

I 
   1 / each

I 
$2,580.00  

-01-13  on strainer and test port - First Offer

Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: Zenner

Model Name: 6
Part Number: PMTB06
Delivery (Calendar Days): 30 days ARO
Warranty Main Case (Years): 25 yrs

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter, 8 Inch lead free brass turbine with bolt- $3,850.00      1 / each $3,850.00  

-01-14  on strainer and test port - First Offer I I 
Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: Zenner

Model Name: 8
Part Number: PMTB08
Delivery (Calendar Days): 30 days ARO
Warranty Main Case (Years): 25 yrs

 IND2122200B1- I Group 1: Meter, 10 Inch lead free brass turbine with bolt- $2,400.00  I    1 / each I $2,400.00  
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-01-15  on strainer and test port - First Offer

Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: Zenner

Model Name: 10
Part Number: PMTB10
Delivery (Calendar Days): 30 days ARO
Warranty Main Case (Years): 25 yrs

 IND2122200B1-
-01-16  I 

Group 1: Meter Reclaimed, 5/8 Inch lead free brass $43.00      10 / each $430.00  
multi-jet - First Offer I I 

Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: Zenner

Model Name: PMN
Part Number: PMNR02
Delivery (Calendar Days): 30 days ARO
Warranty Main Case (Years): 25 yrs

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter Reclaimed, 3/4 Inch lead free brass $69.00      1 / each $69.00  

-01-17  multi-jet - First Offer I I 
Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: Zenner

Model Name: PMN
Part Number: PMNR04
Delivery (Calendar Days): 30 days ARO
Warranty Main Case (Years): 25 yrs

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter Reclaimed, 1 Inch lead free brass multi- $95.65      2 / each $191.30  

-01-18  jet meter - First Offer I I 
Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: Zenner

Model Name: PMN
Part Number: PMNR07
Delivery (Calendar Days): 30 days ARO
Warranty Main Case (Years): 25 yrs

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter Reclaimed, 1 1/2 Inch lead free brass $228.00      1 / each $228.00  

-01-19  flanged ends multi-jet with test por - First Offer I I 
Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: Zenner

Model Name: PMN
Part Number: PMNR09
Delivery (Calendar Days): 30 days ARO
Warranty Main Case (Years): 25 yrs

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter Reclaimed, 2 Inch lead free brass flanged $288.00      1 / each $288.00  

-01-20  ends multi-jet with test port - First Offer I I 
Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: Zenner

Model Name: PMN
Part Number: PMNR12
Delivery (Calendar Days): 30 days ARO
Warranty Main Case (Years): 25 yrs

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter Reclaimed, 3 Inch lead free brass turbine $1,005.00  

I 
   1 / each

I 
$1,005.00  

-01-21  with bolt-on strainer and test p - First Offer

Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: Zenner

Model Name: ZTBM w/ strainer
Part Number: PMBTR03
Delivery (Calendar Days): 30 days ARO
Warranty Main Case (Years): 25 yrs

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter Reclaimed, 4 Inch lead free brass turbine $1,555.00      1 / each $1,555.00  

-01-22  with bolt-on strainer & test por - First Offer I I 
Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: Zenner
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Model Name: ZTBM w/ strainer
Part Number: PMTBR04
Delivery (Calendar Days): 30 days ARO
Warranty Main Case (Years): 25 yrs

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter Reclaimed, 6 Inch lead free brass turbine $2,585.00      1 / each $2,585.00  

-01-23  with bolt-on strainer & test por - First Offer I I 
Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: Zenner

Model Name: 6
Part Number: PMBTR06
Delivery (Calendar Days): 30 days ARO
Warranty Main Case (Years): 25 yrs

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter Reclaimed, 8 Inch lead free brass turbine $3,855.00  

I 
   1 / each

I 
$3,855.00  

-01-24  with bolt-on strainer & test por - First Offer

Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: Zenner

Model Name: 8
Part Number: PMBTR08
Delivery (Calendar Days): 30 days ARO
Warranty Main Case (Years): 25 yrs

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter Fire Service, 10 Inch X 2 Inch lead free $13,500.00      1 / each $13,500.00  

-01-25  brass with test port - First Offer I I 
Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: Zenner

Model Name: PFS010X4
Part Number: 10
Delivery (Calendar Days): 30 days ARO
Warranty Main Case (Years): 25 yrs

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter Fire Service, 8 Inch X 2 Inch lead free $11,250.00      1 / each $11,250.00  

-01-26  brass with test port - First Offer I I 
Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: Zenner

Model Name: PFS08x4
Part Number: 8
Delivery (Calendar Days): 30 days ARO
Warranty Main Case (Years): 25 yrs

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter Fire Service, 6 Inch X 2 Inch lead free $8,900.00      1 / each $8,900.00  

-01-27  brass with test port - First Offer I I 
Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: Zenner

Model Name: PFS06X2
Part Number: 6
Delivery (Calendar Days): 30 days ARO
Warranty Main Case (Years): 25 yrs

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter Fire Service, 4 Inch X 1 1/2 Inch lead free $5,800.00      1 / each $5,800.00  

-01-28  brass with test port - First Offer I I 
Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: Zenner

Model Name: PFS04X2
Part Number: 4
Delivery (Calendar Days): 30 days ARO
Warranty Main Case (Years): 25 yrs

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter Fire Service, 3 Inch X 1 Inch lead free $2,200.00  

I 
   1 / each $2,200.00  

-01-29  brass with test port - First Offer I 
Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: Zenner

Model Name: PMC
Part Number: 3
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Delivery (Calendar Days): 30 days ARO
Warranty Main Case (Years): 25 yrs

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter Residential Fire Service, 2 Inch lead free $325.00  

I 
   1 / each $325.00  

-01-30  brass multi-jet - First Offer I 
Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: Zenner

Model Name: PMN12
Part Number: 2
Delivery (Calendar Days): 30 days ARO
Warranty Main Case (Years): 25 yrs

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter Residential Fire Service, 1 1/2 Inch lead $275.00      1 / each $275.00  

-01-31  free brass multi-jet - First Offer I I 
Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: Zenner

Model Name: PMF09
Part Number: 1-1/2
Delivery (Calendar Days): 30 days ARO
Warranty Main Case (Years): 25 yrs

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter Residential Fire Service, 1 Inch lead free $190.00  

I 
   1 / each $190.00  

-01-32  brass multi-jet - First Offer I 
Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: Zenner

Model Name: PMF07
Part Number: 1
Delivery (Calendar Days): 30 days ARO
Warranty Main Case (Years): 25 yrs

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter residential Fire Service, 5/8 Inch lead free $125.00      1 / each $125.00  

-01-33  brass positive displacement - First Offer I I 
Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: Zenner

Model Name: PMF03
Part Number: 3/4 SL PMF/ZMF
Delivery (Calendar Days): 30 days ARO
Warranty Main Case (Years): 25 yrs

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Discount off of list price - $5,000 - First Offer 20.00%  

I 
   1 / contract 20. 0%  

-01-34  I 
0

Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Delivery (Calendar Days): 10-30 days

Warranty (Years): 1

  Lot Total: $256,735.90  

Core & Main $60,247.13    (14/34 items)

 Bid Contact Susan Reed  Address 590 Ferguson Drive
susan.reed@coreandmain.com Orlando, FL 32805
Ph 407-383-7008   
Fax 321-482-5057

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

 Item #  Line Item Unit Price     Qty/Unit Total Price 

 IND2122200B1- Group 1: Meter, 5/8 Inch lead free brass positive $0.00     2200 / $0.00  
-01-01  displacement - First Offer each

Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: no bid

Model Name: no bid
Part Number: no bid
Delivery (Calendar Days): no bid
Warranty Main Case (Years): no bid

I I 
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 IND2122200B1-

I 
  Group 1: Meter, 3/4 Inch lead free brass positive No Bids  

-01-02  displacement  I 
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes:

 IND2122200B1-

I 
  Group 1: Meter, 1 Inch lead free brass positive No Bids  

-01-03  displacement  I 
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes:

 IND2122200B1-

I 
  Group 1: Meter, 1 1/2 Inch lead free brass flanged ends No Bids  

-01-04  positive displacement with test p  I 
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes:

 IND2122200B1-

I 
  Group 1: Meter, 2 Inch lead free brass flanged ends No Bids  

-01-05  positive displacement with test port  I 
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes:

 IND2122200B1-

I 
  Group 1: Meter, 5/8 Inch lead free brass multi-jet 

I 
No Bids  

-01-06 

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:

 IND2122200B1-

I 
  Group 1: Meter, 1 Inch lead free brass multi-jet  No Bids  

-01-07  I 
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes:

 IND2122200B1-

I 
  Group 1: Meter, 1 1/2 Inch lead free brass flanged ends No Bids  

-01-08  multi-jet with a test port  I 
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes:

 IND2122200B1-

I 
  Group 1: Meter, 2 Inch lead free brass flanged ends No Bids  

-01-09  multi-jet with a test port  I 
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes:

 IND2122200B1-   Group 1: Meter, 3 Inch lead free brass hydrant meter No Bids  
-01-10  I with hydrant couplings turbine  I 
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes:

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter, 3 Inch lead free brass turbine with bolt- $830.75  

I 
   1 / each $830.75  

-01-11  on strainer and test port - First Offer I 
Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: Sensus

Model Name: Omni
Part Number: T2
Delivery (Calendar Days): Stock to 6 Weeks
Warranty Main Case (Years): 1 year case 10 years register & Battery

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter, 4 Inch lead free brass turbine with bolt- $1,617.30      1 / each $1,617.30  

-01-12  on strainer and test port - First Offer I I 
Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: Sensus

Model Name: Omni
Part Number: T2
Delivery (Calendar Days): stock to 6 weeks
Warranty Main Case (Years): 1 year case 10 years register & battery

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter, 6 Inch lead free brass turbine with bolt - $2,911.66      1 / each $2,911.66  

-01-13  on strainer and test port - First Offer I I 
Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: Sensus
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Model Name: Omni
Part Number: T2
Delivery (Calendar Days): stock to 6 weeks
Warranty Main Case (Years): 1 year case 10 years register & battery

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter, 8 Inch lead free brass turbine with bolt- $4,941.27      1 / each $4,941.27  

-01-14  on strainer and test port - First Offer I I 
Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: Sensus

Model Name: Omni
Part Number: T2
Delivery (Calendar Days): stock to 6 weeks
Warranty Main Case (Years): 1 year case 10 years register & battery

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter, 10 Inch lead free brass turbine with bolt- $6,444.44      1 / each $6,444.44  

-01-15  on strainer and test port - First Offer I I 
Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: Sensus

Model Name: Omnis
Part Number: T2
Delivery (Calendar Days): stock to 6 weeks
Warranty Main Case (Years): 1 year case 10 years register & battery

 IND2122200B1-

I 
  Group 1: Meter Reclaimed, 5/8 Inch lead free brass
multi-jet  I 

No Bids  
-01-16 

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:

 IND2122200B1-

I 
  Group 1: Meter Reclaimed, 3/4 Inch lead free brass No Bids  

-01-17  multi-jet  I 
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes:

 IND2122200B1-

I 
  Group 1: Meter Reclaimed, 1 Inch lead free brass multi- No Bids  

-01-18  jet meter  I 
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes:

 IND2122200B1-

I 
  Group 1: Meter Reclaimed, 1 1/2 Inch lead free brass No Bids  

-01-19  flanged ends multi-jet with test por  I 
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes:

 IND2122200B1-
-01-20  I 

  Group 1: Meter Reclaimed, 2 Inch lead free brass No Bids  
flanged ends multi-jet with test port  I 

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter Reclaimed, 3 Inch lead free brass turbine $830.75      1 / each $830.75  

-01-21  with bolt-on strainer and test p - First Offer I I 
Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: Sensus

Model Name: Omni
Part Number: T2 Reclaim
Delivery (Calendar Days): stock to 6 weeks
Warranty Main Case (Years): 1 year case 10 years register & battery

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter Reclaimed, 4 Inch lead free brass turbine $1,617.30      1 / each $1,617.30  

-01-22  with bolt-on strainer & test por - First Offer I I 
Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: Sensus

Model Name: Omnis
Part Number: T2 Reclaim
Delivery (Calendar Days): stock to 6 weeks
Warranty Main Case (Years): 1 year case 10 years register & battery

 IND2122200B1-I Group 1: Meter Reclaimed, 6 Inch lead free brass turbine $2,911.66  I    1 / each I $2,911.66  
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-01-23  I with bolt-on strainer & test por - First Offer I I 
Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: Sensus

Model Name: Omni
Part Number: T2 Reclaim
Delivery (Calendar Days): stock to 6 weeks
Warranty Main Case (Years): 1 year case 10 years register & battery

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter Reclaimed, 8 Inch lead free brass turbine $4,941.27  

I 
   1 / each

I 
$4,941.27  

-01-24  with bolt-on strainer & test por - First Offer

Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: Sensus

Model Name: Omni
Part Number: T2 Reclaim
Delivery (Calendar Days): stock to 6 weeks
Warranty Main Case (Years): 1 year case 10 years register & battery

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter Fire Service, 10 Inch X 2 Inch lead free $13,191.11  

I 
   1 / each

I 
$13,191.11  

-01-25  brass with test port - First Offer

Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: Sensus

Model Name: Omni
Part Number: F2
Delivery (Calendar Days): stock to 6 weeks
Warranty Main Case (Years): 1 year case 10 years register & battery

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter Fire Service, 8 Inch X 2 Inch lead free $9,222.22      1 / each $9,222.22  

-01-26  brass with test port - First Offer I I 
Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: Sensus

Model Name: Omni
Part Number: F2
Delivery (Calendar Days): stock to 6 weeks
Warranty Main Case (Years): 1 year case 10 years register & battery

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter Fire Service, 6 Inch X 2 Inch lead free $6,159.22      1 / each $6,159.22  

-01-27  brass with test port - First Offer I I 
Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: Sensus

Model Name: Omni
Part Number: F2
Delivery (Calendar Days): stock to 6 weeks
Warranty Main Case (Years): 1 year case 10 years register & battery

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter Fire Service, 4 Inch X 1 1/2 Inch lead free $4,628.18      1 / each $4,628.18  

-01-28  brass with test port - First Offer I I 
Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: Sensu

Model Name: Omni
Part Number: F2
Delivery (Calendar Days): stock to 6 weeks
Warranty Main Case (Years): 1 year case 10 years register & battery

 IND2122200B1-

I 
  Group 1: Meter Fire Service, 3 Inch X 1 Inch lead free No Bids  

-01-29  brass with test port  I 
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes:

 IND2122200B1-

I 
  Group 1: Meter Residential Fire Service, 2 Inch lead free No Bids  

-01-30  brass multi-jet  I 
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes:

 IND2122200B1-

I 
  Group 1: Meter Residential Fire Service, 1 1/2 Inch lead No Bids  

-01-31  free brass multi-jet  I 
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:
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Supplier Notes:

 IND2122200B1-

I 
  Group 1: Meter Residential Fire Service, 1 Inch lead free No Bids  

-01-32  brass multi-jet  I 
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes:

 IND2122200B1-

I 
  Group 1: Meter residential Fire Service, 5/8 Inch lead No Bids  

-01-33  free brass positive displacement  I 
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes:

 IND2122200B1-

I 
  Group 1: Discount off of list price - $5,000 

I 
No Bids  

-01-34 

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:

  Lot Total: $60,247.13  

Ferguson Enterprises Inc. $373,361.00    (31/34 items)

 Bid Contact Jason A Mueller  Address 2361 NW 22nd Street
drew.petonick@ferguson.com Pompano Beach, FL 33069
Ph 954-973-8100  

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

 Item #  Line Item Unit Price     Qty/Unit Total Price 

 IND2122200B1- Group 1: Meter, 5/8 Inch lead free brass positive $57.00     2200 / $125,400.00  
-01-01  displacement - First Offer each

Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: HV0GB202
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: MUELLER 

Model Name: 420
Part Number: HV0GB202
Delivery (Calendar Days): 30
Warranty Main Case (Years): 25

 IND2122200B1- Group 1: Meter, 3/4 Inch lead free brass positive $77.00     10 / each $770.00  
-01-02  displacement - First Offer

Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: HV0HB202
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: MUELLER 

Model Name: 435
Part Number: HV0HB202
Delivery (Calendar Days): 30
Warranty Main Case (Years): 25

 IND2122200B1- Group 1: Meter, 1 Inch lead free brass positive $125.00     150 / each $18,750.00  
-01-03  displacement - First Offer

Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: HVOKS202
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: MUELLER 

Model Name: 452
Part Number: HVOKS202
Delivery (Calendar Days): 30
Warranty Main Case (Years): 25

 IND2122200B1- Group 1: Meter, 1 1/2 Inch lead free brass flanged ends $305.00     15 / each $4,575.00  
-01-04  positive displacement with test p - First Offer

Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: HW0NS201
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: MUELLER 

Model Name: 562
Part Number: HW0NS201
Delivery (Calendar Days): 30
Warranty Main Case (Years): 25

 IND2122200B1- Group 1: Meter, 2 Inch lead free brass flanged ends $438.00     15 / each $6,570.00  
-01-05  positive displacement with test port - First Offer
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Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: MWOPS201
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: MUELLER 

Model Name: 572
Part Number: MWOPS201
Delivery (Calendar Days): 30
Warranty Main Case (Years): 25

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter, 5/8 Inch lead free brass multi-jet - First $199.00  

I 
   1 / each

I 
$199.00  

-01-06  Offer

Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: MUELLER 

Model Name: MVR 30
Part Number: Q0HS203 
Delivery (Calendar Days): 30 
Warranty Main Case (Years): 25

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter, 1 Inch lead free brass multi-jet - First $235.00      1 / each

-01-07  Offer I I 
$235.00  

Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: mueller 

Model Name: mvr 50
Part Number: Q0KAS01
Delivery (Calendar Days): 30
Warranty Main Case (Years): 25

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter, 1 1/2 Inch lead free brass flanged ends $367.00  

I 
   100 / each

I 
$36,700.00  

-01-08  multi-jet with a test port - First Offer

Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: MUELLER 

Model Name: MVR 100
Part Number: Q0NAS101
Delivery (Calendar Days): 30
Warranty Main Case (Years): 25

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter, 2 Inch lead free brass flanged ends $465.00      100 / each $46,500.00  

-01-09  multi-jet with a test port - First Offer I I 
Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: MUELLER 

Model Name: MVR 160 
Part Number: Q0PS201
Delivery (Calendar Days): 30
Warranty Main Case (Years): 25

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter, 3 Inch lead free brass hydrant meter $6,100.00      15 / each $91,500.00  

-01-10  with hydrant couplings turbine - First Offer I I 
Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: WATTS

Model Name: 3 994HMB-GPM 
Part Number: 0437808 
Delivery (Calendar Days): 30
Warranty Main Case (Years): 1

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter, 3 Inch lead free brass turbine with bolt- $1,125.00  

I 
   1 / each

I 
$1,125.00  

-01-11  on strainer and test port - First Offer

Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: MUELLER 

Model Name: 350 
Part Number: Q0R0210
Delivery (Calendar Days): 30
Warranty Main Case (Years): 25

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter, 4 Inch lead free brass turbine with bolt- $1,460.00      1 / each $1,460.00  

-01-12  on strainer and test port - First Offer I I 
Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: MUELLER 

Model Name: MVR650
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Part Number: Q0S0210
Delivery (Calendar Days): 30
Warranty Main Case (Years): 25

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter, 6 Inch lead free brass turbine with bolt - $2,700.00      1 / each $2,700.00  

-01-13  on strainer and test port - First Offer I I 
Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: MUELLER 

Model Name: MVR1300
Part Number: Q0T0410
Delivery (Calendar Days): 30
Warranty Main Case (Years): 25

 IND2122200B1-

I 
  Group 1: Meter, 8 Inch lead free brass turbine with bolt- No Bids  

-01-14  on strainer and test port  I 
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes:

 IND2122200B1-

I 
  Group 1: Meter, 10 Inch lead free brass turbine with No Bids  

-01-15  bolt-on strainer and test port  I 
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes:

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter Reclaimed, 5/8 Inch lead free brass $199.00      10 / each $1,990.00  

-01-16  multi-jet - First Offer I I 
Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: MUELLER 

Model Name: MVR 30
Part Number: Q0HS201RCM
Delivery (Calendar Days): 30
Warranty Main Case (Years): 25

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter Reclaimed, 3/4 Inch lead free brass $212.00  

I 
   1 / each

I 
$212.00  

-01-17  multi-jet - First Offer

Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: MUELLER 

Model Name: MVR 50 
Part Number: Q0HS203RCM
Delivery (Calendar Days): 30
Warranty Main Case (Years): 25

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter Reclaimed, 1 Inch lead free brass multi- $235.00      2 / each $470.00  

-01-18  jet meter - First Offer I I 
Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: MUELLER 

Model Name: MVR 50
Part Number: Q0NS101RCM
Delivery (Calendar Days): 30
Warranty Main Case (Years): 25

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter Reclaimed, 1 1/2 Inch lead free brass $367.00      1 / each $367.00  

-01-19  flanged ends multi-jet with test por - First Offer I I 
Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: MUELLER 

Model Name: MVR 100
Part Number: Q0KAS101RCM 
Delivery (Calendar Days): 30
Warranty Main Case (Years): 25

 IND2122200B1- Group 1: Meter Reclaimed, 2 Inch lead free brass flanged $465.00      1 / each $465.00  
-01-20  I ends multi-jet with test port - First Offer I I 
Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: MUELLER 

Model Name: MVR 160
Part Number: Q0SA201RCM
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Delivery (Calendar Days): 30
Warranty Main Case (Years): 25

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter Reclaimed, 3 Inch lead free brass turbine $1,125.00  

I 
   1 / each $1,125.00  

-01-21  with bolt-on strainer and test p - First Offer I 
Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: MUELLER 

Model Name: 350
Part Number: Q0R0210RCM
Delivery (Calendar Days): 30
Warranty Main Case (Years): 25

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter Reclaimed, 4 Inch lead free brass turbine $1,460.00      1 / each $1,460.00  

-01-22  with bolt-on strainer & test por - First Offer I I 
Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: MUELLER 

Model Name: 650
Part Number: Q0S0210RCM
Delivery (Calendar Days): 30
Warranty Main Case (Years): 25

 IND2122200B1-
I 
Group 1: Meter Reclaimed, 6 Inch lead free brass turbine $2,700.00  

I 
   1 / each $2,700.00  

-01-23  with bolt-on strainer & test por - First Offer I 
Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: MUELLER 

Model Name: 1300
Part Number: Q0T0410
Delivery (Calendar Days): 30
Warranty Main Case (Years): 25

 IND2122200B1-

I 
  Group 1: Meter Reclaimed, 8 Inch lead free brass No Bids  

-01-24  turbine with bolt-on strainer & test por  I 
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes:

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter Fire Service, 10 Inch X 2 Inch lead free $10,112.00      1 / each $10,112.00  

-01-25  brass with test port - First Offer I I 
Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: MUELLER 

Model Name: FM3
Part Number: H3V0201
Delivery (Calendar Days): 30
Warranty Main Case (Years): 25

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter Fire Service, 8 Inch X 2 Inch lead free $6,740.00  

I 
   1 / each

I 
$6,740.00  

-01-26  brass with test port - First Offer

Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: MUELLER 

Model Name: FM3
Part Number: H3U0201
Delivery (Calendar Days): 30
Warranty Main Case (Years): 25

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter Fire Service, 6 Inch X 2 Inch lead free $4,720.00  

I 
   1 / each $4,720.00  

-01-27  brass with test port - First Offer I 
Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: MUELLER 

Model Name: FM3
Part Number: H3T0201
Delivery (Calendar Days): 30
Warranty Main Case (Years): 25

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter Fire Service, 4 Inch X 1 1/2 Inch lead free $2,750.00      1 / each $2,750.00  

-01-28  brass with test port - First Offer I I 
Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: MUELLER 
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Model Name: FM3
Part Number: H3SQ201
Delivery (Calendar Days): 30
Warranty Main Case (Years): 25

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter Fire Service, 3 Inch X 1 Inch lead free $2,500.00  

I 
   1 / each

I 
$2,500.00  

-01-29  brass with test port - First Offer

Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: MUELLER

Model Name: FM3
Part Number: H3RQ201
Delivery (Calendar Days): 30
Warranty Main Case (Years): 25

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter Residential Fire Service, 2 Inch lead free $465.00      1 / each $465.00  

-01-30  brass multi-jet - First Offer I I 
Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: MUELLER 

Model Name: MVR 160
Part Number: Q0PA201
Delivery (Calendar Days): 30
Warranty Main Case (Years): 25

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter Residential Fire Service, 1 1/2 Inch lead $367.00  

I 
   1 / each

I 
$367.00  

-01-31  free brass multi-jet - First Offer

Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: MUELLER 

Model Name: MVR 100
Part Number: Q0NA101
Delivery (Calendar Days): 30
Warranty Main Case (Years): 25

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter Residential Fire Service, 1 Inch lead free $235.00      1 / each $235.00  

-01-32  brass multi-jet - First Offer I I 
Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: MUELLER 

Model Name: MVR 50
Part Number: Q0KA201
Delivery (Calendar Days): 30
Warranty Main Case (Years): 25

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Meter residential Fire Service, 5/8 Inch lead free $199.00      1 / each $199.00  

-01-33  brass positive displacement - First Offer I I 
Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Manufacturer Offered: MUELLER 

Model Name: MVR30
Part Number: . 
Delivery (Calendar Days): 30
Warranty Main Case (Years): 25

 IND2122200B1-

I 
Group 1: Discount off of list price - $5,000 - First Offer 6.00%  

I 
   1 / contract 6.00%  

-01-34  I 
Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Delivery (Calendar Days): 30

Warranty (Years): 25

  Lot Total: $373,361.00  
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