

Price Analysis
Bid No. GEN212340081
Phlebotomy and Testing
Services



Date Bid Posted: 10/04/2021
 Date Bid Opened: 11/04/2021
 Agency: Broward Addiction Recovery Center (BARC)
 Purchasing Agent: Patricia Cruz

Bid Submittals : 2
 Declinations: 2

Tabulation of Bid		American Health Associates 15712 SW 41 St. Ste 16-20 Davie, FL 33331		All Labs Solutions LLC 991 NW 16 Ter Fort Lauderdale, FL 33311		Pricing form Previous Contract: GEN211852381_1, Phlebotomy and Blood Testing (BARC)			Difference Between bidder and previous contract		
Item	Description	Qty	Unit	Price	Total Price	Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Qty	Total Price	Total Price
GEN212340081-01-01	Acetaminophen Serum Test	2	each	\$ 25.00	\$ 50.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 25.00	2	\$ 50.00	\$ -
GEN212340081-01-02	Aerobic Culture Test	6	each	\$ 12.00	\$ 72.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 12.00	6	\$ 72.00	\$ -
GEN212340081-01-03	Aerobic Identification Test	6	each	\$ 11.50	\$ 69.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 11.50	6	\$ 69.00	\$ -
GEN212340081-01-04	Ammonia Test	20	each	\$ 18.00	\$ 360.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 17.50	20	\$ 350.00	\$ (10.00)
GEN212340081-01-05	Amylase Test	4	each	\$ 4.00	\$ 16.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 2.00	4	\$ 8.00	\$ (8.00)
GEN212340081-01-06	Basic Metabolic Profile (SMA12) Test	2	each	\$ 5.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 200.00	\$ 5.00	2	\$ 10.00	\$ -
GEN212340081-01-07	BETA HCG Quantitative Test	2	each	\$ 8.00	\$ 16.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 8.00	1	\$ 8.00	\$ (8.00)
GEN212340081-01-08	Carbamazepine Test	10	each	\$ 20.00	\$ 200.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 20.00	10	\$ 200.00	\$ -
GEN212340081-01-09	Complete Blood Count (CBC) with Differential Test	1500	each	\$ 3.00	\$ 4,500.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 3.50	1500	\$ 5,250.00	\$ 750.00
GEN212340081-01-10	Complete Blood Count (CBC) without Differential Test	10	each	\$ 3.00	\$ 30.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 3.00	10	\$ 30.00	\$ -
GEN212340081-01-11	CD4 / CD8 Ratio Test	2	each	\$ 100.00	\$ 200.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 100.00	2	\$ 200.00	\$ -
GEN212340081-01-12	Chlamydia Urine Test	2	each	\$ 20.00	\$ 40.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 20.00	1	\$ 20.00	\$ (20.00)
GEN212340081-01-13	Comprehensive Metabolic Panel Test	1500	each	\$ 5.00	\$ 7,500.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 5.50	1500	\$ 8,250.00	\$ 750.00
GEN212340081-01-14	Creatinine Test	2	each	\$ 3.00	\$ 6.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 2.50	1	\$ 2.50	\$ (3.50)
GEN212340081-01-15	Digoxin Test	2	each	\$ 20.00	\$ 40.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 8.00	1	\$ 8.00	\$ (32.00)
GEN212340081-01-16	Doxepin Test	2	each	\$ 20.00	\$ 40.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 20.00	1	\$ 20.00	\$ (20.00)
GEN212340081-01-17	Fentanyl	20	each	\$ 30.00	\$ 600.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 40.00	20	\$ 800.00	\$ 200.00
GEN212340081-01-18	Ferritin Test	2	each	\$ 10.00	\$ 20.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 6.00	1	\$ 6.00	\$ (14.00)
GEN212340081-01-19	Folate [Folic Acid] Test	2	each	\$ 10.00	\$ 20.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 9.00	1	\$ 9.00	\$ (11.00)
GEN212340081-01-20	Fluorescent Treponemal Antibody Absorption (FTA ABS) Test (for positive RPRs on)	20	each	\$ 22.00	\$ 440.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 22.00	20	\$ 440.00	\$ -
GEN212340081-01-21	GC Urine Test. (Tests for STD Gonorrhea and Chlamydia)	2	each	\$ 40.00	\$ 80.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 13.00	1	\$ 13.00	\$ (67.00)
GEN212340081-01-22	Glucose Plasma Fasting Blood Glucose (FBS) Test	4	each	\$ 3.00	\$ 12.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 2.50	4	\$ 10.00	\$ (2.00)
GEN212340081-01-23	Glycohemoglobin A1C Test	50	each	\$ 10.00	\$ 500.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 7.00	50	\$ 350.00	\$ (150.00)
GEN212340081-01-24	Gram Stain Test	6	each	\$ 4.00	\$ 24.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 5.82	6	\$ 34.92	\$ 10.92
GEN212340081-01-25	HCG Test	10	each	\$ 8.00	\$ 80.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 8.00	3	\$ 24.00	\$ (56.00)
GEN212340081-01-26	Hematocrit Test	2	each	\$ 3.00	\$ 6.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 3.00	1	\$ 3.00	\$ (3.00)
GEN212340081-01-27	Hemoglobin Test	2	each	\$ 3.00	\$ 6.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 3.00	1	\$ 3.00	\$ (3.00)
GEN212340081-01-28	Hemoglobin A1C Test	10	each	\$ 20.00	\$ 200.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 7.00	1	\$ 7.00	\$ (193.00)
GEN212340081-01-29	Hepatitis BE Antibody (AB) Test	5	each	\$ 20.00	\$ 100.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 22.00	1	\$ 22.00	\$ (78.00)
GEN212340081-01-30	Hepatitis BE Antigen (AG) Test	5	each	\$ 20.00	\$ 100.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 22.00	1	\$ 22.00	\$ (78.00)
GEN212340081-01-31	Hepatitis A Antibody IgM Test	5	each	\$ 20.00	\$ 100.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 14.00	1	\$ 14.00	\$ (86.00)
GEN212340081-01-32	Hepatitis B Core Antibody IgM Test	5	each	\$ 20.00	\$ 100.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 42.00	3	\$ 126.00	\$ 26.00
GEN212340081-01-33	Hepatitis B Surface Antibody Test	5	each	\$ 20.00	\$ 100.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 42.00	3	\$ 126.00	\$ 26.00
GEN212340081-01-34	Hepatitis B Surface Antigen Test	5	each	\$ 20.00	\$ 100.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 42.00	3	\$ 126.00	\$ 26.00
GEN212340081-01-35	Hepatitis C Virus (HCV) Antibody Test	5	each	\$ 20.00	\$ 100.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 42.00	3	\$ 126.00	\$ 26.00
GEN212340081-01-36	Hepatitis Panel Acute BARC Specific Multi-Panel Test (Testing for HCV RNA or H	5	each	\$ 50.00	\$ 250.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 80.00	2	\$ 160.00	\$ (90.00)
GEN212340081-01-37	Iron Test	5	each	\$ 40.00	\$ 200.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 18.00	2	\$ 36.00	\$ (164.00)
GEN212340081-01-38	Iron Binding Cap Total Test	30	each	\$ 4.00	\$ 120.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 3.50	30	\$ 105.00	\$ (15.00)
GEN212340081-01-39	Lipase Test	5	each	\$ 30.00	\$ 60.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 20.26	2	\$ 40.52	\$ (19.48)
GEN212340081-01-40	Lipid Profile Test	50	each	\$ 6.00	\$ 300.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 3.00	5	\$ 15.00	\$ (15.00)
GEN212340081-01-41	Lithium Test	50	each	\$ 10.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 1.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 8.00	50	\$ 400.00	\$ (100.00)
GEN212340081-01-42	Magnesium Serum Test	50	each	\$ 11.00	\$ 550.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 11.00	20	\$ 220.00	\$ (330.00)
GEN212340081-01-43	Manual Differential Test	600	each	\$ 5.00	\$ 3,000.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 4.00	600	\$ 2,400.00	\$ (600.00)
GEN212340081-01-44	Medical Professional Profile 8-Panel drug screen Test	100	each	\$ 2.00	\$ 200.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 2.00	100	\$ 200.00	\$ -
GEN212340081-01-45		5	each	\$ 20.00	\$ 100.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 22.00	1	\$ 22.00	\$ (78.00)



Price Analysis
 Bid No. GEN2123400B1
Phlebotomy and Testing Services
 Agency: Broward Addiction Recovery Center (BARC)
 Purchasing Agent: Patricia Cruz

Date Bid Posted: 10/04/2021
 Date Bid Opened: 11/04/2021
 Bid Submittals : 2
 Declinations: 2

Tabulation of Bid		American Health Associates 15712 SW 41 St. Ste 16-20 Davie, FL 33331		All Labs Solutions LLC 991 NW 16 Ter Fort Lauderdale, FL 33311		Pricing form Previous Contract: GEN2118523B1_1, Phlebotomy and Blood Testing (BARC)		Difference Between bidder and previous contract	
GEN Bid No.	Description	Quantity	Unit	Price	Quantity	Unit	Price	Quantity	Price
GEN2123400B1-01-46	Microalbumin Urine Test	2	each	\$ 8.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 8.00	1	\$ 8.00
GEN2123400B1-01-47	Mononucleosis (Mono) Test	2	each	\$ 7.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 7.00	1	\$ 7.00
GEN2123400B1-01-48	Methicillin-resistant Staphylococcus aureus (MRSA) Culture Test	2	each	\$ 10.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 10.00	1	\$ 10.00
GEN2123400B1-01-49	Ova & Parasite Test	10	each	\$ 20.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 15.00	1	\$ 15.00
GEN2123400B1-01-50	Ova & Stain Test	2	each	\$ 25.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 25.00	1	\$ 25.00
GEN2123400B1-01-51	Partial Thromboplastin Time (PTT) Test	10	each	\$ 7.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 7.00	1	\$ 7.00
GEN2123400B1-01-52	Phenobarbital Test	2	each	\$ 30.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 30.00	1	\$ 30.00
GEN2123400B1-01-53	Phenytoin (Dilantin) Test	20	each	\$ 8.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 8.00	20	\$ 160.00
GEN2123400B1-01-54	Potassium Test	25	each	\$ 3.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 3.00	13	\$ 39.00
GEN2123400B1-01-55	Pregnancy Qualitative Urine Test	25	each	\$ 8.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 5.50	2	\$ 11.00
GEN2123400B1-01-56	Prolactin Test	2	each	\$ 20.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 25.00	1	\$ 25.00
GEN2123400B1-01-57	Protein Total Test	2	each	\$ 3.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 5.00	1	\$ 5.00
GEN2123400B1-01-58	Protime / INR Test	2	each	\$ 5.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 5.00	1	\$ 5.00
GEN2123400B1-01-59	Prostate-Specific Antigen (PSA) Test	5	each	\$ 15.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 15.00	1	\$ 15.00
GEN2123400B1-01-60	Rapid Plasma Reagin (RPR) with Fluorescent Treponemal Antibody Absorption (FTA A	2	each	\$ 22.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 22.00	1	\$ 22.00
GEN2123400B1-01-61	Routine Lab BARC Specific Test Package	2000	each	\$ 11.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 11.00	2000	\$ 22,000.00
GEN2123400B1-01-62	Rapid Plasma Reagin (RPR) Titer Test	2	each	\$ 7.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 7.00	1	\$ 7.00
GEN2123400B1-01-63	Sed Rate Test	2	each	\$ 4.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 4.00	2	\$ 8.00
GEN2123400B1-01-64	Stool Culture Test	10	each	\$ 10.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 15.00	1	\$ 15.00
GEN2123400B1-01-65	Streptococcus Culture (Strep Culture) Test	10	each	\$ 10.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 15.00	1	\$ 15.00
GEN2123400B1-01-66	Susceptibility Test	5	each	\$ 11.50	No bid	No bid	\$ 11.50	5	\$ 57.50
GEN2123400B1-01-67	T3 Free Test	2	each	\$ 15.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 22.00	1	\$ 22.00
GEN2123400B1-01-68	T3 Uptake Test	2	each	\$ 5.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 10.00	1	\$ 10.00
GEN2123400B1-01-69	T7 Total Test Multi-panel (Thyroid Profile is TSH T4 Free and T3 Total)	2	each	\$ 60.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 15.00	1	\$ 15.00
GEN2123400B1-01-70	T4 Total Test	2	each	\$ 6.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 10.00	1	\$ 10.00
GEN2123400B1-01-71	Tuberculosis (TB) Quantiferon Test	800	each	\$ 60.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 60.00	800	\$ 48,000.00
GEN2123400B1-01-72	Tegretol Level Test	2	each	\$ 15.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 20.00	1	\$ 20.00
GEN2123400B1-01-73	Testosterone Total Test	2	each	\$ 10.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 10.00	1	\$ 10.00
GEN2123400B1-01-74	Theophylline Blood Level Test	2	each	\$ 20.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 30.00	1	\$ 30.00
GEN2123400B1-01-75	Thyroid Multi-Panel Test	2	each	\$ 60.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 60.00	1	\$ 60.00
GEN2123400B1-01-76	Thyroid Profile BARC Specific Multi-Panel Test (T3 Total T4 Free and TSH)	150	each	\$ 60.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 25.00	100	\$ 2,500.00
GEN2123400B1-01-77	Thyroid-Stimulating Hormone (TSH) 3rd Generation Test	15	each	\$ 10.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 10.00	15	\$ 150.00
GEN2123400B1-01-78	Uric Acid Test	2	each	\$ 3.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 10.00	1	\$ 10.00
GEN2123400B1-01-79	Urinalysis with Reflex To Microscopic Test	50	each	\$ 4.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 3.00	20	\$ 60.00
GEN2123400B1-01-80	Urine Culture Test	50	each	\$ 10.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 10.00	20	\$ 200.00
GEN2123400B1-01-81	Urine Microscopic Test	10	each	\$ 5.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 3.00	10	\$ 30.00
GEN2123400B1-01-82	Other Specimen Collection	10	each	\$ 10.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 10.00	2	\$ 20.00
GEN2123400B1-01-83	Valproic Acid (Depakote) Test	60	each	\$ 10.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 10.00	57	\$ 570.00
GEN2123400B1-01-84	Vitamin B12 Test	10	each	\$ 13.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 60.00	6	\$ 60.00
GEN2123400B1-01-85	Vitamin B12 / Folate Test	10	each	\$ 15.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 15.00	1	\$ 15.00
GEN2123400B1-01-86	Western Blot Test	50	each	\$ 30.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 50.00	50	\$ 2,500.00
GEN2123400B1-01-87	Wound Culture Test	25	each	\$ 10.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 10.00	1	\$ 10.00
GEN2123400B1-01-88	Venipuncture/Blood Draw Price	7000	each	\$ 5.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 5.00	7000	\$ 35,000.00
GEN2123400B1-01-89	Emergency Services and non-work hours	20	each	\$ 25.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 25.00	20	\$ 500.00
GEN2123400B1-01-90	Alcohol Blood	5	each	\$ 10.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 10.00	N/A	N/A



Price Analysis
 Bid No. GEN2123400B1
Phlebotomy and Testing Services
 Agency: Broward Addiction Recovery Center (BARC)
 Purchasing Agent: Patricia Cruz

Date Bid Posted: 10/04/2021
 Date Bid Opened: 11/04/2021
 Bid Submittals : 2
 Declinations: 2

Tabulation of Bid		American Health Associates 15712 SW 41 St. Ste 16-20 Davie, FL 33331		All Labs Solutions LLC 991 NW 16 Ter Fort Lauderdale, FL 33311		Pricing form Previous Contract: GEN2118523B1_1, Phlebotomy and Blood Testing (BARC)		Difference Between bidder and previous contract	
GEN2123400B1-01-91	Alcohol Urine	5	each \$ 10.00 \$ 50.00	No bid	No bid	New Item	N/A	N/A	N/A
GEN2123400B1-01-92	Alanine Aminotransferase (ALT) (SGPT)	2	each \$ 3.00 \$ 6.00	No bid	No bid	New Item	N/A	N/A	N/A
GEN2123400B1-01-93	Aspartate Aminotransferase (AST) (SGOT)	2	each \$ 3.00 \$ 6.00	No bid	No bid	New Item	N/A	N/A	N/A
GEN2123400B1-01-94	Benzodiazepines Serum	3	each \$ 20.00 \$ 60.00	No bid	No bid	New Item	N/A	N/A	N/A
GEN2123400B1-01-95	Calcium	3	each \$ 3.00 \$ 9.00	No bid	No bid	New Item	N/A	N/A	N/A
GEN2123400B1-01-96	Culture Throat	8	each \$ 10.00 \$ 80.00	No bid	No bid	New Item	N/A	N/A	N/A
GEN2123400B1-01-97	Hepatic Function Panel	2	each \$ 5.00 \$ 10.00	No bid	No bid	New Item	N/A	N/A	N/A
GEN2123400B1-01-98	Organism Identification	14	each \$ 10.00 \$ 140.00	No bid	No bid	New Item	N/A	N/A	N/A
GEN2123400B1-01-99	Pregnancy Serum	4	each \$ 8.00 \$ 32.00	No bid	No bid	New Item	N/A	N/A	N/A
GEN2123400B1-01-100	Reticulocyt Count	13	each \$ 6.00 \$ 78.00	No bid	No bid	New Item	N/A	N/A	N/A
GEN2123400B1-01-101	Sensitivity	14	each \$ 10.00 \$ 140.00	No bid	No bid	New Item	N/A	N/A	N/A
GEN2123400B1-01-102	T3 TOTAL	15	each \$ 10.00 \$ 150.00	No bid	No bid	New Item	N/A	N/A	N/A
GEN2123400B1-01-103	T3U1/T8	2	each \$ 13.00 \$ 26.00	No bid	No bid	New Item	N/A	N/A	N/A
GEN2123400B1-01-104	Transferrin	3	each \$ 10.00 \$ 30.00	No bid	No bid	New Item	N/A	N/A	N/A
GEN2123400B1-01-105	Varicella Igm	2	each \$ 12.00 \$ 24.00	No bid	No bid	New Item	N/A	N/A	N/A
GEN2123400B1-01-106	Vitamin D 25-Hydroxy	2	each \$ 40.00 \$ 80.00	No bid	No bid	New Item	N/A	N/A	N/A
GEN2123400B1-01-107	Free T5	7	each \$ 10.00 \$ 70.00	No bid	No bid	New Item	N/A	N/A	N/A
GEN2123400B1-01-108	ANA Titer & Pattern	2	each \$ 18.00 \$ 36.00	No bid	No bid	New Item	N/A	N/A	N/A
GEN2123400B1-01-109	Antinuclear AB	2	each \$ 8.00 \$ 16.00	No bid	No bid	New Item	N/A	N/A	N/A
GEN2123400B1-01-110	Rheumatoid Factor	2	each \$ 100.00 \$ 200.00	No bid	No bid	New Item	N/A	N/A	N/A
GEN2123400B1-01-111	HIV-1 RNA ULTRA QUANT PCR	2	each \$ 300.00 \$ 600.00	No bid	No bid	New Item	N/A	N/A	N/A
GEN2123400B1-01-112	HIV Genotype	2	each \$ 30.00 \$ 60.00	No bid	No bid	New Item	N/A	N/A	N/A
GEN2123400B1-01-113	Drug Screen 10 Urine	3	each \$ 25.00 \$ 75.00	No bid	No bid	New Item	N/A	N/A	N/A
GEN2123400B1-01-114	Drug Screen 9 Serum	2	each \$ 15.00 \$ 30.00	No bid	No bid	New Item	N/A	N/A	N/A
GEN2123400B1-01-115	Ionized Calcium	2	each \$ 3.00 \$ 6.00	No bid	No bid	New Item	N/A	N/A	N/A
GEN2123400B1-01-116	Phosphorous	2	each \$ 3.50 \$ 7.00	No bid	No bid	New Item	N/A	N/A	N/A
GEN2123400B1-01-117	Platelet Count	2	each \$ 30.00 \$ 60.00	No bid	No bid	New Item	N/A	N/A	N/A
GEN2123400B1-01-118	Benzodiazepines GCMS	2	each \$ 30.00 \$ 60.00	No bid	No bid	New Item	N/A	N/A	N/A
GEN2123400B1-01-119	Methadone Serum	2	each \$ 3.00 \$ 6.00	No bid	No bid	New Item	N/A	N/A	N/A
GEN2123400B1-01-120	Lactate dehydrogenase (LDH)	2	each \$ 80.00 \$ 160.00	No bid	No bid	New Item	N/A	N/A	N/A
GEN2123400B1-01-121	Quantiferon TB-Gold	2	each \$ 3.00 \$ 6.00	No bid	No bid	New Item	N/A	N/A	N/A
GEN2123400B1-01-122	Bilirubin Direct	2	each \$ 3.00 \$ 6.00	No bid	No bid	New Item	N/A	N/A	N/A
GEN2123400B1-01-123	Bilirubin Total	2	each \$ 3.00 \$ 6.00	No bid	No bid	New Item	N/A	N/A	N/A
GEN2123400B1-01-124	Red Blood Count	2	each \$ 70.00 \$ 140.00	No bid	No bid	New Item	N/A	N/A	N/A
GEN2123400B1-01-125	COVID-19 PCR Test	1000	each \$ - \$ -	\$ 1.00	\$ 1,000.00	New Item	N/A	N/A	N/A
GEN2123400B1-01-126	COVID-19 Nasal Swab (Test Kit)	2000	each \$ - \$ -	\$ 1.00	\$ 2,000.00	New Item	N/A	N/A	N/A
GEN2123400B1-01-127	COVID-19 Antigen Test (CoV-2 IGG/IGM)	1000	each \$ 50.00 \$ 50,000.00	\$ 1.00	\$ 1,000.00	New Item	N/A	N/A	N/A

Initial Bid amount \$ 263,100.50
 Pass thru allowance \$ 6,000.00
 Total Award \$ 269,100.50
 Difference \$ 132,696.44 \$ 130,404.06

Quantity different in previous solicitation

Total Agreement Amount	
Initial (1 yr.)	\$ 269,100.50
Potential (3 yr.)	\$ 807,301.50

Notes: Per solicitation Basis of Award All Labs Solution LLC, bid deemed incomplete.