

PRICE ANALYSIS

Bid #IND2123546B1 Submersible Lift Station Pumps Parts
 Repair(Warranty) &Install/Removal Service
 Group 1

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Tom Evans Environmental Inc.		Barney's Pumps Inc		Estimate based on previous contract awarded 10/9/2018 adjusted with PPI data		Difference Percent
				Price	Total	Price	Total	Price	Total	
IND2123546B1--01-01	Submersible Pump Curve No. 1 240V 3 Phase 3 HP 4 in. Discharge 2 in. Guide	1	each	\$ 3,118.49	\$ 3,118.49	\$ 4,033.00	\$ 4,033.00	\$ 2,968.44	\$ 2,968.44	36%
IND2123546B1--01-02	Submersible Pump Curve No. 1 240V Single Phase 3 HP 4 in. Discharge 2 in.	1	each	\$ 2,611.41	\$ 2,611.41	\$ 4,033.00	\$ 4,033.00	\$ 2,504.44	\$ 2,504.44	61%
IND2123546B1--01-03	Submersible Pump Curve No. 1 480V 3 Phase 3 HP 4 in. Discharge 2 in. Guide	1	each	\$ 3,118.49	\$ 3,118.49	\$ 4,033.00	\$ 4,033.00	\$ 2,968.44	\$ 2,968.44	36%
				\$ 8,848.39	\$ 8,848.39	\$ 12,099.00	\$ 12,099.00	\$ 8,441.32	\$ 8,441.32	

REJ: Reject; item 2, does not meet minimum requirements for factory mutual explosion proof listed for submersible sewage pumps (as specified in the solicitation Attachment A-1, first (1st) bullet point).
 AWD: Recommended for Award

REJ
 AWD

PRICE ANALYSIS

Bid #IND2123546B1 Submersible Lift Station Pumps Parts
 Group 1 Repair(Warranty) &Install/Removal Service

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Hudson Pump and Equipment		Wastewater Solutions		F J Nugent & Associates Inc	
				Price	Total	Price	Total	Price	Total
IND2123546B1--01-01	Submersible Pump Curve No. 1 240V 3 Phase 3 HP 4 in. Discharge 2 in. Guide	1	each	\$ 5,041.00	\$ 5,041.00	\$ 8,055.00	\$ 8,055.00		No bid
IND2123546B1--01-02	Submersible Pump Curve No. 1 240V Single Phase 3 HP 4 in. Discharge 2 in.	1	each	\$ 5,421.00	\$ 5,421.00	\$ 8,055.00	\$ 8,055.00		No bid
IND2123546B1--01-03	Submersible Pump Curve No. 1 480V 3 Phase 3 HP 4 in. Discharge 2 in. Guide	1	each	\$ 5,041.00	\$ 5,041.00	\$ 8,055.00	\$ 8,055.00		No bid
				\$	\$ 15,503.00	\$	\$ 24,165.00		No bid

REJ: Reject; item 2, does not meet minimum requirements for factory mutual explosion proof listed for submersible sewage pumps (as specified in the solicitation Attachment A-1, first (1st) bullet point).

AWD: Recommended for Award

PRICE ANALYSIS

Bid #IND2123546B1 Submersible Lift Station Pumps Parts
 Repair(Warranty) &Install/Removal Service
 Group 2

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Tom Evans Environmental Inc.		Barney's Pumps Inc		Estimate based on previous contract awarded 10/9/2018 adjusted with PPI data		Difference Percent
				Price	Total	Price	Total	Price	Total	
IND2123546B1--02-01	Submersible Pump Curve No. 2 240V 3 Phase 5 HP 4 in. Discharge 2 in. Guide	1	each	\$ 2,980.99	\$ 2,980.99	\$ 4,204.00	\$ 4,204.00	\$ 3,084.44	\$ 3,084.44	36%
IND2123546B1--02-02	Submersible Pump Curve No. 2 240V Single Phase 5 HP 4 in. Discharge 2 in.	1	each	\$ 2,958.75	\$ 2,958.75	\$ 3,793.00	\$ 3,793.00	\$ 2,807.20	\$ 2,807.20	35%
IND2123546B1--02-03	Submersible Pump Curve No. 2 480V 3 Phase 5 HP 4 in. Discharge 2 in. Guide	1	each	\$ 2,980.99	\$ 2,980.99	\$ 4,204.00	\$ 4,204.00	\$ 3,084.44	\$ 3,084.44	36%
				\$ 8,920.73	\$ 8,920.73	\$ 12,201.00	\$ 12,201.00	\$ 8,976.08	\$ 8,976.08	

AWD

REJ

REJ: Reject; item 2, does not meet minimum requirements for factory mutual explosion proof listed for submersible sewage pumps (as specified in the solicitation Attachment A-1, first (1st) AWD: Recommended for Award

PRICE ANALYSIS

Bid #IND2123546B1 Submersible Lift Station Pumps Parts
 Repair(Warranty) &Install/Removal Service
 Group 2

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Hudson Pump and Equipment		Wastewater Solutions		F J Nugent & Associates Inc	
				Price	Total	Price	Total	Price	Total
IND2123546B1--02-01	Submersible Pump Curve No. 2 240V 3 Phase 5 HP 4 in. Discharge 2 in. Guide	1	each	\$5,366.00	\$ 5,366.00	\$8,055.00	\$ 8,055.00		No Bid
IND2123546B1--02-02	Submersible Pump Curve No. 2 240V Single Phase 5 HP 4 in. Discharge 2 in.	1	each	\$5,937.00	\$ 5,937.00	\$8,055.00	\$ 8,055.00		No Bid
IND2123546B1--02-03	Submersible Pump Curve No. 2 480V 3 Phase 5 HP 4 in. Discharge 2 in. Guide	1	each	\$5,366.00	\$ 5,366.00	\$8,055.00	\$ 8,055.00		No Bid
					\$ 16,669.00		\$ 24,165.00		

REJ: Reject; item 2, does not meet minimum requirements for factory mutual explosion proof listed for submersible sewage pumps (as specified in the solicitation Attachment A-1, first (1st) AWD: Recommended for Award

PRICE ANALYSIS

Submersible Lift Station Pumps Parts
Repair(Warranty) &Install/Removal
Service

Bid #IND2123546B1
Group 3

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Barney's Pumps Inc		Estimate based on previous contract awarded 10/9/2018 adjusted with PPI data		Difference Percent	Tom Evans Environmental Inc.	
				Price	Total	Price	Total		Price	Total
IND2123546B1--03-01	Submersible Pump Curve #3 240V 3 Phase 5.5 HP 4 in. Discharge 2 in. Guide	5	each	\$ 4,204.00	\$ 21,020.00	\$ 2,888.40	\$ 14,442.00	46%	\$ 4,348.69	\$ 21,743.45
	Submersible Pump Curve #3 480V 3 Phase 5.5 HP 4 in. Discharge 2 in. Guide	2	each	\$ 4,204.00	\$ 8,408.00	\$ 2,888.40	\$ 5,776.80	46%	\$ 4,283.84	\$ 8,567.68
					\$ 29,428.00					\$ 30,311.13

AWD

AWD: Recommended for Award

PRICE ANALYSIS

Submersible Lift Station Pumps Parts
Repair(Warranty) &Install/Removal
Service

Bid #IND2123546B1
Group 3

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	F J Nugent & Associates Inc		Hudson Pump and Equipment		Hudson Pump and Equipment (alternate)	
				Price	Total	Price	Total	Price	Total
	Submersible Pump Curve #3 240V 3 Phase 5.5 HP 4 in. Discharge 2 in. Guide	5	each	\$ 5,104.00	\$ 25,520.00	\$ 5,366.00	\$ 26,830.00	\$ 7,510.00	\$ 37,550.00
IND2123546B1--03-01	Submersible Pump Curve #3 480V 3 Phase 5.5 HP 4 in. Discharge 2 in. Guide	2	each	\$ 5,104.00	\$ 10,208.00	\$ 5,366.00	\$ 10,732.00		
					\$ 35,728.00		\$ 37,562.00		\$ 37,550.00

AWD: Recommended for Award

PRICE ANALYSIS

Submersible Lift Station Pumps Parts
Repair(Warranty) &Install/Removal
Service

Bid #IND2123546B1
Group 3

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Price	Wastewater Solutions Total
	Submersible Pump Curve #3				
	240V 3 Phase 5.5 HP 4 in.				
IND2123546B1--03-01	Discharge 2 in. Guide	5	each	\$ 8,055.00	\$ 40,275.00
	Submersible Pump Curve #3				
	480V 3 Phase 5.5 HP 4 in.				
IND2123546B1--03-02	Discharge 2 in. Guide	2	each	\$ 8,055.00	\$ 16,110.00
					\$ 56,385.00

AWD: Recommended for Award

PRICE ANALYSIS

Bid #IND2123546B1 Submersible Lift Station Pumps Parts
 Group 4 Repair(Warranty) &Install/Removal Service

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Barney's Pumps Inc		Estimate based on previous contract awarded 10/9/2018 adjusted with PPI data		Difference Percent	Tom Evans Environmental Inc.	
				Price	Total	Price	Total		Price	Total
IND2123546B1--04-01	Submersible Pump Curve No. 4									
	240V 3 Phase 7.5 HP 4 in. Discharge 2 in.	8	each	\$4,309.00	\$ 34,472.00	\$ 3,753.76	\$ 30,030.08	15%	\$ 4,351.99	\$ 34,815.92
IND2123546B1--04-02	Submersible Pump Curve No. 4									
	480V 3 Phase 7.5 HP 4 in. Discharge 2 in.	2	each	\$4,309.00	\$ 8,618.00	\$ 3,753.76	\$ 7,507.52	15%	\$ 4,351.99	\$ 8,703.98
					\$ 43,090.00					\$ 43,519.90

AWD

AWD: Recommended for Award

PRICE ANALYSIS

Bid #IND2123546B1 Submersible Lift Station Pumps Parts
 Group 4 Repair(Warranty) &Install/Removal Service

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	F J Nugent & Associates Inc		Hudson Pump and Equipment		Hudson Pump and Equipment (alternate)	
				Price	Total	Price	Total	Price	Total
IND2123546B1--04-01	Submersible Pump Curve No. 4 240V 3 Phase 7.5 HP 4 in. Discharge 2 in.	8	each	\$ 5,717.00	\$ 45,736.00	\$ 6,079.00	\$ 48,632.00	\$ 8,410.00	\$ 67,280.00
	Submersible Pump Curve No. 4 480V 3 Phase 7.5 HP 4 in. Discharge 2 in.	2	each	\$ 5,717.00	\$ 11,434.00	\$ 6,079.00	\$ 12,158.00		
				\$ 57,170.00		\$ 60,790.00		\$ 67,280.00	

AWD: Recommended for Award

PRICE ANALYSIS

Bid #IND2123546B1 Submersible Lift Station Pumps Parts
 Group 4 Repair(Warranty) &Install/Removal Service

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Price	Wastewater Solutions Total
	Submersible Pump Curve No. 4				
	240V 3 Phase 7.5 HP 4 in. Discharge 2 in.	8	each	\$ 8,055.00	\$ 64,440.00
IND2123546B1--04-01	Submersible Pump Curve No. 4				
	480V 3 Phase 7.5 HP 4 in. Discharge 2 in.	2	each	\$ 8,055.00	\$ 16,110.00
IND2123546B1--04-02					\$ 80,550.00

AWD: Recommended for Award

PRICE ANALYSIS

Bid #IND2123546B1 Submersible Lift Station Pumps Parts
 Group 5 Repair(Warranty) &Install/Removal Service

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Barney's Pumps Inc		Estimate based on previous contract awarded 10/9/2018 adjusted with PPI data		Difference Percent	F J Nugent & Associates Inc	
				Price	Total	Price	Total		Price	Total
	Submersible Pump Curve No. 5									
	240V 3 Phase 10 HP 4 in. Discharge 2 in.	3	each	\$ 4,485.00	\$ 13,455.00	\$ 3,837.00	\$ 11,511.00	17%	\$ 5,717.00	\$ 17,151.00
IND2123546B1--05-01	Submersible Pump Curve No. 5									
	480V 3 Phase 10 HP 4 in. Discharge 2 in.	2	each	\$ 4,485.00	\$ 8,970.00	\$ 3,837.00	\$ 7,674.00	17%	\$ 5,717.00	\$ 11,434.00
					\$ 22,425.00					\$ 28,585.00

AWD

AWD: Recommended for Award

PRICE ANALYSIS

Bid #IND2123546B1 Submersible Lift Station Pumps Parts
 Group 5 Repair(Warranty) &Install/Removal Service

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Tom Evans Environmental Inc.		Hudson Pump and Equipment		Wastewater Solutions	
				Price	Total	Price	Total	Price	Total
IND2123546B1--05-01	Submersible Pump Curve No. 5 240V 3 Phase 10 HP 4 in. Discharge 2 in.	3	each	\$ 5,842.92	\$ 17,528.76	\$ 6,979.00	\$ 20,937.00	\$ 8,055.00	\$ 24,165.00
IND2123546B1--05-02	Submersible Pump Curve No. 5 480V 3 Phase 10 HP 4 in. Discharge 2 in.	2	each	\$ 5,842.92	\$ 11,685.84	\$ 6,819.00	\$ 13,638.00	\$ 8,055.00	\$ 16,110.00
					\$ 29,214.60		\$ 34,575.00		\$ 40,275.00

AWD: Recommended for Award

PRICE ANALYSIS

Bid #IND2123546B1 Submersible Lift Station Pumps Parts
 Repair(Warranty) &Install/Removal Service
 Group 6

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Barney's Pumps Inc		Estimate based on previous contract awarded 10/9/2018 adjusted with PPI data		Difference Percent	Tom Evans Environmental Inc.	
				Price	Total	Price	Total		Price	Total
IND2123546B1--06-01	Submersible Pump Curve No. 6 240V 3 Phase 10 HP 4 in. Discharge 2 in. Guide	17	each	\$ 5,105.00	\$ 86,785.00	\$ 4,773.40	\$ 81,147.80	7%	\$ 5,685.55	\$ 96,654.35
IND2123546B1--06-02	Submersible Pump Curve No. 6 480V 3 Phase 10 HP 4 in. Discharge 2 in. Guide	1	each	\$ 5,015.00	\$ 5,015.00	\$ 4,773.40	\$ 4,773.40	5%	\$ 5,685.55	\$ 5,685.55
					\$ 91,800.00					\$ 102,339.90

AWD

AWD: Recommended for Award

PRICE ANALYSIS

Bid #IND2123546B1 Submersible Lift Station Pumps Parts
 Repair(Warranty) &Install/Removal Service
 Group 6

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	F J Nugent & Associates Inc		Hudson Pump and Equipment		Wastewater Solutions	
				Price	Total	Price	Total	Price	Total
	Submersible Pump Curve No. 6								
	240V 3 Phase 10 HP 4 in. Discharge 2 in. Guide	17	each	\$ 6,392.00	\$ 108,664.00	\$ 6,979.00	\$ 118,643.00	\$ 8,055.00	\$ 136,935.00
IND2123546B1--06-01	Submersible Pump Curve No. 6								
	480V 3 Phase 10 HP 4 in. Discharge 2 in. Guide	1	each	\$ 6,392.00	\$ 6,392.00	\$ 6,819.00	\$ 6,819.00	\$ 8,055.00	\$ 8,055.00
IND2123546B1--06-02									
				\$ 6,392.00	\$ 6,392.00	\$ 6,819.00	\$ 6,819.00	\$ 8,055.00	\$ 8,055.00
					\$ 115,056.00		\$ 125,462.00		\$ 144,990.00

AWD: Recommended for Award

PRICE ANALYSIS

Bid #IND2123546B1 Submersible Lift Station Pumps Parts
 Repair(Warranty) &Install/Removal Service
 Group 6

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Hudson Pump and Equipment (alternate)	
				Price	Total
IND2123546B1--06-01	Submersible Pump Curve No. 6 240V 3 Phase 10 HP 4 in. Discharge 2 in. Guide	17	each	\$9,877.00	\$ 167,909.00
IND2123546B1--06-02	Submersible Pump Curve No. 6 480V 3 Phase 10 HP 4 in. Discharge 2 in. Guide	1	each		\$ 167,909.00

AWD: Recommended for Award

PRICE ANALYSIS

Submersible Lift Station Pumps Parts
Repair(Warranty) &Install/Removal
Service

Bid #IND2123546B1
Group 7

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Barney's Pumps Inc VOLUNTARY PRICE REDUCTION Price	Total	Estimate based on previous contract awarded 10/9/2018 adjusted with PPI data Price	Total	Difference Percent	Barney's Pumps Inc Price	Total
	Submersible Pump Curve No. 7 240V 3 Phase 15 HP 4 in. Discharge 2 in. Guide	1	each	\$6,730.00	\$ 6,730.00	\$5,788.40	\$ 5,788.40	16%	\$7,036.00	\$ 7,036.00
IND2123546B1--07-01	Submersible Pump Curve No. 7 480V 3 Phase 15 HP 4 in. Discharge 2 in. Guide	1	each	\$6,730.00	\$ 6,730.00	\$5,788.40	\$ 5,788.40	16%	\$7,036.00	\$ 7,036.00
					\$ 13,460.00					\$ 14,072.00

AWD

AWD: Recommended for Award

PRICE ANALYSIS

Submersible Lift Station Pumps Parts
Repair(Warranty) &Install/Removal
Service

Bid #IND2123546B1
Group 7

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Tom Evans Environmental Inc.		Hudson Pump and Equipment		Wastewater Solutions		F J Nugent & Associates Inc Price Total
				Price	Total	Price	Total	Price	Total	
	Submersible Pump Curve No. 7									
	240V 3 Phase 15 HP 4 in. Discharge 2 in. Guide	1	each	\$ 7,101.44	\$ 7,101.44	\$ 8,555.00	\$ 8,555.00	\$ 10,294.00	\$ 10,294.00	No Bid
IND2123546B1--07-01	Submersible Pump Curve No. 7									
	480V 3 Phase 15 HP 4 in. Discharge 2 in. Guide	1	each	\$ 7,101.44	\$ 7,101.44	\$ 8,395.00	\$ 8,395.00	\$ 10,294.00	\$ 10,294.00	No Bid
IND2123546B1--07-02										
					\$ 14,202.88		\$ 16,950.00		\$ 20,588.00	

AWD: Recommended for Award

PRICE ANALYSIS

Bid #IND2123546B1 Submersible Lift Station Pumps Parts
 Group 8 Repair(Warranty) &Install/Removal Service

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Tom Evans Environmental Inc.		Estimate based on previous contract awarded 10/9/2018 adjusted with PPI data		Difference Percent	Barney's Pumps Inc	
				Price	Total	Price	Total		Price	Total
IND2123546B1--08-01	Submersible Pump Curve No. 8 240V 3 Phase 15 HP 4 in. Discharge 2 in. Guide	2	each	\$6,778.45	\$ 13,556.90	\$5,769.84	\$ 11,539.68	17%	\$7,116.00	\$ 14,232.00
IND2123546B1--08-02	Submersible Pump Curve No. 8 480V 3 Phase 15 HP 4 in. Discharge 2 in. Guide	1	each	\$6,778.45	\$ 6,778.45	\$5,769.84	\$ 5,769.84	17%	\$7,116.00	\$ 7,116.00
				\$ 20,335.35					\$ 21,348.00	

AWD

AWD: Recommended for Award

PRICE ANALYSIS

Bid #IND2123546B1 Submersible Lift Station Pumps Parts
 Repair(Warranty) &Install/Removal Service
 Group 8

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Hudson Pump and Equipment Price	Hudson Pump and Equipment Total	Wastewater Solutions Price	Wastewater Solutions Total	F J Nugent & Associates Inc Price	F J Nugent & Associates Inc Total
	Submersible Pump Curve No. 8 240V 3 Phase 15 HP 4 in.								
IND2123546B1--08-01	Discharge 2 in. Guide	2	each	\$8,555.00	\$ 17,110.00	\$10,294.00	\$ 20,588.00		No Bid
	Submersible Pump Curve No. 8 480V 3 Phase 15 HP 4 in.								
IND2123546B1--08-02	Discharge 2 in. Guide	1	each	\$8,395.00	\$ 8,395.00	\$10,294.00	\$ 10,294.00		No Bid
					\$ 25,505.00		\$ 30,882.00		

AWD: Recommended for Award

PRICE ANALYSIS

Bid #IND2123546B1 Submersible Lift Station Pumps Parts
 Repair(Warranty) &Install/Removal Service
 Group 9

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Tom Evans Environmental Inc.		Barney's Pumps Inc		Estimate based on previous contract awarded 10/9/2018 adjusted with PPI data		Difference Percent
				Price	Total	Price	Total	Price	Total	
IND2123546B1--09-01	Submersible Pump Curve No. 9 240V 3 Phase 15 HP 4 in. Discharge 2 in. Guide	1	each	\$ 6,824.58	\$ 6,824.58	\$ 7,116.00	\$ 7,116.00	\$ 5,990.24	\$ 5,990.24	19%
IND2123546B1--09-02	Submersible Pump Curve No. 9 480V 3 Phase 15 HP 4 in. Discharge 2 in. Guide	1	each	\$ 6,824.58	\$ 6,824.58	\$ 7,116.00	\$ 7,116.00	\$ 5,990.24	\$ 5,990.24	19%
				\$ 13,649.16	\$ 13,649.16	\$ 14,232.00	\$ 14,232.00			

REJ

AWD

REJ: Reject, offered pumps with a 3-inch discharge modified with a 4-inch elbow (adapter). Items require a 4-inch discharge (as specified in the solicitation Attachment A-1, 14th bullet point).

AWD: Recommended for Award

PRICE ANALYSIS

Bid #IND2123546B1 Submersible Lift Station Pumps Parts
 Repair(Warranty) &Install/Removal Service
 Group 9

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Hudson Pump and Equipment Price	Hudson Pump and Equipment Total	Wastewater Solutions Price	Wastewater Solutions Total	F J Nugent & Associates Inc Price Total
IND2123546B1--09-01	Submersible Pump Curve No. 9 240V 3 Phase 15 HP 4 in. Discharge 2 in. Guide	1	each	\$ 8,555.00	\$ 8,555.00	\$ 10,294.00	\$ 10,294.00	No Bid
IND2123546B1--09-02	Submersible Pump Curve No. 9 480V 3 Phase 15 HP 4 in. Discharge 2 in. Guide	1	each	\$ 8,395.00	\$ 8,395.00	\$ 10,294.00	\$ 10,294.00	No Bid
					\$ 16,950.00		\$ 20,588.00	

REJ: Reject, offered pumps with a 3-inch discharge modified with a 4-inch elbow (adapter). Items require a 4-inch discharge (as specified in the solicitation Attachment A-1, 14th bullet point).

AWD: Recommended for Award

PRICE ANALYSIS

Submersible Lift Station Pumps Parts
Repair(Warranty) & Install/Removal
Service

Bid #IND2123546B1
Group 10

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Barney's Pumps Inc		Estimate based on previous contract awarded 10/9/2018 adjusted with PPI data		Difference Percent	Tom Evans Environmental Inc.	
				Price	Total	Price	Total		Price	Total
	Submersible Pump Curve No. 10 240V 3 Phase 20 HP 6 in. Discharge 2 in.	7	each	\$ 8,348.00	\$ 58,436.00	\$ 6,433.36	\$ 45,033.52	30%	\$ 8,520.77	\$ 59,645.39
IND2123546B1--10-01	Submersible Pump Curve No. 10 480V 3 Phase 20 HP 6 in. Discharge 2 in.	9	each	\$ 8,348.00	\$ 75,132.00	\$ 6,433.36	\$ 57,900.24	30%	\$ 8,520.77	\$ 76,686.93
					\$ 133,568.00					\$ 136,332.32

AWD

AWD: Recommended for Award

PRICE ANALYSIS

Submersible Lift Station Pumps Parts
Repair(Warranty) & Install/Removal
Service

Bid #IND2123546B1
Group 10

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Hudson Pump and Equipment		F J Nugent & Associates Inc		Hudson Pump and Equipment (alternate)	
				Price	Total	Price	Total	Price	Total
	Submersible Pump Curve No. 10 240V 3 Phase 20 HP 6 in. Discharge 2 in.	7	each	\$ 9,635.00	\$ 67,445.00	\$ 10,289.00	\$ 72,023.00	\$ 12,735.00	\$ 89,145.00
IND2123546B1--10-01	Submersible Pump Curve No. 10 480V 3 Phase 20 HP 6 in. Discharge 2 in.	9	each	\$ 9,474.00	\$ 85,266.00	\$ 10,289.00	\$ 92,601.00	\$ 12,565.00	\$ 113,085.00
					\$ 152,711.00		\$ 164,624.00		\$ 202,230.00

AWD: Recommended for Award

PRICE ANALYSIS

Submersible Lift Station Pumps Parts
Repair(Warranty) & Install/Removal
Service

Bid #IND2123546B1
Group 10

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Price	Wastewater Solutions Total
	Submersible Pump Curve No. 10 240V 3 Phase 20 HP 6 in. Discharge 2 in.	7	each	\$ 14,090.00	\$ 98,630.00
IND2123546B1--10-01	Submersible Pump Curve No. 10 480V 3 Phase 20 HP 6 in. Discharge 2 in.	9	each	\$ 14,090.00	\$ 126,810.00
IND2123546B1--10-02					\$ 225,440.00

AWD: Recommended for Award

PRICE ANALYSIS

Bid #IND2123546B1 Submersible Lift Station Pumps Parts
 Repair(Warranty) &Install/Removal Service
 Group 11

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Barney's Pumps Inc		Estimate based on previous contract awarded 10/9/2018 adjusted with PPI data		Difference Percent	Tom Evans Environmental Inc.	
				Price	Total	Price	Total		Price	Total
	Submersible Pump Curve No. 11 240V 3 Phase 20 HP 4 in. Discharge 2 in.	2	each	\$7,180.00	\$ 14,360.00	\$6,325.48	\$ 12,650.96	14%	\$7,561.36	\$ 15,122.72
IND2123546B1--11-01				\$7,180.00	\$ 7,180.00	\$6,325.48	\$ 6,325.48	14%	\$7,561.36	\$ 7,561.36
	Submersible Pump Curve No. 11 480V 3 Phase 20 HP 4 in. Discharge 2 in.	1	each	\$7,180.00	\$ 7,180.00	\$6,325.48	\$ 6,325.48	14%	\$7,561.36	\$ 7,561.36
IND2123546B1--11-02				\$7,180.00	\$ 21,540.00	\$6,325.48	\$ 6,325.48	14%	\$7,561.36	\$ 22,684.08

AWD: Recommended for Award

AWD

PRICE ANALYSIS

Bid #IND2123546B1 Submersible Lift Station Pumps Parts
 Repair(Warranty) &Install/Removal Service
 Group 11

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Hudson Pump and Equipment Price	Hudson Pump and Equipment Total	Wastewater Solutions Price	Wastewater Solutions Total	F J Nugent & Associates Inc Price	F J Nugent & Associates Inc Total
IND2123546B1--11-01	Submersible Pump Curve No. 11 240V 3 Phase 20 HP 4 in. Discharge 2 in.	2	each	\$ 10,135.00	\$ 20,270.00	\$ 10,294.00	\$ 20,588.00		No Bid
IND2123546B1--11-02	Submersible Pump Curve No. 11 480V 3 Phase 20 HP 4 in. Discharge 2 in.	1	each	\$ 9,974.00	\$ 9,974.00	\$ 10,294.00	\$ 10,294.00		No Bid
					\$ 30,244.00		\$ 30,882.00		

AWD: Recommended for Award

PRICE ANALYSIS

Submersible Lift Station Pumps Parts
Repair(Warranty) &Install/Removal Service

Bid #IND2123546B1
Group 12

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Tom Evans Environmental Inc.		Estimate based on previous contract awarded 10/9/2018 adjusted with PPI data		Difference Percent	Wastewater Solutions	
				Price	Total	Price	Total		Price	Total
	Submersible Pump Curve No. 12 480V 3 Phase 25 HP 4 in.									
IND2123546B1--12-01	Discharge 3 in.	3	each	\$ 9,347.91	\$ 28,043.73	\$ 8,384.48	\$ 25,153.44	11%	\$ 10,437.00	\$ 31,311.00
	Submersible Pump Curve No. 12 480V 3 Phase 25 HP 6 in.									
IND2123546B1--12-02	Discharge 2 in.	4	each	\$ 9,550.15	\$ 38,200.60	\$ 13,247.23	\$ 52,988.92	28% *	\$ 10,437.00	\$ 41,748.00
					\$ 66,244.33					\$ 73,059.00

AWD: Recommended for Award

* Item not on previous contract, average of unit price(s) from all bids received used for comparison purposes.

PRICE ANALYSIS

Bid #IND2123546B1
Group 12
Submersible Lift Station Pumps Parts
Repair(Warranty) &Install/Removal Service

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Barney's Pumps Inc Price	Barney's Pumps Inc Total	Hudson Pump and Equipment Price	Hudson Pump and Equipment Total	Hudson Pump and Equipment (alternate) Price	Hudson Pump and Equipment (alternate) Total	F J Nugent & Associates Inc Price	F J Nugent & Associates Inc Total
IND2123546B1--12-01	Submersible Pump Curve No. 12 480V 3 Phase 25 HP 4 in. Discharge 3 in.	3	each	\$12,726.00	\$ 38,178.00	\$11,865.00	\$ 35,595.00				No Bid
IND2123546B1--12-02	Submersible Pump Curve No. 12 480V 3 Phase 25 HP 6 in. Discharge 2 in.	4	each	\$12,834.00	\$ 51,336.00	\$14,125.00	\$ 56,500.00	\$19,290.00	\$ 77,160.00		No Bid
					\$ 89,514.00		\$ 92,095.00		\$ 77,160.00		

alternate item 2

AWD: Recommended for Award

* Item not on previous contract, average of unit price(s) from all bids received used for comparison purposes.

PRICE ANALYSIS

Submersible Lift Station Pumps Parts
Repair(Warranty) &Install/Removal
Service

Bid #IND2123546B1
Group 13

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	F J Nugent & Associates Inc		Estimate based on previous contract awarded 10/9/2018 adjusted with PPI data		Difference Percent	Tom Evans Environmental Inc.	
				Price	Total	Price	Total		Price	Total
IND2123546B1--13-01	Submersible Pump Curve No. 13 240V 3 Phase 30 HP 4 in. Discharge 3 in.	1	each	\$11,172.00	\$ 11,172.00	\$ 9,705.72	\$ 9,705.72	15%	\$11,060.08	\$ 11,060.08
	Submersible Pump Curve No. 13 480V 3 Phase 30 HP 6 in. Discharge 3 in.	3	each	\$11,172.00	\$ 33,516.00	\$ 9,705.72	\$ 29,117.16	15%	\$11,398.07	\$ 34,194.21
				\$ 44,688.00						\$ 45,254.29

AWD: Recommended for Award

AWD

PRICE ANALYSIS

Submersible Lift Station Pumps Parts
Repair(Warranty) &Install/Removal

Bid #IND2123546B1

Service

Group 13

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Barney's Pumps Inc		Hudson Pump and Equipment		Wastewater Solutions	
				Price	Total	Price	Total	Price	Total
	Submersible Pump Curve No. 13 240V 3 Phase 30								
IND2123546B1--13-01	HP 4 in. Discharge 3 in.	1	each	\$ 12,430.00	\$ 12,430.00	\$ 13,505.00	\$ 13,505.00	\$ 16,982.00	\$ 16,982.00
	Submersible Pump Curve No. 13 480V 3 Phase 30								
IND2123546B1--13-02	HP 6 in. Discharge 3 in.	3	each	\$ 12,430.00	\$ 37,290.00	\$ 15,749.00	\$ 47,247.00	\$ 16,982.00	\$ 50,946.00
					\$ 49,720.00		\$ 60,752.00		\$ 67,928.00

AWD: Recommended for Award

PRICE ANALYSIS

Submersible Lift Station Pumps
Parts Repair(Warranty)
& Install/Removal Service

Bid #IND2123546B1
Group 14

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Barney's Pumps Inc Price	Barney's Pumps Inc Total	Estimate based on previous contract awarded 10/9/2018 adjusted with PPI data Price	Estimate based on previous contract awarded 10/9/2018 adjusted with PPI data Total	Difference Percent	Tom Evans Environmental Inc. Price	Tom Evans Environmental Inc. Total
IND2123546B1--14-01	Submersible Pump Curve No. 14 480V 3 Phase 40 HP 6 in. Discharge 2 in.	6	each	\$13,695.00	\$ 82,170.00	\$ 12,074.44	\$ 72,446.64	13%	\$15,321.00	\$ 91,926.00

AWD

AWD: Recommended for Award

PRICE ANALYSIS

Submersible Lift Station Pumps

Parts Repair(Warranty)

& Install/Removal Service

Bid #IND2123546B1

Group 14

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Hudson Pump and Equipment Price	Hudson Pump and Equipment Total	Hudson Pump and Equipment (alternate) Price	Hudson Pump and Equipment Total	Wastewater Solutions Price	Wastewater Solutions Total	F J Nugent & Associates Inc Price	F J Nugent & Associates Inc Total
IND2123546B1--14-01	Submersible Pump Curve No. 14 480V 3 Phase 40 HP 6 in. Discharge 2 in.	6	each	\$18,557.00	\$ 111,342.00	\$24,180.00	\$ 145,080.00	\$27,120.00	\$ 162,720.00		No Bid

AWD: Recommended for Award

PRICE ANALYSIS

Submersible Lift Station Pumps

Parts Repair(Warranty)

& Install/Removal Service

Bid #IND2123546B1

Group 15

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Barney's Pumps Inc Price	Barney's Pumps Inc Total	Estimate based on previous contract awarded 10/9/2018 adjusted with PPI data	Difference Percent	F J Nugent & Associates Inc Price	F J Nugent & Associates Inc Total
IND2123546B1--15-01	Submersible Pump Curve No. 15 480V 3 Phase 50 HP 6 in. Discharge 3 in.	1	each	\$21,011.00	\$ 21,011.00	\$ 18,768.80	12%	\$21,244.00	\$ 21,244.00

AWD

AWD: Recommended for Award

PRICE ANALYSIS

Submersible Lift Station Pumps
Parts Repair(Warranty)
& Install/Removal Service
Bid #IND2123546B1
Group 15

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Hudson Pump and Equipment Price	Total	Tom Evans Environmental Inc. Price	Total	Wastewater Solutions Price	Total
IND2123546B1--15-01	Submersible Pump Curve No. 15 480V 3 Phase 50 HP 6 in. Discharge 3 in.	1	each	\$22,493.00	\$ 22,493.00	\$25,860.70	\$ 25,860.70	\$27,906.00	\$ 27,906.00

AWD: Recommended for Award

PRICE ANALYSIS

Submersible Lift Station Pumps Parts
Repair(Warranty) &Install/Removal
Service

Bid #IND2123546B1
Group 16

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Barney's Pumps Inc Price	Barney's Pumps Inc Total	Estimate based on previous contract awarded 10/9/2018 adjusted with PPI data Price	Estimate based on previous contract awarded 10/9/2018 adjusted with PPI data Total	Difference Percent	F J Nugent & Associates Inc Price	F J Nugent & Associates Inc Total
IND2123546B1--16-01	Submersible Pump Curve No. 16 480V 3 Phase 60 HP 6 in. Discharge 3 in.	4	each	\$ 19,377.00	\$ 77,508.00	\$ 16,253.92	\$ 65,015.68	19%	\$ 21,244.00	\$ 84,976.00

AWD

AWD: Recommended for Award

PRICE ANALYSIS

Submersible Lift Station Pumps Parts
Repair(Warranty) &Install/Removal
Service

Bid #IND2123546B1
Group 16

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Hudson Pump and Equipment Price	Total	Tom Evans Environmental Inc. Price	Total	Wastewater Solutions Price	Total
IND2123546B1--16-01	Submersible Pump Curve No. 16 480V 3 Phase 60 HP 6 in. Discharge 3 in.	4	each	\$ 25,867.00	\$ 103,468.00	\$ 26,488.19	\$ 105,952.76	\$ 37,245.00	\$ 148,980.00

AWD: Recommended for Award

PRICE ANALYSIS

Bid #IND2123546B1 Submersible Lift Station Pumps Parts
 Group 17 Repair(Warranty) &Install/Removal Service

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Barney's Pumps Inc Price	Barney's Pumps Inc Total	Estimate based on previous contract awarded 10/9/2018 adjusted with PPI data Price	Estimate based on previous contract awarded 10/9/2018 adjusted with PPI data Total	Difference Percent	F J Nugent & Associates Inc Price	F J Nugent & Associates Inc Total
IND2123546B1--17-01	Submersible Pump Curve No. 17 480V 3 Phase Rated 75 HP 6 in. Discharge	4	each	\$20,657.00	\$ 82,628.00	\$ 26,570.96	\$ 106,283.84	22%	\$23,692.00	\$ 94,768.00

AWD

AWD: Recommended for Award

-

PRICE ANALYSIS

Bid #IND2123546B1 Submersible Lift Station Pumps Parts
 Group 17 Repair(Warranty) &Install/Removal Service

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Tom Evans Environmental Inc. Price	Tom Evans Environmental Inc. Total	Hudson Pump and Equipment Price	Hudson Pump and Equipment Total	Wastewater Solutions Price	Wastewater Solutions Total
IND2123546B1--17-01	Submersible Pump Curve No. 17 480V 3 Phase Rated 75 HP 6 in. Discharge	4	each	\$28,916.05	\$ 115,664.20	\$33,663.00	\$ 134,652.00	\$41,355.00	\$ 165,420.00

AWD: Recommended for Award

PRICE ANALYSIS

Bid #IND2123546B1 Submersible Lift Station Pumps Parts
 Group 18 Repair(Warranty) &Install/Removal Service

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Barney's Pumps Inc		Estimate based on previous contract awarded 10/9/2018 adjusted with PPI data		Difference		Tom Evans Environmental Inc.	
				Price	Total	Price	Total	Percent	Price	Total	
IND2123546B1--18-01	Submersible Pump Curve No. 18 100 HP 480V 3 Phase 6 in. Discharge 3 in.	1	each	\$ 20,875.00	\$ 20,875.00	\$ 33,403.33	\$ 33,403.33	-38%	\$ 30,660.32	\$ 30,660.32	

AWD

AWD: Recommended for Award

*Item not on previous contract, average of unit price(s) from all bids received used for comparison purposes.

PRICE ANALYSIS

Bid #IND2123546B1 Submersible Lift Station Pumps Parts
 Group 18 Repair(Warranty) &Install/Removal Service

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Hudson Pump and Equipment Price	Hudson Pump and Equipment Total	Wastewater Solutions Price	Wastewater Solutions Total	F J Nugent & Associates Inc Price	F J Nugent & Associates Inc Total
IND2123546B1--18-01	Submersible Pump Curve No. 18 100 HP 480V 3 Phase 6 in. Discharge 3 in.	1	each	\$ 40,723.00	\$ 40,723.00	\$ 41,355.00	\$ 41,355.00		No Bid

AWD: Recommended for Award

*Item not on previous contract, average of unit price(s) from all bids received used for comparison purposes.

PRICE ANALYSIS

Submersible Lift Station Pumps Parts
Repair(Warranty) &Install/Removal
Service

Bid #IND2123546B1
Group 19

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Estimate based on previous contract awarded 10/9/2018 adjusted with PPI data		Difference Percent	Hudson Pump and Equipment		Wastewater Solutions Price Total
				Price	Total		Price	Total	
IND2123546B1--19-01	Submersible Pump No Curve 240V 3 Phase 15 HP 6 in Discharge Ebara	3	each	\$ 6,138.72	\$ 18,416.16	16%	\$ 8,489.00	\$ 25,467.00	No Bid
IND2123546B1--19-02	Submersible Pump No Curve 30 HP 480V 3 Phase 4 in. Discharge Ebara	1	each	\$ 9,481.84	\$ 9,481.84	13%	\$ 13,505.00	\$ 13,505.00	No Bid
IND2123546B1--19-03	Submersible Pump No Curve 480V 3 Phase 25 HP 12 in. Discharge Ebara	3	each	\$ 10,952.72	\$ 32,858.16	4%	\$ 23,863.00	\$ 71,589.00	No Bid
IND2123546B1--19-04	Submersible Pump No Curve 30 HP 480V 3 Phase 30 HP 10 in. Discharge Ebara	1	each	\$ 10,433.04	\$ 10,433.04	19%	\$ 25,441.00	\$ 25,441.00	No Bid
IND2123546B1--19-05	Submersible Pump No Curve 460V 3 Phase 15 HP 60Hz 1750 RPM Motor Floor Mount	2	each	\$ 4,308.78	\$ 8,617.57 *	-68%	\$ 8,855.00	\$ 17,710.00	No Bid
								\$ 153,712.00	

REJ: Reject; bidder did not bid on all items of the group.

AWD: Recommended for Award

*Item not on previous contract, average of unit price(s) from all bids received used for comparison purposes.

PRICE ANALYSIS

Submersible Lift Station Pumps Parts Repair(Warranty)

Bid #IND2123546B1

&Install/Removal Service

Group 20

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Wastewater Solutions		Hudson Pump and Equipment		Barney's Pumps Inc	
				Price	Total	Price	Total	Price	Total
IND2123546B1--20-01	Onsite Installation/Removal Services	300	hour	No bid	No bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 113.00	\$ 33,900.00
IND2123546B1--20-02	Emergency Onsite Installation/Removal Services	150	hour	No bid	No bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 170.00	\$ 25,500.00
IND2123546B1--20-03	Technician Services	100	hour	No bid	No bid	\$ 125.00	\$ 12,500.00	\$ 113.00	\$ 11,300.00
IND2123546B1--20-04	Submersible Lift Station Pumps Not Listed	1	contract	0%	\$ 100,000.00	25%	\$ 100,000.00	30%	\$ 100,000.00
IND2123546B1--20-05	Parts for Submersible Lift Station Pumps	1	contract	No bid	No bid	25%	\$ 10,000.00	15%	\$ 10,000.00
				\$ 100,000.00		\$ 122,500.00		\$ 180,700.00	
				REJ		REJ		AWD	

REJ: Reject; bidder did not bid on all items of the group.

AWD: Recommended for Award

PRICE ANALYSIS

Submersible Lift Station Pumps Parts Repair(Warranty)

Bid #IND2123546B1

&Install/Removal Service

Group 20

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Estimate based on previous contract awarded 10/9/2018 adjusted with PPI data		Difference Percent	F J Nugent & Associates Inc	
				Price	Total		Price	Total
IND2123546B1--20-01	Onsite Installation/Removal Services	300	hour	\$132.24	\$ 39,672.00	-15%	\$ 150.00	\$ 45,000.00
IND2123546B1--20-02	Emergency Onsite Installation/Removal Services	150	hour	\$198.36	\$ 29,754.00	-14%	\$ 300.00	\$ 45,000.00
IND2123546B1--20-03	Technician Services	100	hour	\$132.24	\$ 13,224.00	-15%	\$ 100.00	\$ 10,000.00
IND2123546B1--20-04	Submersible Lift Station Pumps Not Listed	1	contract	0%	\$ 100,000.00		5%	\$ 100,000.00
IND2123546B1--20-05	Parts for Submersible Lift Station Pumps	1	contract	0%	\$ 10,000.00		5%	\$ 10,000.00
							\$	210,000.00

AWD

REJ: Reject; bidder did not bid on all items of the group.

AWD: Recommended for Award

PRICE ANALYSIS

Submersible Lift Station Pumps Parts Repair(Warranty)

Bid #IND2123546B1

&Install/Removal Service

Group 20

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Tom Evans Environmental Inc. Price	Total
IND2123546B1--20-01	Onsite Installation/Removal Services	300	hour	\$ 600.00	\$ 180,000.00
IND2123546B1--20-02	Emergency Onsite Installation/Removal Services	150	hour	\$1,200.00	\$ 180,000.00
IND2123546B1--20-03	Technician Services	100	hour	\$ 600.00	\$ 60,000.00
IND2123546B1--20-04	Submersible Lift Station Pumps Not Listed	1	contract	5%	\$ 100,000.00
IND2123546B1--20-05	Parts for Submersible Lift Station Pumps	1	contract	5%	\$ 10,000.00
				\$	\$ 530,000.00

AWD

REJ: Reject; bidder did not bid on all items of the group.

AWD: Recommended for Award