
         

             

             

 

   

   

   

 

 

 

 

 

 
   

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

   

   

             

   

 

   
 

   

 

   

   

 

     

         

         

           

           

           

       

             

         

    
     

         

             

   

 

   
 

   

 

   

   

 

     

         

         

           

           

           

       

             

         

    
     

   
     

             

   

 

   
 

   

 

   

   

 

     

         

         

           

           

           

       

             

         

    
     

   
     

   

 

 

   

 

   

Bid Tabulation Date Bid Posted: July 31, 2020 

Bid No. PNC2119543C1 Bid Bid Opened: September 9, 2020 

Job Order Contract (JOC) Step 2  Bid Submittals: 8 

Declinations: 1 

Open Market/Goal Participation 
Alen Construction 

Group, Inc. 

Big Dog 
Construction 
Services, Inc. 

Danz 
Contracting, 

LLC 

FHP 
Tectonics 
Corp 

Florida Palm 
Construction 

Lee 
Construction 
Group, Inc. 

Mejia 
International 
Group Corp 

Shiff Construction 
and Development, 

Inc. 

Item # Item 

Non‐Sheltered Market (30% 
Goal) 

Non‐Sheltered Market (30% 
Goal) 

Non‐Sheltered 
Market (30% Goal) 

Non‐Sheltered 
Market (30% 

Goal) 

Non‐Sheltered 
Market (30% Goal) 

Non‐Sheltered 
Market (30% Goal) 

Non‐Sheltered Market 
(30% Goal) 

Non‐Sheltered Market (30% 
Goal) 

AVIATION 
DEPARTMENT 

PNC2119543C1‐01 

Non‐Security Areas, Normal Working Hours 
Adjustment Factor (20%) 1.5500 No Bid 1.1375 1.1000 No Bid 0.8950 No Bid 1.5000 

Non‐Security Areas, Other than Normal Working 
Hours Adjustment Factor (10%) 1.8500 No Bid 1.1875 1.1500 No Bid 0.9450 No Bid 1.7500 

Security Areas, Normal Working Hours Adjustment 
Factor (40%) 1.6000 No Bid 1.1875 1.2000 No Bid 0.9450 No Bid 1.7500 

Security Areas, Other than Normal Working Hours 
Adjustment Factor (20%) 1.9000 No Bid 1.2275 1.2500 No Bid 0.9950 No Bid 2.0000 

Non Pre‐Priced (10%) 
1.3000 No Bid 1.1150 1.1000 No Bid 1.0500 No Bid 1.4000 

Award Criteria Figure 1.6450 No Bid 1.1783 1.1750 No Bid 0.9555 No Bid 1.7150 

Item # Item 

Non‐Sheltered Market (30% 
Goal) 

Non‐Sheltered Market (30% 
Goal) 

Non‐Sheltered 
Market (30% Goal) 

Non‐Sheltered 
Market (30% 

Goal) 

Non‐Sheltered 
Market (30% Goal) 

Non‐Sheltered 
Market (30% Goal) 

Non‐Sheltered Market 
(30% Goal) 

Non‐Sheltered Market (30% 
Goal) 

FACILITIES 
MANAGEMENT / 

OTHER 
PNC2119543C1‐02 

Non‐Security Areas, Normal Working Hours 
Adjustment Factor (20%) No Bid No Bid 1.1250 1.1000 1.2070 0.8450 No Bid 1.2000 

Non‐Security Areas, Other than Normal Working 
Hours Adjustment Factor (10%) No Bid No Bid 1.1550 1.1500 1.2170 0.8850 No Bid 1.4000 

Security Areas, Normal Working Hours Adjustment 
Factor (40%) No Bid No Bid 1.1350 1.2000 1.2270 0.8450 No Bid 1.3500 

Security Areas, Other than Normal Working Hours 
Adjustment Factor (20%) No Bid No Bid 1.1650 1.2500 1.2370 0.8850 No Bid 1.6500 

Non Pre‐Priced (10%) 
No Bid No Bid 1.1000 1.1000 1.2070 1.0500 No Bid 1.4000 

Award Criteria Figure 
No Bid No Bid 1.1375 1.1750 1.2220 0.8775 No Bid 1.3900 

Item # Item 

Non‐Sheltered Market (30% 
Goal) 

Non‐Sheltered Market (30% 
Goal) 

Non‐Sheltered 
Market (30% Goal) 

Non‐Sheltered 
Market (30% 

Goal) 

Non‐Sheltered 
Market (30% Goal) 

Non‐Sheltered 
Market (30% Goal) 

Non‐Sheltered Market 
(30% Goal) 

Non‐Sheltered Market (30% 
Goal) 

PORT EVERGLADES 
DEPARTMENT 

PNC2119543C1‐03 

Non‐Security Areas, Normal Working Hours 
Adjustment Factor (40%) 

Non‐Security Areas, Other than Normal Working 
Hours Adjustment Factor (20%) 

Security Areas, Normal Working Hours Adjustment 
Factor (20%) 

Security Areas, Other than Normal Working Hours 
Adjustment Factor (10%) 

Non Pre‐Priced (10%) 

1.2500 No Bid 1.1375 1.1000 No Bid 0.8950 No Bid 1.0800 

1.3500 No Bid 1.1875 1.1500 No Bid 0.9450 No Bid 1.1500 

1.3000 No Bid 1.1875 1.2000 No Bid 0.9450 No Bid 1.2500 

1.4000 No Bid 1.2275 1.2500 No Bid 0.9950 No Bid 1.5000 

1.3000 No Bid 1.1150 1.1000 No Bid 1.0500 No Bid 1.4000 

Award Criteria Figure 
1.3000 No Bid 1.1643 1.1450 No Bid .9405 No Bid 1.2020 

Exhibit 1




Accessibility Report


		Filename: 

		Exhibit 1 - Bid Tab.pdf




		Report created by: 

		

		Organization: 

		




[Enter personal and organization information through the Preferences > Identity dialog.]


Summary


The checker found no problems in this document.


		Needs manual check: 0

		Passed manually: 2

		Failed manually: 0

		Skipped: 0

		Passed: 30

		Failed: 0




Detailed Report


		Document



		Rule Name		Status		Description

		Accessibility permission flag		Passed		Accessibility permission flag must be set

		Image-only PDF		Passed		Document is not image-only PDF

		Tagged PDF		Passed		Document is tagged PDF

		Logical Reading Order		Passed manually		Document structure provides a logical reading order

		Primary language		Passed		Text language is specified

		Title		Passed		Document title is showing in title bar

		Bookmarks		Passed		Bookmarks are present in large documents

		Color contrast		Passed manually		Document has appropriate color contrast

		Page Content



		Rule Name		Status		Description

		Tagged content		Passed		All page content is tagged

		Tagged annotations		Passed		All annotations are tagged

		Tab order		Passed		Tab order is consistent with structure order

		Character encoding		Passed		Reliable character encoding is provided

		Tagged multimedia		Passed		All multimedia objects are tagged

		Screen flicker		Passed		Page will not cause screen flicker

		Scripts		Passed		No inaccessible scripts

		Timed responses		Passed		Page does not require timed responses

		Navigation links		Passed		Navigation links are not repetitive

		Forms



		Rule Name		Status		Description

		Tagged form fields		Passed		All form fields are tagged

		Field descriptions		Passed		All form fields have description

		Alternate Text



		Rule Name		Status		Description

		Figures alternate text		Passed		Figures require alternate text

		Nested alternate text		Passed		Alternate text that will never be read

		Associated with content		Passed		Alternate text must be associated with some content

		Hides annotation		Passed		Alternate text should not hide annotation

		Other elements alternate text		Passed		Other elements that require alternate text

		Tables



		Rule Name		Status		Description

		Rows		Passed		TR must be a child of Table, THead, TBody, or TFoot

		TH and TD		Passed		TH and TD must be children of TR

		Headers		Passed		Tables should have headers

		Regularity		Passed		Tables must contain the same number of columns in each row and rows in each column

		Summary		Passed		Tables must have a summary

		Lists



		Rule Name		Status		Description

		List items		Passed		LI must be a child of L

		Lbl and LBody		Passed		Lbl and LBody must be children of LI

		Headings



		Rule Name		Status		Description

		Appropriate nesting		Passed		Appropriate nesting






Back to Top


