



Date Bid Posted: 08/20/2020
 Date Bid Opened: 09/02/2020
 Bid Submittals: 7
 Declinations: 0

Price Analysis
 Bid No. TRN2121638B1
 Engine Coolant
 Agency: Broward County Transit
 Purchasing Agent: Jermaine Pinnoch

Item	Description	Unit	Qty	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price
1-1	ES Complete Coolant OAT - in Bulk	GALLON	28500	No Bid	No Bid	\$4.28	\$121,980.00	\$4.67	\$133,095.00	\$5.29	\$150,765.00
1-2	ES Complete Coolant OAT - in Totes	GALLON	27500	\$3.46	\$95,150.00	\$4.48	\$123,200.00	\$4.67	\$128,425.00	\$5.80	\$159,500.00
1-3	Drum	GALLON	5500	\$4.28	\$23,540.00	\$9.00	\$49,500.00	\$7.49	\$41,185.00	\$9.20	\$50,600.00
1-4	Drum Replacement Cost	EACH	10	\$45.00	\$450.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid
Total					\$119,140.00		\$294,680.00		\$302,715.00		\$357,845.00

Potential Award Total	\$294,680.00
3 Year Potential Total	\$ 884,040.00

Unit Price	Total Price	Difference Between Responsible Bid and Previous Contract	Percentage Difference Between Responsible Bid and Previous Contract
\$4.45	\$126,825.00		
\$4.87	\$133,925.00		
\$4.69	\$25,795.00		
\$0.00	\$0.00		
\$286,545.00		\$5,135.00	2.84% Increase

Item	Description	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price
	Flamingo Oil Company, A Rosedyne Company 205 NE 17th Street Miami, FL 33161	\$4.28	\$121,980.00	\$4.67	\$133,095.00	\$5.29	\$150,765.00
	Cummins (Rejected) 1097 Park 100 Dr Glen Burnie, MD 21062	No Bid	No Bid	\$4.67	\$128,425.00	\$5.80	\$159,500.00
	Ultra Chem (Rejected) 1444 nw 82nd ave Doral, FL 33126	No Bid	No Bid	\$4.28	\$23,540.00	\$9.20	\$50,600.00
	Santex Corporation 14780 SW 136 ST MIAMI, FL 33196	\$4.67	\$128,425.00	\$7.49	\$41,185.00	\$9.20	\$50,600.00
	Palmdale Oil Company, Inc. 500 Pine St ORLANDO, FL 32824	\$5.46	\$155,610.00	\$9.47	\$52,085.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
	Port Consolidated, Inc. 11550 NW 36 AVE MIAMI, FL 33167	\$5.29	\$150,765.00	\$5.80	\$159,500.00	No Bid	No Bid
	Bleu Stream Corp 6690 NW 80th Manor Parkland, FL 33067	\$8.996	\$245,395.00	\$8.996	\$247,390.00	\$19.96	\$109,774.50
	Independent Cost Estimate	\$6.00	\$171,000.00	\$6.00	\$165,000.00	\$12.00	\$66,000.00
	Initial 1YR Term Estimate		\$614,650.50		\$380,865.00		\$402,000.00