

Southeast Florida Governmental Purchasing Co-operative (Co-op)

**20-21B - Furnish, Delivery and Discharge of Quicklime - Type 1 – Pebble Lime**

#	AGENCY	DELIVERY ADDRESS	ANNUAL USAGE	Carmeuse Lime & Stone			Lhoist North America of Alabama, LLC				
				PRICE PER TON	FREIGHT CHARGE	Delivered Price	Agency Total	PRICE PER TON	FREIGHT CHARGE	Delivered Price	Agency Total
1	Broward County Dist. 1	3701 N State Road 7	2500	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 202.00	\$82.80	\$284.80	\$712,000.00
2	Broward County Dist. 2	1390 NE 51 St.	4500	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 202.00	\$82.80	\$284.80	\$1,281,600.00
3	City of Coral	3800 NW 85th Avenue	1352	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 202.00	\$82.80	\$284.80	\$385,049.60
4	Town of Davie	3500 NW 76th Avenue	1000	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 202.00	\$82.80	\$284.80	\$284,800.00
5	City of Dania Beach	1201 Stirling Road Dania	350	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 202.00	\$82.80	\$284.80	\$99,680.00
6	City of Deerfield Beach	290 Goolsby Blvd. – West Plant	1415	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 202.00	\$82.80	\$284.80	\$402,992.00
7	City of Fort Lauderdale	949 NW 38th St. Ft. Lauderdale	11500	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 202.00	\$82.80	\$284.80	\$3,275,200.00
8	City of Hallandale	630 NW 6th	900	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 202.00	\$ 82.8000	\$284.80	\$256,320.00
9	City of Lake Worth Beach	301 College St. Lake Worth	525	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 202.00	\$ 82.8000	\$284.80	\$149,520.00
10	City of Lauderdale	2101 NW 49th	1825	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 202.00	\$ 82.8000	\$284.80	\$519,760.00
11	City of North Lauderdale	841 NW 71st Avenue North	650	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 202.00	\$ 82.8000	\$284.80	\$185,120.00
12	City of North Village of Palm	12098 NW 11th	1150	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 202.00	\$ 82.8000	\$284.80	\$327,520.00
13	Village of Palm Springs	360 David Road	600	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 202.00	\$ 82.8000	\$284.80	\$170,880.00
14	Village of Palm Springs	5618 Basil Drive West Palm Beach	600	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 202.00	\$ 82.8000	\$284.80	\$170,880.00
15	City of Pompano Beach	City of Pompano Beach	2200	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 202.00	\$ 82.8000	\$284.80	\$626,560.00
16	City of Riviera Beach	800 W. Blue Heron Blvd. Riviera Beach	588	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 202.00	\$ 82.8000	\$284.80	\$167,462.40

17	City of Sunrise	4350 Springtree Drive Sunrise	2400	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 202.00	\$ 82.8000	\$ 284.80	\$ 683,520.00
18	City of Sunrise	15400 Sludge Mill Road Davie	600	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 202.00	\$ 82.8000	\$ 284.80	\$ 170,880.00
19	Village of Wellington	1100 Wellington Trace Wellington	1330	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 202.00	\$ 82.8000	\$ 284.80	\$ 378,784.00
Subtotal:												\$10,248,528.00

**20-21B - Furnish, Delivery and Discharge of Quicklime - Quote Form - Type 1A -- Foundry/Rice Lime**

#	AGENCY	DELIVERY ADDRESS	ANNUAL USAGE	Carmeuse Lime & Stone			Lhoist North America of Alabama, LLC					
				PRICE PER TON	FREIGHT CHARGE	Delivered Price	PRICE PER TON	FREIGHT CHARGE	Delivered Price			
1	City of Boynton Beach	124 E. Woolbright Rd. Boynton Beach	1685	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 202.00	\$ 82.80	\$ 284.80	\$ 479,888.00
2	City of Delray Beach	201 SW 7th St. Delray Beach	3650	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 202.00	\$ 82.80	\$ 284.80	\$ 1,039,520.00
3	City of Hollywood	3441 Hollywood Blvd. Hollywood	2400	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 202.00	\$ 82.80	\$ 284.80	\$ 683,520.00
4	City of Margate	980 NW 66th Ave Margate	2000	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 202.00	\$ 82.80	\$ 284.80	\$ 569,600.00
5	City of North Miami Beach	19150 NW 8th Ave Miami Gardens	3000	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 202.00	\$ 82.80	\$ 284.80	\$ 854,400.00
6	City of Pembroke Pines	7960 Johnson Street Pembroke Pines	4200	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 202.00	\$ 82.80	\$ 284.80	\$ 1,196,160.00
7	City of Tamarac	7803 NW 61st Street Tamarac	1500	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 202.00	\$ 82.80	\$ 284.80	\$ 427,200.00





**Southeast Florida Governmental Purchasing Co-op  
Bid 20-21B, Furnish, Deliver and Discharge of Quicklime  
Estimated Annual Dollars Spend Inclusive of Allowable Quarterly Price Adjustments**

Year	Annual Quantity	Unit	Total Price Delivered	Estimated Price Adjustment Increase %	Estimated Adjusted Price	Total Estimated Yearly Value	Estimated Annual Average Amount
1	7,000	Ton	\$ 284.80	3%	\$ 293.34	\$ 2,053,408.00	
2	7,000	Ton	\$ 293.34	3%	\$ 302.14	\$ 2,115,010.24	
3	7,000	Ton	\$ 302.14	3%	\$ 311.21	\$ 2,178,460.55	
4	7,000	Ton	\$ 311.21	3%	\$ 320.54	\$ 2,243,814.36	\$ 2,213,714.10
5	7,000	Ton	\$ 320.54	3%	\$ 330.16	\$ 2,311,128.79	
6	7,000	Ton	\$ 330.16	3%	\$ 340.07	\$ 2,380,462.66	
<b>Total Potential Six Year Term</b>						<b>\$ 13,282,284.60</b>	