

Tabulation of Bids-Group 1		Antas Body Shop and Painting 560 SOUTH BIKE HIGHWAY HOLLYWOOD, FL 33023				CAFTI BROTHERS BODY SHOP 560 SOUTH BIKE HIGHWAY HOLLYWOOD, FL 33023				Collision Acts Ft. Lauderdale 14777 AVENUE FT. LAUDERDALE, FL 33311				Pricing from Previous Contract: TRN211602281 Paint and Body Repairs for Medium and Heavy Trucks (Broward County Transportation Dept.)				Difference Between and Low Bid and Previous Contract	
Item	Description	Unit	Qty	Unit Price	Total Price	% Attributed to labor	%Discount	Future Price Year 1	Future Price Year 2	Unit Price	Total Price	% Attributed to labor	%Discount	Future Price Year 1	Future Price Year 2	Unit Price	Total Price	Total Price	
TRN212320481-01-01	Body Repair Labor Rate for Auto and Light Trucks - OEM Repair Parts for	Hour	2500	\$18.00	\$45,000.00	n/a	n/a	\$18.00	\$18.00	\$40.00	\$100,000.00	0	n/a	0	0	\$20.000	\$27,080.00	\$17,920.00	
TRN212320481-01-02	Auto and Light Trucks	Each	1	n/a	n/a	n/a	15	n/a	n/a	n/a	n/a	n/a	10	n/a	n/a	15	15	0	
TRN212320481-01-03	Miscellaneous Aftermarket Repair Parts for Auto and Light Trucks	Each	1	n/a	n/a	n/a	15	n/a	n/a	n/a	n/a	n/a	20	n/a	n/a	15	15	5	
TOTAL - Group 1					AWARD \$ 45,000.00						\$50,000.00								

Funding for	
Annual	\$ 55,000.00
Initial 2 yrs	\$ 100,000.00
total award:	\$ 200,000.00

Tabulation of Bids-Group 2		Antas Body Shop and Painting 560 SOUTH BIKE HIGHWAY HOLLYWOOD, FL 33023				CAFTI BROTHERS BODY SHOP 560 SOUTH BIKE HIGHWAY HOLLYWOOD, FL 33023				Collision Acts Ft. Lauderdale 14777 AVENUE FT. LAUDERDALE, FL 33311				Pricing from Previous Contract: TRN211602281 Paint and Body Repairs for Medium and Heavy Trucks (Broward County Transportation Dept.)				Difference Between and Low Bid and Previous Contract	
Item	Description	Unit	Qty	Unit Price	Total Price	% Attributed to labor	%Discount	Future Price Year 1	Future Price Year 2	Unit Price	Total Price	% Attributed to labor	%Discount	Future Price Year 1	Future Price Year 2	Unit Price	Total Price	Total Price	
TRN212320481-02-01	Paint and Body Repair Labor Rate for Medium and Heavy Trucks - OEM Repair Parts for	Hour	1820	\$20.00	\$36,400.00	n/a	15	\$20.00	\$20.00	\$75.00	\$136,500.00	0	n/a	0	0	\$22.000	\$22,330.00	\$17,710.00	
TRN212320481-02-02	Medium and Heavy Trucks	Each	1	n/a	n/a	n/a	15	n/a	n/a	n/a	n/a	n/a	10	n/a	n/a	15	15	0	
TRN212320481-02-03	Miscellaneous Aftermarket Repair Parts for Medium and Heavy Trucks	Each	1	No bid	No bid	n/a	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	n/a	No bid	No bid	No bid	15	15	0	
TOTAL - Group 1					AWARD \$ 40,340.00						\$50,000.00								

Funding for	
Annual	\$ 55,000.00
Initial 2 yrs	\$ 95,040.00
total award:	\$ 190,080.00

Funding Allocated for Parts	
Group 1: Misc. OEM Repair Parts	\$ 27,500.00
Group 1: Misc. Aftermarket Repair Parts	\$ 27,500.00
Group 2: Misc. OEM Repair Parts	\$ 27,500.00
Group 2: Misc. Aftermarket Repair Parts	\$ 27,500.00

Total Agreement Amount	
Annual Total with parts:	\$ 195,040.00
Initial (2 yrs) with parts:	\$ 390,080.00
Potential (5 yrs) with parts:	\$ 775,200.00