



Date Bid Posted: 8/15/2024  
Date Bid Opened: 9/20/2024  
Bid Submittals: 3  
Declinations: 0

BID TABULATION  
Bid No. BLD2128953B1, Fire Sprinkler and Fire Pump Maintenance and Repair Services  
Lot: Group 1 FMD and Group 2 PORT  
Agency: Port Everglades Department

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Advanced Systems Inc		AB Fire Equipment		Black Fire Protection Inc.	
				Price	Total	Price	Total	Price	Total
<b>Group 1 FMD</b>									
BLD2128953B1--01-01	Governmental Center East Governmental Center. 5year Internal Inspection piping.	1	each	\$ 4,505.00	\$ 4,505.00	\$ 4,375.00	\$ 4,375.00	\$ 5,625.00	\$ 5,625.00
BLD2128953B1--01-02	Governmental Center East Governmental Center. Annual Fire Pump Inspection.	1	year	\$ 1,655.00	\$ 1,655.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 750.00
BLD2128953B1--01-03	Governmental Center East Governmental Center. Quarterly Fire Sprinklers Insp.	4	quarter	\$ 1,115.00	\$ 4,460.00	\$ 1,400.00	\$ 5,600.00	\$ 1,867.50	\$ 7,470.00
BLD2128953B1--01-04	Governmental Center East. 5 year Internal Inspection of Piping.	1	each	\$ 4,505.00	\$ 4,505.00	\$ 4,375.00	\$ 4,375.00	\$ 2,625.00	\$ 2,625.00
BLD2128953B1--01-05	Governmental Center East. Quarterly Fire Sprinklers Inspection. Annual Backflow.	4	quarter	\$ 1,115.00	\$ 4,460.00	\$ 1,400.00	\$ 5,600.00	\$ 922.50	\$ 3,690.00
BLD2128953B1--01-06	Governmental Center East - 1200 Garage. 5year Internal Inspection of Piping.	1	each	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 2,800.00	\$ 2,800.00	\$ 3,375.00	\$ 3,375.00
BLD2128953B1--01-07	Governmental Center East - 1200 Garage. Annual Fire Pump Inspection.	1	year	\$ 1,655.00	\$ 1,655.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 750.00
BLD2128953B1--01-08	Governmental Center East - 1200 Garage. Quarterly Fire Sprinklers Inspection.	4	quarter	\$ 1,115.00	\$ 4,460.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 945.00	\$ 3,780.00
BLD2128953B1--01-09	Main Library. 5 year Internal Inspection of Piping.	1	each	\$ 4,505.00	\$ 4,505.00	\$ 5,500.00	\$ 5,500.00	\$ 7,125.00	\$ 7,125.00
BLD2128953B1--01-10	Main Library. Annual Fire Pump Inspection.	1	year	\$ 1,655.00	\$ 1,655.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 750.00
BLD2128953B1--01-11	Main Library. Quarterly Fire Sprinklers and Quarterly Cross Zone System Inspect	4	quarter	\$ 1,115.00	\$ 4,460.00	\$ 1,700.00	\$ 6,800.00	\$ 2,250.00	\$ 9,000.00
BLD2128953B1--01-12	Gore Building. 5-year Internal Inspection of Piping.	1	each	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 3,100.00	\$ 3,100.00	\$ 4,125.00	\$ 4,125.00
BLD2128953B1--01-13	Gore Building. Annual Fire Pump Inspection.	1	year	\$ 1,655.00	\$ 1,655.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 750.00
BLD2128953B1--01-14	Gore Building. Quarterly Fire Sprinklers Inspection and Annual Backflow Prevent.	4	quarter	\$ 1,115.00	\$ 4,460.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 4,000.00	\$ 1,342.50	\$ 5,370.00
BLD2128953B1--01-15	Governmental Center West. 5 year Internal Inspection of Piping.	1	each	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 2,550.00	\$ 2,550.00	\$ 3,375.00	\$ 3,375.00
BLD2128953B1--01-16	Governmental Center West. Annual Fire Pump Inspection.	1	year	\$ 1,655.00	\$ 1,655.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 750.00

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Advanced Systems Inc		AB Fire Equipment		Black Fire Protection Inc.	
				Price	Total	Price	Total	Price	Total
BLD2128953B1--01-17	Governmental Center West. Quarterly Fire Sprinkler and Quarterly Pre-Action Insp	4	quarter	\$ 1,115.00	\$ 4,460.00	\$ 1,550.00	\$ 6,200.00	\$ 2,745.00	\$ 10,980.00
BLD2128953B1--01-18	Governmental Center West - Garage. 5 year Internal Inspection of Piping.	1	each	\$ 1,265.00	\$ 1,265.00	\$ 1,900.00	\$ 1,900.00	\$ 2,625.00	\$ 2,625.00
BLD2128953B1--01-19	Governmental Center West - Garage. Quarterly Fire Sprinklers Insp.	4	quarter	\$ 575.00	\$ 2,300.00	\$ 570.00	\$ 2,280.00	\$ 922.50	\$ 3,690.00
BLD2128953B1--01-20	Environmental Monitoring Laboratory. 5 year Internal Inspection of Piping.	1	each	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 750.00
BLD2128953B1--01-21	Environmental Monitoring Laboratory. Quarterly Fire Sprinklers Inspection.	4	quarter	\$ 1,115.00	\$ 4,460.00	\$ 160.00	\$ 640.00	\$ 260.00	\$ 1,040.00
BLD2128953B1--01-22	Broward Logistics Center. 5 year Internal Inspection of Piping.	1	each	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 1,125.00	\$ 1,125.00
BLD2128953B1--01-23	Broward Logistics Center. Annual Fire Pump Inspection.	1	year	\$ 1,655.00	\$ 1,655.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 750.00
BLD2128953B1--01-24	Broward Logistics Center. Quarterly Fire Sprinklers Inspection.	4	quarter	\$ 1,115.00	\$ 4,460.00	\$ 160.00	\$ 640.00	\$ 365.00	\$ 1,460.00
BLD2128953B1--01-25	Broward Logistics Center. Annual Fire Hydrant Test.	1	each	\$ 575.00	\$ 575.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 187.50	\$ 187.50
BLD2128953B1--01-26	Transit O&M North - Bldg 2 - Maintenance. 5 year Internal Inspection of Piping.	1	each	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 1,500.00	\$ 1,500.00
BLD2128953B1--01-27	Transit O&M North - Bldg 2 - Maintenance. Quarterly Fire Sprinklers Inspection.	4	quarter	\$ 1,115.00	\$ 4,460.00	\$ 285.00	\$ 1,140.00	\$ 310.00	\$ 1,240.00
BLD2128953B1--01-28	Transit O&M North - Bldg 2 - Maintenance. Annual Fire Hydrant Test.	9	each	\$ 1,115.00	\$ 10,035.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 450.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 765.00
BLD2128953B1--01-29	Transit O&M North - Bldg 4 - Operations. 5 year Internal Inspection of Piping.	1	each	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 700.00	\$ 700.00	\$ 1,125.00	\$ 1,125.00
BLD2128953B1--01-30	Transit O&M North - Bldg 4 - Operations. Quarterly Fire Sprinklers Inspection.	4	quarter	\$ 1,115.00	\$ 4,460.00	\$ 190.00	\$ 760.00	\$ 365.00	\$ 1,460.00
BLD2128953B1--01-31	Margate Catharine Young Branch Library. 5 year Internal Inspection of Piping.	1	each	\$ 1,265.00	\$ 1,265.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 750.00
BLD2128953B1--01-32	Margate Catharine Young Branch Library. Quarterly Fire Sprinklers Inspection.	4	quarter	\$ 575.00	\$ 2,300.00	\$ 95.00	\$ 380.00	\$ 260.00	\$ 1,040.00
BLD2128953B1--01-33	Nancy J. Cotterman Center (NJCC). 5 year Internal Inspection of Piping.	1	each	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 700.00	\$ 700.00	\$ 1,125.00	\$ 1,125.00
BLD2128953B1--01-34	Nancy J. Cotterman Center (NJCC). Annual Fire Pump Inspection.	1	year	\$ 1,655.00	\$ 1,655.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 750.00
BLD2128953B1--01-35	Nancy J. Cotterman Center (NJCC). Quarterly Fire Sprinklers Inspection.	4	quarter	\$ 1,115.00	\$ 4,460.00	\$ 190.00	\$ 760.00	\$ 365.00	\$ 1,460.00
BLD2128953B1--01-36	South Regional Health Center. 5 year Internal Inspection of Piping.	1	each	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 750.00

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Advanced Systems Inc		AB Fire Equipment		Black Fire Protection Inc.	
				Price	Total	Price	Total	Price	Total
BLD2128953B1--01-37	South Regional Health Center. Quarterly Fire Sprinklers Inspection.	4	quarter	\$ 1,115.00	\$ 4,460.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 260.00	\$ 1,040.00
BLD2128953B1--01-38	Broward County Landfill & Fleet Service 8. 5 year Internal Inspection of Piping.	1	each	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 750.00
BLD2128953B1--01-39	Broward County Landfill & Fleet Service 8. Quarterly Fire Sprinkler Inspection.	4	quarter	\$ 1,115.00	\$ 4,460.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 260.00	\$ 1,040.00
BLD2128953B1--01-40	West Regional Courthouse. 5 year Internal Inspection of Piping.	1	each	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 700.00	\$ 700.00	\$ 1,125.00	\$ 1,125.00
BLD2128953B1--01-41	West Regional Courthouse. Quarterly Fire Sprinklers Inspection.	4	quarter	\$ 1,115.00	\$ 4,460.00	\$ 190.00	\$ 760.00	\$ 365.00	\$ 1,460.00
BLD2128953B1--01-42	Emergency Operations Center. 5 year Internal Inspection of Piping.	1	each	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 1,100.00	\$ 1,100.00	\$ 1,500.00	\$ 1,500.00
BLD2128953B1--01-43	Emergency Operations Center. Quarterly Fire Sprinklers Inspection.	4	quarter	\$ 1,115.00	\$ 4,460.00	\$ 285.00	\$ 1,140.00	\$ 620.00	\$ 2,480.00
BLD2128953B1--01-44	West Regional Library. 5 year Internal Inspection of Piping.	1	each	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 700.00	\$ 700.00	\$ 1,125.00	\$ 1,125.00
BLD2128953B1--01-45	West Regional Library. Quarterly Fire Sprinklers Inspection.	4	quarter	\$ 1,115.00	\$ 4,460.00	\$ 190.00	\$ 760.00	\$ 365.00	\$ 1,460.00
BLD2128953B1--01-46	West Regional Library Garage. 5 year Internal Inspection of Piping.	1	each	\$ 1,265.00	\$ 1,265.00	\$ 700.00	\$ 700.00	\$ 1,125.00	\$ 1,125.00
BLD2128953B1--01-47	West Regional Library Garage. Quarterly Fire Sprinklers Inspection.	4	quarter	\$ 575.00	\$ 2,300.00	\$ 190.00	\$ 760.00	\$ 365.00	\$ 1,460.00
BLD2128953B1--01-48	Young at Art Childrens Museum/Broward County Library. 5 year Internal Inspect.	1	each	\$ 1,805.00	\$ 1,805.00	\$ 700.00	\$ 700.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 750.00
BLD2128953B1--01-49	Young at Art Childrens Museum/Broward County Library. Quarterly Fire Sprinklers.	4	quarter	\$ 575.00	\$ 2,300.00	\$ 190.00	\$ 760.00	\$ 365.00	\$ 1,460.00
BLD2128953B1--01-50	Young at Art Childrens Museum/Broward County Library. Annual Fire Hydrant Test.	2	each	\$ 575.00	\$ 1,150.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 250.00
BLD2128953B1--01-51	Imperial Point Branch Library. 5 year Internal Inspection of Piping.	1	each	\$ 1,265.00	\$ 1,265.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 750.00
BLD2128953B1--01-52	Imperial Point Branch Library. Quarterly Fire Sprinklers Inspection.	4	quarter	\$ 575.00	\$ 2,300.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 260.00	\$ 1,040.00
BLD2128953B1--01-53	Lauderdale Lakes Library. 5 year Internal Inspection of Piping.	1	each	\$ 1,265.00	\$ 1,265.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 1,125.00	\$ 1,125.00
BLD2128953B1--01-54	Lauderdale Lakes Library. Quarterly Fire Sprinklers Inspection.	4	quarter	\$ 575.00	\$ 2,300.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 365.00	\$ 1,460.00
BLD2128953B1--01-55	Stirling Road Branch Library. 5 year Internal Inspection of Piping.	1	each	\$ 1,805.00	\$ 1,805.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 750.00
BLD2128953B1--01-56	Stirling Road Branch Library. Quarterly Fire Sprinklers Inspection.	4	quarter	\$ 575.00	\$ 2,300.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 260.00	\$ 1,040.00

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Advanced Systems Inc		AB Fire Equipment		Black Fire Protection Inc.	
				Price	Total	Price	Total	Price	Total
BLD2128953B1--01-57	North Regional Health Center - Hunter Bldg. 5 year Internal Inspection of Piping	1	each	\$ 1,805.00	\$ 1,805.00	\$ 700.00	\$ 700.00	\$ 3,500.00	\$ 3,500.00
BLD2128953B1--01-58	North Regional Health Center - Hunter Bldg. Quarterly Fire Houses Inspection.	4	quarter	\$ 575.00	\$ 2,300.00	\$ 195.00	\$ 780.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 360.00
BLD2128953B1--01-59	Edgar P. Mills Multi-purpose Center. 5 year Internal Inspection of Piping.	1	each	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 1,400.00	\$ 1,400.00	\$ 1,875.00	\$ 1,875.00
BLD2128953B1--01-60	Edgar P. Mills Multi-purpose Center. Quarterly Fire Sprinklers Inspection.	4	quarter	\$ 1,115.00	\$ 4,460.00	\$ 380.00	\$ 1,520.00	\$ 575.00	\$ 2,300.00
BLD2128953B1--01-61	Edgar P. Mills Center Garage. 5 year Internal Inspection of Piping.	1	each	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 1,875.00	\$ 1,875.00
BLD2128953B1--01-62	Edgar P. Mills Center Garage. Quarterly Fire Sprinklers Inspection.	4	quarter	\$ 575.00	\$ 2,300.00	\$ 285.00	\$ 1,140.00	\$ 470.00	\$ 1,880.00
BLD2128953B1--01-63	Broward Addiction Recovery Center-BARC-Booher Bldg. 5 year Internal Inspect.	1	each	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 750.00
BLD2128953B1--01-64	Broward Addiction Recovery Center-BARC-Booher Bldg. Quarterly Fire Sprinklers.	4	quarter	\$ 1,115.00	\$ 4,460.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 260.00	\$ 1,040.00
BLD2128953B1--01-65	African-American Research Library. 5 year Internal Inspection of Piping.	1	each	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 1,125.00	\$ 1,125.00
BLD2128953B1--01-66	African-American Research Library. Annual fire pump inspection.	1	year	\$ 1,655.00	\$ 1,655.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 750.00
BLD2128953B1--01-67	African-American Research Library. Quarterly Fire Sprinklers and Pre-action Syst	4	quarter	\$ 1,115.00	\$ 4,460.00	\$ 785.00	\$ 3,140.00	\$ 1,700.00	\$ 6,800.00
BLD2128953B1--01-68	Transit O&M South - Maintenance Bldg. 5 year Internal Inspection of Piping.	1	each	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 1,400.00	\$ 1,400.00	\$ 1,875.00	\$ 1,875.00
BLD2128953B1--01-69	Transit O&M South - Maintenance Bldg. Annual fire pump inspection.	1	year	\$ 1,655.00	\$ 1,655.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 750.00
BLD2128953B1--01-70	Transit O&M South - Maintenance Bldg. Quarterly Fire Sprinklers Inspection.	4	quarter	\$ 1,115.00	\$ 4,460.00	\$ 380.00	\$ 1,520.00	\$ 575.00	\$ 2,300.00
BLD2128953B1--01-71	Transit O&M South - Maintenance Bldg. Annual Fire Hydrant Test.	3	each	\$ 575.00	\$ 1,725.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 375.00
BLD2128953B1--01-72	Transit O&M South-Operations Center & Parking Garage. 5 year Internal Inspect.	1	each	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 1,500.00	\$ 1,500.00
BLD2128953B1--01-73	Transit O&M South-Operations Center & Parking Garage. Annual fire pump insp.	1	year	\$ 1,655.00	\$ 1,655.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 750.00
BLD2128953B1--01-74	Transit O&M South-Operations Center & Parking Garage. Quarterly Fire Sprinklers.	4	quarter	\$ 1,115.00	\$ 4,460.00	\$ 285.00	\$ 1,140.00	\$ 470.00	\$ 1,880.00
BLD2128953B1--01-75	Transit O&M South-Operations Center & Parking Garage. Quarterly Foam Analysis.	4	quarter	\$ 1,365.00	\$ 5,460.00	\$ 250.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 1,875.00	\$ 7,500.00
BLD2128953B1--01-76	BCJC - West Building. 5 year Internal Inspection of Piping.	1	each	\$ 7,265.00	\$ 7,265.00	\$ 5,500.00	\$ 5,500.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 10,000.00

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Advanced Systems Inc		AB Fire Equipment		Black Fire Protection Inc.	
				Price	Total	Price	Total	Price	Total
BLD2128953B1--01-77	BCJC - West Building. Fire Pump (Diesel) Annual Overhaul / oil and filter chang	1	year	\$ 4,855.00	\$ 4,855.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 5,000.00	\$ 5,000.00
BLD2128953B1--01-78	BCJC - West Building. Quarterly Fire Pump (Diesel) Inspections.	4	quarter	\$ 1,655.00	\$ 6,620.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 1,200.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 3,000.00
BLD2128953B1--01-79	BCJC - West Building. Quarterly Fire Sprinklers Inspection.	4	quarter	\$ 4,355.00	\$ 17,420.00	\$ 2,500.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 2,500.00	\$ 10,000.00
BLD2128953B1--01-80	BCJC - North Building. 5 year Internal Inspection of Piping.	1	each	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 2,000.00	\$ 2,000.00	\$ 3,500.00	\$ 3,500.00
BLD2128953B1--01-81	BCJC - North Building. Quarterly Fire Sprinklers Inspection.	4	quarter	\$ 1,115.00	\$ 4,460.00	\$ 650.00	\$ 2,600.00	\$ 890.00	\$ 3,560.00
BLD2128953B1--01-82	BCJC - East Building. 5 year Internal Inspection of Piping.	1	each	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 2,200.00	\$ 2,200.00	\$ 3,375.00	\$ 3,375.00
BLD2128953B1--01-83	BCJC - East Building. Annual Fire Pump Inspection.	1	each	\$ 1,655.00	\$ 1,655.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 750.00
BLD2128953B1--01-84	BCJC - East Building. Quarterly Fire Sprinklers Inspection.	4	quarter	\$ 1,115.00	\$ 4,460.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 4,000.00
BLD2128953B1--01-85	BCJC - Midrise Office Building. 5 year Internal Inspection of Piping.	1	each	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 1,400.00	\$ 1,400.00	\$ 1,875.00	\$ 1,875.00
BLD2128953B1--01-86	BCJC - Midrise Office Building. Annual Fire Pump Inspection.	1	year	\$ 1,655.00	\$ 1,655.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 750.00
BLD2128953B1--01-87	BCJC - Midrise Office Building. Quarterly Fire Sprinklers Inspection.	4	quarter	\$ 1,115.00	\$ 4,460.00	\$ 380.00	\$ 1,520.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 3,000.00
BLD2128953B1--01-88	BCJC - East/Midrise Parking Garage. 5 year Internal Inspection of Piping.	1	each	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 1,750.00	\$ 1,750.00	\$ 2,625.00	\$ 2,625.00
BLD2128953B1--01-89	BCJC - East/Midrise Parking Garage. Annual Fire Pump Inspection.	1	year	\$ 1,655.00	\$ 1,655.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 750.00
BLD2128953B1--01-90	BCJC - East/Midrise Parking Garage. Quarterly Fire Sprinklers Inspection.	4	quarter	\$ 1,115.00	\$ 4,460.00	\$ 570.00	\$ 2,280.00	\$ 785.00	\$ 3,140.00
BLD2128953B1--01-91	BCJC - South Parking Garage. 5 year Internal Inspection of Piping.	1	each	\$ 3,235.00	\$ 3,235.00	\$ 2,850.00	\$ 2,850.00	\$ 4,125.00	\$ 4,125.00
BLD2128953B1--01-92	BCJC - South Parking Garage. Annual Fire Pump Inspection.	1	year	\$ 1,655.00	\$ 1,655.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 750.00
BLD2128953B1--01-93	BCJC - South Parking Garage. Quarterly Fire Sprinklers Inspection.	4	quarter	\$ 1,115.00	\$ 4,460.00	\$ 950.00	\$ 3,800.00	\$ 1,200.00	\$ 4,800.00
BLD2128953B1--01-94	Miramar Branch Library & Education Center. 5 year Internal Inspection of Piping.	1	each	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 1,500.00	\$ 1,500.00
BLD2128953B1--01-95	Miramar Branch Library & Education Center. Quarterly Fire Sprinklers Inspection.	4	quarter	\$ 1,115.00	\$ 4,460.00	\$ 285.00	\$ 1,140.00	\$ 470.00	\$ 1,880.00
BLD2128953B1--01-96	Public Safety Complex-Ron Cochran Bldg. 5 year Internal Inspection of Piping.	1	each	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 4,875.00	\$ 4,875.00

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Advanced Systems Inc		AB Fire Equipment		Black Fire Protection Inc.	
				Price	Total	Price	Total	Price	Total
BLD2128953B1--01-97	Public Safety Complex-Ron Cochran Bldg. Annual Fire Pump Inspection.	1	year	\$ 1,655.00	\$ 1,655.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 750.00
BLD2128953B1--01-98	Public Safety Complex-Ron Cochran Bldg. Quarterly Fire Sprinklers Cross Zone Sys	4	quarter	\$ 1,115.00	\$ 4,460.00	\$ 1,140.00	\$ 4,560.00	\$ 1,500.00	\$ 6,000.00
BLD2128953B1--01-99	Public Safety Complex-Ron Cochran Bldg. Annual Fire Hydrant Test.	5	each	\$ 1,115.00	\$ 5,575.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 250.00	\$ 430.00	\$ 2,150.00
BLD2128953B1--01-100	Public Safety Complex - Technology Services Center. 5 year Internal Inspection.	1	each	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 2,250.00	\$ 2,250.00
BLD2128953B1--01-101	Public Safety Complex-Technology Services Center. Quarterly Fire Sprinklers Insp	4	quarter	\$ 1,115.00	\$ 4,460.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 820.00	\$ 3,280.00
BLD2128953B1--01-102	Public Safety Complex - BSO District 5. 5 year Internal Inspection of Piping.	1	each	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 1,125.00	\$ 1,125.00
BLD2128953B1--01-103	Public Safety Complex - BSO District 5. Quarterly Fire Sprinklers Inspection.	4	quarter	\$ 1,115.00	\$ 4,460.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 365.00	\$ 1,460.00
BLD2128953B1--01-104	Public Safety Complex-BSO Uniform Service Center. 5 year Internal Inspection.	1	each	\$ 1,265.00	\$ 1,265.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 750.00
BLD2128953B1--01-105	Public Safety Complex-BSO Uniform Service Center. Quarterly Fire Sprinklers Insp	4	quarter	\$ 575.00	\$ 2,300.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 260.00	\$ 1,040.00
BLD2128953B1--01-106	Public Safety Complex-Defense Tactics Training Center. 5-yr Internal Inspection	1	each	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 750.00
BLD2128953B1--01-107	Public Safety Complex-Defense Tactics Training Center. Quarterly Fire Sprinklers	4	quarter	\$ 1,115.00	\$ 4,460.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 260.00	\$ 1,040.00
BLD2128953B1--01-108	Public Safety Complex-BSO Training Center. 5 year Internal Inspection of Piping.	1	each	\$ 1,265.00	\$ 1,265.00	\$ 2,850.00	\$ 2,850.00	\$ 4,125.00	\$ 4,125.00
BLD2128953B1--01-109	Public Safety Complex-BSO Training Center. Annual Fire Pump System inspection.	1	year	\$ 1,655.00	\$ 1,655.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 750.00
BLD2128953B1--01-110	Public Safety Complex-BSO Training Center Quarterly / Annual Fire Sprinkler Insp	4	quarter	\$ 1,115.00	\$ 4,460.00	\$ 1,200.00	\$ 4,800.00	\$ 1,942.50	\$ 7,770.00
BLD2128953B1--01-111	Public Safety Complex-BSO Training Center. Annual Fire Hydrant Inspection.	2	each	\$ 575.00	\$ 1,150.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 250.00
BLD2128953B1--01-112	Public Safety Complex-BSO Parking Garage. Quarterly and Annual Fire Sprinkler.	4	quarter	\$ 575.00	\$ 2,300.00	\$ 250.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 2,000.00	\$ 8,000.00
BLD2128953B1--01-113	North Lauderdale Saraniero Branch Library. 5 year Internal Inspection of Piping.	1	each	\$ 1,265.00	\$ 1,265.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 750.00
BLD2128953B1--01-114	North Lauderdale Saraniero Branch Library. Quarterly Fire Sprinklers Inspection.	4	quarter	\$ 575.00	\$ 2,300.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 260.00	\$ 1,040.00
BLD2128953B1--01-115	North Regional Courthouse. 5 year Internal Inspection of Piping.	1	each	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 2,200.00	\$ 2,200.00	\$ 2,625.00	\$ 2,625.00
BLD2128953B1--01-116	North Regional Courthouse. Quarterly Fire Sprinklers Inspection.	4	quarter	\$ 1,115.00	\$ 4,460.00	\$ 570.00	\$ 2,280.00	\$ 781.75	\$ 3,127.00

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Advanced Systems Inc		AB Fire Equipment		Black Fire Protection Inc.	
				Price	Total	Price	Total	Price	Total
BLD2128953B1--01-117	Tamarac Branch Library. 5 year Internal Inspection of Piping.	1	each	\$ 1,265.00	\$ 1,265.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 750.00
BLD2128953B1--01-118	Tamarac Branch Library. Quarterly Fire Sprinklers Inspection.	4	quart	\$ 575.00	\$ 2,300.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 250.00	\$ 1,000.00
BLD2128953B1--01-119	Fire Station 17 - HAZ MAT. 5 year Internal Inspection of Piping.	1	each	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 750.00
BLD2128953B1--01-120	Fire Station 17 - HAZ MAT. Quarterly Fire Sprinklers Inspection.	4	quarter	\$ 1,115.00	\$ 4,460.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 250.00	\$ 1,000.00
BLD2128953B1--01-121	BSO Fire Rescue Logistics Warehouse. 5 year Internal Inspection of Piping.	1	each	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 1,125.00	\$ 1,125.00
BLD2128953B1--01-122	BSO Fire Rescue Logistics Warehouse. Quarterly Fire pump (Diesel) Inspections.	4	quarter	\$ 1,655.00	\$ 6,620.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 1,200.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 3,000.00
BLD2128953B1--01-123	BSO Fire Rescue Logistics Warehouse. Quarterly Fire Sprinklers Inspection.	4	quarter	\$ 575.00	\$ 2,300.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 365.00	\$ 1,460.00
BLD2128953B1--01-124	BSO Fire Rescue Logistics Warehouse. Annual Fire Pump (Diesel) Inspection.	1	year	\$ 1,655.00	\$ 1,655.00	\$ 450.00	\$ 450.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 750.00
BLD2128953B1--01-125	BSO Fire Rescue Logistics Warehouse. Annual Fire Hydrant Test.	1	each	\$ 575.00	\$ 575.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 750.00
BLD2128953B1--01-126	Housing and Community Development. 5 year Internal Inspection of Piping.	1	each	\$ 1,265.00	\$ 1,265.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 750.00
BLD2128953B1--01-127	Housing and Community Development. Quarterly Fire Sprinkler/Fire Standpipe.	4	quarter	\$ 575.00	\$ 2,300.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 250.00	\$ 1,000.00
BLD2128953B1--01-128	Tyrone Bryant Branch Library. 5 year Internal Inspection of Piping.	1	each	\$ 1,265.00	\$ 1,265.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 400.00	No Bid	No Bid
BLD2128953B1--01-129	Tyrone Bryant Branch Library. Quarterly Fire Sprinklers Inspection.	4	quarter	\$ 575.00	\$ 2,300.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 3,000.00
BLD2128953B1--01-130	Hollywood Branch Library. 5 year Internal Inspection of Piping.	1	each	\$ 1,805.00	\$ 1,805.00	\$ 700.00	\$ 700.00	\$ 1,125.00	\$ 1,125.00
BLD2128953B1--01-131	Hollywood Branch Library. Quarterly Fire Sprinklers Inspection.	4	quarter	\$ 575.00	\$ 2,300.00	\$ 190.00	\$ 760.00	\$ 365.00	\$ 1,460.00
BLD2128953B1--01-132	Weston Branch Library. 5 year Internal Inspection of Piping.	1	each	\$ 1,265.00	\$ 1,265.00	\$ 700.00	\$ 700.00	\$ 1,125.00	\$ 1,125.00
BLD2128953B1--01-133	Weston Branch Library. Quarterly Fire Sprinklers Inspection.	4	quarter	\$ 575.00	\$ 2,300.00	\$ 190.00	\$ 760.00	\$ 365.00	\$ 1,460.00
BLD2128953B1--01-134	Weston Branch Library. Annual Fire Hydrant Test.	3	each	\$ 575.00	\$ 1,725.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 375.00
BLD2128953B1--01-135	Dania Beach Paul DeMaio Branch Library. 5 year Internal Inspection of Piping.	1	each	\$ 1,265.00	\$ 1,265.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 750.00
BLD2128953B1--01-136	Dania Beach Paul DeMaio Branch Library. Quarterly Fire Sprinklers Inspection.	4	quarter	\$ 575.00	\$ 2,300.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 365.00	\$ 1,460.00

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Advanced Systems Inc		AB Fire Equipment		Black Fire Protection Inc.	
				Price	Total	Price	Total	Price	Total
BLD2128953B1--01-137	Medical Examiner - N Bldg (N & S bldgs). Quarterly Fire Sprinkler Inspection	4	quarter	\$ 1,115.00	\$ 4,460.00	\$ 250.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 250.00	\$ 1,000.00
BLD2128953B1--01-138	Medical Examiner - North Bldg. Annual Fire Hydrant Test.	1	each	\$ 305.00	\$ 305.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 125.00
BLD2128953B1--01-139	Medical Examiner - South Bldg. (North and South buildings). 5 year Internal Insp	1	each	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 700.00	\$ 700.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 750.00
BLD2128953B1--01-140	Northeast Transit Center. 5 year Internal Inspection of Piping.	1	each	\$ 1,265.00	\$ 1,265.00	\$ 0.00	\$ 0.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 750.00
BLD2128953B1--01-141	Northeast Transit Center. Quarterly Fire Sprinklers Inspection.	4	quarter	\$ 575.00	\$ 2,300.00	\$ 0.00	\$ 0.00	\$ 260.00	\$ 1,040.00
BLD2128953B1--01-142	Northeast Transit Center. Annual Fire Hydrant Test.	2	each	\$ 575.00	\$ 1,150.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 250.00
BLD2128953B1--01-143	Northwest Regional Library. 5 year Internal Inspection of Piping.	1	each	\$ 1,805.00	\$ 1,805.00	\$ 700.00	\$ 700.00	\$ 1,125.00	\$ 1,125.00
BLD2128953B1--01-144	Northwest Regional Library. Quarterly Fire Sprinklers Inspection.	4	quarter	\$ 575.00	\$ 2,300.00	\$ 190.00	\$ 760.00	\$ 365.00	\$ 1,460.00
BLD2128953B1--01-145	Traffic Engineering - Bldg A. 5 year Internal Inspection of Piping.	1	each	\$ 1,265.00	\$ 1,265.00	\$ 700.00	\$ 700.00	\$ 1,125.00	\$ 1,125.00
BLD2128953B1--01-146	Traffic Engineering - Bldg A. Quarterly Fire Sprinklers Inspection.	4	quarter	\$ 575.00	\$ 2,300.00	\$ 190.00	\$ 760.00	\$ 365.00	\$ 1,460.00
BLD2128953B1--01-147	Traffic Engineering - Bldg B. 5 year Internal Inspection of Piping.	1	each	\$ 1,265.00	\$ 1,265.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 750.00
BLD2128953B1--01-148	Traffic Engineering - Bldg B. Quarterly Fire Sprinklers Inspection.	4	quarter	\$ 575.00	\$ 2,300.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 260.00	\$ 1,040.00
BLD2128953B1--01-149	Fire Station 106. 5 year Internal Inspection of Piping.	1	each	\$ 1,265.00	\$ 1,265.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 750.00
BLD2128953B1--01-150	Fire Station 106. Annual Fire Pump Inspection.	1	year	\$ 1,655.00	\$ 1,655.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 750.00	\$ 750.00
BLD2128953B1--01-151	Fire Station 106. Quarterly Fire Sprinklers Inspection.	4	quarter	\$ 845.00	\$ 3,380.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 260.00	\$ 1,040.00
BLD2128953B1--01-152	Fire Station 106. Annual Fire Hydrant Test.	1	each	\$ 305.00	\$ 305.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 125.00
BLD2128953B1--01-153	Northwest Branch Library. 5 year Internal Inspection of Piping.	1	each	\$ 1,265.00	\$ 1,265.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 750.00
BLD2128953B1--01-154	Northwest Branch Library. Quarterly Fire Sprinklers Inspection.	4	quarter	\$ 575.00	\$ 2,300.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 260.00	\$ 1,040.00
BLD2128953B1--01-155	Fleet Service 3 & 4 - Blount Rd. 5 year Internal Inspection of Piping.	1	each	\$ 1,805.00	\$ 1,805.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 1,125.00	\$ 1,125.00
BLD2128953B1--01-156	Fleet Service 3 & 4 - Blount Rd. Quarterly Fire Sprinklers Inspection.	4	quarter	\$ 1,115.00	\$ 4,460.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 260.00	\$ 1,040.00



Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Advanced Systems Inc		AB Fire Equipment		Black Fire Protection Inc.	
				Price	Total	Price	Total	Price	Total
BLD2128953B1--01-157	Florida Department of Health-Operations Bldg. 5 year Internal Inspection of Pip.	1	each	\$ 1,805.00	\$ 1,805.00	\$ 700.00	\$ 700.00	\$ 1,125.00	\$ 1,125.00
BLD2128953B1--01-158	Florida Department of Health-Operations Bldg. Quarterly Fire Standpipe and Fire.	4	quarter	\$ 575.00	\$ 2,300.00	\$ 250.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 365.00	\$ 1,460.00
BLD2128953B1--01-159	Fire Station 27. 5 year Internal Inspection of Piping.	1	each	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 750.00
BLD2128953B1--01-160	Fire Station 27. Quarterly Fire Sprinklers Inspection.	4	quarter	\$ 575.00	\$ 2,300.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 260.00	\$ 1,040.00
BLD2128953B1--01-161	Fire Station 32 - TRT. 5 year Internal Inspection of Piping.	1	each	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 750.00
BLD2128953B1--01-162	Fire Station 32 - TRT. Quarterly Fire Sprinklers Inspection.	4	quarter	\$ 575.00	\$ 2,300.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 260.00	\$ 1,040.00
BLD2128953B1--01-163	Fire Station 32 - TRT. Annual Fire Hydrant Test.	2	each	\$ 305.00	\$ 610.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 250.00
BLD2128953B1--01-164	Fleet Service 2. 5 year Internal Inspection of Piping.	1	each	\$ 1,265.00	\$ 1,265.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 750.00
BLD2128953B1--01-165	Fleet Service 2. Quarterly Fire Sprinklers Inspection.	4	quarter	\$ 575.00	\$ 2,300.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 260.00	\$ 1,040.00
BLD2128953B1--01-166	Lauderhill Town Centre Library. 5 year Internal Inspection of Piping.	1	each	\$ 1,265.00	\$ 1,265.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 750.00
BLD2128953B1--01-167	Lauderhill Town Centre Library. Quarterly Fire Sprinklers Inspection.	4	quarter	\$ 575.00	\$ 2,300.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 260.00	\$ 1,040.00
BLD2128953B1--01-168	Southwest Regional Library. 5 year Internal Inspection of Piping.	1	each	\$ 1,805.00	\$ 1,805.00	\$ 700.00	\$ 700.00	\$ 1,125.00	\$ 1,125.00
BLD2128953B1--01-169	Southwest Regional Library. Quarterly Fire Sprinklers Inspection.	4	quarter	\$ 575.00	\$ 2,300.00	\$ 190.00	\$ 760.00	\$ 365.00	\$ 1,460.00
BLD2128953B1--01-170	Animal Care & Regulation - South. 5 year Internal Inspection of Piping.	1	each	\$ 1,805.00	\$ 1,805.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 750.00
BLD2128953B1--01-171	Animal Care & Regulation - South. Quarterly Fire Sprinklers Inspection.	4	quarter	\$ 575.00	\$ 2,300.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 260.00	\$ 1,040.00
BLD2128953B1--01-172	Animal Care & Regulation - South. Annual Fire Hydrant Test.	2	each	\$ 305.00	\$ 610.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 250.00
BLD2128953B1--01-173	Broward Addiction Recovery Center - BARC- Central Facility. 5 year Internal Insp	1	each	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 700.00	\$ 700.00	\$ 1,125.00	\$ 1,125.00
BLD2128953B1--01-174	Broward Addiction Recovery Center - BARC- Central Facility. Quarterly Fire Sprin	4	quarter	\$ 1,115.00	\$ 4,460.00	\$ 190.00	\$ 760.00	\$ 365.00	\$ 1,460.00
BLD2128953B1--01-175	Citrix Office Building. 5 year Internal Inspection of Piping.	1	each	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 1,200.00	\$ 1,200.00	\$ 1,875.00	\$ 1,875.00
BLD2128953B1--01-176	Citrix Office Building. Quarterly Fire Sprinklers Inspection.	4	quarter	\$ 1,115.00	\$ 4,460.00	\$ 380.00	\$ 1,520.00	\$ 575.00	\$ 2,300.00

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Advanced Systems Inc		AB Fire Equipment		Black Fire Protection Inc.	
				Price	Total	Price	Total	Price	Total
BLD2128953B1--01-177	Citrix Office Building. Annual Fire Hydrant Test.	2	each	\$ 305.00	\$ 610.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 250.00
BLD2128953B1--01-178	Lauderhill Transit Center. 5-year Internal Inspection of Piping.	1	each	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 1,500.00	\$ 1,500.00
BLD2128953B1--01-179	Lauderhill Transit Center. Quarterly Fire Sprinklers Inspection.	4	quarter	\$ 1,115.00	\$ 4,460.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 470.00	\$ 1,880.00
BLD2128953B1--01-180	Supervisor of Elections Bldg. - 5-Year Internal Inspection of Piping	1	each	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 2,400.00	\$ 2,400.00	\$ 3,375.00	\$ 3,375.00
BLD2128953B1--01-181	Supervisor of Elections Bldg. - Quarterly Fire Sprinkler Inspection	4	quarter	\$ 575.00	\$ 2,300.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 991.75	\$ 3,967.00
BLD2128953B1--01-182	Supervisor of Elections Bldg. - Annual Fire Hydrant Test	1	year	\$ 305.00	\$ 305.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 125.00
BLD2128953B1--01-183	Annual Fire Hydrant Test. Per Specifications and Requirements.	1	each	\$ 1,115.00	\$ 1,115.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 350.00	\$ 350.00
BLD2128953B1--01-184	Scheduled labor rate for certified NICET II or III tech during business hours	900	hour	\$ 135.00	\$ 121,500.00	\$ 72.00	\$ 64,800.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 76,500.00
BLD2128953B1--01-185	Scheduled labor rate for certified NICET II or III tech during non-business hrs	100	hour	\$ 270.00	\$ 27,000.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 157.50	\$ 15,750.00
BLD2128953B1--01-186	Scheduled labor rate for non-certified technician/helper during business hours.	100	hour	\$ 135.00	\$ 13,500.00	\$ 68.00	\$ 6,800.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 8,500.00
BLD2128953B1--01-187	Scheduled labor rate for non-certified technician/helper during non-business hrs	100	hour	\$ 270.00	\$ 27,000.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 9,000.00	\$ 127.50	\$ 12,750.00
BLD2128953B1--01-188	Emergency labor rate for certified NICET II or III tech during business hours	250	hour	\$ 205.00	\$ 51,250.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 25,000.00	\$ 127.50	\$ 31,875.00
BLD2128953B1--01-189	Emergency labor rate for certified NICET II or III tech during non-business hrs	175	hour	\$ 270.00	\$ 47,250.00	\$ 120.00	\$ 21,000.00	\$ 157.50	\$ 27,562.50
BLD2128953B1--01-190	Emergency labor rate for non-certified technician/helper during business hours.	250	hour	\$ 205.00	\$ 51,250.00	\$ 68.00	\$ 17,000.00	\$ 127.50	\$ 31,875.00
BLD2128953B1--01-191	Emergency labor rate for non-certified technician/helper during non-business hrs	100	hour	\$ 270.00	\$ 27,000.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 9,000.00	\$ 127.50	\$ 12,750.00
BLD2128953B1--01-192	1/4 inch 3 way screw type brass valve with in-run side brass plug UL listed	3	each	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 75.00
BLD2128953B1--01-193	Fire Sprinkler Suction Gauge or System Gauge UL Listed.	5	each	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$ 19.00	\$ 95.00	\$ 120.00	\$ 600.00
BLD2128953B1--01-194	Fire Sprinkler System Gauge UL Listed.	150	each	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 2,250.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 3,000.00
<b>Group 1 FMD Total Bid Amount</b>				<b>\$</b>	<b>869,625.00</b>	<b>\$</b>	<b>371,585.00</b>	<b>\$</b>	<b>573,194.00</b>

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Advanced Systems Inc		AB Fire Equipment		Black Fire Protection Inc.	
				Price	Total	Price	Total	Price	Total
<b>Group 2 PORT</b>									
BLD2128953B1--02-01	(1081-0009) BSO Boat Dock. 5-Year STAND PIPE w/Fire hoses System Inspection.	1	each	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 500.00
BLD2128953B1--02-02	(1082-0030) Building # 611 (AMMAN). 5-year Sprinkler System Inspection.	1	each	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 750.00
BLD2128953B1--02-03	(1081-0026) Building #28-28A (Elec Shop). 5-year Sprinkler System Inspection.	1	each	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 500.00
BLD2128953B1--02-04	(1081-0018) Midport (Palm) Parking Garage 5-year Sprinkler System Inspection.	1	each	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 6,000.00	\$ 6,000.00	\$ 6,000.00	\$ 6,000.00
BLD2128953B1--02-05	(1081-0003) Admin Building 5-year Sprinkler System Inspection/Obstruction Test.	1	each	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 2,400.00	\$ 2,400.00	\$ 2,000.00	\$ 2,000.00
BLD2128953B1--02-06	(1081-0013) Port Public Safety Security Operations CTR. (SOC). 5-year Inspection	1	each	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 500.00
BLD2128953B1--02-07	(1082-0010) Public Works Office Building 5-year Sprinkler System Inspection.	1	each	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 750.00
BLD2128953B1--02-08	(1082-0020) Terminal No.2 5-year Sprinkler System Inspection/Obstruction Testing	1	each	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 1,200.00	\$ 1,200.00	\$ 1,750.00	\$ 1,750.00
BLD2128953B1--02-09	(1082-0021) Terminal No. 4. 5-yr Sprinkler System Inspection/Obstruction Testing	1	each	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 1,200.00	\$ 1,200.00	\$ 1,750.00	\$ 1,750.00
BLD2128953B1--02-10	(1081-0012) Terminal No.18 5-yr Sprinkler System Inspection/Obstruction Testing.	1	each	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 2,600.00	\$ 2,600.00	\$ 2,500.00	\$ 2,500.00
BLD2128953B1--02-11	(1081-0017) Terminal No.19 5-yr Sprinkler System Inspection/Obstruction Testing.	1	each	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 2,600.00	\$ 2,600.00	\$ 1,500.00	\$ 1,500.00
BLD2128953B1--02-12	(1081-0019) Terminal No.21 5-yr Sprinkler System Inspection/Obstruction Testing.	1	each	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 1,500.00	\$ 1,500.00
BLD2128953B1--02-13	(1081-0023) Terminal No.25 5-yr Sprinkler System Inspection/Obstruction Testing.	1	each	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 1,750.00	\$ 1,750.00	\$ 2,000.00	\$ 2,000.00
BLD2128953B1--02-14	(1081-0025) Terminal No. 26 5-yr Sprinkler System Inspection/Obstruction Testing	1	each	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 1,200.00	\$ 1,200.00	\$ 2,000.00	\$ 2,000.00
BLD2128953B1--02-15	(1081-0037) Terminal No.29 5-yr Sprinkler System Inspection/Obstruction Testing.	1	each	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 700.00	\$ 700.00	\$ 1,750.00	\$ 1,750.00
BLD2128953B1--02-16	(1082-0021) HERON Parking Garage. 5-year Sprinkler System Inspection.	1	each	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 4,600.00	\$ 4,600.00	\$ 4,750.00	\$ 4,750.00
BLD2128953B1--02-17	(1080-0009) Warehouse No.30 5-yr Sprinkler System Inspection/Obstruction Testing	1	each	\$ 2,345.00	\$ 2,345.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 750.00	\$ 750.00
BLD2128953B1--02-18	(1081-0009) BSO Boat Dock. Annual Backflow and STAND PIPE Fire System Inspection	1	year	\$ 1,655.00	\$ 1,655.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 225.00	\$ 225.00
BLD2128953B1--02-19	(1082-0030) Building # 611 (AMMAN). Annual Fire Pump System Inspection.	4	year	\$ 1,655.00	\$ 6,620.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 1,200.00	\$ 250.00	\$ 1,000.00
BLD2128953B1--02-20	(1081-0026) Building #28-28A (Elec Shop). Annual Fire Pump System Inspection.	4	year	\$ 1,655.00	\$ 6,620.00	\$ 399.99	\$ 1,599.96	\$ 250.00	\$ 1,000.00

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Advanced Systems Inc		AB Fire Equipment		Black Fire Protection Inc.	
				Price	Total	Price	Total	Price	Total
BLD2128953B1--02-21	(1081-0018) Midport Garage Annual Fire Pump System Inspection.	4	year	\$ 1,655.00	\$ 6,620.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 1,200.00	\$ 250.00	\$ 1,000.00
BLD2128953B1--02-22	(1081-0013) Port Public Safety Security Operations CTR.(SOC) Annual Inspection.	4	year	\$ 1,115.00	\$ 4,460.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 250.00	\$ 1,000.00
BLD2128953B1--02-23	(1082-0010) Public Works Office Building. Annual Fire Pump System Inspection.	4	year	\$ 1,655.00	\$ 6,620.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 1,200.00	\$ 250.00	\$ 1,000.00
BLD2128953B1--02-24	(1082-0020) Terminal No. 2 Annual Fire Pump System Inspection.	4	year	\$ 1,655.00	\$ 6,620.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 1,200.00	\$ 250.00	\$ 1,000.00
BLD2128953B1--02-25	(1082-0021) Terminal No. 4 Annual Fire Pump System Inspection.	4	year	\$ 1,655.00	\$ 6,620.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 1,200.00	\$ 250.00	\$ 1,000.00
BLD2128953B1--02-26	(1081-0012) Terminal No.18 Annual Fire Pump System Inspection.	4	year	\$ 1,655.00	\$ 6,620.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 1,200.00	\$ 250.00	\$ 1,000.00
BLD2128953B1--02-27	(1081-0017) Terminal No.19 Annual Fire Pump System Inspection.	4	year	\$ 1,655.00	\$ 6,620.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 1,200.00	\$ 250.00	\$ 1,000.00
BLD2128953B1--02-28	(1081-0019) Terminal No.21 Annual Fire Pump System Inspection.	4	year	\$ 1,655.00	\$ 6,620.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 1,200.00	\$ 250.00	\$ 1,000.00
BLD2128953B1--02-29	(1081-0037) Terminal No.29 Annual Fire Pump System Inspection.	4	year	\$ 1,655.00	\$ 6,620.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 1,200.00	\$ 250.00	\$ 1,000.00
BLD2128953B1--02-30	(1081-0023) Terminal No.25 Annual Fire Pump System Inspection.	4	year	\$ 1,655.00	\$ 6,620.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 1,200.00	\$ 250.00	\$ 1,000.00
BLD2128953B1--02-31	(1081-0025) Terminal No.26 Annual Fire Pump System Inspection.	4	year	\$ 1,655.00	\$ 6,620.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 1,200.00	\$ 250.00	\$ 1,000.00
BLD2128953B1--02-32	(1082-0021) HERON Parking Garage Annual Fire Pump System Inspection.	4	year	\$ 1,655.00	\$ 6,620.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 1,200.00	\$ 250.00	\$ 1,000.00
BLD2128953B1--02-33	(1081-0003) Port Everglades Administration Bldg. Annual Fire System Inspection.	4	year	\$ 1,655.00	\$ 6,620.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 1,600.00
BLD2128953B1--02-34	(1080-0009) Warehouse No.30 Annual Fire Pump System Inspection.	4	year	\$ 1,655.00	\$ 6,620.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 1,200.00	\$ 250.00	\$ 1,000.00
BLD2128953B1--02-35	(1081-0009) BSO Boat Dock Monthly Backflow and STAND PIPE w/Fire Inspection.	12	month	\$ 1,655.00	\$ 19,860.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 1,500.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 1,800.00
BLD2128953B1--02-36	(1082-0030) Building # 611 (AMMAN) Monthly Fire Sprinklers Inspection.	12	month	\$ 845.00	\$ 10,140.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 780.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 1,800.00
BLD2128953B1--02-37	(1081-0026) Building 28. Monthly Fire Sprinklers Inspection.	12	month	\$ 845.00	\$ 10,140.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 780.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 1,800.00
BLD2128953B1--02-38	(1082-0021) HERON Parking Garage - Quarterly Pre-Action System Inspection.	4	quarter	\$ 845.00	\$ 3,380.00	\$ 250.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 2,000.00
BLD2128953B1--02-39	(1081-0018) Midport Garage. Monthly Fire Sprinklers Inspection.	12	month	\$ 845.00	\$ 10,140.00	\$ 1,450.00	\$ 17,400.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 1,800.00
BLD2128953B1--02-40	(1081-0003) Port Everglades Administration Bldg Mthly Fire Sprinklers Inspection	12	month	\$ 2,195.00	\$ 26,340.00	\$ 450.00	\$ 5,400.00	\$ 340.00	\$ 4,080.00
BLD2128953B1--02-41	(1081-0013) Port Public Safety/Security Operations CTR. (SOC) Monthly inspection	12	month	\$ 1,115.00	\$ 13,380.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 780.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 1,800.00

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Advanced Systems Inc		AB Fire Equipment		Black Fire Protection Inc.	
				Price	Total	Price	Total	Price	Total
BLD2128953B1--02-42	(1082-0010) Port Public Works Building. Monthly Fire Sprinklers Inspection.	12	month	\$ 1,115.00	\$ 13,380.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 780.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 1,800.00
BLD2128953B1--02-43	(1082-0020) Terminal No. 2 Monthly Fire Sprinklers Inspection.	12	month	\$ 1,115.00	\$ 13,380.00	\$ 260.00	\$ 3,120.00	\$ 350.00	\$ 4,200.00
BLD2128953B1--02-44	(1082-0021) Terminal No. 4 Monthly Fire Sprinklers Inspection.	12	month	\$ 1,115.00	\$ 13,380.00	\$ 260.00	\$ 3,120.00	\$ 350.00	\$ 4,200.00
BLD2128953B1--02-45	(1081-0012) Terminal No. 18 Monthly Fire Sprinklers Inspection.	12	month	\$ 1,115.00	\$ 13,380.00	\$ 585.00	\$ 7,020.00	\$ 700.00	\$ 8,400.00
BLD2128953B1--02-46	(1081-0017) Terminal No. 19 Monthly Fire Sprinklers Inspection.	12	month	\$ 1,115.00	\$ 13,380.00	\$ 195.00	\$ 2,340.00	\$ 280.00	\$ 3,360.00
BLD2128953B1--02-47	(1081-0019) Terminal No. 21 Monthly Fire Sprinklers Inspection.	12	month	\$ 1,115.00	\$ 13,380.00	\$ 195.00	\$ 2,340.00	\$ 560.00	\$ 6,720.00
BLD2128953B1--02-48	(1081-0023) Terminal No. 25 Monthly Fire Sprinklers Inspection.	12	month	\$ 1,115.00	\$ 13,380.00	\$ 325.00	\$ 3,900.00	\$ 420.00	\$ 5,040.00
BLD2128953B1--02-49	(1081-0025) Terminal No. 26 Monthly Fire Sprinklers Inspection.	12	month	\$ 1,115.00	\$ 13,380.00	\$ 260.00	\$ 3,120.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 6,000.00
BLD2128953B1--02-50	(1081-0037) Terminal No. 29 Monthly Fire Sprinklers Inspection.	12	month	\$ 1,115.00	\$ 13,380.00	\$ 130.00	\$ 1,560.00	\$ 210.00	\$ 2,520.00
BLD2128953B1--02-51	(1082-0021) HERON Parking Garage Monthly Fire Sprinklers Inspection.	12	month	\$ 1,115.00	\$ 13,380.00	\$ 850.00	\$ 10,200.00	\$ 1,500.00	\$ 18,000.00
BLD2128953B1--02-52	(1080-0009) Warehouse No. 30 Monthly Fire Sprinklers Inspection. Monthly Fire Sprinklers Inspection Per Specifications and	12	month	\$ 1,115.00	\$ 13,380.00	\$ 130.00	\$ 1,560.00	\$ 210.00	\$ 2,520.00
BLD2128953B1--02-53	Requirements. (1082-0021) HERON Parking Garage Monthly Fire Pump System	12	month	\$ 1,115.00	\$ 13,380.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 780.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 1,800.00
BLD2128953B1--02-54	Inspection.	12	month	\$ 1,115.00	\$ 13,380.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 600.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 1,500.00
BLD2128953B1--02-55	(1081-0003) Administration Building Monthly Electric Fire Pump System Inspection	12	month	\$ 1,115.00	\$ 13,380.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 600.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 1,500.00
BLD2128953B1--02-56	(1081-0018) Midport Garage Monthly Fire Electric Pump System Inspection.	12	month	\$ 1,115.00	\$ 13,380.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 600.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 1,500.00
BLD2128953B1--02-57	(1082-0021) Terminal No. 4 Monthly Fire Electric Pump System Inspection.	12	month	\$ 1,115.00	\$ 13,380.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 600.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 1,500.00
BLD2128953B1--02-58	(1081-0023) Terminal No. 25 Monthly Fire Electric Pump System Inspection.	12	month	\$ 1,115.00	\$ 13,380.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 600.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 1,500.00
BLD2128953B1--02-59	(1081-0025) Terminal No. 26 Monthly Fire Electric Pump System Inspection.	12	month	\$ 1,115.00	\$ 13,380.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 600.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 1,500.00
BLD2128953B1--02-60	(1081-0013) Port Public Safety Security Operations CTR. (SOC) Mthly Inspection.	12	month	\$ 1,115.00	\$ 13,380.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 780.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 1,800.00
BLD2128953B1--02-61	(1082-0010) Public Works Office Building Monthly Fire Sprinklers Inspection.	12	month	\$ 1,115.00	\$ 13,380.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 780.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 1,800.00

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Advanced Systems Inc		AB Fire Equipment		Black Fire Protection Inc.	
				Price	Total	Price	Total	Price	Total
BLD2128953B1--02-62	(1081-0018) Midport Garage Weekly Fire Pump (electric) Inspection. Scheduled labor rate for certified NICET II or III technician (business hours).	52	week	\$ 575.00	\$ 29,900.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 2,600.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 6,500.00
BLD2128953B1--02-63	Scheduled labor rate for certified NICET II or III technician (business hours).	600	hour	\$ 135.00	\$ 81,000.00	\$ 72.00	\$ 43,200.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 51,000.00
BLD2128953B1--02-64	Scheduled labor rate for certified NICET II or III technician (non-business hrs)	300	hour	\$ 270.00	\$ 81,000.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 30,000.00	\$ 157.50	\$ 47,250.00
BLD2128953B1--02-65	Scheduled labor rate for non-certified technician/helper (business hours).	300	hour	\$ 135.00	\$ 40,500.00	\$ 68.00	\$ 20,400.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 25,500.00
BLD2128953B1--02-66	Scheduled labor rate for non-certified technician/helper (non-business hours).	300	hour	\$ 270.00	\$ 81,000.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 27,000.00	\$ 127.50	\$ 38,250.00
BLD2128953B1--02-67	Emergency labor rate for certified NICET II or III technician (business hours).	60	hour	\$ 205.00	\$ 12,300.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 6,000.00	\$ 157.50	\$ 9,450.00
BLD2128953B1--02-68	Emergency labor rates for certified NICET II or III technician(non-business hrs)	68	hour	\$ 270.00	\$ 18,360.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 8,500.00	\$ 157.50	\$ 10,710.00
BLD2128953B1--02-69	Emergency labor rate for non-certified technician/helper (business hours).	60	hour	\$ 205.00	\$ 12,300.00	\$ 68.00	\$ 4,080.00	\$ 127.50	\$ 7,650.00
BLD2128953B1--02-70	Emergency labor rate for non-certified technician/helper (non-business hours).	60	hour	\$ 270.00	\$ 16,200.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 5,400.00	\$ 127.50	\$ 7,650.00
BLD2128953B1--02-71	Engineering Services to include signed and sealed drawings.	250	hour	\$ 150.00	\$ 37,500.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 25,000.00	\$ 175.00	\$ 43,750.00
BLD2128953B1--02-72	Labor Hours for Replacement of existing Fire pump and Controllers.	200	hour	\$ 135.00	\$ 27,000.00	\$ 72.00	\$ 14,400.00	\$ 175.00	\$ 35,000.00
BLD2128953B1--02-73	Removal and safe disposal of existing Materials.	200	hour	\$ 135.00	\$ 27,000.00	\$ 68.00	\$ 13,600.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 17,000.00
BLD2128953B1--02-74	1 inch - 2 inch- Galvanized Sch. 40 pipe to include red color epoxy coating.	5	each	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 12.00	\$ 60.00
BLD2128953B1--02-75	1 inch - 3 inch Flow Switch to include red color epoxy coating.	5	each	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 195.00	\$ 975.00
BLD2128953B1--02-76	1 inch - 3 inch Galvanized 22.5 Degree Elbow to include red color epoxy coating.	5	each	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 250.00
BLD2128953B1--02-77	1 inch - 3 inch Galvanized 45 Degree Elbow to include red color epoxy coating.	5	each	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 200.00
BLD2128953B1--02-78	1 inch - 3 inch Galvanized 90 Degree Elbow to include red color epoxy coating.	5	each	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 200.00
BLD2128953B1--02-79	1 inch-3 inch Galvanized Back Flow Preventer to include red color epoxy coating.	5	each	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$ 3,100.00	\$ 15,500.00
BLD2128953B1--02-80	1 inch - 3 inch Galvanized Check Valves to include red color epoxy coating.	5	each	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$ 425.00	\$ 2,125.00
BLD2128953B1--02-81	1 inch - 3 inch Galvanized Couplings to include red color epoxy coating.	5	each	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$ 29.95	\$ 149.75	\$ 70.00	\$ 350.00
BLD2128953B1--02-82	1 inch - 3 inch Galvanized Double Detector Check Valves (DDCV).	5	each	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$ 3,100.00	\$ 15,500.00
BLD2128953B1--02-83	1 inch-3 inch Galvanized pipe Hangers and support.	5	each	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$ 7.00	\$ 35.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 100.00

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Advanced Systems Inc		AB Fire Equipment		Black Fire Protection Inc.	
				Price	Total	Price	Total	Price	Total
BLD2128953B1--02-84	1 inch - 3 inch Galvanized Valves to include red color epoxy coating.	5	each	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$500.00	\$2,500.00
BLD2128953B1--02-85	11 inch - 12 inch Galvanized Sch. 40 pipe to include red color epoxy coating.	5	each	\$0.00	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$170.00	\$850.00
BLD2128953B1--02-86	3 inch - 4 inch Galvanized Sch. 40 pipe to include red color epoxy coating.	5	each	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$40.00	\$200.00
BLD2128953B1--02-87	3 inch - 6 inch Flow Switch to include red color epoxy coating.	5	each	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$299.00	\$1,495.00	\$280.00	\$1,400.00
BLD2128953B1--02-88	3 inch - 6 inch Galvanized 22.5 Degree Elbow to include red color epoxy coating.	5	each	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$38.95	\$194.75	\$175.00	\$875.00
BLD2128953B1--02-89	3 inch - 6 inch Galvanized 45 Degree Elbow to include red color epoxy coating.	5	each	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$38.96	\$194.80	\$175.00	\$875.00
BLD2128953B1--02-90	3 inch - 6 inch Galvanized 90 Degree Elbow to include red color epoxy coating.	5	each	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$38.95	\$194.75	\$175.00	\$875.00
BLD2128953B1--02-91	3 inch-6 inch Galvanized Back Flow Preventer to include red color epoxy coating.	5	each	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$6,000.00	\$30,000.00
BLD2128953B1--02-92	3 inch - 6 inch Galvanized Check Valves to include red color epoxy coating.	5	each	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$1,000.00	\$5,000.00
BLD2128953B1--02-93	3 inch - 6 inch Galvanized Couplings to include red color epoxy coating.	5	each	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$38.95	\$194.75	\$80.00	\$400.00
BLD2128953B1--02-94	3 inch - 6 inch Galvanized Double Detector Check Valves (DDCV).	5	each	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$6,000.00	\$30,000.00
BLD2128953B1--02-95	3 inch - 6 inch Galvanized pipe Hangers and Support.	5	each	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$9.00	\$45.00	\$20.00	\$100.00
BLD2128953B1--02-96	3 inch - 6 inch Galvanized Valves to include red color epoxy coating.	5	each	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$1,000.00	\$5,000.00
BLD2128953B1--02-97	350 KW Generator rental to include setup delivery and pickup.	5	each	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$3,500.00	\$17,500.00
BLD2128953B1--02-98	5 inch - 6 inch Galvanized Sch. 40 pipe to include red color epoxy coating.	5	each	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$70.00	\$350.00
BLD2128953B1--02-99	6 inch - 8 inch Flow Switch to include red color epoxy coating.	5	each	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$299.99	\$1,499.95	\$400.00	\$2,000.00
BLD2128953B1--02-100	6 inch - 8 inch Galvanized 22.5 Degree Elbow to include red color epoxy coating.	5	each	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$44.95	\$224.75	\$400.00	\$2,000.00
BLD2128953B1--02-101	6 inch - 8 inch Galvanized 45 Degree Elbow to include red color epoxy coating.	5	each	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$44.05	\$220.25	\$400.00	\$2,000.00
BLD2128953B1--02-102	6 inch - 8 inch Galvanized 90 Degree Elbow to include red color epoxy coating.	5	each	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$44.95	\$224.75	\$400.00	\$2,000.00
BLD2128953B1--02-103	6 inch-8 inch Galvanized Back Flow Preventer to include red color epoxy coating.	5	each	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$10,000.00	\$50,000.00
BLD2128953B1--02-104	6 inch - 8 inch Galvanized Check Valves to include red color epoxy coating.	5	each	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$2,000.00	\$10,000.00

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Advanced Systems Inc		AB Fire Equipment		Black Fire Protection Inc.	
				Price	Total	Price	Total	Price	Total
BLD2128953B1--02-105	6 inch - 8 inch Galvanized Couplings to include red color epoxy coating.	5	each	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$38.95	\$194.75	\$100.00	\$500.00
BLD2128953B1--02-106	6 inch - 8 inch Galvanized Double Detector Check Valves (DDCV).	5	each	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$10,000.00	\$50,000.00
BLD2128953B1--02-107	6 inch - 8 inch Galvanized Pipe Hangers and Support.	5	each	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$9.00	\$45.00	\$30.00	\$150.00
BLD2128953B1--02-108	6 inch - 8 inch Galvanized Valves to include red color epoxy coating.	5	each	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$2,000.00	\$10,000.00
BLD2128953B1--02-109	7 inch - 8 inch Galvanized sch. 40 pipe to include red color epoxy coating.	5	each	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$100.00	\$500.00
BLD2128953B1--02-110	8 inch - 12 inch Flow Switch to include red color epoxy coating.	5	each	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$320.00	\$1,600.00	\$800.00	\$4,000.00
BLD2128953B1--02-111	8 inch - 12 inch Galvanized 22.5 Degree Elbow to include red color epoxy coating	5	each	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$48.95	\$244.75	\$3,200.00	\$16,000.00
BLD2128953B1--02-112	8 inch - 12 inch Galvanized 45 Degree Elbow to include red color epoxy coating.	5	each	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$48.95	\$244.75	\$2,400.00	\$12,000.00
BLD2128953B1--02-113	8 inch - 12 inch Galvanized 90 Degree Elbow to include red color epoxy coating.	5	each	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$48.95	\$244.75	\$3,400.00	\$17,000.00
BLD2128953B1--02-114	8 inch-12 inch Galvanized Back Flow Preventer to include red color epoxy coating	5	each	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$30,000.00	\$150,000.00
BLD2128953B1--02-115	8 inch - 12 inch Galvanized Check Valves to include red color epoxy coating.	5	each	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$20,000.00	\$100,000.00
BLD2128953B1--02-116	8 inch - 12 inch Galvanized Couplings to include red color epoxy coating.	5	each	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$48.95	\$244.75	\$1,000.00	\$5,000.00
BLD2128953B1--02-117	8 inch - 12 inch Galvanized Double Detector Check Valves (DDCV).	5	each	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$30,000.00	\$150,000.00
BLD2128953B1--02-118	8 inch - 12 inch Galvanized pipe Hangers and Support.	5	each	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$10.00	\$50.00	\$250.00	\$1,250.00
BLD2128953B1--02-119	8 inch - 12 inch Galvanized Valves to include red color epoxy coating.	5	each	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$20,000.00	\$100,000.00
BLD2128953B1--02-120	9 inch - 10 inch Galvanized Sch. 40 pipe to include red color epoxy coating.	5	each	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$160.00	\$800.00
BLD2128953B1--02-121	1/4 inch 3 way screw type brass valve with in-run side brass plug UL listed.	5	each	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$25.00	\$125.00	\$25.00	\$125.00
BLD2128953B1--02-122	Epoxy coating with minimum thickness of 250 cm to include primer. Evaluations and Flow Pressure Testing per various locations in Port Everglades.	5	each	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$75.00	\$375.00
BLD2128953B1--02-123	Annual Fire Hydrant Test Location requires special hours for testing. Fire Sprinkler Suction Gauge or System Gauge UL Listed.	12	each	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$125.00	\$1,500.00	\$1,295.00	\$15,540.00
BLD2128953B1--02-124	Fire Sprinkler System Gauge UL Listed.	350	each	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$50.00	\$17,500.00	\$157.50	\$55,125.00
BLD2128953B1--02-125	Fire Sprinkler Suction Gauge or System Gauge UL Listed.	5	each	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$19.00	\$95.00	\$30.00	\$150.00
BLD2128953B1--02-126	Fire Sprinkler System Gauge UL Listed.	5	each	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$19.00	\$95.00	\$30.00	\$150.00



Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Advanced Systems Inc		AB Fire Equipment		Black Fire Protection Inc.	
				Price	Total	Price	Total	Price	Total
BLD2128953B1--02-127	Labor hours for Repairs on existing Fire Pump and Controllers.	200	each	\$ 135.00	\$ 27,000.00	\$ 72.00	\$ 14,400.00	\$ 175.00	\$ 35,000.00
BLD2128953B1--02-128	Peerless Fire Pump - 3 - 10 Horse power to include red color epoxy coating.	1	each	\$ 0.00	\$ 0.00	\$ 0.00	\$ 0.00	\$ 18,750.00	\$ 18,750.00
BLD2128953B1--02-129	Peerless Fire Pump - 10 - 20 Horse power to include red color epoxy coating.	1	each	\$ 0.00	\$ 0.00	\$ 0.00	\$ 0.00	\$ 30,000.00	\$ 30,000.00
BLD2128953B1--02-130	Peerless Fire Pump - 20 - 40 Horse power to include red color epoxy coating.	1	each	\$ 0.00	\$ 0.00	\$ 0.00	\$ 0.00	\$ 41,250.00	\$ 41,250.00
BLD2128953B1--02-131	Peerless Fire Pump - 40 - 80 Horse power to include red color epoxy coating.	1	each	\$ 0.00	\$ 0.00	\$ 0.00	\$ 0.00	\$ 56,250.00	\$ 56,250.00
BLD2128953B1--02-132	Peerless Fire Pump Controller to cover 3 - 10 Horse Power Pump.	1	each	\$ 0.00	\$ 0.00	\$ 0.00	\$ 0.00	\$ 12,750.00	\$ 12,750.00
BLD2128953B1--02-133	Peerless Fire Pump Controller to cover 10 - 20 Horse Power Pump.	1	each	\$ 0.00	\$ 0.00	\$ 0.00	\$ 0.00	\$ 15,000.00	\$ 15,000.00
BLD2128953B1--02-134	Peerless Fire Pump Controller to cover 20 - 40 Horse Power Pump.	1	each	\$ 0.00	\$ 0.00	\$ 0.00	\$ 0.00	\$ 21,000.00	\$ 21,000.00
BLD2128953B1--02-135	Peerless Fire Pump Controller to cover 40 - 80 Horse Power Pump.	1	each	\$ 0.00	\$ 0.00	\$ 0.00	\$ 0.00	\$ 26,250.00	\$ 26,250.00
BLD2128953B1--02-136	Pressure clean to include generator and all necessary equipment.	1500	each	\$ 0.00	\$ 0.00	\$ 0.00	\$ 0.00	\$ 175.00	\$ 262,500.00
BLD2128953B1--02-137	Scissor Lift / Man Lift up to 30 feet.	10	each	\$ 0.00	\$ 0.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 600.00	\$ 6,000.00
BLD2128953B1--02-138	Scissor Lift / Man Lift up to 31 feet - 59 feet.	2	each	\$ 0.00	\$ 0.00	\$ 1,500.00	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 1,200.00	\$ 2,400.00
BLD2128953B1--02-139	Scissor Lift / Man Lift up to 60 feet - 100 feet.	6	each	\$ 0.00	\$ 0.00	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 18,000.00	\$ 2,000.00	\$ 12,000.00
BLD2128953B1--02-140	Sprinkler heads.	2000	each	\$ 0.00	\$ 0.00	\$ 13.00	\$ 26,000.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 40,000.00
BLD2128953B1--02-141	36 inch Mueller Super Centurion Model No. 250 Fire Hydrant.	50	each	\$ 0.00	\$ 0.00	\$ 0.00	\$ 0.00	\$ 7,500.00	\$ 375,000.00
BLD2128953B1--02-142	48 inch Mueller Super Centurion Model No. 250 Fire Hydrant.	10	each	\$ 0.00	\$ 0.00	\$ 0.00	\$ 0.00	\$ 7,500.00	\$ 75,000.00
BLD2128953B1--02-143	48 inch Mueller Super Centurion Model No. 250/HS Fire Hydrant.	10	each	\$ 0.00	\$ 0.00	\$ 0.00	\$ 0.00	\$ 9,000.00	\$ 90,000.00
BLD2128953B1--02-144	Mueller Super Centurim Extension Kit 0 feet 6 inches - 1 foot 6 inches.	10	each	\$ 0.00	\$ 0.00	\$ 0.00	\$ 0.00	\$ 2,200.00	\$ 22,000.00
BLD2128953B1--02-145	Backflow and Fire Hydrants Repair Services.	30	each	\$ 135.00	\$ 4,050.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 4,500.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 2,550.00
<b>Group 2 PORT Total Bid Amount</b>					<b>\$ 1,001,370.00</b>		<b>\$ 425,102.21</b>		<b>\$ 2,471,575.00</b>
<b>Allowances</b>					<b>\$ 152,500.00</b>		<b>\$ 152,500.00</b>		<b>\$ 152,500.00</b>
<b>TOTAL INITIAL ONE-YEAR AWARD AMOUNT</b>					<b>\$ 2,023,495.00</b>		<b>\$ 949,187.21</b>		<b>\$ 3,197,269.00</b>
<b>POTENTIAL FIVE-YEAR AWARD AMOUNT</b>					<b>\$ 10,117,475.00</b>		<b>\$ 4,745,936.05</b>		<b>\$ 15,986,345.00</b>

Rejected

Rejected

Rejected

Rejected

Rejected

Rejected

Rejected

Award