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SUPERIOR OFFICE SERVICES

UnitPrice

$132,029.0
0
$0
TotalCost

1 Group 1 - Sign Shop Material Items (Annually) (69)

2.25 inches x 100 yards BriteLine+ Application Tape

#1-1 |OPN2129256B1_1_01 |or approved equal 6 |each No Bid No Bid $69.53 |$417.18 $99 $ 594
15 inches x 100 yards, BriteLite+ Application Tape or

#1-2 |OPN2129256B1_1_02 |approved equal 2 |each No Bid No Bid $77.25 |$154.5 $ 105 $210
30 inches x 100 yards, BriteLite+ Appplication Tape or

#1-3 |OPN2129256B1_1_03 [approved equal 2 |each No Bid No Bid $154.5 |$309.0 $224 $ 448
30 inches x 50 yards, Intense Blue 3630 Unpunched

#1-4 |OPN2129256B1_1_04 |or approved equal 2 |each No Bid No Bid $932.08 |[$1,864.16 $1,150.0 $2,300.0

#1-5 |OPN2129256B1_1_05 |Squeege Blue Felt or approved equal 24 |each No Bid No Bid $14.9 $357.6 $12 $288
48 inches x 96 inches, Sheet, Light Blue Corrugated

#1-6 |OPN2129256B1_1_06 |Plastic or approved equal 10 |each No Bid No Bid $22.29 $222.89 ||$ 25 $ 250
48 inches x 96 inches, Sheet, White Corrugated

#1-7 |OPN2129256B1_1_07 |Plastic or approved equal 20 |each No Bid No Bid $11.79 $235.79 ||$ 15 $ 300
48 inches x 96 inches x 3MM, White Palight PVC or

#1-8 |OPN2129256B1_1_08 [approved equal 24 |each No Bid No Bid $49.11 $1,178.63 [[$ 75 $1,800.0
MRP HP 831 775 ML Cyan Latex Designlet or

#1-9 |OPN2129256B1_1_09 [approved equal 10 |each No Bid No Bid $212.71 [$2,127.1 $271 $2,710.0
MRP HP 831 775 ML Black Latex Designlet or

#1-10 |OPN2129256B1_1_10 [approved equal 3 |each No Bid No Bid $212.71 |$638.13 $271 $813
MRP HP 831 775 ML MAG Latex DesignJet or

#1-11 |OPN2129256B1_1_11 |approved equal 3 |each No Bid No Bid $212.71 |$638.13 $271 $813
MRP HP 831 775 ML MAGTA Latex DesignJet or

#1-12 |OPN2129256B1_1_12 |approved equal 3 |each No Bid No Bid $212.71 |$638.13 $271 $813
MRP HP 831 775 ML Yellow Latex Designlet or

#1-13 |OPN2129256B1_1_13 [approved equal 8 |each No Bid No Bid $212.71 [$1,701.68 $271 $2,168.0
60 inches x 500 feet, 50 pound, Brown Kraft Paper or

#1-14 |OPN2129256B1_1_14 |approved equal 4 |each No Bid No Bid $99.29 |$397.16 $ 120 $ 480
MRP DOLI1360Z Optically Clear 48 inch x 50 yard or

#1-15 |OPN2129256B1_1_15 |approved equal 4 |each No Bid No Bid $555.75 [$2,223.0 $ 645 $2,580.0
54 inches x 150 feet 6.0MIL RAD Grafix V or approved

#1-16 |OPN2129256B1_1_16 [equal 1 |each No Bid No Bid $364.5 [$364.5 $ 499 $499
MRP HP 831 775 ML Latex Optimizer Ink Car or

#1-17 |OPN2129256B1_1_17 |approved equal 4 |each No Bid No Bid $212.71 |$850.84 $271 $1,084.0

#1-18 |OPN2129256B1_1_18|3/4 inch x 25 yards, White Hook or approved equal |4 |each No Bid No Bid $34.94 |$139.76 $35 $ 140

#1-19 |OPN2129256B1_1_19 |3/4 inch x 25 yards, White Loop or approved equal |4 |each No Bid No Bid $34.94 |$139.76 $35 $ 140
.020 48 x 96 White Hips Matte/Matte Opaque or

#1-20 |OPN2129256B1_1_20 [approved equal 24 |each No Bid No Bid $11.59 $278.15 [[$ 15 $ 360
48 inches x 50 yards, Orcal 631 Azure Blue or

#1-21 [OPN2129256B1_1_21 |approved equal 2 |each No Bid No Bid $341.58 [$683.16 $ 389 $778
Application Fluid, 5 Gallon Container or approved

#1-22 |OPN2129256B1_1_22 |equal 2 |container No Bid No Bid $276.6 [$553.2 $319 $638
48 inches x 50 yards, Matte Black Blockout Film or

#1-23 |OPN2129256B1_1_23 [approved equal 1 |each No Bid No Bid $1,186.6 [$1,186.6 $1,350.0 $1,350.0
HP 831 Latex Maintenance Cartridge or approved

#1-24 [OPN2129256B1_1_24 |equal 2 |each No Bid No Bid $205.28 |[$410.56 $285 $570
HP 831 Cyan/Black Designlet Printhead or approved

#1-25 |OPN2129256B1_1_25 |equal 3 |each No Bid No Bid $176.38 |$529.14 $ 252 $ 756
HP 831 Yellow/Magenta DesignJet Printhead or

#1-26 |OPN2129256B1_1_26 |approved equal 3 |each No Bid No Bid $176.38 |$529.14 $252 $756
HP 831 Lt. Mag/Lt. Cyan Designlet Printhead or

#1-27 |OPN2129256B1_1_27 |approved equal 3 |each No Bid No Bid $176.38 |$529.14 $252 $756

#1-28 |OPN2129256B1_1_28 |HP 831 Latex Optimizer Printhead or approved equal |3 |each No Bid No Bid $176.38 |$529.14 $252 $756
30 Degrees Snap Blade 9MM, 100 pieces per package

#1-29 [OPN2129256B1_1_29 |or approved equal 1 |each No Bid No Bid $164.09 |$164.09 $253 $253
60 inches x 100 feet 10ML Instant Dry Satin or

#1-30 |OPN2129256B1_1_30 |approved equal 2 |each No Bid No Bid $677.39 [$1,354.78 $ 842 $1,684.0
48 inches x 96 inches Aluminum Sheet MILL 5052-

#1-31 |OPN2129256B1_1_31|H32 or approved equal 12 |each No Bid No Bid $101.51 $1,218.12 [[$ 125 $1,500.0
54 inches x 50 yards, 1J35C Gloss White Vinyl Comply

#1-32 |OPN2129256B1_1_32 |or approved equal 12 |each No Bid No Bid $ 336.45 $4,037.39 | |$ 332 $3,984.0
54 inches x 50 yards , 8509 Luster Over Laminate or

#1-33 |OPN2129256B1_1_33 |approved equal 12 |each No Bid No Bid $423.66 |$5,083.92 $ 499 $5,988.0
54 inches x 50 yards, 1J180C Gloss White Vinyl

#1-34 |OPN2129256B1_1_34 |Comply or approved equal 6 |each No Bid No Bid $1,116.45 $6,698.70 | |$ 1,294.0 $7,764.0
54 inches x 50 yards , 8519 Luster Over Laminate or

#1-35 |OPN2129256B1_1_35 |approved equal 6 |each No Bid No Bid $826.51 $4,959.05 | |$ 862 $5,172.0

#1-36 |OPN2129256B1_1_36 |Maxmetal or approved equal 12 |each No Bid No Bid $363.8 |$4,365.6 $75 $ 900

#1-37 |OPN2129256B1_1_37|3M VHB Tape (FOR PVC) or approved equal 10 |each No Bid No Bid $1,763.14|$ 17,631.4 $ 250 $2,500.0
OLFA Heavy-Duty Rubber Inset Utility Knife or

#1-38 |OPN2129256B1_1_38 |approved equal 2 |each No Bid No Bid $2435 |$48.7 $35 $70

#1-39 |OPN2129256B1_1_39 |OLFA Heavy-Duty Snap-off Blade or approved equal |2 |each No Bid No Bid $19.86 |$39.72 S 66 $132
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OLFA Stainless Steel Slide-Lock Utility Knife or

#1-40 [OPN2129256B1_1_40 |[approved equal 2 |each No Bid No Bid $20.26 |$40.52 $25 $ 50

#1-41 [OPN2129256B1_1_41 |OLFA Snap-Off Blades or approved equal 2 |each No Bid No Bid $42.44 [$84.88 $20 $ 40
36 inches x 100 feet Canon 10 mil (240g) satin photo

#1-42 [OPN2129256B1_1_42 |paper or approved equal 4 |each No Bid No Bid $404.52 |$1,618.08 $524 $2,096.0
ACRYLITE P99 1/4 inch Non-Glare Acrylic 4 feet x 8

#1-43 [OPN2129256B1_1_43 [feet Sheets White, Matte or approved equal 4 |each No Bid No Bid $318.06 |$1,272.24 $499 $1,996.0
3/16 inches Cast Acrylic 4 feet x 8 feet Sheets White

#1-44 |OPN2129256B1_1_44 7328 or approved equal 2 |each No Bid No Bid $163.03 |$326.06 $199 $398
3/16 inches Foamboard 4 feet x 8 feet Sheet White

#1-45 [OPN2129256B1_1_45 |or approved equal 2 |each No Bid No Bid $22.41 [$44.82 $25 $ 50
3/16 inches UltraBoard Mount 4 feet x 8 feet Sheet

#1-46 [OPN2129256B1_1_46 |White or approved equal 2 |each No Bid No Bid $61.98 [$123.96 $75 $ 150
Graphtec Plotter Blades 2-Pack CB15UA (Reflective)

#1-47 [OPN2129256B1_1_47 |or approved equal 2 |each No Bid No Bid $244.13 |$488.26 $296 $ 592
Graphtec Plotter Blades 2-Pack CBO9UB or approved

#1-48 |OPN2129256B1_1_48 |equal 2 |each No Bid No Bid $126.53 |$253.06 $199 $398
3MIJ5100R-10 3M Scotchlite Reflective Graphic Film

#1-49 |OPN2129256B1_1_49 |1J5100R 48 in x 25 yd or approved equal 12 |each No Bid No Bid $840.94 |$10,091.28 $984 $11,808.0
05650RA-010-541 ORALITE 5650RA Fleet Engineer
Grade Reflective 54in x 10 yd, White, Punched: No or

#1-50 |OPN2129256B1_1_50 |approved equal 5 |each No Bid No Bid $760.49 |$3,802.45 $ 809 $ 4,045.0
P846MW Palight Premium Foamed PVC Sheets 4 ft x

#1-51 [OPN2129256B1_1_51 |8 ft, White, 6 mm or approved equal 6 |each No Bid No Bid $94.7 $568.2 $99 $ 594
P8412MW Palight Premium Foamed PVC Sheets 4 ft

#1-52 [OPN2129256B1_1_52 |x 8 ft, White, 12 mm or approved equal 5 |each No Bid No Bid $173.45 |$867.25 $239 $1,195.0
P8419MW Palight Premium Foamed PVC Sheets 4 ft

#1-53 [OPN2129256B1_1_53 |x 8 ft, White, 19 mm or approved equal 6 |each No Bid No Bid $272.8 $1,636.80 | [$ 319 $1,914.0
P8425MW Palight Premium Foamed PVC Sheets 4 ft

#1-54 [OPN2129256B1_1_54 |x 8 ft, White, 25 mm or approved equal 5 |each No Bid No Bid $393.75 |[$1,968.75 $ 499 $2,495.0
P1053MW Palight Premium Foamed PVC Sheets 5 ft

#1-55 [OPN2129256B1_1_55 [x 10 ft, White, 3 mm or approved equal 6 |each No Bid No Bid $76.74 $460.43 ||$ 99 $ 594
CC60120316W7328 Duratex Cast Acrylic 5 ft x 10 ft,

#1-56 [OPN2129256B1_1_56 |White 7328, 3/16 in or approved equal 6 |each No Bid No Bid $84.51 $507.06 ||S 268 $1,608.0
UB84316W UltraBoard Classic 48 in x 96 in, White,

#1-57 [OPN2129256B1_1_57|3/16 in or approved equal 6 |each No Bid No Bid $65.91 [$395.46 $99 $ 594
3M8520 3M Scotchcal Matte Graphic Protection

#1-58 |[OPN2129256B1_1_58 |Overlaminate 8520 54 in x 50 yd or approved equal |10 |each No Bid No Bid $826.51 |$8,265.1 $ 862 $ 8,620.0
BL-T54150 Briteline Translucent Printable Vinyl Film

#1-59 [OPN2129256B1_1_59 |54 in x 150 ft or approved equal 6 |each No Bid No Bid $870.4 |$5,222.4 $999 $5,994.0
211-54 GF 211 Traffic Graphic Overlaminate 54in x 50

#1-60 [OPN2129256B1_1_60 |yd or approved equal 6 |each No Bid No Bid $644.78 |$ 3,868.68 $921 $5,526.0
212-54 GF 212 Carpet Film 54 in x 50 yd or approved

#1-61 |[OPN2129256B1_1_61 |equal 6 |each No Bid No Bid $442.24 |$2,653.44 $ 499 $2,994.0
109-54 GF 109 Overlaminate 54 in x 50 yd or

#1-62 [OPN2129256B1_1_62 [approved equal 6 |each No Bid No Bid $648.68 |$ 3,892.08 $819 $4,914.0
LF328BK Poster Holder Stands 22 in x 28 in, Black or

#1-63 |OPN2129256B1_1_63 |approved equal 6 |each No Bid No Bid $343.9 $2,063.39 ||$ 376 $2,256.0
OLUV-MATS54 Briteline Shield UV Overlaminate 54 in

#1-64 [OPN2129256B1_1_64 |x 150 ft, Matte or approved equal 5 |each No Bid No Bid $303.06 |$1,515.3 $275 $1,375.0
5100R-76-3010U 3M 5100R Scotchlite Reflective
Vinyl Graphic Film 30in x 10 yd, Light Blue, Punched:

#1-65 [OPN2129256B1_1_65 |No or approved equal 2 |each No Bid No Bid $315.13 [$630.26 $312 $624
7125-211-2410 3M 7125 Scotchcal ElectroCut
Graphic Film 24in x 10 yd, Charcoal Metallic,

#1-66 [OPN2129256B1_1_66 [Punched: No or approved equal 6 |each No Bid No Bid $135.76 |$814.56 $ 150 $ 900
3635-20B-48 3M Blockout 3635-20b White Film 48 in

#1-67 [OPN2129256B1_1_67 |x 50 yd or approved equal 3 |each No Bid No Bid $1,186.56|$ 3,559.68 $1,499.0 $4,497.0
0290GF-54 ORAGUARD 290GF Optically Clear

#1-68 |OPN2129256B1_1_68 [Laminating Film 54 in x 50 yd or approved equal 5 |each No Bid No Bid $908.18 |$4,540.9 $1,027.0 $5,135.0
WS8977 Wind Sign Deluxe Snap Frame or approved

#1-69 |[OPN2129256B1_1_69 |equal 6 |each No Bid No Bid $474.24 |$2,845.44 $580 $ 3,480.0
Fixed Percent Discount Off Catalog Price List | ‘ ‘ ‘

#2-1 |Percent Discount (Estimated Annual Amount $5,000) 1 |Percent No Bid No Bid 40% 40%| |No Bid No Bid







Accessibility Report





		Filename: 

		Exhibit 1 - Bid Tabulation.pdf









		Report created by: 

		



		Organization: 

		







[Enter personal and organization information through the Preferences > Identity dialog.]



Summary



The checker found no problems in this document.





		Needs manual check: 0



		Passed manually: 2



		Failed manually: 0



		Skipped: 0



		Passed: 30



		Failed: 0







Detailed Report





		Document





		Rule Name		Status		Description



		Accessibility permission flag		Passed		Accessibility permission flag must be set



		Image-only PDF		Passed		Document is not image-only PDF



		Tagged PDF		Passed		Document is tagged PDF



		Logical Reading Order		Passed manually		Document structure provides a logical reading order



		Primary language		Passed		Text language is specified



		Title		Passed		Document title is showing in title bar



		Bookmarks		Passed		Bookmarks are present in large documents



		Color contrast		Passed manually		Document has appropriate color contrast



		Page Content





		Rule Name		Status		Description



		Tagged content		Passed		All page content is tagged



		Tagged annotations		Passed		All annotations are tagged



		Tab order		Passed		Tab order is consistent with structure order



		Character encoding		Passed		Reliable character encoding is provided



		Tagged multimedia		Passed		All multimedia objects are tagged



		Screen flicker		Passed		Page will not cause screen flicker



		Scripts		Passed		No inaccessible scripts



		Timed responses		Passed		Page does not require timed responses



		Navigation links		Passed		Navigation links are not repetitive



		Forms





		Rule Name		Status		Description



		Tagged form fields		Passed		All form fields are tagged



		Field descriptions		Passed		All form fields have description



		Alternate Text





		Rule Name		Status		Description



		Figures alternate text		Passed		Figures require alternate text



		Nested alternate text		Passed		Alternate text that will never be read



		Associated with content		Passed		Alternate text must be associated with some content



		Hides annotation		Passed		Alternate text should not hide annotation



		Other elements alternate text		Passed		Other elements that require alternate text



		Tables





		Rule Name		Status		Description



		Rows		Passed		TR must be a child of Table, THead, TBody, or TFoot



		TH and TD		Passed		TH and TD must be children of TR



		Headers		Passed		Tables should have headers



		Regularity		Passed		Tables must contain the same number of columns in each row and rows in each column



		Summary		Passed		Tables must have a summary



		Lists





		Rule Name		Status		Description



		List items		Passed		LI must be a child of L



		Lbl and LBody		Passed		Lbl and LBody must be children of LI



		Headings





		Rule Name		Status		Description



		Appropriate nesting		Passed		Appropriate nesting










Back to Top



