

Bid Tabulation												
Bid No. & Title: PNC212969ZC1, Second Floor Addition - Operations Center at Port Everglades												
#	Items	ItemDescription	Quantity of Required Measure	ACCEPTABLE PAINTING UNLIMITED LLC		FRANJO BUILDERS LLC		VERCETTI ENTERPRISES, LLC		DIPOPEO CONSTRUCTION CORPORATION	ALLEN CONSTRUCTION GROUP, Inc.	SHIFF CONSTRUCTION & DEVELOPMENT, INC.
				UnitPrice	Total	Unit Price	Total	UnitPrice	Total			
				Bid Amount								
				Unit								
				Quantity of Required Measure	UnitPrice	Total	Unit Price	Total	UnitPrice	Total	UnitPrice	Total
No Basket (19)												
	Volume 1 - Existing Division 02 - Conditions -	Demolition Services Include: Structure and Selective Destruction	1	Lump Sum	No Bid					\$117,781.00	\$320,000.00	\$226,251.68
#0-1	Volume 1 - Division 03 - Concrete	Concrete Services Include: Maintenance of Cast-In-Place Concrete, Concrete Forming and Accessories, Concrete Reinforcing, Cast-In-Place Concrete, Lightweight Insulating Concrete	1	Lump Sum	No Bid					\$612,593.00	\$360,000.00	\$395,940.45
#0-2	Volume 1 - Division 04 - Masonry	Masonry Services Include: Masonry Cleaning and Concrete Unit Masonry										
#0-3	Volume 1 - Division 05 - Metals	Metals include: Structural Steel Framing, Steel Decking, Metal Fabrications, Metal Pan Stairs and pipe and Tube Railings	1	Lump Sum	No Bid					\$220,000.00	\$250,000.00	\$339,377.53
#0-4	Volume 1 - Division 06 - Wood, Plastics and Composites	Wood Plastics and Composites include: Rough Carpentry and Plastic-Laminate-Clad Architectural Cabinets	1	Lump Sum	No Bid					\$276,025.00	\$275,000.00	\$395,940.45
#0-5		Thermal and Moisture Protection include: Preparation of Reroofing, Pre-Applied Integrally Bonded Sheet Membrane Waterproofing, Cold-Fluid Applied Waterproofing, Crystalline Waterproofing, Water Reppents, Thermal Insulation, Foamed-In-Place Insulation, Styrene-Butadiene-Styrene (SBS) Modified Bituminous Membrane Roofing, Sheet Metal Flasing and Trim, Roof Accessories, Applied Fire Protection, Intumescent Fire Protection, Penetration Firestopping, Joint Firestopping, Joint Sealants and Acoustical Joint Sealants	1	Lump Sum	No Bid					\$15,000.00	\$14,000.00	\$169,688.76
#0-6	Volume 1 - Division 07 - Thermal and Moisture Protection	Openings include: Hollow Metal Doors and Frames, Access Doors and Frames, Aluminum - Framed Entrance, Glazed Aluminum Curtain Walls and Window Walls, Door Hardware, Glazing and Fixed Louvers	1	Lump Sum	No Bid					\$346,428.00	\$270,000.00	\$452,503.37
#0-7	Volume 1 - Division 08 - Openings	Finishes Include: Maintenance Repainting, Moisture Vapor Emission Control, Non-Structural Metal Framing, Cement Plastering, Gypsum Board, Ceramic Tiling, Acoustical Panel Ceilings, Resilient Base and Accessories, Static-Control Resilient Flooring, Access Flooring, Exterior Painting, Interior Painting and High Performance Coatings	1	Lump Sum	No Bid					\$404,000.00	\$412,000.00	\$452,503.37
#0-8	Volume 1 - Division 09 - Finishes	Specialties Include: Wall and Door Protection, Toilet, Bath and Laundry Accessories, Fire Protection Cabinets and Fire Extinguishers	1	Lump Sum	\$116,502.00	\$116,502.00				\$29,632.00	\$25,000.00	\$282,814.61
#0-9												

[illegible]

[illegible]