

Price Analysis

Bid No. TRN2124711B1
Bus Stop Signs & Pole Mounted Solar Lighting Installation
Agency: Broward County Transportation Department
Purchasing Agent: Jermaine Pinnock

Date Bid Posted: 06/16/2022
Date Bid Opened: 08/03/2022
Bid Submittals: 4
Declinations: 4



Tabulation of Bids				SELS USA, LLC 4840 NE 11th Ave Oakland Park, FL 33334		Advanced Service Management Inc. 4840 NE 11th Ave Oakland Park, FL 33334		AUM Construction 4840 NE 11th Ave Oakland Park, FL 33334		Signal Technology & Installation Inc. 4840 NE 11th Ave Oakland Park, FL 33334		Pricing Estimate		Percentage Difference Between Overall Low Bidder and ICE	
Item	Description	Unit	Qty									Unit Price	Total Price		
TRN2124711B1--01-01	Thick Aluminum Panels Double Sided	EACH	2000	NO BID	NO BID	\$103.68	\$207,360.00	\$100.00	\$200,000.00	\$72.47	\$144,940.00	\$70.00	\$140,000.00	48.11%	
TRN2124711B1--01-02	Thick Aluminum Panels Single Sided	EACH	1200	NO BID	NO BID	\$34.56	\$41,472.00	\$100.00	\$120,000.00	\$17.26	\$20,712.00	\$25.00	\$30,000.00	38.24%	
TRN2124711B1--01-03	Wedge for Nex Poles by S-Square Tube Products or Approved Equal	EACH	350	NO BID	NO BID	\$5.76	\$2,016.00	\$10.00	\$3,500.00	\$10.52	\$3,682.00	\$5.00	\$1,750.00	15.20%	
TRN2124711B1--01-04	Non perforated anchor for 2"NEX Poles by S-Square Tube Product or Approved Equal	EACH	350	NO BID	NO BID	\$87.12	\$30,492.00	\$150.00	\$52,500.00	\$115.54	\$40,439.00	\$25.00	\$8,750.00	248.48%	
TRN2124711B1--01-05	NEX Sign Post (Octagon)	EACH	300	NO BID	NO BID	\$244.80	\$73,440.00	\$300.00	\$90,000.00	\$281.77	\$84,531.00	\$110.00	\$33,000.00	122.55%	
TRN2124711B1--01-06	TGIC Yellow Top Cap for 2" NEX Post (Powder coated)	EACH	300	NO BID	NO BID	\$16.20	\$4,860.00	\$20.00	\$6,000.00	\$25.22	\$7,566.00	\$12.50	\$3,750.00	29.60%	
TRN2124711B1--01-07	Z-Bar Bracket Set - 8" with 6" Hole Span	EACH	1000	NO BID	NO BID	\$30.00	\$30,000.00	\$30.00	\$30,000.00	\$30.36	\$30,360.00	\$23.00	\$23,000.00	30.43%	
TRN2124711B1--01-08	Single Post and Signs Installation in Concrete	EACH	300	NO BID	NO BID	\$108.00	\$32,400.00	\$250.00	\$75,000.00	\$362.80	\$108,840.00	\$115.00	\$34,500.00	-6.09%	
TRN2124711B1--01-09	Single Post and Signs Installation in Grass/Soil	EACH	300	NO BID	NO BID	\$93.60	\$28,080.00	\$250.00	\$75,000.00	\$241.87	\$72,561.00	\$105.00	\$31,500.00	-10.86%	
TRN2124711B1--01-10	Sign Install on Existing Bus Stop Post	EACH	1400	NO BID	NO BID	\$64.01	\$89,614.00	\$125.00	\$175,000.00	\$241.87	\$338,618.00	\$55.00	\$77,000.00	16.38%	
TRN2124711B1--01-11	Demolition & Removal/Recycling	EACH	2000	NO BID	NO BID	\$57.60	\$115,200.00	\$75.00	\$150,000.00	\$60.47	\$120,940.00	\$35.00	\$70,000.00	64.57%	
TRN2124711B1--01-12	Mobilization	EACH	1	NO BID	NO BID	\$51,465.00	\$51,465.00	\$100,000.00	\$100,000.00	\$167,288.16	\$167,288.16	\$25,000.00	\$25,000.00	105.86%	
TRN2124711B1--01-13	MOT (Sidewalk Closure Flaggers etc.)	EACH	50	NO BID	NO BID	\$14.40	\$720.00	\$450.00	\$22,500.00	\$1,934.90	\$96,745.00	\$28.00	\$1,400.00	-48.57%	
TRN2124711B1--01-14	8"x19" Sign Installation on Single Post	EACH	2000	NO BID	NO BID	\$36.00	\$72,000.00	\$75.00	\$150,000.00	\$241.87	\$483,740.00	\$45.00	\$90,000.00	-20.00%	
TRN2124711B1--01-15	Solar Pole Mounted LED Light Purchase	EACH	125	\$1,385.20	\$173,150.00	\$2,792.16	\$349,020.00	\$2,400.00	\$300,000.00	\$2,993.54	\$374,192.50	\$1,695.00	\$211,875.00	64.73%	
TRN2124711B1--01-16	Solar Pole Mounted LED Light Install	EACH	125	\$295.00	\$36,875.00	\$47.52	\$5,940.00	\$250.00	\$31,250.00	\$1,451.18	\$181,397.50	\$135.00	\$16,875.00	-64.80%	
TRN2124711B1--01-17	Trimming and Disposal of Tree Branches	EACH	115	NO BID	NO BID	\$21.60	\$2,484.00	\$100.00	\$11,500.00	\$483.73	\$55,628.95	\$15.00	\$1,725.00	44.00%	
TRN2124711B1--01-18	Installation/Removal of Poster Signage	EACH	4000	NO BID	NO BID	\$23.04	\$92,160.00	\$75.00	\$300,000.00	\$181.40	\$725,600.00	\$15.00	\$60,000.00	53.60%	
TRN2124711B1--01-19	Bus Stop Survey	EACH	2460	NO BID	NO BID	\$25.20	\$61,992.00	\$40.00	\$98,400.00	\$151.17	\$371,878.20	\$25.00	\$61,500.00	0.80%	
TRN2124711B1--01-20	Allowance	ALLOWANCE	1	NO BID	NO BID	\$98,000.00	\$98,000.00	\$98,000.00	\$ 98,000.00	\$98,000.00	\$98,000.00	\$98,000.00	\$98,000.00		
Total Bid Amount				\$210,025.00		\$1,388,715.00	\$1,388,715.00	\$2,088,650.00	\$2,088,650.00	\$3,527,659.31	\$3,527,659.31		\$1,019,625.00	36.20%	
					REJ		AWD								

AWD - Recommendation for Award

REJ - Failure to bid on all line items

Potential Award Total	\$1,388,715.00	4 Year Potential Total	\$ 5,554,860.00
--------------------------	----------------	---------------------------	-----------------