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SUMMARY
Bid Tabulation Thermo Air, Inc.** Airmatic Controls, M{\M AI(': and AJ Air Services, Te!n.ptr'ol Air
Inc. Refrigeration Co. Inc.* Conditioning, Inc.
Item No. e Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price
Description
Group 1 (Initial Term) Subtotal:| $ 348,537.00 || $ 374,126.50 || $ 778,190.65 || $ 176,460.00 No Bid
Allowance Total:|| $ 93,650.00 || $ 93,650.00 || $ 93,650.00 || $ 93,650.00 No Bid
Total for Initial Term thru 12/31/2020| $ 442,187.00 || $ 467,776.50 | $ 871,840.65 | $ 270,110.00 No Bid
Group 1 (Renewal No. 1) $ 397,917.00 || $ 411,554.60 | $ 841,84847 | $ 176,460.00 No Bid
Allowance Subtotal $ 93,650.00 [ $ 93,650.00 |[ $ 93,650.00 [ $ 93,650.00 No Bid
Total for Renewal No. 1 $ 491,567.00 || $ 505,204.60 || $ 935,498.47 || $ 270,110.00 No Bid
Group 1 (Renewal No. 2) $ 397,917.00 || § 411,554.60 || $ 841,84847 (1 $ 176,460.00 No Bid
Allowance Subtotal $ 93,650.00 || $ 93,650.00 || $ 93,650.00 || $ 93,650.00 No Bid
Total for Renewal No. 2 $ 491,567.00 || $ 505,204.60 || $ 935,498.47 || $ 270,110.00 No Bid
Potential 3-Year Total:| $ 1,425,321.00 | $ 1,478,185.70 || $ 2,742,837.59 || $ 810,330.00 No Bid
Bid Tabulation Thermo Air, Inc. mmstcContos M'.AM AI(.: L AJ Air Services, Inc. Tefr,ptr_ol Air
Inc. Refrigeration Co. Conditioning, Inc.
Item No. s Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price
Description
Group 2 (Initial Term) Subtotal:|| $ 189,574.00 | $ 190,951.50 || $ 1,336,496.01 No Bid $ 222,158.00
Allowance Total:|| $ 84,402.00 || $ 84,402.00 || $ 84,402.00 No Bid $ 84,402.00
Total for Initial Term thru 12/31/2020| $ 273,976.00 (| $ 275,353.50 || $ 1,420,898.01 No Bid $ 306,560.00
Group 2 (Renewal No. 1) $ 210,012.00 || $ 203,807.30 || $ 1,425,477.26 No Bid $ 227,364.00
Allowance Total $ 84,402.00 [ $ 84,402.00 | $ 84,402.00 No Bid $ 84,402.00
Total for Renewal No. 1 $ 294,414.00 || $ 288,209.30 || $ 1,509,879.26 No Bid $ 311,766.00
Group 2 (Renewal No. 2) $ 210,012.00 || $ 203,807.30 || $ 1,425,477.26 No Bid $ 227,364.00
Allowance Total $ 84,402.00 || $ 84,402.00 || $ 84,402.00 No Bid $ 84,402.00
Total for Renewal No. 2 $ 294,414.00 || $ 288,209.30 || $ 1,509,879.26 No Bid $ 311,766.00
Potential 3-Year Total:| $ 862,804.00 || $ 851,772.10 || $ 4,440,656.53 No Bid $ 930,092.00

*For Group 1, AJ Air Services, Inc. only bid on two of the thirty-six line items. AJ Air Services, Inc. was determined to be non-responsive for not bidding all lines of the solicitation as required in the solicitation’s

Basis of Award.

**For Group 1, Thermo Air, Inc. was determined to be non-responsive for not meeting the requirements of the solicitation's Special Instructions to Vendors and the Special Instructions - Section H. Certification

Requirements.

NOTE: Renewal Amounts reflect unit price increases due to the health care benefit increase effective January 1, 2021.
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Bid Tabulation

Thermo Air, Inc.

Percentage of
Unit Price Total Price Price Attributed to
Effective January Effective Labor Portion of
Item # Item Qty Unit Price Total 1,2021 January 1, 2021 Services

Group 1 - HVAC Precision Cooling Units
Repair Service Outside of Routine

BLD2117444B1--01-01 Maintenance: Labor Regular Hours 2068 [hour $ 102.00 | $ 210,936.00 [ $ 118.00 | $  244,024.00
Repair Service Outside of Routine

BLD2117444B1--01-02 Maintenance: Labor Overtime Hours 8|hour $ 153.00 | $ 1,224.00 | $ 178.00 | $ 1,424.00
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Florida

BLD2117444B1--01-03 Dept of Health 15|month $ 30000 |$% 4,500.00 |$ 350.00 [ $ 5,250.00 60.00
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: North

BLD2117444B1--01-04 Regional Health Center (Hunter Building) 15|month $ 55000 % 8,250.00 [ $ 600.00 | $ 9,000.00 60.00
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Paul

BLD2117444B1--01-05 Hughes Health Center (Hughes Building) 15|month $ 45000 | $ 6,750.00 | $ 500.00 | $ 7,500.00 60.00
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Lauderhill

BLD2117444B1--01-06 Transfer Facility 15|month $ 180.00 [$ 2,700.00 | $ 200.00 [ $ 3,000.00 60.00
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Transit

BLD2117444B1--01-07 O&M North Customer Service Building #4 15[month $ 430.00 | $ 6,450.00 | $ 460.00 | $ 6,900.00 50.00
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Transit

BLD2117444B1--01-08 O&M North Maintenance Building #2 15[month $ 400.00 | $ 6,000.00 | $ 440.00 [ $ 6,600.00 60.00
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Transit

BLD2117444B1--01-09 O&M South Maintenance Building 15[month $ 1,200.00 | $ 18,000.00 | $ 1,300.00 | $ 19,500.00 60.00
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Transit

BLD2117444B1--01-10 O&M South Parking Garage 15/month $ 350.00 |$ 5,250.00 | $ 400.00 | $ 6,000.00 60.00
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Broward

BLD2117444B1--01-11 County Landfill Administrative Building 15|month $ 150.00 [ $ 2,250.00 | $ 200.00 [ $ 3,000.00 60.00
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Broward

BLD2117444B1--01-12 County Landfill Scalehouse 15|month $ 150.00 [ $ 2,250.00 | $ 200.00 [ $ 3,000.00 60.00
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Animal

BLD2117444B1--01-13 Care & Regulation South 15|month $ 1500.00 [$ 22,500.00 | $ 1,600.00 | $ 24,000.00 60.00
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Medical

BLD2117444B1--01-14 Examiner South Building 15|month $ 1,200.00 [$ 18,000.00 | $ 1,300.00 | $ 19,500.00 60.00
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: 64th

BLD2117444B1--01-15 Street Warehouse 15/month $ 60000 |$ 9,000.00 | $ 660.00 | $ 9,900.00 60.00
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance: semi

BLD2117444B1--01-16 Florida Dept of Health 2|annual $ 600.00 |$ 1,200.00 | $ 800.00 [ $ 1,600.00 60.00
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance:
North Regional Health Center (Hunter semi

BLD2117444B1--01-17 Building 2[annual $ 600.00 | $ 1,200.00 | $ 680.00 | $ 1,360.00 60.00
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance: Paul semi

BLD2117444B1--01-18 Hughes Health Center (Hughes Building) 2|annual $ 52000 % 1,040.00 | $ 580.00 | $ 1,160.00 60.00
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance: semi

BLD2117444B1--01-19 Lauderhill Transfer Facility 2|annual $ 23000 (% 460.00 [ $ 280.00 [ $ 560.00 60.00
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance:
Transit O&M North Customer Service semi

BLD2117444B1--01-20 Building 2[annual $ 600.00 | $ 1,200.00 | $ 700.00 | $ 1,400.00 60.00
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance: semi

BLD2117444B1--01-21 Transit O&M North Maintenance Building #2 2|annual $ 1,100.00 | $ 2,200.00 [ $ 1,200.00 | $ 2,400.00 60.00
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance: semi

BLD2117444B1--01-22 Transit O&M South Maintenance Building 2|annual $ 350.00 [ $ 700.00 | $ 400.00 [ $ 800.00 60.00
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance: semi

BLD2117444B1--01-23 Transit O&M South Parking Garage 2[annual $ 880.00 |$ 1,760.00 | $ 980.00 | $ 1,960.00 60.00
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance: semi

BLD2117444B1--01-24 Broward County Landfill Administrative Build 2|annual $ 150.00 [ $ 300.00 | $ 180.00 [ § 360.00 60.00
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance: semi

BLD2117444B1--01-25 Broward County Landfill Scalehouse 2|annual $ 150.00 | $ 300.00 | $ 180.00 | $ 360.00 60.00
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance: semi

BLD2117444B1--01-26 Animal Care & Regulation South 2|annual $ 780.00 % 1,560.00 | $ 880.00 [ $ 1,760.00 60.00
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance: semi

BLD2117444B1--01-27 Medical Examiner South Building 2|annual $ 20000 [$ 400.00 [ $ 240.00 [ $ 480.00 60.00
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance: 64th semi

BLD2117444B1--01-28 Street Warehouse 2|annual $ 950.00 | $ 1,900.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 60.00
Parts & Materials: Thermostat Non-

BLD2117444B1--01-29 programmable 3|each $ 54.00 | $ 162.00 [ $ 60.00 | $ 180.00
Parts & Materials: Refrigeration Liquid Line

BLD2117444B1--01-30 Filter Drier 1/2 inch 7|each $ 44.00 | $ 308.00 | $ 54.00 | $ 378.00
Parts & Materials: Refrigeration Liquid Line

BLD2117444B1--01-31 Filter Drier 7/8 inch 2|each $ 45.00 | $ 90.00 | $ 55.00 | $ 110.00
Parts & Materials: Compressor Hermetic

BLD2117444B1--01-32 Scroll 1|each $ 140000 | $ 1,400.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 1,500.00

BLD2117444B1--01-33 Parts & Materials: Nitrogen 581|cubic foot | $ 700 |$ 4,067.00 | $ 9.00 % 5,229.00
Parts & Materials: Refrigerant (Freon) R-22

BLD2117444B1--01-34 Cylinder 79[pound $ 18.00 | $ 1,422.00 | $ 28.00 | $ 2,212.00
Parts & Materials: Refrigerant (Freon) R-410

BLD2117444B1--01-35 Cylinder 351|pound $ 800 |$ 2,808.00 [ $ 10.00 | $ 3,510.00
Parts & Materials: Refrigerant (Freon) RS-

BLD2117444B1--01-36 44B Refrigerant (453a) 63|pound $ - $ - - $ -

Pass-Thru Allowance 1|Each $ 93,650.00 $ 93,650.00

Group 1 Initial One Year Total Amount $ 442,187.00

Group 1 Renewal One Year Total Amount $  491,567.00

Group 1 Potential Three Year Total Amount $ 1,425,321.00
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Bid Tabulation

Airmatic Controls, Inc.

Percentage of

Unit Price Total Price Price Attributed to
Effective Effective January | Labor Portion of
Item # Item Qty Unit Price Total January 1, 2021 1, 2021 Services

Group 1 - HVAC Precision Cooling Units
Repair Service Outside of Routine

BLD2117444B1--01-01 Maintenance: Labor Regular Hours 2068 [hour $ 95.00 $ 196,460.00] $ 105.00| $ 217,140.00
Repair Service Outside of Routine

BLD2117444B1--01-02 Maintenance: Labor Overtime Hours 8|hour $ 130.00| $ 1,040.00] $ 140.00| $ 1,120.00
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Florida

BLD2117444B1--01-03 Dept of Health 15|month $ 280.00| $ 4,200.00] $ 320.00| $ 4,800.00 80
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: North

BLD2117444B1--01-04 Regional Health Center (Hunter Building) 15|month $ 450.00| $ 6,750.00| $ 500.00| $ 7,500.00 80
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Paul

BLD2117444B1--01-05 Hughes Health Center (Hughes Building) 15|month $ 450.00| $ 6,750.00| $ 500.00| $ 7,500.00 80
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Lauderhill

BLD2117444B1--01-06 Transfer Facility 15|month $ 180.00| $ 2,700.00| $ 200.00| $ 3,000.00 80
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Transit

BLD2117444B1--01-07 O&M North Customer Service Building #4 15[month $ 400.00 $ 6,000.00| $ 450.00| $ 6,750.00 480
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Transit

BLD2117444B1--01-08 O&M North Maintenance Building #2 15[month $ 600.00[ $ 9,000.00| $ 650.00 $ 9,750.00 80
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Transit

BLD2117444B1--01-09 O&M South Maintenance Building 15[month $ 2,400.00f $ 36,000.00| $ 2,600.00| $ 39,000.00 60
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Transit

BLD2117444B1--01-10 O&M South Parking Garage 15/month $ 525.00[ $ 7,875.00| $ 575.00] $ 8,625.00 80
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Broward

BLD2117444B1--01-11 County Landfill Administrative Building 15|month $ 180.00| $ 2,700.00| $ 200.00| $ 3,000.00 80
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Broward

BLD2117444B1--01-12 County Landfill Scalehouse 15|month $ 100.00| $ 1,500.00] $ 110.00| $ 1,650.00 90
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Animal

BLD2117444B1--01-13 Care & Regulation South 15|month $ 2420.00{ $ 36,300.00| $ 2,600.00| $ 39,000.00 60
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Medical

BLD2117444B1--01-14 Examiner South Building 15|month $ 52500] $ 7,875.00| $ 575.00| $ 8,625.00 80
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: 64th

BLD2117444B1--01-15 Street Warehouse 15/month $ 1,770.00f $ 26,550.00| $ 1,950.00{ $ 29,250.00 80
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance: semi

BLD2117444B1--01-16 Florida Dept of Health 2|annual $ 280.00| $ 560.00| $ 305.00| $ 610.00 85
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance:
North Regional Health Center (Hunter semi

BLD2117444B1--01-17 Building 2[annual $ 400.00[ $ 800.00 $ 450.00| $ 900.00 85
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance: Paul semi

BLD2117444B1--01-18 Hughes Health Center (Hughes Building) 2|annual $  400.00[ $ 800.00f $ 450.00| $ 900.00 85
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance: semi

BLD2117444B1--01-19 Lauderhill Transfer Facility 2|annual $ 100.00| $ 200.00 $ 110.00| $ 220.00 85
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance:
Transit O&M North Customer Service semi

BLD2117444B1--01-20 Building 2[annual $ 300.00[ $ 600.00[ $ 330.00] $ 660.00 85
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance: semi

BLD2117444B1--01-21 Transit O&M North Maintenance Building #2 2|annual $ 600.00| $ 1,200.00] $ 650.00| $ 1,300.00 85
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance: semi

BLD2117444B1--01-22 Transit O&M South Maintenance Building 2|annual $ 600.00] $ 1,200.00 $ 650.00 $ 1,300.00 85
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance: semi

BLD2117444B1--01-23 Transit O&M South Parking Garage 2|annual $ 300.00] $ 600.00( $ 330.00] $ 660.00 85
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance: semi

BLD2117444B1--01-24 Broward County Landfill Administrative Build 2|annual $ 180.00| $ 360.00f $ 200.00| $ 400.00 85
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance: semi

BLD2117444B1--01-25 Broward County Landfill Scalehouse 2|annual $ 100.00| $ 200.00f $ 110.00| $ 220.00 85
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance: semi

BLD2117444B1--01-26 Animal Care & Regulation South 2|annual $ 1,200.00| $ 2,400.00| $ 1,350.00{ $ 2,700.00 85
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance: semi

BLD2117444B1--01-27 Medical Examiner South Building 2|annual $ 600.00| $ 1,200.00] $ 650.00| $ 1,300.00 85
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance: 64th semi

BLD2117444B1--01-28 Street Warehouse 2|annual $ 800.00| $ 1,600.00 $ 875.00| $ 1,750.00 85
Parts & Materials: Thermostat Non-

BLD2117444B1--01-29 programmable 3|each $ 33.00| $ 99.00| $ 36.00| $ 108.00
Parts & Materials: Refrigeration Liquid Line

BLD2117444B1--01-30 Filter Drier 1/2 inch 7|each $ 50.00| $ 350.00 $ 55.00| $ 385.00
Parts & Materials: Refrigeration Liquid Line

BLD2117444B1--01-31 Filter Drier 7/8 inch 2|each $ 55.00| $ 110.00| $ 60.00| $ 120.00
Parts & Materials: Compressor Hermetic

BLD2117444B1--01-32 Scroll 1|each $ 3,000.00| $ 3,000.00| $ 3,300.00| $ 3,300.00

BLD2117444B1--01-33 Parts & Materials: Nitrogen 581|cubic foot | $ 3.00] $ 1,743.00] $ 3.50| § 2,033.50
Parts & Materials: Refrigerant (Freon) R-22

BLD2117444B1--01-34 Cylinder 79[pound $ 27.00| $ 2,133.00| $ 30.00| $ 2,370.00
Parts & Materials: Refrigerant (Freon) R-410

BLD2117444B1--01-35 Cylinder 351|pound $ 6.00| $ 2,106.00| $ 6.60| $ 2,316.60
Parts & Materials: Refrigerant (Freon) RS-

BLD2117444B1--01-36 44B Refrigerant (453a) 63|pound $ 18.50| $ 1,165.50 $ 20.50 $ 1,291.50

Pass-Thru Allowance 1|Each $ 93,650.00 $ 93,650.00

Group 1 Initial One Year Total Amount $ 467,776.50

Group 1 Renewal One Year Total Amount $ 505,204.60

Group 1 Potential Three Year Total Amount $ 1,478,185.70
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Bid Tabulation

MAM A/C and Refrigeration Co.

Percentage of
Total Price Price Attributed to
Unit Price Effective | Effective January 1,| Labor Portion of
Item # Item Qty Unit Price Total January 1, 2021 2021 Services

Group 1 - HVAC Precision Cooling Units
Repair Service Outside of Routine

BLD2117444B1--01-01 Maintenance: Labor Regular Hours 2068 [hour $ 87.00[ $ 179,916.00] $ 88.00| $ 181,984.00
Repair Service Outside of Routine

BLD2117444B1--01-02 Maintenance: Labor Overtime Hours 8|hour $ 130.50| $ 1,044.00[ $ 133.50| $ 1,068.00
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Florida

BLD2117444B1--01-03 Dept of Health 15|month $ 3,269.42| $ 49,041.30| $ 3469.42| $ 52,041.30 85.00
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: North

BLD2117444B1--01-04 Regional Health Center (Hunter Building) 15|month $ 3,269.42| $ 49,041.30| $ 3469.42| $ 52,041.30 85.00
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Paul

BLD2117444B1--01-05 Hughes Health Center (Hughes Building) 15|month $ 2,390.70| $ 35,860.50| $ 2,590.70| $ 38,860.50 85.00
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Lauderhill

BLD2117444B1--01-06 Transfer Facility 15|month $ 1,5619.08] $ 22,786.20| $ 1,719.08] $ 25,786.20 85.00
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Transit

BLD2117444B1--01-07 O&M North Customer Service Building #4 15[month $ 1,519.08| $ 22,786.20| $ 1,719.08 § 25,786.20 85.00
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Transit

BLD2117444B1--01-08 O&M North Maintenance Building #2 15[month $ 1,519.08| $ 22,786.20| $ 1,719.08 § 25,786.20 82.00
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Transit

BLD2117444B1--01-09 O&M South Maintenance Building 15[month $ 1,519.08| $ 22,786.20| $ 1,717.08[ § 25,756.20 85.00
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Transit

BLD2117444B1--01-10 O&M South Parking Garage 15/month $ 1,912.56] $ 28,688.40| $ 2,112.56] $ 31,688.40 85.00
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Broward

BLD2117444B1--01-11 County Landfill Administrative Building 15|month $ 1.912.56| $ 28,688.40| $ 2,112.56| $ 31,688.40 85.00
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Broward

BLD2117444B1--01-12 County Landfill Scalehouse 15|month $ 1.912.56| $ 28,688.40| $ 2,112.56| $ 31,688.40 85.00
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Animal

BLD2117444B1--01-13 Care & Regulation South 15|month $ 1.912.56| $ 28,688.40| $ 2,112.56| $ 31,688.40 85.00
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Medical

BLD2117444B1--01-14 Examiner South Building 15|month $ 2,676.35| $ 40,145.25| $ 3,876.35| $ 58,145.25 85.00
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: 64th

BLD2117444B1--01-15 Street Warehouse 15/month $ 1.712.56| $ 25,688.40| $ 1,912.56] $ 28,688.40 85.00
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance: semi

BLD2117444B1--01-16 Florida Dept of Health 2|annual $ 12,260.00| $ 24,520.00| $ 12,360.00{ $ 24,720.00 82.00
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance:
North Regional Health Center (Hunter semi

BLD2117444B1--01-17 Building 2[annual $ 12,260.00( $ 24,520.00| $ 12,360.00| $ 24,720.00 82.00
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance: Paul semi

BLD2117444B1--01-18 Hughes Health Center (Hughes Building) 2|annual $ 8,965.13| $ 17,930.26] $ 9,965.13| $ 19,930.26 85.00
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance: semi

BLD2117444B1--01-19 Lauderhill Transfer Facility 2|annual $ 5,696.55| $ 11,393.10 § 5,896.55| $ 11,793.10 85.00
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance:
Transit O&M North Customer Service semi

BLD2117444B1--01-20 Building 2[annual $ 5,696.53| $ 11,393.06| $ 5,896.55| $ 11,793.10 85.00
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance: semi

BLD2117444B1--01-21 Transit O&M North Maintenance Building #2 2|annual $ 5,696.55| $ 11,393.10 § 5,896.55| $ 11,793.10 85.00
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance: semi

BLD2117444B1--01-22 Transit O&M South Maintenance Building 2[annual $ 5,696.55| $ 11,393.10| $ 5,896.55| $ 11,793.10 85.00
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance: semi

BLD2117444B1--01-23 Transit O&M South Parking Garage 2[annual $ 5,696.55| $ 11,393.10| $ 5,896.55| $ 11,793.10 85.00
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance: semi

BLD2117444B1--01-24 Broward County Landfill Administrative Build 2|annual $ 5,696.55| $ 11,393.10f § 5,896.55| $ 11,793.10 85.00
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance: semi

BLD2117444B1--01-25 Broward County Landfill Scalehouse 2|annual $ 2,848.28| $ 5,696.56| $ 3,048.28| $ 6,096.56 85.00
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance: semi

BLD2117444B1--01-26 Animal Care & Regulation South 2|annual $ 5,696.55| $ 11,393.10f § 5,896.55| $ 11,793.10 85.00
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance: semi

BLD2117444B1--01-27 Medical Examiner South Building 2|annual $ 5,696.55| $ 11,393.10 § 5,896.55| $ 11,793.10 85.00
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance: 64th semi

BLD2117444B1--01-28 Street Warehouse 2|annual $ 5,696.55| $ 11,393.10f § 5,896.55| $ 11,793.10 85.00
Parts & Materials: Thermostat Non-

BLD2117444B1--01-29 programmable 3|each $ 214.94| § 644.82| $ 254.94| $ 764.82
Parts & Materials: Refrigeration Liquid Line

BLD2117444B1--01-30 Filter Drier 1/2 inch 7|each $ 163.98| $ 1,147.86] $ 183.98| $ 1,287.86
Parts & Materials: Refrigeration Liquid Line

BLD2117444B1--01-31 Filter Drier 7/8 inch 2|each $ 257.19| § 514.38| $ 277.19| $ 554.38
Parts & Materials: Compressor Hermetic

BLD2117444B1--01-32 Scroll 1|each $ 3,640.80| $ 3,640.80| $ 3,660.00| $ 3,660.00

BLD2117444B1--01-33 Parts & Materials: Nitrogen 581|cubic foot | § 9.90| $ 5,751.90| $ 10.90f § 6,332.90
Parts & Materials: Refrigerant (Freon) R-22

BLD2117444B1--01-34 Cylinder 79[pound $ 25.00] $ 1,975.00f $ 2562 $ 2,023.98
Parts & Materials: Refrigerant (Freon) R-410

BLD2117444B1--01-35 Cylinder 351|pound $ 5.00] $ 1,755.00[ $ 562 $ 1,972.62
Parts & Materials: Refrigerant (Freon) RS-

BLD2117444B1--01-36 44B Refrigerant (453a) 63|pound $ 14.62| $ 921.06| $ 15.08| $ 950.04

Pass-Thru Allowance 1|Each $ 93,650.00 $ 93,650.00

Group 1 Initial One Year Total Amount $  871,840.65

Group 1 Renewal One Year Total Amount $ 935,498.47

Group 1 Potential Three Year Total Amount $ 2,742,837.59
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Bid Tabulation

AJ Air Services, Inc.

Percentage of
Price Attributed to
Unit Price Effective | Total Price Effective | Labor Portion of
Item # Item Qty Unit Price Total January 1, 2021 January 1, 2021 Services

Group 1 - HVAC Precision Cooling Units
Repair Service Outside of Routine

BLD2117444B1--01-01 Maintenance: Labor Regular Hours 2068 [hour $ 85.00| $ 175,780.00( $ 85.00| $ 175,780.00
Repair Service Outside of Routine

BLD2117444B1--01-02 Maintenance: Labor Overtime Hours 8|hour $ 85.00| $ 680.00| $ 85.00| § 680.00
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Florida

BLD2117444B1--01-03 Dept of Health 15|month No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: North

BLD2117444B1--01-04 Regional Health Center (Hunter Building) 15|month No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Paul

BLD2117444B1--01-05 Hughes Health Center (Hughes Building) 15|month No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Lauderhill

BLD2117444B1--01-06 Transfer Facility 15|month No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Transit

BLD2117444B1--01-07 O&M North Customer Service Building #4 15|month No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Transit

BLD2117444B1--01-08 O&M North Maintenance Building #2 15[month No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Transit

BLD2117444B1--01-09 O&M South Maintenance Building 15[/month No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Transit

BLD2117444B1--01-10 O&M South Parking Garage 15|month No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Broward

BLD2117444B1--01-11 County Landfill Administrative Building 15|month No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Broward

BLD2117444B1--01-12 County Landfill Scalehouse 15|month No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Animal

BLD2117444B1--01-13 Care & Regulation South 15|month No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Medical

BLD2117444B1--01-14 Examiner South Building 15|month No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: 64th

BLD2117444B1--01-15 Street Warehouse 15/month No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance: semi

BLD2117444B1--01-16 Florida Dept of Health 2|annual No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance:
North Regional Health Center (Hunter semi

BLD2117444B1--01-17 Building 2[annual No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance: Paul semi

BLD2117444B1--01-18 Hughes Health Center (Hughes Building) 2|annual No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance: semi

BLD2117444B1--01-19 Lauderhill Transfer Facility 2|annual No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance:
Transit O&M North Customer Service semi

BLD2117444B1--01-20 Building 2[annual No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance: semi

BLD2117444B1--01-21 Transit O&M North Maintenance Building #2 2|annual No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance: semi

BLD2117444B1--01-22 Transit O&M South Maintenance Building 2|annual No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance: semi

BLD2117444B1--01-23 Transit O&M South Parking Garage 2|annual No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance: semi

BLD2117444B1--01-24 Broward County Landfill Administrative Build 2|annual No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance: semi

BLD2117444B1--01-25 Broward County Landfill Scalehouse 2|annual No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance: semi

BLD2117444B1--01-26 Animal Care & Regulation South 2|annual No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance: semi

BLD2117444B1--01-27 Medical Examiner South Building 2|annual No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance: 64th semi

BLD2117444B1--01-28 Street Warehouse 2|annual No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Parts & Materials: Thermostat Non-

BLD2117444B1--01-29 programmable 3|each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Parts & Materials: Refrigeration Liquid Line

BLD2117444B1--01-30 Filter Drier 1/2 inch 7|each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Parts & Materials: Refrigeration Liquid Line

BLD2117444B1--01-31 Filter Drier 7/8 inch 2|each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Parts & Materials: Compressor Hermetic

BLD2117444B1--01-32 Scroll 1leach No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

BLD2117444B1--01-33 Parts & Materials: Nitrogen 581 | cubic foot No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Parts & Materials: Refrigerant (Freon) R-22

BLD2117444B1--01-34 Cylinder 79[pound No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Parts & Materials: Refrigerant (Freon) R-410

BLD2117444B1--01-35 Cylinder 351|pound No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Parts & Materials: Refrigerant (Freon) RS-

BLD2117444B1--01-36 44B Refrigerant (453a) 63|pound No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Pass-Thru Allowance 1|Each $ 93,650.00 $ 93,650.00

Group 1 Initial One Year Total Amount $ 270,110.00

Group 1 Renewal One Year Total Amount $ 270,110.00

Group 1 Potential Three Year Total Amount $ 810,330.00
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Bid Tabulation

Temptrol Air Conditioning, Inc.

Percentage of
Price Attributed
Unit Price Effective | Total Price Effective | to Labor Portion
Item # Item Qty Unit Price Total January 1, 2021 January 1, 2021 of Services
Group 1 - HVAC Precision Cooling Units
Repair Service Outside of Routine
BLD2117444B1--01-01 Maintenance: Labor Regular Hours 2068 [hour No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Repair Service Outside of Routine
BLD2117444B1--01-02 Maintenance: Labor Overtime Hours 8|hour No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Florida
BLD2117444B1--01-03 Dept of Health 15|month No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: North
BLD2117444B1--01-04 Regional Health Center (Hunter Building) 15|month No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Paul
BLD2117444B1--01-05 Hughes Health Center (Hughes Building) 15|month No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Lauderhill
BLD2117444B1--01-06 Transfer Facility 15|month No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Transit
BLD2117444B1--01-07 O&M North Customer Service Building #4 15|month No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Transit
BLD2117444B1--01-08 O&M North Maintenance Building #2 15[month No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Transit
BLD2117444B1--01-09 O&M South Maintenance Building 15[/month No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Transit
BLD2117444B1--01-10 O&M South Parking Garage 15|month No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Broward
BLD2117444B1--01-11 County Landfill Administrative Building 15|month No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Broward
BLD2117444B1--01-12 County Landfill Scalehouse 15|month No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Animal
BLD2117444B1--01-13 Care & Regulation South 15|month No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Medical
BLD2117444B1--01-14 Examiner South Building 15|month No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: 64th
BLD2117444B1--01-15 Street Warehouse 15/month No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance: semi
BLD2117444B1--01-16 Florida Dept of Health 2|annual No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance:
North Regional Health Center (Hunter semi
BLD2117444B1--01-17 Building 2[annual No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance: Paul semi
BLD2117444B1--01-18 Hughes Health Center (Hughes Building) 2|annual No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance: semi
BLD2117444B1--01-19 Lauderhill Transfer Facility 2|annual No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance:
Transit O&M North Customer Service semi
BLD2117444B1--01-20 Building 2[annual No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance: semi
BLD2117444B1--01-21 Transit O&M North Maintenance Building #2 2|annual No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance: semi
BLD2117444B1--01-22 Transit O&M South Maintenance Building 2|annual No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance: semi
BLD2117444B1--01-23 Transit O&M South Parking Garage 2|annual No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance: semi
BLD2117444B1--01-24 Broward County Landfill Administrative Build 2|annual No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance: semi
BLD2117444B1--01-25 Broward County Landfill Scalehouse 2|annual No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance: semi
BLD2117444B1--01-26 Animal Care & Regulation South 2|annual No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance: semi
BLD2117444B1--01-27 Medical Examiner South Building 2|annual No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance: 64th semi
BLD2117444B1--01-28 Street Warehouse 2|annual No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Parts & Materials: Thermostat Non-
BLD2117444B1--01-29 programmable 3|each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Parts & Materials: Refrigeration Liquid Line
BLD2117444B1--01-30 Filter Drier 1/2 inch 7|each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Parts & Materials: Refrigeration Liquid Line
BLD2117444B1--01-31 Filter Drier 7/8 inch 2|each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Parts & Materials: Compressor Hermetic
BLD2117444B1--01-32 Scroll 1leach No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
BLD2117444B1--01-33 Parts & Materials: Nitrogen 581 | cubic foot No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Parts & Materials: Refrigerant (Freon) R-22
BLD2117444B1--01-34 Cylinder 79[pound No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Parts & Materials: Refrigerant (Freon) R-410
BLD2117444B1--01-35 Cylinder 351|pound No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Parts & Materials: Refrigerant (Freon) RS-
BLD2117444B1--01-36 44B Refrigerant (453a) 63|pound No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pass-Thru Allowance 1|Each $ 93,650.00 $ 93,650.00
Group 1 Initial One Year Total Amount No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Group 1 Renewal One Year Total Amount No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Group 1 Potential Three Year Total Amount No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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Bid #BLD2117444B1
HVAC Unit and HVAC Precision Cooling Unit Maintenance and Repair Services
Bid Tabulation Thermo Air, Inc.
Percentage of
Unit Price Total Price Price Attributed to
Effective January Effective Labor Portion of
Item # Item Qty Unit Price Total 1,2021 January 1, 2021 Services
Group 2
Repair Service Outside of Routine
BLD2117444B1--02-01 Maintenance: Labor Regular Hours 1039 |hour $ 112.00 | $ 116,368.00 | $ 118.00 [ $ 122,602.00
Repair Service Outside of Routine
BLD2117444B1--02-02 Maintenance: Labor Overtime Hours 16 [hour $ 168.00 $ 2,688.00 | $ 184.00 [ $ 2,944.00
Monthly Preventive Maintenance:
BLD2117444B1--02-03 Emergency Operations Center 15| month $ 300.00 | $ 4,500.00 [ $ 400.00 | $ 6,000.00 60.00
Monthly Preventive Maintenance:
BLD2117444B1--02-04 Government Center West Buildings A and B 15| month $ 300.00 | $ 4,500.00 [ $ 400.00 [ $ 6,000.00 60.00
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Public
BLD2117444B1--02-05 Safety Building 15[{month $ 880.00|% 13,200.00| $ 980.00 | $ 14,700.00 60.00
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Main
BLD2117444B1--02-06 Library 15|month $ 27000 $ 4,050.00 | $ 340.00 | $ 5,100.00 60.00
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Historical
BLD2117444B1--02-07 Commission Building 15|month $ 24000 $ 3,600.00 | $ 300.00 | $ 4,500.00 60.00
Monthly Preventive Maintenance:
BLD2117444B1--02-08 Government Center East 15[month $ 380.00| % 5,700.00 | $ 440.00 | $ 6,600.00 60.00
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Broward
BLD2117444B1--02-09 County Judicial Complex West Building 15[{month $ 380.00]| 9% 5,700.00 | $ 440.00 | $ 6,600.00 60.00
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Traffic
BLD2117444B1--02-10 Engineering Building A 15[month $ 260.00]| % 3,900.00 | $ 320.00 | $ 4,800.00 60.00
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Broward
BLD2117444B1--02-11 County Judicial Complex Midrise Building 15|month $ 490.00 | $ 7,350.00 | $ 540.00 | $ 8,100.00 60.00
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Miramar
BLD2117444B1--02-12 Branch Library 15|month $ 22000 $ 3,300.00 | $ 280.00 | $ 4,200.00 60.00
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Tamarac
BLD2117444B1--02-13 Brach Library 15|month $ 22000 $ 3,300.00 | $ 280.00 | $ 4,200.00 60.00
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance:
BLD2117444B1--02-14 Emergency Operations Center 2|semiannug $ 585.00 | $ 1,170.00 [ $ 685.00 | $ 1,370.00 60.00
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance:
BLD2117444B1--02-15 Government Center West Buildings A and B 2|semiannud $ 585.00 | $ 1,170.00 [ $ 685.00 [ $ 1,370.00 60.00
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance:
BLD2117444B1--02-16 Public Safety Building 2|semiannugd $  525.00 | § 1,050.00 | $ 625.00 | $ 1,250.00 60.00
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance: Main
BLD2117444B1--02-17 Library 2|semiannug $ 380.00 | $ 760.00 | $ 480.00 | $ 960.00 60.00
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance:
BLD2117444B1--02-18 Historical Commission Building 2|semiannugd $ 480.00 | $ 960.00 [ $ 550.00 [ $ 1,100.00 60.00
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance:
BLD2117444B1--02-19 Government Center East 2|semiannug $  380.00 | $ 760.00 | $ 460.00 | $ 920.00 60.00
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance:
Broward County Judicial Complex West
BLD2117444B1--02-20 Building 2|semiannugd $  360.00 | $ 720.00 | $ 420.00 | $ 840.00 60.00
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance:
BLD2117444B1--02-21 Traffic Engineering Building A 2|semiannugd $  320.00 | § 640.00 | $ 380.00 | $ 760.00 60.00
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance:
Broward County Judicial Complex Midrise
BLD2117444B1--02-22 Building 2|semiannugd $ 588.00 | § 1,176.00 | $ 688.00 | $ 1,376.00 60.00
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance:
BLD2117444B1--02-23 Miramar Branch Library 2|semiannud $  320.00 | $ 640.00 [ $ 380.00 [ $ 760.00 60.00
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance:
BLD2117444B1--02-24 Tamarac Brach Library 2|semiannud $  320.00 | $ 640.00 [ $ 380.00 [ $ 760.00 60.00
BLD2117444B1--02-25 Parts & Materials: Nitrogen 16| cubic foot | $§ 7.00 | $ 112.00 | $ 9.00 [ $ 144.00
Parts & Materials: Refrigerant (Freon) R-22
BLD2117444B1--02-26 Cylinder 31|pound $ 1800 [ $ 558.00 | $ 28.00 | $ 868.00
Parts & Materials: Refrigerant (Freon) R-410
BLD2117444B1--02-27 Cylinder 63|pound $ 8.00| % 504.00 | $ 1000 | § 630.00
Parts & Materials: Refrigerant (Freon) RS-
BLD2117444B1--02-28 44B Refrigerant (453a) 31|pound $ 1800 [ $ 558.00 | $ 18.00 | § 558.00
Pass-Thru Allowance 1|Each 84,402.00 $ 84,402.00
Group 2 Initial One Year Total Amount 273,976.00
Group 2 Renewal One Year Total Amount $  294,414.00
Group 2 Potential Three Year Total Amount $ 862,804.00
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Bid #BLD2117444B1
HVAC Unit and HVAC Precision Cooling Unit Maintenance and Repair Services
Bid Tabulation Airmatic Controls, Inc.
Percentage of
Unit Price Total Price Price Attributed to
Effective Effective January | Labor Portion of
Item # Item Qty Unit Price Total January 1, 2021 1, 2021 Services

Group 2
Repair Service Outside of Routine

BLD2117444B1--02-01 Maintenance: Labor Regular Hours 1039 |hour $ 105.00 | $ 109,095.00 | $ 110.00 [ $ 114,290.00
Repair Service Outside of Routine

BLD2117444B1--02-02 Maintenance: Labor Overtime Hours 16 [hour $  140.00 | $ 2,240.00 | $ 150.00 [ $ 2,400.00
Monthly Preventive Maintenance:

BLD2117444B1--02-03 Emergency Operations Center 15| month $ 320.00( $ 4,800.00 | $ 350.00 | $ 5,250.00 80
Monthly Preventive Maintenance:

BLD2117444B1--02-04 Government Center West Buildings A and B 15| month $ 340.00( $ 5,100.00 | $ 375.00 | $ 5,625.00 80
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Public

BLD2117444B1--02-05 Safety Building 15[{month $ 112000 | § 16,800.00 | $ 1,225.00 | $ 18,375.00 80
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Main

BLD2117444B1--02-06 Library 15|month $ 390.00 | $ 5,850.00 | $ 429.00 | $ 6,435.00 80
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Historical

BLD2117444B1--02-07 Commission Building 15|month $ 32000 $ 4,800.00 | $ 350.00 | $ 5,250.00 80
Monthly Preventive Maintenance:

BLD2117444B1--02-08 Government Center East 15[month $ 450.00 | $ 6,750.00 | $ 495.00 | $ 7,425.00 80
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Broward

BLD2117444B1--02-09 County Judicial Complex West Building 15[{month $ 38000| 8% 570000 % 415.00 | $ 6,225.00 80
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Traffic

BLD2117444B1--02-10 Engineering Building A 15[month $ 30000| % 450000(% 315.00 | $ 4,725.00 80
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Broward

BLD2117444B1--02-11 County Judicial Complex Midrise Building 15|month $ 380.00]| $ 5,700.00 | $ 415.00 | $ 6,225.00 80
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Miramar

BLD2117444B1--02-12 Branch Library 15|month $ 32000 $ 4,800.00 | $ 350.00 | $ 5,250.00 80
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Tamarac

BLD2117444B1--02-13 Brach Library 15|month $ 180.00 | $ 2,700.00 | $ 205.00 | $ 3,075.00 80
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance:

BLD2117444B1--02-14 Emergency Operations Center 2|semiannug $  400.00 | $ 800.00 | $ 450.00 | $ 900.00 85
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance:

BLD2117444B1--02-15 Government Center West Buildings A and B 2|semiannud $ 380.00 | $ 760.00 | $ 420.00 | $ 840.00 85
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance:

BLD2117444B1--02-16 Public Safety Building 2|semiannug $ 120000 | $ 2400.00 | $ 1,325.00 | $ 2,650.00 85
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance: Main

BLD2117444B1--02-17 Library 2|semiannugd $  450.00 | § 900.00 | $ 495.00 | $ 990.00 85
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance:

BLD2117444B1--02-18 Historical Commission Building 2|semiannugd $  400.00 | $ 800.00 | $ 440.00 | $ 880.00 85
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance:

BLD2117444B1--02-19 Government Center East 2[semiannug $  800.00 | § 1,600.00 | $ 850.00 | $ 1,700.00 75
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance:
Broward County Judicial Complex West

BLD2117444B1--02-20 Building 2|semiannugd $  380.00 | $ 760.00 | $ 415.00 [ $ 830.00 85
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance:

BLD2117444B1--02-21 Traffic Engineering Building A 2|semi annugd $ 300.00 | $ 600.00 | $ 325.00 | $ 650.00 85
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance:
Broward County Judicial Complex Midrise

BLD2117444B1--02-22 Building 2|semiannug $  350.00 | § 700.00 | $ 375.00 | $ 750.00 85
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance:

BLD2117444B1--02-23 Miramar Branch Library 2|semiannud $ 300.00 | $ 600.00 | $ 315.00 | $ 630.00 85
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance:

BLD2117444B1--02-24 Tamarac Brach Library 2|semiannud $ 180.00 | $ 360.00 | $ 200.00 | $ 400.00 85

BLD2117444B1--02-25 Parts & Materials: Nitrogen 16| cubic foot | $§ 3.00 (% 48.00 | $ 350 $ 56.00
Parts & Materials: Refrigerant (Freon) R-22

BLD2117444B1--02-26 Cylinder 31|pound $ 27.00 | $ 837.00 | $ 30.00 | $ 930.00
Parts & Materials: Refrigerant (Freon) R-410

BLD2117444B1--02-27 Cylinder 63|pound $ 6.00 | $ 378.00 | $ 6.60 | $ 415.80
Parts & Materials: Refrigerant (Freon) RS-

BLD2117444B1--02-28 44B Refrigerant (453a) 31|pound $ 18.50 | § 573.50 | $ 2050 | $ 635.50

Pass-Thru Allowance 1|Each $ 84,402.00 $ 84,402.00

Group 2 Initial One Year Total Amount $ 275,353.50

Group 2 Renewal One Year Total Amount $ 288,209.30

Group 2 Potential Three Year Total Amount $ 851,772.10
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Bid #BLD2117444B1
HVAC Unit and HVAC Precision Cooling Unit Maintenance and Repair Services
Bid Tabulation MAM A/C and Refrigeration Co.
Percentage of
Total Price Price Attributed to
Unit Price Effective | Effective January 1,| Labor Portion of
Item # Item Qty Unit Price Total January 1, 2021 2021 Services

Group 2
Repair Service Outside of Routine

BLD2117444B1--02-01 Maintenance: Labor Regular Hours 1039 |hour $ 87.00 | $ 90,393.00 | $ 88.00 | $ 91,432.00
Repair Service Outside of Routine

BLD2117444B1--02-02 Maintenance: Labor Overtime Hours 16 [hour $ 130.00 [ $ 2,080.00 | $ 133.05 [ $ 2,128.80
Monthly Preventive Maintenance:

BLD2117444B1--02-03 Emergency Operations Center 15|month $ 3,266.67 | $ 49,000.05 | $ 3,300.00 | $ 49,500.00 85.00
Monthly Preventive Maintenance:

BLD2117444B1--02-04 Government Center West Buildings A and B 15[month $ 3,569.88 | $ 53,548.20 | $ 3,669.88 | $ 55,048.20 86.00
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Public

BLD2117444B1--02-05 Safety Building 15[{month $ 1059139 [ $ 158,870.85 | $ 11,591.39 | § 173,870.85 86.00
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Main

BLD2117444B1--02-06 Library 15|month $ 3,184.91 | $ 47,77365 | $ 3,384.91 | $ 50,773.65 86.00
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Historical

BLD2117444B1--02-07 Commission Building 15|month $ 10,986.96 | $§  164,804.40 | $ 10,986.96 | $ 164,804.40 85.00
Monthly Preventive Maintenance:

BLD2117444B1--02-08 Government Center East 15[month $ 2,770.86 | $ 41,562.90 | $ 3,070.86 | $ 46,062.90 85.00
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Broward

BLD2117444B1--02-09 County Judicial Complex West Building 15[{month $ 151335 | § 22,700.25 | $ 161335 | § 24,200.25 85.00
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Traffic

BLD2117444B1--02-10 Engineering Building A 15[month $ 210727 | $ 31,609.05 | $ 230727 | $ 34,609.05 85.00
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Broward

BLD2117444B1--02-11 County Judicial Complex Midrise Building 15|month $ 5,065.32 | $ 75,979.80 | $ 5,165.32 | $ 77,479.80 85.00
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Miramar

BLD2117444B1--02-12 Branch Library 15|month $ 2,016.45 | $ 30,246.75 | $ 2,116.45 | $ 31,746.75 85.00
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Tamarac

BLD2117444B1--02-13 Brach Library 15|month $ 1,524.67 | $ 22,870.05 | $ 1,724.67 | $ 25,870.05 85.00
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance:

BLD2117444B1--02-14 Emergency Operations Center 2|semiannugd $ 1,469.40 | $ 2,938.80 | $ 1,669.40 | $ 3,338.80 85.00
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance:

BLD2117444B1--02-15 Government Center West Buildings A and B 2|semiannugd $ 26,77413 [ $ 53,548.26 | $ 2877413 [ $ 57,548.26 85.00
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance:

BLD2117444B1--02-16 Public Safety Building 2|semiannugd $ 7943546 | $§ 158,870.92 | § 89,435.46 | § 178,870.92 85.00
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance: Main

BLD2117444B1--02-17 Library 2|semiannugd $ 23,886.84 | $ 47,77368 | $ 24,886.84 | $ 49,773.68 85.00
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance:

BLD2117444B1--02-18 Historical Commission Building 2|semiannugd $ 27,467.40 | $ 54,934.80 | $ 2946740 | $ 58,934.80 85.00
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance:

BLD2117444B1--02-19 Government Center East 2[semiannug $ 20,781.47 [ $ 41,562.94 | $ 22,781.47 [ $ 45,562.94 85.00
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance:
Broward County Judicial Complex West

BLD2117444B1--02-20 Building 2|semi annug $ 11,349.26 | § 22,698.52 | $ 13,349.26 | $ 26,698.52 85.00
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance:

BLD2117444B1--02-21 Traffic Engineering Building A 2|semi annug $ 15,804.54 | $ 31,609.08 [ $ 17,804.54 | $ 35,609.08 85.00
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance:
Broward County Judicial Complex Midrise

BLD2117444B1--02-22 Building 2|semiannugd $ 37,989.90 | $ 75,979.80 | $ 40,989.90 | $ 81,979.80 85.00
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance:

BLD2117444B1--02-23 Miramar Branch Library 2|semiannugd $ 1512340 [ $ 30,246.80 | $ 17,12340 | $ 34,246.80 85.00
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance:

BLD2117444B1--02-24 Tamarac Brach Library 2|semiannugd $ 1143503 [ $ 22,870.06 | $ 11,635.03 [ $ 23,270.06 85.00

BLD2117444B1--02-25 Parts & Materials: Nitrogen 16| cubic foot | $ 990 | $ 158.40 | $ 10.90 | $ 174.40
Parts & Materials: Refrigerant (Freon) R-22

BLD2117444B1--02-26 Cylinder 31|pound $ 2500 | $ 775.00 | $ 2562 | $ 794.22
Parts & Materials: Refrigerant (Freon) R-410

BLD2117444B1--02-27 Cylinder 63|pound $ 500|$ 315.00 | $ 562 | 9$ 354.06
Parts & Materials: Refrigerant (Freon) RS-

BLD2117444B1--02-28 44B Refrigerant (453a) 31|pound $ 25.00 775.00 | $ 2562 | $ 794.22

Pass-Thru Allowance 1|Each 84,402.00 $ 84,402.00

Group 2 Initial One Year Total Amount 1,420,898.01

Group 2 Renewal One Year Total Amount $ 1,509,879.26

Group 2 Potential Three Year Total Amount $ 4,440,656.53
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Bid #BLD2117444B1
HVAC Unit and HVAC Precision Cooling Unit Maintenance and Repair Services
Bid Tabulation AJ Air Services, Inc.
Percentage of
Price Attributed to
Unit Price Effective | Total Price Effective | Labor Portion of
Item # Item Qty Unit Price Total January 1, 2021 January 1, 2021 Services

Group 2
Repair Service Outside of Routine

BLD2117444B1--02-01 Maintenance: Labor Regular Hours 1039 |hour No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Repair Service Outside of Routine

BLD2117444B1--02-02 Maintenance: Labor Overtime Hours 16 [hour No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly Preventive Maintenance:

BLD2117444B1--02-03 Emergency Operations Center 15|month No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly Preventive Maintenance:

BLD2117444B1--02-04 Government Center West Buildings A and B 15| month No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Public

BLD2117444B1--02-05 Safety Building 15|month No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Main

BLD2117444B1--02-06 Library 15|month No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Historical

BLD2117444B1--02-07 Commission Building 15|month No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly Preventive Maintenance:

BLD2117444B1--02-08 Government Center East 15[month No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Broward

BLD2117444B1--02-09 County Judicial Complex West Building 15| month No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Traffic

BLD2117444B1--02-10 Engineering Building A 15|month No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Broward

BLD2117444B1--02-11 County Judicial Complex Midrise Building 15|month No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Miramar

BLD2117444B1--02-12 Branch Library 15|month No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Tamarac

BLD2117444B1--02-13 Brach Library 15|month No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance:

BLD2117444B1--02-14 Emergency Operations Center 2|semi annug No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance:

BLD2117444B1--02-15 Government Center West Buildings A and B 2|semi annug No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance:

BLD2117444B1--02-16 Public Safety Building 2|semi annug No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance: Main

BLD2117444B1--02-17 Library 2|semi annug No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance:

BLD2117444B1--02-18 Historical Commission Building 2|semi annug No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance:

BLD2117444B1--02-19 Government Center East 2|semi annug No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance:
Broward County Judicial Complex West

BLD2117444B1--02-20 Building 2|semi annu: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance:

BLD2117444B1--02-21 Traffic Engineering Building A 2|semi annu: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance:
Broward County Judicial Complex Midrise

BLD2117444B1--02-22 Building 2|semi annug No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance:

BLD2117444B1--02-23 Miramar Branch Library 2|semi annug No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance:

BLD2117444B1--02-24 Tamarac Brach Library 2|semi annug No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

BLD2117444B1--02-25 Parts & Materials: Nitrogen 16| cubic foot No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Parts & Materials: Refrigerant (Freon) R-22

BLD2117444B1--02-26 Cylinder 31|pound No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Parts & Materials: Refrigerant (Freon) R-410

BLD2117444B1--02-27 Cylinder 63 |pound No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Parts & Materials: Refrigerant (Freon) RS-

BLD2117444B1--02-28 44B Refrigerant (453a) 31|pound No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Pass-Thru Allowance 1|Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Group 2 Initial One Year Total Amount No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Group 2 Renewal One Year Total Amount No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Group 2 Potential Three Year Total Amount No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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Bid #BLD2117444B1
HVAC Unit and HVAC Precision Cooling Unit Maintenance and Repair Services
Bid Tabulation Temptrol Air Conditioning, Inc.
Percentage of
Price Attributed
Unit Price Effective | Total Price Effective | to Labor Portion
Item # Item Qty Unit Price Total January 1, 2021 January 1, 2021 of Services
Group 2
Repair Service Outside of Routine
BLD2117444B1--02-01 Maintenance: Labor Regular Hours 1039 |hour $ 95.00 | $ 98,705.00 | $ 95.00 | $ 98,705.00
Repair Service Outside of Routine
BLD2117444B1--02-02 Maintenance: Labor Overtime Hours 16 [hour $ 142.50 | $ 2,280.00 | $ 14250 | $ 2,280.00
Monthly Preventive Maintenance:
BLD2117444B1--02-03 Emergency Operations Center 15| month $ 470.00 | $ 7,050.00 | $ 485.00 | $ 7,275.00 78.00
Monthly Preventive Maintenance:
BLD2117444B1--02-04 Government Center West Buildings A and B 15| month $ 578.00 | $ 8,670.00 [ $ 636.00 | $ 9,540.00 70.00
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Public
BLD2117444B1--02-05 Safety Building 15[{month $ 1,674.00 | $ 25110.00 | § 1,725.00 | $ 25,875.00 70.00
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Main
BLD2117444B1--02-06 Library 15|month $ 503.00 | $ 7,545.00 | $ 519.00 | $ 7,785.00 70.00
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Historical
BLD2117444B1--02-07 Commission Building 15|month $ 521.00 | $ 7,815.00 | $ 537.00 | $ 8,055.00 90.00
Monthly Preventive Maintenance:
BLD2117444B1--02-08 Government Center East 15[month $ 370.00 | $ 5,550.00 | $ 381.00 | § 5,715.00 79.00
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Broward
BLD2117444B1--02-09 County Judicial Complex West Building 15[{month $ 225.00 | $ 3,375.00 | $ 232.00 | $ 3,480.00 78.00
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Traffic
BLD2117444B1--02-10 Engineering Building A 15[month $ 318.00 | $ 4,770.00 | $ 328.00 | $ 4,920.00 74.00
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Broward
BLD2117444B1--02-11 County Judicial Complex Midrise Building 15|month $ 820.00 | $ 12,300.00 | $ 845.00 | $ 12,675.00 78.00
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Miramar
BLD2117444B1--02-12 Branch Library 15|month $ 298.00 | $ 4,470.00 | $ 307.00 | $ 4,605.00 79.00
Monthly Preventive Maintenance: Tamarac
BLD2117444B1--02-13 Brach Library 15|month $ 181.00 [ $ 2,715.00 | $ 187.00 [ $ 2,805.00 66.00
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance:
BLD2117444B1--02-14 Emergency Operations Center 2|semiannugd $ 1,085.00 | $ 2,170.00 | $ 1,140.00 | $ 2,280.00 95.00
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance:
BLD2117444B1--02-15 Government Center West Buildings A and B 2|semiannugd $ 1,925.00 | $ 3,850.00 | $ 2,022.00 | $ 4,044.00 84.00
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance:
BLD2117444B1--02-16 Public Safety Building 2|semiannugd $ 4,260.00 | $ 8,520.00 | $ 4,473.00 | $ 8,946.00 72.00
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance: Main
BLD2117444B1--02-17 Library 2|semiannugd $ 1,290.00 | $ 2,580.00 | $ 1,355.00 | $ 2,710.00 76.00
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance:
BLD2117444B1--02-18 Historical Commission Building 2|semiannugd $ 1,135.00 | $ 2,270.00 | $ 1,192.00 | $ 2,384.00 96.00
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance:
BLD2117444B1--02-19 Government Center East 2[semiannug $ 995.00 | $ 1,990.00 | $ 1,045.00 | $ 2,090.00 91.00
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance:
Broward County Judicial Complex West
BLD2117444B1--02-20 Building 2[semiannugd $ 500.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 525.00 | $ 1,050.00 96.00
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance:
BLD2117444B1--02-21 Traffic Engineering Building A 2|semiannugd $ 945.00 | $ 1,890.00 | $ 993.00 | $ 1,986.00 89.00
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance:
Broward County Judicial Complex Midrise
BLD2117444B1--02-22 Building 2|semiannugd $ 1,650.00 | $ 3,300.00 | $ 1,733.00 | $ 3,466.00 81.00
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance:
BLD2117444B1--02-23 Miramar Branch Library 2|semiannug $ 855.00 | $ 1,710.00 | $ 898.00 | $ 1,796.00 96.00
Semi-Annual Preventive Maintenance:
BLD2117444B1--02-24 Tamarac Brach Library 2|semiannugd $ 465.00 [ $ 930.00 | $ 488.00 | $ 976.00 90.00
BLD2117444B1--02-25 Parts & Materials: Nitrogen 16 |cubic foot | § 1000 | $ 160.00 | $ 1100 $ 176.00
Parts & Materials: Refrigerant (Freon) R-22
BLD2117444B1--02-26 Cylinder 31|pound $ 16.00 | $ 496.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 620.00
Parts & Materials: Refrigerant (Freon) R-410
BLD2117444B1--02-27 Cylinder 63|pound $ 7.00) % 441.00 | $ 9.00 | § 567.00
Parts & Materials: Refrigerant (Freon) RS-
BLD2117444B1--02-28 44B Refrigerant (453a) 31|pound $ 16.00 [ $ 496.00 | $ 18.00 | $ 558.00
Pass-Thru Allowance 1|Each 84,402.00 $ 84,402.00
Group 2 Initial One Year Total Amount 306,560.00
Group 2 Renewal One Year Total Amount $ 311,766.00
Group 2 Potential Three Year Total Amount $ 930,092.00
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