
 
 

 

 
 

 

 
 

  

Price Analysis 
Bid No. TRN2121511B1 Date Bid Posted:    07/20/2020 
Bus Driver Protection Barriers Date Bid Opened:  08/05/2020 
Agency: Broward County Transit Bid  Submittals: 3 Project Manager: Nicholas Smith Declinations:

 3 

Exhibit 4 
Page 1 of 1

Tabulation of Bids  GD Services  CoachCrafters  The Aftermarket Parts Company, 
LLC 

 Independent Cost 
Estimate

Item Description Unit Qty  Unit Price Total Price  Unit Price Total Price  Unit Price Total Price  Unit Price Total Price 

TRN2121511B1--01-01 2018 Gillig 40 Foot Transit Buses EA 28 $1,990.0000 $55,720.00 $6,489.1300 $181,695.64 $6,044.6900 $169,251.32 $6,350.0000 $177,800.00 
TRN2121511B1--01-02 2014 New Flyer Excelsior Articulated Buses EA 9 $1,990.0000 $17,910.00 $9,315.0000 $83,835.00 $6,880.4300 $61,923.87 $6,350.0000 $57,150.00 
TRN2121511B1--01-03 2014 NABI 40 Foot Transit Buses EA 20 $1,990.0000 $39,800.00 No Bid $6,515.6800 $130,313.60 $6,350.0000 $127,000.00 
TRN2121511B1--01-04 2013 NABI 40 Foot Transit Buses EA 49 $1,990.0000 $97,510.00 No Bid $6,515.6800 $319,268.32 $6,350.0000 $311,150.00 
TRN2121511B1--01-05 2012 NABI 42 BRT Buses EA 9 $1,990.0000 $17,910.00 No Bid $7,350.9200 $66,158.28 $6,350.0000 $57,150.00 
TRN2121511B1--01-06 2011 NABI 42 BRT Buses EA 15 $1,990.0000 $29,850.00 No Bid $7,350.9200 $110,263.80 $6,350.0000 $95,250.00 
TRN2121511B1--01-07 2011 NABI 60 Foot Articulated Transit Buses EA 10 $1,990.0000 $19,900.00 No Bid $7,485.4800 $74,854.80 $6,350.0000 $63,500.00 
TRN2121511B1--01-08 2011 NABI 40 Foot Transit Buses EA 44 $1,990.0000 $87,560.00 No Bid $6,515.6800 $286,689.92 $6,350.0000 $279,400.00 
TRN2121511B1--01-09 2009 New Flyer Articulated Buses EA 15 $1,990.0000 $29,850.00 $9,315.0000 $139,725.00 $6,351.1100 $95,266.65 $6,350.0000 $95,250.00 
TRN2121511B1--01-10 2014 MCI D4500 EA 5 $1,990.0000 $9,950.00 $5,520.0000 $27,600.00 $6,556.6900 $32,783.45 $6,350.0000 $31,750.00 
TRN2121511B1--01-11 2015 MCI D4500 EA 9 $1,990.0000 $17,910.00 $5,520.0000 $49,680.00 $6,556.6900 $59,010.21 $6,350.0000 $57,150.00 
TRN2121511B1--01-12 2018 MCI D4500 EA 30 $1,990.0000 $59,700.00 $5,520.0000 $165,600.00 $6,374.1700 $191,225.10 $6,350.0000 $190,500.00 
TRN2121511B1--01-13 2020 MCI D4500 EA 5 $1,990.0000 $9,950.00 $5,520.0000 $27,600.00 $6,374.1700 $31,870.85 $6,350.0000 $31,750.00 

TOTAL EA 248 $493,520.00 $675,735.64 $1,628,880.17 $1,574,800.00 

Estimated Cost: $1,574,800.00 

Independent Cost Estimate (ICE) from BCT 
RFB - Bid No. TRN2121511B1 

Different 
Between ICE 

and 
Responsive/ 
Responsible 

Bid 

Percentage 
Difference 

Between ICE 
and 

Responsive/ 
Responsible 

Bid 

Total Price Total Price Percentage 

$1,574,800.00 $54,080.17 3% 
Increase

Potential Award 
Total $1,628,880.17 
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