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Bid #OPN2120996B1 - THERMOPLASTIC PAVEMENT MARKING MATERIAL AND GLASS BEADS 
~ 
Creation Date ~Apr 22, 2020 End Date Jun 17, 2020 2:00:00 PM EDT 

Start Date May 22, 2020 6:58:01 AM EDT Awarded Date ~ Not Yet Awarded 

~OPN2120996B1--01-01 ~ White Thermoplastic Material for Traffic Stripes 
~Supplier Unit Price~ ~~Qty/Unit Total Price~ ~Attch. ~Docs 
Potters Industries, LLC [Ad] ~~ ~ First Offer -~ $0.00 ~~~250 / ton $0.00 ~ ~ Y 
Product Code: 
Agency Notes: 

Supplier Product Code:~ 
Supplier Notes: Brand Offered: NO BID 
Product Offered: NO BID 
Warranty Offered: NO BID 
NO BID 

~ 
Swarco Industries LLC ~ First Offer -~ $1,069.00 ~~~250 / ton $267,250.00 ~ Y Y 
Product Code: 
Agency Notes: 

Supplier Product Code:~Swarcotherm 
Supplier Notes: Brand Offered: Swarco 
Product Offered: Swarcothermo 
Warranty Offered: Standard 
~ 

Ennis-Flint, Inc. [Ad] ~~ ~ First Offer -~ $1,095.00 ~~~250 / ton $273,750.00 ~ ~ Y 
Product Code: 
Agency Notes: 

Supplier Product Code:~884102 
Supplier Notes: Brand Offered: Ennis-Flint, Inc. 
Product Offered: white thermoplastic 
Warranty Offered: 1 year 
~ 

Crown Technology LLC [Ad] ~~ ~ First Offer -~ $1,250.00 ~~~250 / ton $312,500.00 ~ ~ Y 
Product Code: 
Agency Notes: 

Supplier Product Code:~03-wax-baea 
Supplier Notes: Brand Offered: Crown Technology, LLC 
Product Offered: White Granular FL Alkyd Thermoplastic 
Warranty Offered: One year 
~ 

Traffic Supplies and Distribution ~ First Offer -~ $1,270.00 ~~~250 / ton $317,500.00 ~ ~ Y 
Product Code: 
Agency Notes: 

Supplier Product Code:~884102 
Supplier Notes: Brand Offered: Ennis 
Product Offered: 884102 
Warranty Offered: per manufacturer 
Product offered has 40% type 1 bead in the intermix which means it 
meets Broward specifications as published but not current FDOT 
which includes type 3 bad as well. 
~ 

~OPN2120996B1--01-02 ~ Yellow Thermoplastic Material for Traffic Stripes 
~Supplier Unit Price~ ~~Qty/Unit Total Price~ ~Attch. ~Docs 
Potters Industries, LLC [Ad] ~~ ~ First Offer -~ $0.00 ~~~250 / ton $0.00 ~ ~ Y 
Product Code: 
Agency Notes: 

Supplier Product Code:~ 
Supplier Notes: Brand Offered: NO BID 
Product Offered: NO BID 
Warranty Offered: NO BID 
~ 

Swarco Industries LLC ~ First Offer -~ $969.00 ~~~250 / ton $242,250.00 ~ Y Y 
Product Code: 
Agency Notes: 

Supplier Product Code:~Swarcotherm 
Supplier Notes: Brand Offered: Swarco 
Product Offered: Swarcotherm 
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Warranty Offered: Standard 
~ 

Ennis-Flint, Inc. [Ad] ~~ ~ First Offer -~ $995.00 ~~~250 / ton $248,750.00 ~ ~ Y 
Product Code: 
Agency Notes: 

Supplier Product Code:~884103 
Supplier Notes: Brand Offered: Ennis-Flint, Inc. 
Product Offered: yellow thermoplastic 
Warranty Offered: 1 year 
~ 

Crown Technology LLC [Ad] ~~ ~ First Offer -~ $1,175.00 ~~~250 / ton $293,750.00 ~ ~ Y 
Product Code: 
Agency Notes: 

Supplier Product Code:~03-yax-aaea 
Supplier Notes: Brand Offered: Crown Technology, LLC 
Product Offered: Yellow Granular FL Alkyd Thermoplastic 
Warranty Offered: One year 
~ 

Traffic Supplies and Distribution ~ First Offer -~ $1,265.00 ~~~250 / ton $316,250.00 ~ ~ Y 
Product Code: 
Agency Notes: 

Supplier Product Code:~884103 
Supplier Notes: Brand Offered: Ennis 
Product Offered: 884103 
Warranty Offered: per manufacturer 
Product offered has 40% type 1 bead in intermix which meets 
Browar 
d county published specifications but not current FDOT which 
includes type 3 beads as well. 
~ 

~OPN2120996B1--01-03 ~ Reflectorized Glass Beads, Type 1 
~Supplier Unit Price~ ~~Qty/Unit Total Price~ ~Attch. ~Docs 
Potters Industries, LLC [Ad] ~~ ~ First Offer -~ $636.00 ~~~130 / ton $82,680.00 ~ Y Y 
Product Code: 
Agency Notes: 

Supplier Product Code:~ 
Supplier Notes: Brand Offered: Potters 
Product Offered: Potters 
Warranty Offered: Yes 
~ 

Swarco Industries LLC ~ First Offer -~ $695.00 ~~~130 / ton $90,350.00 ~ Y Y 
Product Code: 
Agency Notes: 

Supplier Product Code:~Swarco Type I 
Supplier Notes: Brand Offered: Swarco 
Product Offered: Swarco Type I 
Warranty Offered: Standard 
~ 

Crown Technology LLC [Ad] ~~ ~ First Offer -~ $850.00 ~~~130 / ton $110,500.00 ~ ~ Y 
Product Code: 
Agency Notes: 

Supplier Product Code:~Type I Glass Beads 
Supplier Notes: Brand Offered: Potters or Swarco 
Product Offered: Type I Glass Beads 
Warranty Offered: N/A 
~ 

Traffic Supplies and Distribution ~ First Offer -~ $892.00 ~~~130 / ton $115,960.00 ~ ~ Y 
Product Code: 
Agency Notes: 

Supplier Product Code:~604130 
Supplier Notes: Brand Offered: Potters 
Product Offered: M247-1 
Warranty Offered: per manufacturer 
Product is on current FDOT APL. 
~ 

Ennis-Flint, Inc. [Ad] ~~ ~ First Offer -~ $960.00 ~~~130 / ton $124,800.00 ~ ~ Y 
Product Code: 
Agency Notes: 

Supplier Product Code:~651509FL 
Supplier Notes: Brand Offered: Potters Industries 
Product Offered: Type 1 glass beads 
Warranty Offered: 1 year 
~ 
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f ~ Potters Industries, LLC [Ad] ~~ $82,680.00 ~~ (3/3 items) 

~Bid Contact~ Yvonne Harris ~Address~ P.O. Box 841 
yvonne.harris@pottersbeads.com Valley Forge, PA 19482-
Ph 610-651-4714 ~ 0841 
Fax 610-408-9723 

~Supplier Code~ VC0000008565 

Bid Notes Potters Industries, LLC 
Potters bid for the Type I Glass Beads 
NO BID for Thermoplastic Material 

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Head 
Potters Industries, LLC Attch: 
Potters bid for the Type I Glass Beads 
NO BID for Thermoplastic Material 

f ~ Swarco Industries LLC $599,850.00 ~~ (3/3 items) 

~Bid Contact~ Roseann Meredith ~Address~ 270 Rutherford Lane 
roseann.meredith@swarco.com Columbia, TN 38401 
Ph 931-388-5900 
Fax 931-388-4039 

~Supplier Code~ VC0000011749 

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Head Attch: 

f ~ Ennis-Flint, Inc. [Ad] ~~ $647,300.00 ~~ (3/3 items) 

Bid Contact Anne Selby Address 4161 Piedmont Parkway 
brobbins@ennisflint.com Suite 370 
Ph 336-308-3768 ~ Greensboro, NC 27410 
Fax 336-218-6746 

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Head Attch: 

f Crown Technology LLC [Ad] $716,750.00 (3/3 items) 

~Bid Contact~ Pam S Kellett ~Address~ P O Box 789 
sales@crownthermo.com 35 Industrial Park Drive 
Ph 706-553-9500 ~ Woodbury, GA 30293 

Supplier Code VS0000010047 

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Head Attch: 

f ~ Traffic Supplies and Distribution $749,710.00 ~~ (3/3 items) 

~Bid Contact~ Martin Warner ~Address~ 3501 S Sanford Ave 
mwarner@tsdist.com Sanford, FL 32773 
Ph 352-263-0646 

~Bid Notes ~ Thermoplastic product offered is the 2004 FDOT spec material with 2% binder increase to perfectly 
match Broward Counties specifications. 

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Head 
Thermoplastic product offered is the 2004 Attch: 
FDOT spec material with 2% binder increase 
to perfectly match Broward Counties 
specifications. 
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