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Bid #TRN2121635B1 - Engine Coolant
Creation Date Jul 22, 2020 End Date Sep 2, 2020 2:00:00 PM EDT
Start Date Aug 20, 2020 1:54:27 PM EDT Awarded Date Not Yet Awarded
TRN2121635B1--01-01 Engine Coolant: ES Compleat Coolant OAT - In Bulk
Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. Docs
Cummins First Offer - $0.00 | 28500 / gallon $0.00 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code: No Bid
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

No Bid
Reladyne Florida LLC [Ad] | | FirstOffer- $4.28 | 28500/ gallon | $121,980.00 | | Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
SANTEX CORPORATION | | FirstOffer- $4.67 | 28500/ gallon | $13309500 | Y | Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code: Guardian 2BSROAT2BULK
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
Port Consolidated, Inc | | Firstoffer- $5.29 | 28500/ gallon | $150,765.00 | |y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
Palmdale Oil Company, Inc. | | FirstOffer- $5.46 | 28500/ gallon | $15561000 | Y | Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code: PEAK-FXAB50-000
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: PEAK FINAL CHARGE GLOBAL 50/50 PREMIX
Bleu Stream Corp | | First Offer- $8.996 | 28500/ gallon $256,386.00 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
TRN2121635B1--01-02 Engine Coolant: ES Compleat Coolant OAT - In Totes
Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. Docs
Ultra chem | First Offer - $3.46 | 27500 / gallon $95,150.00 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code: UAC5050GRE-t
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
Reladyne Florida LLC [Ad] | | FirstOffer- $4.48 | 27500/ gallon | $123,200.00 | |y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
SANTEX CORPORATION | | Firstoffer- $4.67 | 27500/ gallon | $12842500 | Y | ¥
Product Code: Supplier Product Code: Guardian 2BSROAT2BULK
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
Cummins | | FirstOffer- $536 | 27500/ gallon | $147,400.00 | |y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code: CC36074USR
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: 275 GAL in a tote

$ 5.36 per gallon
Palmdale Oil Company, Inc. | | First Offer - $5.46 | 27500/ gallon I $150,150.00 | Y | Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code: PEAK-FXAB58-275
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Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: PEAK FINAL CHARGE GLOBAL 50/50 PREMIX
Port Consolidated, Inc | | Firstoffer- $5.80 | 27500/ gallon | $159,500.00 | |y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

Bleu Stream Corp | | FirstOffer- $8.996 | 27500/ gallon | $247,390.00 | LY
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

TRN2121635B1--01-03 Engine Coolant: ES Compleat Coolant OAT Concentrate - In 55 Gallon Drum

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. Docs
Ultra chem | First Offer - $4.28 | 5500/ gallon $23,540.00 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code: UAC5050GRE-D
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
SANTEX CORPORATION | | FirstOffer- $7.49 | 5500/ gallon | $4119500 | Y | ¥
Product Code: Supplier Product Code: Guardian 2BSROAT1
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

Reladyne Florida LLC [Ad] | | FirstOffer- $9.00 | 5500/ gallon | $49,500.00 | Ly
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

Port Consolidated, Inc | | FirstOffer- $9.20 | 5500/ gallon | $50,600.00 | | Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

Palmdale Oil Company, Inc. | | First Offer - $9.47 | 5500/ gallon | $52,085.00 | Y | Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code: PEAK-FXAOB1-055

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: PEAK FINAL CHARGE GLOBAL 100% CONCENTRATE
Cummins | | FirstOffer- $10.36 | 5500/ gallon | $56,980.00 | LY
Product Code: Supplier Product Code: CC36072

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: $ 10.36 per gallon

155 Gallon Drum $569.80

Bleu Stream Corp | | FirstOffer- $19.959 | 5500/ gallon | $109,774.50 | LY
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

TRN2121635B1--01-04 Engine Coolant: Drum Replacement Cost

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. Docs
Cummins | First Offer - $0.00 | 10/ each $0.00 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code: No Bid

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: No Bid

SANTEX CORPORATION | | FirstOffer- $0.00 | 10/each | $0.00 | LY
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

Palmdale Oil Company, Inc. | | First Offer- $0.00 | 10/ each | $0.00 | | Y
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Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: NO CHARGE OR DEPOSITS FOR DRUMS
Reladyne Florida LLC [Ad] | | FirstOffer - $0.00 | | |
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
| | First Offer - $45.00 | | |
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
| | Firstoffer- $110.00 | 10/each | $1,100.00 | |y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
Supplier Totals
f Cummins $204,380.00 (4/4 items)
Bid Contact Courtney McCoy Address 1097 Park 100 Dr
cssnabids@cummins.com Glen Burnie, MD 21062
Ph 812-344-5078
Fax
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Head Attch:
f Reladyne Florida LLC [Ad] $294,680.00 (4/4 items)
Bid Contact Andrew Moseley Address 205 NE 179th Street
Andrew.Moseley@Reladyne.com Miami, FL 33162
Ph 305-952-4020
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Head Attch:
f SANTEX CORPORATION $302,715.00 (4/4 items)
Bid Contact ALBERT PULLES Address 14780 SW 136 ST
apulles@santexcorp.com MIAMI, FL 33196
Ph 786-445-5561
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Head Attch:
f Palmdale Oil Company, Inc. $357,845.00 (4/4 items)
Bid Contact Scott Bennin Address ORLANDO, FL 32824
sbennin@palmdaleoil.com
Ph 407-413-9382
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Head Attch:
f Bleu Stream Corp $614,650.50 (4/4 items)
Bid Contact  Lisa Lawrence Address 6690 NW 80th Manor
BleuStreamcorp@gmail.com Parkland , FL 33067
Ph 954-822-4614
Supplier Code VS0000015415
Qualifications DBE MBE SB
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Head Attch:
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Port Consolidated, Inc

Bid Contact  Yelitza Hansen
yhansen@portconsolidated.com
Ph 800-683-5823
Fax 305-685-8729

Supplier Code VC0000021176
Agency Notes:

$360,865.00 (3/4 items)

Address 11550 NW 36 AVE
MIAMI, FL 33167

Supplier Notes:

Ultra chem

Bid Contact alex palomino
apalomino@ultralplus.com
Ph 305-607-2800

Agency Notes:

$119,140.00 (3/4 items)

Address 1444 nw 82nd ave
doral, FL 33126

Supplier Notes:

*%*
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