

BID TABULATION

RFB No. BLD2120718B1
Janitorial Services-Aviation Administration Buildings
Agency: Aviation Department Maintenance Division
Purchasing Agent: Randy Plunkett

Opened: 7/22/20
Responses: 15
Declinations: 0



SUMMARY

GROUP 1 BUILDINGS

Tabulation of Bids	Clean Freek's Janitorial Service LLC 321 N.W. 5 St., #1 Pompano Beach, FL 33060 (Non-CBE)	Kelly Janitorial Systems, Inc. 3764 N.W. 124th Ave. Coral Springs, FL 33067 (Non-CBE)	BNB Distributors Co. 3760 N.W. 172 Terr. Miami Gardens, FL 33055 (Non-CBE)	Island Cleaning CC LLC 4800 N.W. 35 St., Ste 616 Lauderdale Lakes, FL 33319 (CBE)	MCJ Professional Cleaning Services, Corp. 1905 N.W. 32nd St., Ste. 6 Pompano Beach, FL 33064 (CBE)
Group	Total Price	Total Price	Total Price	Total Price	Total Price
Group 1 Buildings	\$ 100,950.00	\$ 103,151.50	\$ 111,087.50	\$ 112,227.00	\$ 116,442.58
					AWARD
Tabulation of Bids	Dammel Cleaning Enterprise, Inc. DBA Palm Beach & Broward Building Maintenance 2719 Hollywood Blvd., #248 Hollywood, FL 33020 (CBE)	Mckenzie's Cleaning, Inc. 3600 S. St. Rd. 7, Ste. 38 Miramar, FL 33023 (CBE)	Legally Clean, Inc. 1773 N. St. Rd. 7, Ste. 101-I Lauderhill, FL 33313 (CBE)	U-4 Global Enterprise Inc. 4818 W. Commercial Blvd. Tamarac, FL 33319 (Non-CBE)	ALJ Services LLC 12717 W. Sunrise Blvd., #153 Sunrise, FL 33323 (CBE)
Group	Total Price	Total Price	Total Price	Total Price	Total Price
Group 1 Buildings	\$ 139,891.44	\$ 140,021.73	\$ 146,542.97	\$ 147,022.81	\$ 166,186.00
Tabulation of Bids	Amer-Plus Janitorial Maintenance LLC 1265 N.E. 203rd St. Miami, FL 33179 (CBE)	Sky High Entertainment LLC DBA Kleen 365 8231 S.W. 5th St. North Lauderdale, FL 33068 (CBE)	Ann's Janitorial Services, Inc. 11846 S.W. 8th St. Pembroke Pines, FL 33025 (CBE)	Janitorial 5 Star Services LLC 1961 N.E. 25th Ave. Pompano Beach, FL 33062 (CBE)	Milclean USA LLC 257 Goolsby Blvd. Deerfield Beach, FL 33442 (CBE)
Group	Total Price	Total Price	Total Price	Total Price	Total Price
Group 1 Buildings	\$ 179,133.20	\$ 179,608.00	\$ 200,016.44	\$ 341,355.46	Incomplete

AWARD - Recommendation for Award
REJECT¹ - Reject for non-compliance to CBE Reserved requirements
Incomplete - Failed to bid all line items



BID TABULATION

RFB No. BLD2120718B1
Janitorial Services-Aviation Administration Buildings
Agency: Aviation Department Maintenance Division
Purchasing Agent: Randy Plunkett

Opened: 7/22/20
Responses: 15
Declinations: 0

SUMMARY

GROUP 2 BUILDINGS

Tabulation of Bids	ALJ Services LLC 12717 W. Sunrise Blvd., #153 Sunrise, FL 33323 (CBE)	BNB Distributors Co. 3760 N.W. 172 Terr. Miami Gardens, FL 33055 (Non-CBE)	MCJ Professional Cleaning Services, Corp. 1905 N.W. 32nd St., Ste. 6 Pompano Beach, FL 33064 (CBE)	Island Cleaning CC LLC 4800 N.W. 35 St., Ste 616 Lauderdale Lakes, FL 33319 (CBE)	Kelly Janitorial Systems, Inc. 3764 N.W. 124th Ave. Coral Springs, FL 33067 (Non-CBE)
Group	Total Price	Total Price	Total Price	Total Price	Total Price
Group 2 Buildings	\$ 6,468.56	\$ 48,687.50	\$ 116,347.00	\$ 116,544.60	\$ 129,677.50
	REJECT ²	REJECT ¹	WITHDRAW	WITHDRAW	REJECT ¹
Tabulation of Bids	Clean Freek's Janitorial Service LLC 321 N.W. 5 St., #1 Pompano Beach, FL 33060 (Non-CBE)	Dammel Cleaning Enterprise, Inc. DBA Palm Beach & Broward Building Maintenance 2719 Hollywood Blvd., #248 Hollywood, FL 33020 (CBE)	Ann's Janitorial Services, Inc. 11846 S.W. 8th St. Pembroke Pines, FL 33025 (CBE)	Legally Clean, Inc. 1773 N. St. Rd. 7, Ste. 101-J Lauderhill, FL 33313 (CBE)	Mckenzie's Cleaning, Inc. 3600 S. St. Rd. 7, Ste. 38 Miramar, FL 33023 (CBE)
Group	Total Price	Total Price	Total Price	Total Price	Total Price
Group 2 Buildings	\$ 132,750.00	\$ 133,023.96	\$ 145,001.60	\$ 168,096.53	\$ 169,019.65
	REJECT ¹	AWARD			

Tabulation of Bids	U-4 Global Enterprise Inc. 4818 W. Commercial Blvd. Tamarac, FL 33319 (Non-CBE)	Amer-Plus Janitorial Maintenance LLC 1265 N.E. 203rd St. Miami, FL 33179 (CBE)	Sky High Entertainment LLC DBA Kleen 365 8231 S.W. 5th St. North Lauderdale, FL 33068 (CBE)	Janitorial 5 Star Services LLC 1961 N.E. 25th Ave. Pompano Beach, FL 33062 (CBE)	Milclean USA LLC 257 Goolsby Blvd. Deerfield Beach, FL 33442 (CBE)
Group	Total Price	Total Price	Total Price	Total Price	Total Price
Group 2 Buildings	\$ 177,816.95	\$ 194,135.08	\$ 200,271.00	\$ 289,940.98	Incomplete

AWARD - Recommendation for Award

REJECT¹ - Reject for non-compliance to CBE Reserved requirements

REJECT² - Reject for unbalanced bid (2021 pricing)

WITHDRAW - Withdrew Bid

Incomplete - Failed to bid all line items

1 yr Initial Term (Prices eff. 1/1/2021)

* Group 2 total price for Item 02-04 adjusted to reflect 12 month period

Group 1	Island Cleaning CC, LLC	Group 2	Dammel Cleaning Enterprise, Inc. DBA Palm Beach & Broward Building Maintenance
Year 1	\$ 112,227.00	Year 1	\$ 133,023.96
Year 2	\$ 112,227.00	Year 2	\$ 133,023.96
Year 3	\$ 112,227.00	Year 3	\$ 133,023.96
Potential 3-Years	\$ 336,681.00	Potential 3-Years	\$ 399,071.88



BID TABULATION
RFB No. BLD2120718B1
Janitorial Services-Aviation Administration Buildings
Lot: Group 1
Opened: 7/22/2020
Responses: 15
Declinations: 0

Item #	Item	Quantity	Unit	Clean Freek's Janitorial Service LLC 321 N.W. 5 St., #1 Pompano Beach, FL 33060			Kelly Janitorial Systems, Inc. 3764 N.W. 124th Ave. Coral Springs, FL 33067								
				Price	Total	Percentage of price attributed to labor portion of service(s)	Future Price effective January 1, 2021	Price	Total	Percentage of price attributed to labor portion of service(s)	Future Price effective January 1, 2021				
BLD2120718B1--01-01	Janitorial Services - BCAD Maintenance Facility	12	month	\$2,500.00		\$30,000.00	90%	\$2,600.00	\$31,200.00	\$5,040.00		\$60,480.00	66%	\$5,040.00	\$60,480.00
BLD2120718B1--01-02	Janitorial Services - BCAD Security Building	12	month	\$1,800.00		\$21,600.00	90%	\$1,850.00	\$22,200.00	\$799.00		\$9,588.00	68%	\$799.00	\$9,588.00
BLD2120718B1--01-03	Janitorial Services - BCAD Trailers	12	month	\$1,650.00		\$19,800.00	90%	\$1,725.00	\$20,700.00	\$799.00		\$9,588.00	68%	\$799.00	\$9,588.00
BLD2120718B1--01-04	Janitorial Services - Security Booth at Gates 100 & 101	12	month	\$150.00		\$1,800.00	90%	\$150.00	\$1,800.00	\$677.00		\$8,124.00	75%	\$677.00	\$8,124.00
BLD2120718B1--01-05	Janitorial Services - Security Booth at Gate 504	12	month	\$75.00		\$900.00	90%	\$85.00	\$1,020.00	\$258.00		\$3,096.00	71%	\$258.00	\$3,096.00
BLD2120718B1--01-06	Janitorial Services - Security Credential Office	12	month	\$900.00		\$10,800.00	90%	\$900.00	\$10,800.00	\$516.00		\$6,192.00	71%	\$516.00	\$6,192.00
BLD2120718B1--01-07	Janitorial Services - Security Training Center	12	month	\$765.00		\$9,180.00	90%	\$790.00	\$9,480.00	\$283.00		\$3,396.00	64%	\$283.00	\$3,396.00
BLD2120718B1--01-08	Optional Service - Additional Labor	125	hour	\$30.00		\$3,750.00		\$30.00	\$3,750.00	\$21.50		\$2,687.50		\$21.50	\$2,687.50
				\$97,830.00			\$100,950.00			\$103,151.50			\$103,151.50		
				Estimated Initial Term Amount: \$100,950.00			Estimated Initial Term Amount: \$103,151.50								

NOTES:
AWARD - Recommendation for Award
REJECT¹ - Reject for non-compliance to CBE Reserved requirements
Incomplete: Failed to bid all line items

BID TABULATION

RFB No. BLD2120718B1
 Janitorial Services-Aviation Administration Buildings
 Lot: Group 1

Opened: 7/22/2020
 Responses: 15
 Declinations: 0

Item #	Item	Quantity	Unit	BNB Distributors Co. 3760 N.W. 172 Terr. Miami Gardens, FL 33055				Island Cleaning CC LLC 4800 N.W. 35 St., Ste 616 Lauderdale Lakes, FL 33319			
				Price	Total	Percentage of price attributed to labor portion of service(s)	Future Price effective January 1, 2021	Price	Total	Percentage of price attributed to labor portion of service(s)	Future Price effective January 1, 2021
BLD2120718B1--01-01	Janitorial Services - BCAD Maintenance Facility	12	month	\$1,513.75	\$18,165.00	50%	\$1,300.00	\$4,700.00	\$56,400.00	80%	\$5,012.67
BLD2120718B1--01-02	Janitorial Services - BCAD Security Building	12	month	\$1,430.42	\$17,165.00	50%	\$1,300.00	\$1,325.00	\$15,900.00	80%	\$1,665.63
BLD2120718B1--01-03	Janitorial Services - BCAD Trailers	12	month	\$1,513.75	\$18,165.00	50%	\$1,300.00	\$1,000.00	\$12,000.00	80%	\$1,242.71
BLD2120718B1--01-04	Janitorial Services - Security Booth at Gates 100 & 101	12	month	\$1,347.08	\$16,165.00	50%	\$1,300.00	\$100.00	\$1,200.00	80%	\$108.33
BLD2120718B1--01-05	Janitorial Services - Security Booth at Gate 504	12	month	\$1,347.08	\$16,165.00	50%	\$1,300.00	\$50.00	\$600.00	80%	\$58.33
BLD2120718B1--01-06	Janitorial Services - Security Credential Office	12	month	\$1,180.42	\$14,165.00	50%	\$1,300.00	\$525.00	\$6,300.00	80%	\$558.33
BLD2120718B1--01-07	Janitorial Services - Security Training Center	12	month	\$1,263.75	\$15,165.00	50%	\$1,300.00	\$325.00	\$3,900.00	80%	\$341.67
BLD2120718B1--01-08	Optional Service - Additional Labor	125	hour	\$0.12	\$15.10		\$15.10	\$30.00	\$3,750.00		\$35.00
				\$115,170.10			\$111,087.50	\$100,050.00			\$112,227.00
				Estimated Initial Term Amount: \$111,087.50		REJECT ¹		Estimated Initial Term Amount: \$112,227.00		AWARD	

NOTES:
AWARD - Recommendation for Award
REJECT¹ - Reject for non-compliance to CBE Reserved requirements
 Incomplete: Failed to bid all line items

BID TABULATION

RFB No. BLD2120718B1
Janitorial Services-Aviation Administration Buildings
Lot: Group 1

Opened: 7/22/2020
Responses: 15
Declinations: 0

Item #	Item	Quantity	Unit	MCJ Professional Cleaning Services, Corp. 1905 N.W. 32nd St., Ste. 6 Pompano Beach, FL 33064			Dammel Cleaning Enterprise, Inc. DBA Palm Beach & Broward Building Maintenance 2719 Hollywood Blvd., #248 Hollywood, FL 33020						
				Price	Total	Percentage of price attributed to labor portion of service(s)	Future Price effective January 1, 2021	Price	Total	Percentage of price attributed to labor portion of service(s)	Future Price effective January 1, 2021		
BLD2120718B1--01-01	Janitorial Services - BCAD Maintenance Facility	12	month	\$4,494.55	\$53,934.60	73.86%	\$4,606.92	\$55,283.04	\$4,586.68	\$55,040.16	62%	\$5,434.31	\$65,211.72
BLD2120718B1--01-02	Janitorial Services - BCAD Security Building	12	month	\$1,189.88	\$14,278.56	73.86%	\$1,219.63	\$14,635.56	\$1,715.64	\$20,587.68	62%	\$1,878.84	\$22,546.08
BLD2120718B1--01-03	Janitorial Services - BCAD Trailers	12	month	\$938.70	\$11,264.40	73.86%	\$962.17	\$11,546.04	\$1,123.34	\$13,480.08	62%	\$1,230.19	\$14,762.28
BLD2120718B1--01-04	Janitorial Services - Security Booth at Gates 100 & 101	12	month	\$1,169.02	\$14,028.24	73.86%	\$1,198.25	\$14,379.00	\$768.60	\$9,223.20	62%	\$841.72	\$10,100.64
BLD2120718B1--01-05	Janitorial Services - Security Booth at Gate 504	12	month	\$597.00	\$7,164.00	73.86%	\$622.92	\$7,475.04	\$274.50	\$3,294.00	62%	\$300.61	\$3,607.32
BLD2120718B1--01-06	Janitorial Services - Security Credential Office	12	month	\$367.37	\$4,408.44	73.86%	\$378.60	\$4,543.20	\$714.85	\$8,578.20	62%	\$782.85	\$9,394.20
BLD2120718B1--01-07	Janitorial Services - Security Training Center	12	month	\$367.37	\$4,408.44	73.86%	\$378.60	\$4,543.20	\$714.85	\$8,578.20	62%	\$782.85	\$9,394.20
BLD2120718B1--01-08	Optional Service - Additional Labor	125	hour	\$31.52	\$3,940.00		\$32.30	\$4,037.50	\$35.00	\$4,375.00		\$39.00	\$4,875.00
				\$113,426.68			\$116,442.58			Estimated Initial Term Amount: \$139,891.44			
							Estimated Initial Term Amount: \$116,442.58			Estimated Initial Term Amount: \$139,891.44			

NOTES:
AWARD - Recommendation for Award
REJECT¹ - Reject for non-compliance to CBE Reserved requirements
Incomplete: Failed to bid all line items

BID TABULATION

RFB No. BLD2120718B1
Janitorial Services-Aviation Administration Buildings
Lot: Group 1

Opened: 7/22/2020
Responses: 15
Declinations: 0

Item #	Item	Quantity	Unit	Mckenzie's Cleaning, Inc. 3600 S. St. Rd. 7, Ste. 38 Miramar, FL 33023		Legally Clean, Inc. 1773 N. St. Rd. 7, Ste. 101-I Lauderhill, FL 33313	
				Price	Total	Percentage of price attributed to labor portion of service(s)	Future Price effective January 1, 2021
BLD2120718B1--01-01	Janitorial Services - BCAD Maintenance Facility	12	month	\$5,043.58	\$60,522.94	71.11%	\$5,638.72 \$67,664.65
BLD2120718B1--01-02	Janitorial Services - BCAD Security Building	12	month	\$1,347.96	\$16,175.49	65.65%	\$1,507.02 \$18,084.20
BLD2120718B1--01-03	Janitorial Services - BCAD Trailers	12	month	\$1,194.97	\$14,339.69	64.87%	\$1,335.98 \$16,031.77
BLD2120718B1--01-04	Janitorial Services - Security Booth at Gates 100 & 101	12	month	\$1,124.49	\$13,493.84	69.02%	\$1,257.18 \$15,086.12
BLD2120718B1--01-05	Janitorial Services - Security Booth at Gate 504	12	month	\$543.26	\$6,519.16	55.52%	\$607.37 \$7,288.42
BLD2120718B1--01-06	Janitorial Services - Security Credential Office	12	month	\$478.88	\$5,746.61	56.49%	\$535.39 \$6,424.71
BLD2120718B1--01-07	Janitorial Services - Security Training Center	12	month	\$470.95	\$5,651.41	57.43%	\$526.52 \$6,318.28
BLD2120718B1--01-08	Optional Service - Additional Labor	125	hour	\$22.35	\$2,793.90		\$24.99 \$3,123.58
				\$125,243.04			\$140,021.73
				Estimated Initial Term Amount: \$140,021.73		Estimated Initial Term Amount: \$146,542.97	

NOTES:
AWARD - Recommendation for Award
REJECT¹ - Reject for non-compliance to CBE Reserved requirements
Incomplete: Failed to bid all line items

BID TABULATION

RFB No. BLD2120718B1
Janitorial Services-Aviation Administration Buildings
Lot: Group 1

Opened: 7/22/2020
Responses: 15
Declinations: 0

Item #	Item	Quantity	Unit	U-4 Global Enterprise Inc. 4818 W. Commercial Blvd. Tamarac, FL 33319			ALJ Services LLC 12717 W. Sunrise Blvd. #153 Sunrise, FL 33323						
				Price	Total	Percentage of price attributed to labor portion of service(s)	Future Price effective January 1, 2021	Price	Total	Percentage of price attributed to labor portion of service(s)	Future Price effective January 1, 2021		
BLD2120718B1--01-01	Janitorial Services - BCAD Maintenance Facility	12	month	\$5,295.76	\$63,549.09	75%	\$5,920.66	\$71,047.88	\$6,440.70	\$77,288.40	60	\$7,135.03	\$85,620.36
BLD2120718B1--01-02	Janitorial Services - BCAD Security Building	12	month	\$1,415.36	\$16,984.27	75%	\$1,582.37	\$18,988.41	\$1,657.53	\$19,890.36	60	\$1,836.22	\$22,034.64
BLD2120718B1--01-03	Janitorial Services - BCAD Trailers	12	month	\$1,254.72	\$15,056.67	75%	\$1,402.78	\$16,833.36	\$1,420.74	\$17,048.88	60	\$1,573.90	\$18,886.80
BLD2120718B1--01-04	Janitorial Services - Security Booth at Gates 100 & 101	12	month	\$1,180.71	\$14,168.54	75%	\$1,320.04	\$15,840.42	\$663.01	\$7,956.12	60	\$734.49	\$8,813.88
BLD2120718B1--01-05	Janitorial Services - Security Booth at Gate 504	12	month	\$570.43	\$6,845.12	75%	\$637.74	\$7,652.84	\$236.79	\$2,841.48	60	\$262.32	\$3,147.84
BLD2120718B1--01-06	Janitorial Services - Security Credential Office	12	month	\$502.83	\$6,033.94	75%	\$562.16	\$6,745.95	\$1,065.56	\$12,786.72	60	\$1,180.43	\$14,165.16
BLD2120718B1--01-07	Janitorial Services - Security Training Center	12	month	\$494.50	\$5,933.98	75%	\$552.85	\$6,634.19	\$828.77	\$9,945.24	60	\$918.11	\$11,017.32
BLD2120718B1--01-08	Optional Service - Additional Labor	125	hour	\$23.47	\$2,933.59		\$26.24	\$3,279.76	\$18.00	\$2,250.00		\$20.00	\$2,500.00
				\$131,505.20			\$147,022.81						
				Estimated Initial Term Amount :			\$147,022.81			Estimated Initial Term Amount :			\$166,186.00

NOTES:
AWARD - Recommendation for Award
REJECT¹ - Reject for non-compliance to CBE Reserved requirements
Incomplete: Failed to bid all line items

BID TABULATION

RFB No. BLD2120718B1
Janitorial Services-Aviation Administration Buildings
Lot: Group 1

Opened: 7/22/2020
Responses: 15
Declinations: 0

Item #	Item	Quantity	Unit	Amer-Plus Janitorial Maintenance LLC 1265 N.E. 203rd St. Miami, FL 33179		Sky High Entertainment LLC DBA Keen 365 8231 S.W. 8th St. North Lauderdale, FL 33068	
				Price	Total	Percentage of price attributed to labor portion of service(s)	Future Price effective January 1, 2021
BLD2120718B1--01-01	Janitorial Services - BCAD Maintenance Facility	12	month	\$4,551.92	\$54,623.04	95%	\$8,234.64 \$98,815.68
BLD2120718B1--01-02	Janitorial Services - BCAD Security Building	12	month	\$755.59	\$9,067.08	90%	1,307.21 \$15,686.52
BLD2120718B1--01-03	Janitorial Services - BCAD Trailers	12	month	\$755.59	\$9,067.08	90%	1,307.21 \$15,686.52
BLD2120718B1--01-04	Janitorial Services - Security Booth at Gates 100 & 101	12	month	\$1,711.51	\$20,538.12	90%	\$2,090.88 \$25,090.56
BLD2120718B1--01-05	Janitorial Services - Security Booth at Gate 504	12	month	\$611.04	\$7,332.48	90%	\$747.13 \$8,965.56
BLD2120718B1--01-06	Janitorial Services - Security Credential Office	12	month	\$377.80	\$4,533.60	90%	\$653.51 \$7,842.12
BLD2120718B1--01-07	Janitorial Services - Security Training Center	12	month	\$188.90	\$2,266.80	90%	\$326.77 \$3,921.24
BLD2120718B1--01-08	Optional Service - Additional Labor	125	hour	\$20.00	\$2,500.00		\$25.00 \$3,125.00
				Estimated Initial Term Amount: \$179,133.20		Estimated Initial Term Amount: \$179,608.00	

NOTES:
AWARD - Recommendation for Award
REJECT¹ - Reject for non-compliance to CBE Reserved requirements
Incomplete: Failed to bid all line items

BID TABULATION

RFB No. BLD2120718B1
Janitorial Services-Aviation Administration Buildings
Lot: Group 1

Opened: 7/22/2020
Responses: 15
Declinations: 0

Item #	Item	Quantity	Unit	Ann's Janitorial Services, Inc. 11846 S.W. 8th St. Pembroke Pines, FL 33025			Janitorial 5 Star Services LLC 1961 N.E. 25th Ave. Pompano Beach, FL 33062				
				Price	Total	Percentage of price attributed to labor portion of service(s)	Future Price effective January 1, 2021	Price	Total	Percentage of price attributed to labor portion of service(s)	Future Price effective January 1, 2021
BLD2120718B1--01-01	Janitorial Services - BCAD Maintenance Facility	12	month	\$7,486.27	\$89,835.24	65%	\$7,710.86 \$92,530.32	\$12,630.97	\$151,571.64	73%	\$14,020.33 \$168,243.96
BLD2120718B1--01-02	Janitorial Services - BCAD Security Building	12	month	\$1,600.25	\$19,203.00	65%	\$1,648.00 \$19,776.00	\$4,183.93	\$50,207.16	77%	\$4,627.48 \$55,529.76
BLD2120718B1--01-03	Janitorial Services - BCAD Trailers	12	month	\$1,547.25	\$18,567.00	65%	\$1,593.67 \$19,124.04	\$2,517.15	\$30,205.80	75%	\$2,758.82 \$33,105.84
BLD2120718B1--01-04	Janitorial Services - Security Booth at Gates 100 & 101	12	month	\$1,275.00	\$15,300.00	65%	\$1,313.25 \$15,759.00	\$589.86	\$7,078.32	72%	\$627.53 \$7,530.36
BLD2120718B1--01-05	Janitorial Services - Security Booth at Gate 504	12	month	\$1,250.00	\$15,000.00	65%	\$1,287.50 \$15,450.00	\$271.90	\$3,262.80	72%	\$288.01 \$3,456.12
BLD2120718B1--01-06	Janitorial Services - Security Credential Office	12	month	\$1,250.00	\$15,000.00	65%	\$1,287.50 \$15,450.00	\$2,846.98	\$34,163.76	76%	\$3,133.75 \$37,605.00
BLD2120718B1--01-07	Janitorial Services - Security Training Center	12	month	\$1,369.50	\$16,434.00	65%	\$1,410.59 \$16,927.08	\$2,524.74	\$30,296.88	75%	\$2,766.41 \$33,196.92
BLD2120718B1--01-08	Optional Service - Additional Labor	125	hour	\$38.00	\$4,750.00		\$40.00 \$5,000.00	\$19.50	\$2,437.50		\$21.50 \$2,687.50
				\$194,089.24			\$200,016.44	\$309,223.86			\$341,355.46
				Estimated Initial Term Amount : \$200,016.44				Estimated Initial Term Amount			\$341,355.46

NOTES:
AWARD - Recommendation for Award
REJECT¹ - Reject for non-compliance to CBE Reserved requirements
Incomplete: Failed to bid all line items

BID TABULATION
RFB No. BLD2120718B1
Janitorial Services-Aviation Administration Buildings
Lot: Group 1

Opened: 7/22/2020
Responses: 15
Declinations: 0

Item #	Item	Quantity	Unit	Milclean USA LLC 257 Goolsby Blvd. Deerfield Beach, FL 33442			
				Price	Total	Percentage of price attributed to labor portion of service(s)	Future Price effective January 1, 2021
BLD2120718B1--01-01	Janitorial Services - BCAD Maintenance Facility	12	month	\$4,069.62	\$48,835.44	80%	\$4,473.03 \$53,676.36
BLD2120718B1--01-02	Janitorial Services - BCAD Security Building	12	month	\$1,696.90	\$20,362.80	80%	\$1,873.53 \$22,482.36
BLD2120718B1--01-03	Janitorial Services - BCAD Trailers	12	month	\$1,637.88	\$19,654.56	80%	\$1,812.33 \$21,747.96
BLD2120718B1--01-04	Janitorial Services - Security Booth at Gates 100 & 101	12	month	\$322.34	\$3,868.08	80%	\$360.51 \$4,326.12
BLD2120718B1--01-05	Janitorial Services - Security Booth at Gate 504	12	month	\$230.25	\$2,763.00	80%	\$257.50 \$3,090.00
BLD2120718B1--01-06	Janitorial Services - Security Credential Office	12	month	\$1,024.88	\$12,298.56	85%	\$1,138.27 \$13,659.24
BLD2120718B1--01-07	Janitorial Services - Security Training Center	12	month	\$1,014.79	\$12,177.48	85%	\$1,128.18 \$13,538.16
BLD2120718B1--01-08	Optional Service - Additional Labor	125	hour	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
				Partial Bid			
				Incomplete			

NOTES:
AWARD - Recommendation for Award
REJECT¹ - Reject for non-compliance to CBE Reserved requirements
Incomplete: Failed to bid all line items



Opened: 7/22/2020
Responses: 15
Declinations: 0

BID TABULATION
RFB No. BLD2120718B1
Janitorial Services-Aviation Administration Buildings
Lot: Group 2

				ALJ Services LLC 12717 W. Sunrise Blvd., #153 Sunrise, FL 33323			BNB Distributors Co. 3760 N.W 172 Terr. Miami Gardens, FL 33055				
Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Price	Total	Percentage of price attributed to labor portion of service(s)	Future Price effective January 1, 2021	Price	Total	Percentage of price attributed to labor portion of service(s)	Future Price effective January 1, 2021
BLD2120718B1--02-01	Janitorial Services - Building Code Services FLL Wing	12	month	\$475.38	\$5,704.56	60%	\$526.63	\$1,347.08	\$16,165.00	50%	\$15,600.00
BLD2120718B1--02-02	Janitorial Services - BCAD Administration Building (Cabot Bldg)	1	month	\$5,704.58	\$5,704.58	60%		\$17,720.00	\$17,720.00	50%	
BLD2120718B1--02-03	Janitorial Services - BCAD Airport Development Admin. Bldgs. 1 2 & 4	1	month	\$4,991.50	\$4,991.50	60%		\$14,720.00	\$14,720.00	50%	
BLD2120718B1--02-04	Janitorial Services - BCAD Administration Offices Terminal 4	11	month	\$12,359.91	\$135,959.01	60%	\$1.00	\$1,560.45	\$17,165.00	50%	\$15,600.00 *
BLD2120718B1--02-05	Janitorial Services - North Perry Airport Administrative Bldg.	12	month	\$285.23	\$3,422.76	60%	\$1.00	\$1,430.42	\$17,165.00	50%	\$15,600.00
BLD2120718B1--02-06	Optional Service - Additional Labor	125	hour	\$18.00	\$2,250.00		\$1.00	\$0.12	\$15.10	50%	\$1,887.50
				\$158,032.41			\$6,468.56	\$82,960.10			\$48,687.50
NOTES:				Estimated Initial Term Amount: \$6,468.56 REJECT ²				Estimated Initial Term Amount: \$48,687.50 REJECT ¹			

NOTES:

- * Represents adjustment in total price for 12 months
- AWARD** - Recommendation for Award
- REJECT¹** - Reject for non-compliance to CBE Reserved requirements
- REJECT²** - Reject for unbalanced bid (2021 pricing)
- Incomplete: Failed to bid all line items

BID TABULATION
RFB No. BLD2120718B1
Janitorial Services-Aviation Administration Buildings
Lot: Group 2

				MCJ Professional Cleaning Services, Corp. 1905 N.W. 32nd St., Ste. 6 Pompano Beach, FL 33064			Island Cleaning CC LLC 4800 N.W. 35 St. Ste 616 Lauderdale Lakes, FL 33319							
Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Price	Total	Percentage of price attributed to labor portion of service(s)	Future Price effective January 1, 2021	Price	Total	Percentage of price attributed to labor portion of service(s)	Future Price effective January 1, 2021			
BLD2120718B1--02-01	Janitorial Services - Building Code Services FLL Wing	12	month	\$3,618.89	\$43,426.68	73.86%	\$3,709.36	\$44,512.32	\$900.00	\$10,800.00	80%	\$1,041.67	12,500.00	
BLD2120718B1--02-02	Janitorial Services - BCAD Administration Building (Cabot Bldg)	1	month	\$3,618.89	\$3,618.89	73.86%			\$8,200.00	\$8,200.00	80%			
BLD2120718B1--02-03	Janitorial Services - BCAD Airport Development Admin. Bldgs. 1 2 & 4	1	month	\$3,520.39	\$3,520.39	73.86%			\$5,925.00	\$5,925.00	80%			
BLD2120718B1--02-04	Janitorial Services - BCAD Administration Offices Terminal 4	11	month	\$5,122.00	\$56,342.00	73.86%	\$5,250.05	\$63,000.60 *	\$7,406.25	\$81,468.75	80%	\$7,889.13	94,669.60 *	
BLD2120718B1--02-05	Janitorial Services - North Perry Airport Administrative Bldg.	12	month	\$393.01	\$4,716.12	73.86%	\$402.84	\$4,834.08	\$393.75	\$4,725.00	80%	\$416.67	5,000.00	
BLD2120718B1--02-06	Optional Service - Additional Labor	125	hour	\$32.00	\$4,000.00		\$32.00	\$4,000.00	\$30.00	\$3,750.00		\$35.00	4,375.00	
				\$115,624.08			\$116,347.00			\$114,868.75			\$116,544.60	
				Estimated Initial Term Amount:.			\$116,347.00 WITHDREW			Estimated Initial Term Amount:.			\$116,544.60 WITHDREW	
NOTES:														

NOTES:

- * Represents adjustment in total price for 12 months
- AWARD** - Recommendation for Award
- REJECT¹** - Reject for non-compliance to CBE Reserved requirements
- REJECT²** - Reject for unbalanced bid (2021 pricing)
- Incomplete: Failed to bid all line items

BID TABULATION
RFB No. BLD2120718B1
Janitorial Services-Aviation Administration Buildings
Lot: Group 2

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Kelly Janitorial Systems, Inc. 3764 N.W. 124th Ave. Coral Springs, FL 33067				Clean Freek's Janitorial Service LLC 321 N.W. 5 St., #1 Pompano Beach, FL 33060			
				Price	Total	Percentage of price attributed to labor portion of service(s)	Future Price effective January 1, 2021	Price	Total	Percentage of price attributed to labor portion of service(s)	Future Price effective January 1, 2021
BLD2120718B1--02-01	Janitorial Services - Building Code Services FLL Wing	12	month		\$799.00	68%	\$799.00	\$1,900.00	\$22,800.00	90%	\$1,950.00
BLD2120718B1--02-02	Janitorial Services - BCAD Administration Building (Cabot Bldg)	1	month		\$4,727.00	62%		\$5,000.00	\$5,000.00	90%	
BLD2120718B1--02-03	Janitorial Services - BCAD Airport Development Admin. Bldgs. 1, 2 & 4	1	month		\$3,595.00	61%		\$4,000.00	\$4,000.00	90%	
BLD2120718B1--02-04	Janitorial Services - BCAD Administration Offices Terminal 4	11	month		\$9,454.00	62%	\$9,454.00	\$7,000.00	\$77,000.00	90%	\$7,000.00
BLD2120718B1--02-05	Janitorial Services - North Perry Airport Administrative Bldg.	12	month		\$329.50	66%	\$329.50	\$1,800.00	\$21,600.00	90%	\$1,800.00
BLD2120718B1--02-06	Optional Service - Additional Labor	125	hour		\$21.50		\$21.50	\$30.00	\$3,750.00		\$30.00
				Estimated Initial Term Amount: \$129,677.50				Estimated Initial Term Amount: \$132,750.00			
				REJECT ¹				REJECT ¹			

NOTES:

- * Represents adjustment in total price for 12 months
- AWARD** - Recommendation for Award
- REJECT¹** - Reject for non-compliance to CBE Reserved requirements
- REJECT²** - Reject for unbalanced bid (2021 pricing)
- Incomplete: Failed to bid all line items

BID TABULATION
RFB No. BLD2120718B1
Janitorial Services-Aviation Administration Buildings
Lot: Group 2

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Dammel Cleaning Enterprise, Inc. DBA Palm Beach & Broward Building Maintenance 2719 Hollywood Blvd., #248 Hollywood, FL 33020		Ann's Janitorial Services, Inc. 11846 S.W. 8th St. Pembroke Pines, FL 33025	
				Price	Total	Percentage of price attributed to labor portion of service(s)	Future Price effective January 1, 2021
BLD2120718B1--02-01	Janitorial Services - Building Code Services FLL Wing	12	month	\$714.85	\$8,578.20	62%	\$782.85 \$9,394.20
BLD2120718B1--02-02	Janitorial Services - BCAD Administration Building (Cabot Bldg)	1	month	\$4,263.12	\$4,263.12	62%	
BLD2120718B1--02-03	Janitorial Services - BCAD Airport Development Admin. Bldgs. 1, 2 & 4	1	month	\$2,566.97	\$2,566.97	62%	
BLD2120718B1--02-04	Janitorial Services - BCAD Administration Offices Terminal 4	11	month	\$8,301.61	\$91,317.71	62%	\$9,426.52 \$113,118.24 *
BLD2120718B1--02-05	Janitorial Services - North Perry Airport Administrative Bldg.	12	month	\$428.91	\$5,146.92	62%	\$469.71 \$5,636.52
BLD2120718B1--02-06	Optional Service - Additional Labor	125	hour	\$35.00	\$4,375.00	62%	\$39.00 \$4,875.00
				\$116,247.92		\$133,023.96	
				Estimated Initial Term Amount.:		\$133,023.96	
						AWARD	
				Estimated Initial Term Amount.:		\$145,001.60	

NOTES:

- * Represents adjustment in total price for 12 months
- AWARD** - Recommendation for Award
- REJECT¹** - Reject for non-compliance to CBE Reserved requirements
- REJECT²** - Reject for unbalanced bid (2021 pricing)
- Incomplete: Failed to bid all line items

BID TABULATION
RFB No. BLD2120718B1
Janitorial Services-Aviation Administration Buildings
Lot: Group 2

				Legally Clean, Inc. 1773 N. St. Rd. 7, Ste. 101-I Lauderhill, FL 33313			Mckenzie's Cleaning, Inc. 3600 S. St. Rd. 7, Ste. 38 Miramar, FL 33023						
Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Price	Total	Percentage of price attributed to labor portion of service(s)	Future Price effective January 1, 2021	Price	Total	Percentage of price attributed to labor portion of service(s)	Future Price effective January 1, 2021		
BLD2120718B1--02-01	Janitorial Services - Building Code Services FLL Wing	12	month	\$1,823.68	\$21,884.16	70%	\$1,847.57	\$22,170.84	\$1,037.03	\$12,444.38	64.17%	\$1,159.40	\$13,912.82
BLD2120718B1--02-02	Janitorial Services - BCAD Administration Building (Cabot Bldg)	1	month	\$5,072.37	\$5,072.37	70%			\$4,927.04	\$4,927.04	69.51%		
BLD2120718B1--02-03	Janitorial Services - BCAD Airport Development Admin. Bldgs. 1 2 & 4	1	month	\$5,500.23	\$5,500.23	70%			\$3,922.94	\$3,922.94	69.72%		
BLD2120718B1--02-04	Janitorial Services - BCAD Administration Offices Terminal 4	11	month	\$9,754.84	\$107,303.24	70%	\$11,315.62	\$135,787.44 *	\$9,876.20	\$108,638.18	69.66%	\$12,045.37	\$144,544.45 *
BLD2120718B1--02-05	Janitorial Services - North Perry Airport Administrative Bldg.	12	month	\$550.00	\$6,600.00	70%	\$561.00	\$6,732.00	\$579.06	\$6,948.68	34.37%	\$647.39	\$7,768.63
BLD2120718B1--02-06	Optional Service - Additional Labor	125	hour	\$24.00	\$3,000.00		\$27.25	\$3,406.25	\$22.35	\$2,793.90		\$22.35	\$2,793.75
				\$149,360.00			\$168,096.53			\$169,019.65			
				Estimated Initial Term Amount :			\$168,096.53			Estimated Initial Term Amount :			

NOTES:

* Represents adjustment in total price for 12 months

AWARD - Recommendation for Award

REJECT¹ - Reject for non-compliance to CBE Reserved requirements

REJECT² - Reject for unbalanced bid (2021 pricing)

Incomplete: Failed to bid all line items

BID TABULATION
RFB No. BLD2120718B1
Janitorial Services-Aviation Administration Buildings
Lot: Group 2

				U-4 Global Enterprise Inc. 4818 W. Commercial Blvd. Tamarac, FL 33319			Amer-Plus Janitorial Maintenance LLC 1265 N.E. 203rd St. Miami, FL 33179						
Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Price	Total	Percentage of price attributed to labor portion of service(s)	Future Price effective January 1, 2021	Price	Total	Notes	Percentage of price attributed to labor portion of service(s)	Future Price effective January 1, 2021	
BLD2120718B1--02-01	Janitorial Services - Building Code Services FLL Wing	12	month	\$1,088.88	\$13,066.60	75%	\$1,217.37	\$14,608.46	\$570.19	\$6,842.28	January 1, 2021 percentage attributed to labor will be 65%	\$993.99	\$11,927.88
BLD2120718B1--02-02	Janitorial Services - BCAD Administration Building (Cabot Bldg)	1	month	\$5,173.39	\$5,173.39	75%		\$4,152.03	\$4,152.03	January 1, 2021 percentage attributed to labor will be 65%	90%		
BLD2120718B1--02-03	Janitorial Services - BCAD Airport Development Admin. Bldgs. 1 2 & 4	1	month	\$4,119.08	\$4,119.08	75%		\$3,041.01	\$3,041.01	January 1, 2021 percentage attributed to labor will be 65%	90%		
BLD2120718B1--02-04	Janitorial Services - BCAD Administration Offices Terminal 4	11	month	\$11,312.74	\$124,440.10	75%	\$12,647.64	\$151,771.67 *	\$8,195.51	\$90,150.61	January 1, 2021 percentage attributed to labor will be 65%	\$14,578.00	\$174,936.00 *
BLD2120718B1--02-05	Janitorial Services - North Perry Airport Administrative Bldg.	12	month	\$608.01	\$7,296.15	75%	\$679.76	\$8,157.06	\$236.20	\$2,834.40	January 1, 2021 percentage attributed to labor will be 65%	\$397.60	\$4,771.20
BLD2120718B1--02-06	Optional Service - Additional Labor	125	hour	\$23.47	\$2,933.59		\$26.24	\$3,279.76	\$20.00	\$2,500.00		\$20.00	\$2,500.00
				\$157,028.91			\$177,816.95	\$109,520.33		Estimated Initial Term Amount : \$194,135.08			

NOTES:

- * Represents adjustment in total price for 12 months
- AWARD** - Recommendation for Award
- REJECT¹** - Reject for non-compliance to CBE Reserved requirements
- REJECT²** - Reject for unbalanced bid (2021 pricing)
- Incomplete: Failed to bid all line items

BID TABULATION
RFB No. BLD2120718B1
Janitorial Services-Aviation Administration Buildings
Lot: Group 2

				Sky High Entertainment LLC DBA Klean 365 8231 S.W. 5th St. North Lauderdale, FL 33068			Janitorial 5 Star Services LLC 1961 N.E. 25th Ave. Pompano Beach, FL 33062							
Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Price	Total	Percentage of price attributed to labor portion of service(s)	Future Price effective January 1, 2021	Price	Total	Percentage of price attributed to labor portion of service(s)	Future Price effective January 1, 2021			
BLD2120718B1--02-01	Janitorial Services - Building Code Services FLL Wing	12	month	\$1,149.00	\$13,788.00	80%	\$1,423.00	\$17,076.00	\$3,299.83	\$39,597.96	77%	\$3,646.76	\$43,761.12	
BLD2120718B1--02-02	Janitorial Services - BCAD Administration Building (Cabot Bldg)	1	month	\$2,000.00	\$2,000.00	80%			\$9,711.57	\$9,711.57	77%			
BLD2120718B1--02-03	Janitorial Services - BCAD Airport Development Admin. Bldgs. 1 2 & 4	1	month	\$3,750.00	\$3,750.00	80%			\$6,780.17	\$6,780.17	77%			
BLD2120718B1--02-04	Janitorial Services - BCAD Administration Offices Terminal 4	11	month	\$11,759.00	\$129,349.00	80%	\$13,985.00	\$167,820.00 *	\$17,302.60	\$190,328.60	77%	\$19,158.70	\$229,904.40 *	
BLD2120718B1--02-05	Janitorial Services - North Perry Airport Administrative Bldg.	12	month	\$700.00	\$8,400.00	80%	\$1,000.00	\$12,000.00	\$1,035.66	\$12,427.92	72%	\$1,132.33	\$13,587.96	
BLD2120718B1--02-06	Optional Service - Additional Labor	125	hour	\$23.00	\$2,875.00	80%	\$27.00	\$3,375.00	\$19.50	\$2,437.50		\$21.50	\$2,687.50	
				\$160,162.00			\$200,271.00			\$261,283.72			\$289,940.98	
				Estimated Initial Term Amount.:			\$200,271.00			Estimated Initial Term Amount.:			\$289,940.98	

NOTES:
* Represents adjustment in total price for 12 months
AWARD - Recommendation for Award
REJECT¹ - Reject for non-compliance to CBE Reserved requirements
REJECT² - Reject for unbalanced bid (2021 pricing)
Incomplete: Failed to bid all line items

BID TABULATION
RFB No. BLD2120718B1
Janitorial Services-Aviation Administration Buildings
Lot: Group 2

				Milclean USA LLC 257 Goolsby Blvd. Deerfield Beach, FL 33442			
				Percentage of price attributed to labor	portion of service(s)	Future Price effective January 1, 2021	
Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Price	Total		
BLD2120718B1--02-01	Janitorial Services - Building Code Services FLL Wing	12	month	\$2,514.37	\$30,172.44	85%	\$2,795.67 \$33,548.04
BLD2120718B1--02-02	Janitorial Services - BCAD Administration Building (Cabot Bldg)	1	month	\$3,395.32	\$3,395.32	85%	
BLD2120718B1--02-03	Janitorial Services - BCAD Airport Development Admin. Bldgs. 1, 2 & 4	1	month	\$2,458.68	\$2,458.68	85%	
BLD2120718B1--02-04	Janitorial Services - BCAD Administration Offices Terminal 4	11	month	\$5,854.57	\$64,400.27	80%	\$6,399.73 \$70,397.03
BLD2120718B1--02-05	Janitorial Services - North Perry Airport Administrative Bldg.	12	month	\$610.61	\$7,327.32	85%	\$678.21 \$8,138.52
BLD2120718B1--02-06	Optional Service - Additional Labor	125	hour	No Bid			No Bid
				Partial Bid			

NOTES:
* Represents adjustment in total price for 12 months
AWARD - Recommendation for Award
REJECT¹ - Reject for non-compliance to CBE Reserved requirements
REJECT² - Reject for unbalanced bid (2021 pricing)
Incomplete: Failed to bid all line items

BID TABULATION

RFB No. BLD2120718B1
 Janitorial Services-Aviation Administration Buildings
 Lot: Group 1

Opened: 7/22/2020
 Responses: 15
 Declinations: 0

Item #	Item	Quantity	Unit	BNB Distributors Co. 3760 N.W. 172 Terr. Miami Gardens, FL 33055				Island Cleaning CC LLC 4800 N.W. 35 St., Ste 616 Lauderdale Lakes, FL 33319			
				Price	Total	Percentage of price attributed to labor portion of service(s)	Future Price effective January 1, 2021	Price	Total	Percentage of price attributed to labor portion of service(s)	Future Price effective January 1, 2021
BLD2120718B1--01-01	Janitorial Services - BCAD Maintenance Facility	12	month	\$1,513.75	\$18,165.00	50%	\$1,300.00	\$4,700.00	\$56,400.00	80%	\$5,012.67
BLD2120718B1--01-02	Janitorial Services - BCAD Security Building	12	month	\$1,430.42	\$17,165.00	50%	\$1,300.00	\$1,325.00	\$15,900.00	80%	\$1,665.63
BLD2120718B1--01-03	Janitorial Services - BCAD Trailers	12	month	\$1,513.75	\$18,165.00	50%	\$1,300.00	\$1,000.00	\$12,000.00	80%	\$1,242.71
BLD2120718B1--01-04	Janitorial Services - Security Booth at Gates 100 & 101	12	month	\$1,347.08	\$16,165.00	50%	\$1,300.00	\$100.00	\$1,200.00	80%	\$108.33
BLD2120718B1--01-05	Janitorial Services - Security Booth at Gate 504	12	month	\$1,347.08	\$16,165.00	50%	\$1,300.00	\$50.00	\$600.00	80%	\$58.33
BLD2120718B1--01-06	Janitorial Services - Security Credential Office	12	month	\$1,180.42	\$14,165.00	50%	\$1,300.00	\$525.00	\$6,300.00	80%	\$558.33
BLD2120718B1--01-07	Janitorial Services - Security Training Center	12	month	\$1,263.75	\$15,165.00	50%	\$1,300.00	\$325.00	\$3,900.00	80%	\$341.67
BLD2120718B1--01-08	Optional Service - Additional Labor	125	hour	\$0.12	\$15.10		\$15.10	\$30.00	\$3,750.00		\$35.00
				\$115,170.10			\$111,087.50	\$100,050.00			\$112,227.00
				Estimated Initial Term Amount: \$111,087.50		REJECT ¹		Estimated Initial Term Amount: \$112,227.00		AWARD	

AWARD - Recommendation for Award
REJECT¹ - Reject for non-compliance to CBE Reserved requirements
 Incomplete: Failed to bid all line items

BID TABULATION

RFB No. BLD2120718B1
Janitorial Services-Aviation Administration Buildings
Lot: Group 1

Opened: 7/22/2020
Responses: 15
Declinations: 0

Item #	Item	Quantity	Unit	MCJ Professional Cleaning Services, Corp. 1905 N.W. 32nd St., Ste. 6 Pompano Beach, FL 33064				Dammel Cleaning Enterprise, Inc. DBA Palm Beach & Broward Building Maintenance 2719 Hollywood Blvd., #248 Hollywood, FL 33020			
				Price	Total	Percentage of price attributed to labor portion of service(s)	Future Price effective January 1, 2021	Price	Total	Percentage of price attributed to labor portion of service(s)	Future Price effective January 1, 2021
BLD2120718B1--01-01	Janitorial Services - BCAD Maintenance Facility	12	month	\$4,494.55	\$53,934.60	73.86%	\$4,606.92	\$4,586.68	\$55,040.16	62%	\$5,434.31
BLD2120718B1--01-02	Janitorial Services - BCAD Security Building	12	month	\$1,189.88	\$14,278.56	73.86%	\$1,219.63	\$1,715.64	\$20,587.68	62%	\$1,878.84
BLD2120718B1--01-03	Janitorial Services - BCAD Trailers	12	month	\$938.70	\$11,264.40	73.86%	\$962.17	\$1,123.34	\$13,480.08	62%	\$1,230.19
BLD2120718B1--01-04	Janitorial Services - Security Booth at Gates 100 & 101	12	month	\$1,169.02	\$14,028.24	73.86%	\$1,198.25	\$768.60	\$9,223.20	62%	\$841.72
BLD2120718B1--01-05	Janitorial Services - Security Booth at Gate 504	12	month	\$597.00	\$7,164.00	73.86%	\$622.92	\$274.50	\$3,294.00	62%	\$300.61
BLD2120718B1--01-06	Janitorial Services - Security Credential Office	12	month	\$367.37	\$4,408.44	73.86%	\$378.60	\$714.85	\$8,578.20	62%	\$782.85
BLD2120718B1--01-07	Janitorial Services - Security Training Center	12	month	\$367.37	\$4,408.44	73.86%	\$378.60	\$714.85	\$8,578.20	62%	\$782.85
BLD2120718B1--01-08	Optional Service - Additional Labor	125	hour	\$31.52	\$3,940.00		\$32.30	\$35.00	\$4,375.00		\$39.00
				\$113,426.68			\$116,442.68	\$123,566.52			\$139,891.44
				Estimated Initial Term Amount: \$116,442.68			Estimated Initial Term Amount: \$139,891.44				

AWARD - Recommendation for Award
REJECT¹ - Reject for non-compliance to CBE Reserved requirements
Incomplete: Failed to bid all line items

BID TABULATION

RFB No. BLD2120718B1
Janitorial Services-Aviation Administration Buildings
Lot: Group 1

Opened: 7/22/2020
Responses: 15
Declinations: 0

Item #	Item	Quantity	Unit	Mckenzie's Cleaning, Inc. 3600 S. St. Rd. 7, Ste. 38 Miramar, FL 33023		Legally Clean, Inc. 1773 N. St. Rd. 7, Ste. 101-I Lauderhill, FL 33313	
				Price	Total	Percentage of price attributed to labor portion of service(s)	Future Price effective January 1, 2021
BLD2120718B1--01-01	Janitorial Services - BCAD Maintenance Facility	12	month	\$5,043.58	\$60,522.94	71.11%	\$5,638.72 \$67,664.65
BLD2120718B1--01-02	Janitorial Services - BCAD Security Building	12	month	\$1,347.96	\$16,175.49	65.65%	\$1,507.02 \$18,084.20
BLD2120718B1--01-03	Janitorial Services - BCAD Trailers	12	month	\$1,194.97	\$14,339.69	64.87%	\$1,335.98 \$16,031.77
BLD2120718B1--01-04	Janitorial Services - Security Booth at Gates 100 & 101	12	month	\$1,124.49	\$13,493.84	69.02%	\$1,257.18 \$15,086.12
BLD2120718B1--01-05	Janitorial Services - Security Booth at Gate 504	12	month	\$543.26	\$6,519.16	55.52%	\$607.37 \$7,288.42
BLD2120718B1--01-06	Janitorial Services - Security Credential Office	12	month	\$478.88	\$5,746.61	56.49%	\$535.39 \$6,424.71
BLD2120718B1--01-07	Janitorial Services - Security Training Center	12	month	\$470.95	\$5,651.41	57.43%	\$526.52 \$6,318.28
BLD2120718B1--01-08	Optional Service - Additional Labor	125	hour	\$22.35	\$2,793.90		\$24.99 \$3,123.58
				\$125,243.04			\$140,021.73
				Estimated Initial Term Amount: \$140,021.73			Estimated Initial Term Amount: \$146,542.97

AWARD - Recommendation for Award
REJECT¹ - Reject for non-compliance to CBE Reserved requirements
Incomplete: Failed to bid all line items

BID TABULATION

RFB No. BLD2120718B1
Janitorial Services-Aviation Administration Buildings
Lot: Group 1

Opened: 7/22/2020
Responses: 15
Declinations: 0

Item #	Item	Quantity	Unit	U-4 Global Enterprise Inc. 4818 W. Commercial Blvd. Tamarac, FL 33319			ALJ Services LLC 12717 W. Sunrise Blvd. #153 Sunrise, FL 33323							
				Price	Total	Percentage of price attributed to labor portion of service(s)	Future Price effective January 1, 2021	Price	Total	Percentage of price attributed to labor portion of service(s)	Future Price effective January 1, 2021			
BLD2120718B1--01-01	Janitorial Services - BCAD Maintenance Facility	12	month	\$5,295.76	\$63,549.09	75%	\$5,920.66	\$71,047.88	\$6,440.70	\$77,288.40	60	\$7,135.03	\$85,620.36	
BLD2120718B1--01-02	Janitorial Services - BCAD Security Building	12	month	\$1,415.36	\$16,984.27	75%	\$1,582.37	\$18,988.41	\$1,657.53	\$19,890.36	60	\$1,836.22	\$22,034.64	
BLD2120718B1--01-03	Janitorial Services - BCAD Trailers	12	month	\$1,254.72	\$15,056.67	75%	\$1,402.78	\$16,833.36	\$1,420.74	\$17,048.88	60	\$1,573.90	\$18,886.80	
BLD2120718B1--01-04	Janitorial Services - Security Booth at Gates 100 & 101	12	month	\$1,180.71	\$14,168.54	75%	\$1,320.04	\$15,840.42	\$663.01	\$7,956.12	60	\$734.49	\$8,813.88	
BLD2120718B1--01-05	Janitorial Services - Security Booth at Gate 504	12	month	\$570.43	\$6,845.12	75%	\$637.74	\$7,652.84	\$236.79	\$2,841.48	60	\$262.32	\$3,147.84	
BLD2120718B1--01-06	Janitorial Services - Security Credential Office	12	month	\$502.83	\$6,033.94	75%	\$562.16	\$6,745.95	\$1,065.56	\$12,786.72	60	\$1,180.43	\$14,165.16	
BLD2120718B1--01-07	Janitorial Services - Security Training Center	12	month	\$494.50	\$5,933.98	75%	\$552.85	\$6,634.19	\$828.77	\$9,945.24	60	\$918.11	\$11,017.32	
BLD2120718B1--01-08	Optional Service - Additional Labor	125	hour	\$23.47	\$2,933.59		\$26.24	\$3,279.76	\$18.00	\$2,250.00		\$20.00	\$2,500.00	
				\$131,505.20			\$147,022.81			\$150,007.20			\$166,186.00	
				Estimated Initial Term Amount: \$147,022.81			Estimated Initial Term Amount: \$166,186.00							

AWARD - Recommendation for Award
REJECT¹ - Reject for non-compliance to CBE Reserved requirements
Incomplete: Failed to bid all line items

BID TABULATION

RFB No. BLD2120718B1
Janitorial Services-Aviation Administration Buildings
Lot: Group 1

Opened: 7/22/2020
Responses: 15
Declinations: 0

Item #	Item	Quantity	Unit	Amer-Plus Janitorial Maintenance LLC 1265 N.E. 203rd St. Miami, FL 33179			Sky High Entertainment LLC DBA Klean 365 8231 S.W. 8th St. North Lauderdale, FL 33068						
				Price	Total	Percentage of price attributed to labor portion of service(s)	Future Price effective January 1, 2021	Price	Total	Percentage of price attributed to labor portion of service(s)	Future Price effective January 1, 2021		
BLD2120718B1--01-01	Janitorial Services - BCAD Maintenance Facility	12	month	\$4,551.92	\$54,623.04	95%	\$8,234.64	\$98,815.68	\$4,925.00	\$59,100.00	80%	\$5,525.00	\$66,300.00
BLD2120718B1--01-02	Janitorial Services - BCAD Security Building	12	month	\$755.59	\$9,067.08	90%	1,307.21	\$15,686.52	\$1,609.00	\$19,308.00	80%	\$1,992.00	\$23,904.00
BLD2120718B1--01-03	Janitorial Services - BCAD Trailers	12	month	\$755.59	\$9,067.08	90%	\$1,307.21	\$15,686.52	\$1,458.00	\$17,496.00	80%	\$1,725.00	\$20,700.00
BLD2120718B1--01-04	Janitorial Services - Security Booth at Gates 100 & 101	12	month	\$1,711.51	\$20,538.12	90%	\$2,090.88	\$25,090.56	\$1,607.00	\$19,284.00	80%	\$1,902.00	\$22,824.00
BLD2120718B1--01-05	Janitorial Services - Security Booth at Gate 504	12	month	\$611.04	\$7,332.48	90%	\$747.13	\$8,965.56	\$745.00	\$8,940.00	80%	\$1,009.00	\$12,108.00
BLD2120718B1--01-06	Janitorial Services - Security Credential Office	12	month	\$377.80	\$4,533.60	90%	\$653.51	\$7,842.12	\$977.00	\$11,724.00	80%	\$1,295.00	\$15,540.00
BLD2120718B1--01-07	Janitorial Services - Security Training Center	12	month	\$188.90	\$2,266.80	90%	\$326.77	\$3,921.24	\$873.00	\$10,476.00	80%	\$1,186.00	\$14,232.00
BLD2120718B1--01-08	Optional Service - Additional Labor	125	hour	\$20.00	\$2,500.00		\$25.00	\$3,125.00	\$28.00	\$3,500.00		\$32.00	\$4,000.00
				\$109,928.20			\$179,133.20			\$149,828.00			\$179,608.00
				Estimated Initial Term Amount. :			\$179,133.20			Estimated Initial Term Amount. :			\$179,608.00

AWARD - Recommendation for Award
REJECT¹ - Reject for non-compliance to CBE Reserved requirements
Incomplete: Failed to bid all line items

BID TABULATION

RFB No. BLD2120718B1
Janitorial Services-Aviation Administration Buildings
Lot: Group 1

Opened: 7/22/2020
Responses: 15
Declinations: 0

Item #	Item	Quantity	Unit	Ann's Janitorial Services, Inc. 11846 S.W. 8th St. Pembroke Pines, FL 33025			Janitorial 5 Star Services LLC 1961 N.E. 25th Ave. Pompano Beach, FL 33062								
				Price	Total	Percentage of price attributed to labor portion of service(s)	Future Price effective January 1, 2021	Price	Total	Percentage of price attributed to labor portion of service(s)	Future Price effective January 1, 2021				
BLD2120718B1--01-01	Janitorial Services - BCAD Maintenance Facility	12	month	\$7,486.27		\$89,835.24	65%	\$7,710.86	\$92,530.32	\$12,630.97		\$151,571.64	73%	\$14,020.33	\$168,243.96
BLD2120718B1--01-02	Janitorial Services - BCAD Security Building	12	month	\$1,600.25		\$19,203.00	65%	\$1,648.00	\$19,776.00	\$4,183.93		\$50,207.16	77%	\$4,627.48	\$55,529.76
BLD2120718B1--01-03	Janitorial Services - BCAD Trailers	12	month	\$1,547.25		\$18,567.00	65%	\$1,593.67	\$19,124.04	\$2,517.15		\$30,205.80	75%	\$2,758.82	\$33,105.84
BLD2120718B1--01-04	Janitorial Services - Security Booth at Gates 100 & 101	12	month	\$1,275.00		\$15,300.00	65%	\$1,313.25	\$15,759.00	\$589.86		\$7,078.32	72%	\$627.53	\$7,530.36
BLD2120718B1--01-05	Janitorial Services - Security Booth at Gate 504	12	month	\$1,250.00		\$15,000.00	65%	\$1,287.50	\$15,450.00	\$271.90		\$3,262.80	72%	\$288.01	\$3,456.12
BLD2120718B1--01-06	Janitorial Services - Security Credential Office	12	month	\$1,250.00		\$15,000.00	65%	\$1,287.50	\$15,450.00	\$2,846.98		\$34,163.76	76%	\$3,133.75	\$37,605.00
BLD2120718B1--01-07	Janitorial Services - Security Training Center	12	month	\$1,369.50		\$16,434.00	65%	\$1,410.59	\$16,927.08	\$2,524.74		\$30,296.88	75%	\$2,766.41	\$33,196.92
BLD2120718B1--01-08	Optional Service - Additional Labor	125	hour	\$38.00		\$4,750.00		\$40.00	\$5,000.00	\$19.50		\$2,437.50		\$21.50	\$2,687.50
				\$194,089.24			\$200,016.44			\$309,223.96			\$341,355.46		
				Estimated Initial Term Amount.:			\$200,016.44			Estimated Initial Term Amount.:			\$341,355.46		

AWARD - Recommendation for Award
REJECT¹ - Reject for non-compliance to CBE Reserved requirements
Incomplete: Failed to bid all line items

BID TABULATION

RFB No. BLD2120718B1
Janitorial Services-Aviation Administration Buildings
Lot: Group 1

Opened: 7/22/2020
Responses: 15
Declinations: 0

Item #	Item	Quantity	Unit	Milclean USA LLC 257 Goolsby Blvd. Deerfield Beach, FL 33442			
				Price	Total	Percentage of price attributed to labor portion of service(s)	Future Price effective January 1, 2021
BLD2120718B1--01-01	Janitorial Services - BCAD Maintenance Facility	12	month	\$4,069.62	\$48,835.44	80%	\$4,473.03 \$53,676.36
BLD2120718B1--01-02	Janitorial Services - BCAD Security Building	12	month	\$1,696.90	\$20,362.80	80%	\$1,873.53 \$22,482.36
BLD2120718B1--01-03	Janitorial Services - BCAD Trailers	12	month	\$1,637.88	\$19,654.56	80%	\$1,812.33 \$21,747.96
BLD2120718B1--01-04	Janitorial Services - Security Booth at Gates 100 & 101	12	month	\$322.34	\$3,868.08	80%	\$360.51 \$4,326.12
BLD2120718B1--01-05	Janitorial Services - Security Booth at Gate 504	12	month	\$230.25	\$2,763.00	80%	\$257.50 \$3,090.00
BLD2120718B1--01-06	Janitorial Services - Security Credential Office	12	month	\$1,024.88	\$12,298.56	85%	\$1,138.27 \$13,659.24
BLD2120718B1--01-07	Janitorial Services - Security Training Center	12	month	\$1,014.79	\$12,177.48	85%	\$1,128.18 \$13,538.16
BLD2120718B1--01-08	Optional Service - Additional Labor	125	hour	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
				Partial Bid			
				Incomplete			

AWARD - Recommendation for Award
REJECT¹ - Reject for non-compliance to CBE Reserved requirements
Incomplete: Failed to bid all line items