
         

             

             

 

 

 

   

   

 

 

 

 

 

 
   

 

   

 

 

 

 

     

 

               

       

     
       

       

       

         

       

             

         

       

       

    
       

           

               

       

             
       

       

         

       

             
         

       
       

    
       

   
       

               

       

                 
       

       

             

       

                 
         

       
           

    
           

   
           

                           

   

 

 

   

 

 

Bid Tabulation Date Bid Posted: July 31, 2020 

Bid No. PNC2119543C1 Bid Bid Opened: September 9, 2020 

Job Order Contract (JOC) Step 2  Bid  Submittals: 8 

Declinations: 1 

Exhibit 1 
Page 1 of 2

Alen 
Construction 
Group, Inc. 

Big Dog 
Construction 
Services, Inc.* 

Danz 
Contracting, 

LLC* 

FHP 
Tectonics 
Corp 

Florida Palm 
Construction 

Lee Construction 
Group, Inc. 

Mejia 
International 
Group Corp 

Shiff Construction and 
Development, Inc. 

Item # Item 
CBE Reserve CBE Reserve CBE Reserve CBE Reserve CBE Reserve CBE Reserve CBE Reserve CBE Reserve 

Non‐Security Areas, Normal Working 
Hours Adjustment Factor (20%) 

1.5500 1.6470 1.0895 No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.3500 No Bid 
Non‐Security Areas, Other than 
Normal Working Hours Adjustment 
Factor (10%) 1.8500 1.7420 1.1095 No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.3800 No Bid 

Security Areas, Normal Working 
Hours Adjustment Factor (40%) 1.6000 1.6470 1.1295 No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.3800 No Bid 
Security Areas, Other than Normal 
Working Hours Adjustment Factor 
(20%) 1.9000 1.7420 1.1495 No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.4200 No Bid 

Non Pre‐Priced (10%) 
1.3000 1.5670 1.0695 No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.3500 No Bid 

Award Criteria Figure 1.6450 1.6765 1.1175 No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.3790 No Bid 

Item # Item 
CBE Reserve CBE Reserve CBE Reserve CBE Reserve CBE Reserve CBE Reserve CBE Reserve CBE Reserve 

Non‐Security Areas, Normal Working 
Hours Adjustment Factor (20%) No Bid 1.6120 1.1035 No Bid 1.2170 No Bid 1.6000 No Bid 
Non‐Security Areas, Other than 
Normal Working Hours Adjustment 
Factor (10%) No Bid 1.6620 1.1335 No Bid 1.2270 No Bid 1.6500 No Bid 

Security Areas, Normal Working 
Hours Adjustment Factor (40%) No Bid 1.6200 1.1135 No Bid 1.2370 No Bid 1.6500 No Bid 
Security Areas, Other than Normal 
Working Hours Adjustment Factor 
(20%) No Bid 1.6700 1.1335 No Bid 1.2450 No Bid 1.6800 No Bid 

Non Pre‐Priced (10%) 
No Bid 1.6270 1.0835 No Bid 1.2170 No Bid 1.6000 No Bid 

Award Criteria Figure 
No Bid 1.6333 1.1145 No Bid 1.2316 No Bid 1.6410 No Bid 

Item # Item 
CBE Reserve CBE Reserve CBE Reserve CBE Reserve CBE Reserve CBE Reserve CBE Reserve CBE Reserve 

Non‐Security Areas, Normal Working 
Hours Adjustment Factor (40%) 1.2500 No Bid 1.0915 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
Non‐Security Areas, Other than 
Normal Working Hours Adjustment 
Factor (20%) 1.3500 No Bid 1.1215 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Security Areas, Normal Working 
Hours Adjustment Factor (20%) 1.3000 No Bid 1.1315 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
Security Areas, Other than Normal 
Working Hours Adjustment Factor 
(10%) 1.4000 No Bid 1.1615 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Non Pre‐Priced (10%) 
1.3000 No Bid 1.0815 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Award Criteria Figure 
1.3000 No Bid 1.1115 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

PORT EVERGLADES 
DEPARTMENT 

PNC2119543C1‐03 

AVIATION 
DEPARTMENT 

PNC2119543C1‐01 

FACILITIES 
MANAGEMENT / 

OTHER 
PNC2119543C1‐02 

CBE Reserve 

* Vendor provided adjustment factor for areas not pre‐qualified in during Step 1 solicitation. 



         

             

             

 

 

 

   

   

 

 

 

 
       

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

   

 

 

   

 

 

 

   

 

 

   

 

   

   

 

   

 

         

                 

         

                     

         

                 

           

                   

    
             

                 

   

 

 

   

 

 

 

   

 

 

   

 

   

   

 

   

 

         

               

         

                   

         

               

           

                 

    
           

   
           

   

 

 

   

 

 

 

   

 

 

   

 

   

   

 

   

 

         

                 

         

                     

         

                 

           

                   

    
             

   
             

   

 

 

   

 

 

Bid Tabulation Date Bid Posted: July 31, 2020 

Bid No. PNC2119543C1 Bid Bid Opened: September 9, 2020 

Job Order Contract (JOC) Step 2  Bid  Submittals: 8 

Declinations: 1 

Exhibit 1 
Page 2 of 2

SBE Reserve 

Alen 
Construction 
Group, Inc. 

Big Dog 
Construction 
Services, Inc. 

Danz 
Contracting, 

LLC* 

FHP Tectonics 
Corp 

Florida Palm 
Construction 

Lee 
Construction 
Group, Inc. 

Mejia 
International 
Group Corp 

Shiff 
Construction 

and 
Development, 

Inc. 

Item # Item 

Sheltered Market/SBE 
Reserve 

Sheltered 
Market/SBE Reserve 

Sheltered 
Market/SBE 
Reserve 

Sheltered Market/SBE 
Reserve 

Sheltered 
Market/SBE Reserve 

Sheltered 
Market/SBE Reserve 

Sheltered Market/SBE 
Reserve 

Sheltered Market/SBE 
Reserve 

AVIATION 
DEPARTMENT 

PNC2119543C1‐01 

Non‐Security Areas, Normal Working Hours 
Adjustment Factor (20%) No Bid No Bid 1.1765 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Non‐Security Areas, Other than Normal 
Working Hours Adjustment Factor (10%) No Bid No Bid 1.1965 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Security Areas, Normal Working Hours 
Adjustment Factor (40%) No Bid No Bid 1.2065 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Security Areas, Other than Normal Working 
Hours Adjustment Factor (20%) No Bid No Bid 1.2265 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Non Pre‐Priced (10%) 
No Bid No Bid 1.1865 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Award Criteria Figure No Bid No Bid 1.2015 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Item # Item 

Sheltered Market/SBE 
Reserve 

Sheltered 
Market/SBE Reserve 

Sheltered 
Market/SBE 
Reserve 

Sheltered Market/SBE 
Reserve 

Sheltered 
Market/SBE Reserve 

Sheltered 
Market/SBE Reserve 

Sheltered Market/SBE 
Reserve 

Sheltered Market/SBE 
Reserve 

FACILITIES 
MANAGEMENT / 

OTHER 
PNC2119543C1‐02 

Non‐Security Areas, Normal Working Hours 
Adjustment Factor (20%) No Bid No Bid 1.1525 No Bid 1.2070 No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Non‐Security Areas, Other than Normal 
Working Hours Adjustment Factor (10%) No Bid No Bid 1.1725 No Bid 1.2170 No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Security Areas, Normal Working Hours 
Adjustment Factor (40%) No Bid No Bid 1.1425 No Bid 1.2270 No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Security Areas, Other than Normal Working 
Hours Adjustment Factor (20%) No Bid No Bid 1.1825 No Bid 1.2370 No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Non Pre‐Priced (10%) 
No Bid No Bid 1.2250 No Bid 1.2070 No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Award Criteria Figure 
No Bid No Bid 1.1638 No Bid 1.2220 No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Item # Item 

Sheltered Market/SBE 
Reserve 

Sheltered 
Market/SBE Reserve 

Sheltered 
Market/SBE 
Reserve 

Sheltered Market/SBE 
Reserve 

Sheltered 
Market/SBE Reserve 

Sheltered 
Market/SBE Reserve 

Sheltered Market/SBE 
Reserve 

Sheltered Market/SBE 
Reserve 

PORT EVERGLADES 
DEPARTMENT 

PNC2119543C1‐03 

Non‐Security Areas, Normal Working Hours 
Adjustment Factor (40%) 

Non‐Security Areas, Other than Normal 
Working Hours Adjustment Factor (20%) 

Security Areas, Normal Working Hours 
Adjustment Factor (20%) 

Security Areas, Other than Normal Working 
Hours Adjustment Factor (10%) 

Non Pre‐Priced (10%) 

No Bid No Bid 1.1645 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

No Bid No Bid 1.1845 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

No Bid No Bid 1.1345 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

No Bid No Bid 1.1245 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

No Bid No Bid 1.1545 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Award Criteria Figure 
No Bid No Bid 1.1575 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
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