			Bid	Tabula	Bid Tabulation for	- ⊢	128813	\$B1 - OE	EM Con	ıstructic	on/Hea	vv Equi	RN2128813B1 - OEM Construction/Heavy Equipment Parts and Maintenance Repair Services	arts a	nd Ma	intena	nce Re	pair Se	rvices								
			Alta Co	nstruction Eq	Alta Construction Equipment Florida		Dobbs Equipment LLC	ment LLC	Even	Everglades Equipment Group	nent Group	Great S	Great Southern Equipment LLC	nent LLC		Kelly Tractor Co	tor Co	_	Linder Ind	Linder Industrial Machinery	hinery	Pat's	Pat's Pump & Blower		SMITH BE EQUIPMENT B	SMITH BROS CONTRACING EQUIPMENT INC/DBA BOBCAT OF BROWARD	ACING DBCAT OF
ll (Rems	Hembezofiston	Total Annual Cost Quantity Of Required Rescuired Rescuired	of Unit	Percentage Percent of Percentage	000.00 of of Price of Price of Price of the Price of the Original of the Original of Original of Service of Service	Unit	S1,107,255 Percortage Professorunt Attributed La Offered La MSRP Pow	Percentage of Price to the Postion of Service	Unit	Percentage Polycent of Officered Discount to Officered Labor Officered Labor MSRP of Servin	Percentage of Price of Price to Ushor Ushor Ushor Cost Pertinon of Service Service	Unit Price	Si61,975.00 Percentage of Attributed Officed Labor Officed Labor Officed Percentage Officed Attributed Officed Labor Officed Percentage Percentage Officed Attributed Attributed Officed Labor Officed Percentage Officed Attributed	ted Total Labor Cost	Price	Percentage Percentage Offereut Offereut Offereut MASRP Percentage	mtage fice buted bor fion	Total Ur Cost PM	Percentage of Offered	Percentage of Price Portion of Service	ed Total	Perce O Unit Diso Price Off	Percentage of of Attributed Offered Off Percentage Offered Labor Offered Attributed Offered Offered Service	Total Cost P	Percentage of of Office	Percentage of Price Attributed to Labor Portion of Service	Total
Group 1 - BOBCAT (4)	DBCAT (4) Enter Labor Rate S/nour for In-Shop Regair and Service per Specifications and Requirements. Please enter zero (0) in the																										
#1-1 Labor: Shour Labor: Shour Prield Repair and Service		M .		ž		No Bid					2			Dig ov	No Bid		2		1	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	· .	170 0		\$ 51,000.0
M1-2 Labor: S/hour h-Freid Repair Overtime/After Hours:		100 Hour	N Pig Di	Dia on	No Bid	98 92	No Bid	P 1	on sign sign sign sign sign sign sign sig	No Bid	PB 2	2 2 2 2 3 3 3 3	No Bid	200	PB 92	PB 1	No Bid	No Bid	20 2	20 Bid	Pig 1	08 1 02 2	No Bid	No Bid	185		\$ 18,500.0
	Examinate Discount Off of MSR (Finder Frad Percentage Discount Off of MSR (Finder Percentage Sylle), per Specifications and Requirements, Please enter zono (0) in the Unit Principal of Percentage of Price and Percentage of Per	Personal same (2000)	Pi Pi	: z		2 2		-		2				P P P						e e	Pil W			, ,	2		00 000 000
#3-5 Annual Pass-Thru				ш	ш	1	ш	ш		ш	ш		ш			ш	ш	Ш									020025
In-Shop Repair and Service #2-1 Lebot: Shrour	The Labor Rate S/hour for In-Shop Regair and Service per Specifications and Requirements. Please enter zero (0) in the Service Percentage of Discount Offered Off MSRP column.	400 Hour	Pig on	No Bid	Pig on Pig on	No Bid	No Bid Mo Bid	99 90 90	No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Big	o N	No Bid No Bid	Pig ov	No Bid	N Pig ou	No Bid No Bid	No Bid	99 90 90 90 90 90	No Bid	No Bid	Pig on Pig on Pig on	No Big	No Bid	No Bid	Pig oN	98 ov
	Enter Labor Rate S/hour for In-Field Repair and Service per Specifications and Requirements, Phase enter zero (0) in the Service Percentage of Discount Offered Off MSRP	W.C.				2			200		•			3	i i				· '	2	r i				7 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0	300	3
700	320223	January 100		2	2		pig oN	2		<u> </u>		2 2	1	2	2 2	2			2 2	2 2	98	2	989		Dig ON	98	3
	1		o N				ow or we have	2		z				9	Pin ox	N Pin Ou			P S	Page 8	Pi B	N N N N N N N N N N N N N N N N N N N	No H			E C N	No Rid
	RPILL																										
In-Strop Repair and Service #3-1 Laborr Syhour	Enter Labor Rai and Service per Requirements. Percentage of E column. Enter Labor Rai	700 Hour	No Bid No	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	to Bid No Bit	No Bid	No Bid No	Bid No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Bid No Bid	Pig ON	\$ 153	0	31 \$	7,100.0 No Bi	D Bill	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Bid No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
In-Ffeld Repair and Service 83-2 Labor: S/hour	and Service per Specifications and Requirements. Please enter zero (0) in the Service Percentage of Discount Offered Off MSRP column.	350 Hour	No Bid M	No Bid No Bid	Sid No Bid	No Bid	No Bid No Bid	Pi No Bid	No Bid No	No Bid No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Biđ No Bid	No Bid	\$ 163	0	\$ 55	57,050.0 No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid	No Bid No	No Bid No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
In-Field Repair Overtime/After Hours: #3-3 \$/hour	10860	100 Hour	No Bio	No Bid	o Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Pi Pi	No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid	oN big on	40 Bid No Bid	No Bid	\$ 215		\$ 21	21,500.0 No Bid	N Sign	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No 86
OEM/OE Parts and Materials Discount off	Enter Keep Discount Off of MSRP (Include percentage Nagin), per Specifications and Requirements, Please enter zero (0) in the Unit Price and off Percentage of Pire Antibured to Labor Percentage of Pire Antibured to Labor		ž	Pie ou	2	2	Pia on	3 2 2		200	3	3	ya ca	3 6 2	0 000 000		Ę.	00000	3 3 3	70 00	i d	30 00 00 00 00 00 00 00 00 00 00 00 00 0	TO SEE		P10 02	1 0 1	3
#3-5 Annua 4 Group 4 - D	T S																\$	\$1,000.00									
In-Shop Repair and Service M4-1 Labor: S/hour	Enter Labor Rate S/hour for In-Shop Repair and Service per Specifications and Requirements. Please enter zero (0) in the Service Percentage of Discount Offered Off MSRP column.	- Sept.	No Bid oN	PIS ON	Pi8 ou	No Bid	No Bid	Pi So N	N Bid on	No Bid	Pi Bi Q	oN Pig oN	PIB ON PIB ON	98 ou	No Bid	Pig ou	JoN Bid	No Bid	2 2	No Bid	No Bid	Pig ov Pig ov	No Bid	Pig oN	Vo Bid	Pig ow	Pig on
	7 4 5 5 8	SS OF	200	900	200	2000	98 98	2	2	Pig on	N N	2 2 2 2	PB 98	2	2	2 2	PB.	2	2	98	2	98 90 90 90 90 90 90 90 90 90 90 90 90 90	Pin N		Pig ox	2	38 2
In-Reid Repair Overtime/After Hours: M4-3 S/frour	m 0 8 8 9	nd Hour	No Bid	Pig o	No Bid		lo Bid No Bic	98 9N	No Bid	- Bid No Bid	No Bid	No 8id	Bid No Bid	No Bid	N Bid	No Bid	. Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Big	No Bid	No Bid No Bid	N Big	ž	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
OEM/OE Parts and Materials Discount off #4-4 MSRP: %	Enter Ferce Reconstage Discount Off of MSRP (include percentage Nisoln), por Specifications and Requirements. Please enter serve (i) in the Unit Prince and enter serve (ii) in the Unit Prince and enter and Service columns.	7 Percentage 10000	2	D B id No Bid	3d No Bid	No Bid	to Bid No Bit	Pig ON	No Bid No	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Bid No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Bid No E	II No Bi	Pig on	No Bid	Pi Bi Q	No Bid No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Bid No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

					Bic	1 Tabu	Bid Tabulation for T	1 for T	RN212	38813E	31 - OE	M Co	nstruc	tion/h	leavy	RN2128813B1 - OEM Construction/Heavy Equipment Parts and Maintenance Repair Services	nent P.	arts a	nd Mg	inten	ance	Repair	Service	ces									Г
					Alta	Construction	Alta Construction Equipment Florida	ıt Florida		Dobbs Equipment LLC	nt LLC	Eve	Everglades Equipment Group	ipment Gro	ā,	Great South	Great Southern Equipment LLC	ent LLC		Kelly Ti	Kelly Tractor Co		Lind	Linder Industrial Machinery	al Machiner	>	Pat's P	Pat's Pump & Blower	wer	SMI	SMITH BROS CONTRACING EQUIPMENT INC/DBA BOBCAT OF BROWARD	ONTRACING BA BOBCAT ARD	ı ĕ
2	Rems	Itembeznipton	Total Ar Quantity Of Required Measure	Total Annual Cost Annual Annual of Expected asure Expenditure	ual Unit tred Price	Percentage of Discount Offered Off MSRP	Percentage of Proce Attributed to Labor Portion of Service Service	Total Labor Cost	Percel 0 Office	St.107.250.00 St.107.250.00 Percentage	age red Total Labor Cost	Unit	S922,00	S922,000.00 Percentage Price Price Attributed 1 to 1 Labor Labor Portion of of Service	Labor Cost	S161, Percentage Unit Discourt Price Offered Off	\$161,975.00 tage of Price of Price of Price of Price of Iabor of Iabor of Senice of Senice	ed Total Labor Cost	Unit	Percentage of Discount Offered Off	S886,650.00 Percentage of Price unt Attributed to be	Total Labor Cost	Unit Price	S108,300.00 Percentage PATINE Discount to Offered Lab. Offered Lab. MSRP Portor	Percentage of Price Attributed to Labor Portion of Service	Total Cost P	Percentage Ourit Discount Price Offered Off	So Percentage of Price age Price to Labor Ip Portion of Price of Labor Ip Of Of Service	e cost	Unit	Percentage Percentage of Attu Offered L Off Per NASSP S	Percentage of Price Attributed T Labor to Labor Portion of Service	Total Labor Cost
ın	Group 5 - DOOSAN (4) Enter Lal and Service Requirer In-Shop Repair and Service Percental	Finter Labor Rate S/hour for In-Shop Repair and Service per Specifications and Requirements. Please enter zero (0) in the Percentage of Discount Officed Off MSSP																									⊩						
45-1	Labor: S/hour In-Field Repair and Service	0 w n & a	400 Hour			No Bid		No Bid	4 -		P8 00		z		2	1	No Bid	98 i	No Bid	Dig on	No Bid	No Bid		2 : : : : : : : : : : : : : : : : : : :	2			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	2 :		28
74 89	Labor: S/mour In-Field Repair Overtime/After Hours: S/hour	Codumn. Enter Labor Rate Syhour for In-Field Repair Overtime/After Hours per Specifications and Requirements. Please enter zero (0) in the Percentage of Discount Offered Off MSRP column.	100 Hone		PH P	pi pi N	Z Z	pig ow	99 99 99 99 99 99 99 99 99 99 99 99 99	DI D	B 88	PH P	DE DE ON	8 8	pia pia pia on p	PR 98 98 98 98 98 98 98 98 98 98 98 98 98	DIB ON	9 9 9 9	Di D	98 98 00 00	9 99 9 90 9 90	on on	No Bid	2 2 28 28 28 28	D	2 2 2 2 2 2	2 2	Di Di N	Pig 90 90 N	9 9 9 9 9 9 9 9	2 2	2 2	8 3
4.8		Enter Fixed Percentage Discount Off of MSRP (Include percentage Nagin), per Specifications and Requirements, Pease enter zero (of) in the Unit Price and Percentage of Price Attributed to Labor Percentage of Price Attributed to Labor Portion of Service columns.	1 Percent	75000	PIB ON	Pig on	Pi go y	No Bid	No Bid No Bid	Pig oN	Pig on	PI BON	No Bid	o _N	Bid No Bid	Pig on Pi	PIG ON	P O N	No Bid	Pig on	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Dig c	W Pig	bid o	Pig V Pig	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid No E	g oN Pig	g ov Pig	2
٥	Group 6 - GRADALL (4) Enter Lake and Service Recquirem In-Stop Repair and Service Percentag	Finer Labor Rate S/hour for In-Shop Repair and Service per Specifications and Recquirements. Please enter zero (0) in the Recquirements. Please enter zero (0) in the Percentage of Discourt Offered Off MSRP															L										_	H	Н	_	Н	Н	
14 S	Labor: S/hour In-Field Repair and Service	column. Tette Labor Rate S/hour for In-Field Repair and Service per Specifications and Requirements. Please enter zero (0) in the precentage of Discount Offered Off MSRP	, Hori		98 3 90 3	No Bid	N 1	No Bid	No Bid		2 1	2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2	DE 00 1	DB 50	0 Bid 8 22	2325		\$ 45,100.0	No Bid	98 3 02 1	No Bid	9 8 8 8 8 8 8 8 8 8 8 8 8 8 8 8 8 8 8 8	No Bid	N 2	2 2		DB 1	No Bid	00 i	No Bid	Dig Sig	2 1	98 3
ě	In-Field Repair Overtime/After Hours:	0 4 0 4 4 0	`		900			000000000000000000000000000000000000000	5	000000000000000000000000000000000000000	2 2		ž	1		2 2		000000000000000000000000000000000000000		8 3	D 00 00 00 00 00 00 00 00 00 00 00 00 00	00 00		-				2	2 2		000		
		Enter Fixed Percentage Discount Off of MSRP (Include percentage % sign), per generation and Requirements. Please enter zero (0) in the Unit Price and Percentage of Price Attributed to Labor																															
#6-4 #6-5			1 Percentage	9 ege	No Bid No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid N	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid \$ 60	0 0'000'0 9	•	\$ 60,000.0	\$60,000.0 No Bid \$500.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid No	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid No Bid	3id No Bid	No Bid	2
144.1	In-Shop Repair and Service Labor: 5/hour	Enter Labor Rate S/hour for In-Shop Repair and Service per Specifications and Requirements, Please enter zero (D) in the Percentage of Discourt Offered Off MSRP column.	100 Hour	-	Pig on	Pig ov	Pig ON	No Bid	No Bid No Bid	PIB ON	- PB 92	Pig	No Bid	No Bid	PIG ON	Pig on Pig	PiB oN	28	No Bid	Pig OV	Pii on	No Bid	No Bid	2 2 2 2 3 3	- Bid	Dig o	Pig ON Pig ON	No Bid	Pig 0N	N PR ON	No 8	90 Pi	pig o
629	In-Reid Repair and Service	m 8 ac ac c	Se Se		20	Pie Se	N Pid ou	pig ov	N O Bid	S S	iii g		Pig Og	N N	Pig ON		8	20 G	12	98 92	e e	No Bid	Pig on	98	,	No Bid	Dig ON	No Bid		No Rid	- S	28.00	3
£1.3	In-Field Repair Overtime/After Hours: \$/hour	w 0 a a 0	SO Hour		Pig ov			No Bid	Pig on Pig on		PIS ON		PISON	N Sid	Z	z	98 oN	98 9V	PB 90	28 28	No Bid	Pig oN					PB PB	PB 90	P8 92	No Bid	8 ON	9	P8
17-4	OEM/DE Parts and Materials Discount off MSRP: %	Enter Fixed Percentage Obscount Off of MSRP (Fixedule per centrage K sign.), per Specifications and Requirements. Pease enter zero (ob) in the Unit Pirce and Percentage of Price Attributed to Labor Percentage of Price Attributed to Labor	1 Percent	9800 10000	Pig oN	Pig oN	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid	Pig ov	No Bid	No Bid	o Bid	pig on Bid	Pig ON Pig	No Bid	98 98	No Bid	28 02	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid No	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid	No 8id	No Bid No Bid	Bid No Bid	Pig ON	3
	Group 8 - JCB (4) In-Stop Regair and Service	fetter Labor Rate S/hour for In-Shop Repair and Service per Specifications and Requirements. Please enter zero (0) in the Percentage of Discount Offered Off MSRP column	9		ii o	2	DE ON	DE ON	No Bid	2	2	3	100	Dia di	2	200	200	2	2		2	, c	N Pid ON	2	2	pia	2	No Big	2	No and	2	2	700
8	In-Reid Repair and Service Labor: 5/hour		100 Hour		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	73 80 00		2	No Pigo	Bid No B	No Bid	No No	- 38 92	No Bid	No Big	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	980	2		20 20 20 20 20 20 20 20 20 20 20 20 20 2	No Bid	No Big Big		No B	2	3
W8-3	In-Field Repair Overtime/After Hours: S/hour	Enter Labor Rate Sybour for in-Field Repair Overtime/After Hours per Specifications and Requirements. Please enter zero (0) in the Percentage of Oscount Offered Off MSRP column.	10 Hour		Pig oN	No Bid	N big on	No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	oN bið on	No No	Bid No B	Pig on Pi	P(g oN	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid No	No bid o	o Bid	o Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid Not	3id No 8	PH PH	Pig
48 7-7	#o#	fine Fixed becoming Discount Of 16 MSRP (Include percentage N 1801), per (Include percentage N 1801), per Specifications and Requirements. Please enter area (10) in the Unit Price and Percentage of Price Authorized to Labor 1	2	oentage 10000	No Bid No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	o Bid No	Bid	id No Bid	No Bid	No Big	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	o Bid	o Bid	0 Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid No E	3id No B	No 8	3

			"	id Tab	ulation	Bid Tabulation for T		8813B1	OEN	1 Const	truction	n/Heav	v Equi	RN2128813B1 - OEM Construction/Heavy Equipment Parts and Maintenance Repair Services	Parts a	Ind Mi	intena	ance Re	bair S	ervices								
			a	Alta Construction Equipment Florida	on Equipmen	nt Florida		Dobbs Equipment LLC	OH OH	Evergla	Everglades Equipment Group	nt Group	Great S	Great Southern Equipment LLC	pment LLC		Kelly Tra	Kelly Tractor Co		Linder Inc	Linder Industrial Machinery	nery	Pat's F	Pat's Pump & Blower	ver	SMITH	SMITH BROS CONTRACING EQUIPMENT INC/DBA BOBCAT OF	RACING BOBCAT OF
II Reems	Itembezripton	Total Annual Cost Ouentity Of Expect Required Measure Expending	Annual Unit Expected Price	Percent of Discou Offers Off	\$73,000.00 Percentage of Price of Price of Labor of Portion of Service	Total Labor Cost	Percentage of Unit Discount Price Offered Off	St.107.250.00 Percentage of Pico Pico Pico Pico Pico Pico Pico Pico	Total Labor Cost	Perce 0 Unit Disc Price Offe MS	Percentage Percentage Percentage Price Discount Arributed Offered Labor Off Ports Offered Labor Arributed Coff Percentage Offered Labor Off Percentage Off Percentage Percentage Percentage Percentage Percentage Percentage	need Total	Unit D Price C	S161,975.00 Percentage Prior of Attriti Discount by Offered Discount by Offered Differed Differed Differed Differed Services Services Differed Diff	S16,975.00 Percentage of Price of Price of Price of Price of Price of Labor Cost of Price of Labor Cost of Price of Pri	. Unit	Percentage of Discount Offered Off	S886,550.00 Percentage of Price of Price of Attributed count Attributed count SRP Price of SRP P	Total U Cost	S108, Percentage of Unit Discount Price Offered Off	\$108,300.00 Percentage of Prico of Triffunde Tota freed Labor Cos Of Prico Freed Labor Cos Of Service	Total Cost	Percentage of of the Discount Price Offered Offered Offered Off	So crage Price of Attributed to Tee Percentage of Price of Tee Percentage of Tee Percentage of Service Service	ed Total Labor n Cost	Percentage of of Unit Discount Price Officed Officed Officed Off	Percentage Profession of Particular Attributed Ton Labor Co Particular Co Percentage Profession Co Percentage Co P	ed Total Labor n Cost
Group 9 - JOHN DEERE (4) Enter Labor Ral and Service per Requirements.	DEERE (4) Enter Labor Rate S/hour for In-Shop Repair and Service per Specifications and Requirements. Please enter zero (0) in the																						\blacksquare					
In-Stop Repair and Service 49-1 Labor: Syhour Thour Syhour In-Field Repair and Service	Percentage of Discount Offered Off MSRP ookun. Inter Labor Rate S/nour for In-field Repair and Sonvices and Sonvices and Requirements. Please enter zero (o) in the Percentage of Discount Offered Off MSRP	700 Hour	- ON	Bid No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	8 225 0	100	\$ 157,500.0	\$ 110	100	\$ 77,000.0	No Bid	Bid No Bic	No 86d	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid	Pi
In-Field Repair Overtime/After Hours: 5/hour	Contum. Enter Labor Rate S/hour for In-Held Repair Overtime/After Hours per Specifications and Requirements. Please enter zero (0) in the Percentage of Discount Offered Off MISSP Lobburn.	100 Hear	N SN	P P P P P P P P P P P P P P P P P P P	2 2	D	5 437.5 0	3 8	\$ 43,750.0		8 8	\$ 33,000.0		Pig ON ON Pig	2 2	No No	2 2	2	o o o o o	9 98 92 92	2 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0	P	00 00 00 00 00 00 00 00 00	N Big	DI D	DI NO BIQ	B 98 90 00	2 2
OEM/OE Parts and Materials Decount off MSRP: N.	Enter Fixed Percentage Discount Off of MSRP (findled percentage & sign), per Specifications and Requirements. Pease enter zero (o) in the Unit Price and Percentage of Price Astronomy Percentage of Price Astronomy Percentage of Price Astronomy Specification of Service columns.	1 Percentage 800000		No Bid No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0 0 0 0	0	00'000'008\$	9	٥	Pi8 ON 000'0085		No Bid No Bid	Pig ov	No Bid	Pig ov	No Bid	No Bid No Bid	Pig No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Pig on Pig on	No Bid	No Bid	Vo Bid No Bid	No Bid	No 8ld
	Thin Allowance for Freight/Shipping (ATSU (4)								\$1,000.00			\$1,000																
In-Shop Repair and Service	Enter Labor Rate Syhour for In-Shop Repair and Service per Spedifications and Requirements. Please enter zero (D) in the Percentage of Discount Offered Off MSRP only non	100	9	his on	No Red	No Brd	No Bid	78 57	198 00	38 00		28.00	No Red	28.0	A Book	No Rid	19 00	No Bod	PB/4	-	c	0.19.100.0	No Bod	No. B.	3	AN PER NA PER	3	38
	Enter Labor Rate Sylvour for In-field Repair and Service per Spedifications and Requirements. Please enter zero (0) in the Precentage of Discount Offered Off MSRP cohem	1001		2	1 1		70 TO 100	Pia di	1		3 3	20 TO 10 TO	70 N	Pig ON	3		3	3 7 3				001		200	3	1		3 3
200	Enter Labor Rate S/hour for In-Held Repair Overtime/After Hours per Specifications and Requirements. Please enter zero (0) in the precentage of Discours Offered Off MSRP over	1000			1			Pia Si	3		3 3	9	1				3					001	3		9	-		3 3
	Enter Rud Derocentage Discount Off of MSRP (include percentage & sign.), per Specifications and Requirements. Please enter axeo (to) in the Unit Price and Precentage of Price Attributed to Labor Reviewing of Price Attributed to Labor Reviewing of Sociologo Attributed to Labor Reviewing of Sociologo Attributed to Labor Reviewing of Sociologo Attributed Sociologo At	The state of the s	-	8							2				2	3 3				9 9 9					20 Big	2		10 H
#10.5 Annual Pass-Thru Allowance for allowed for the Allowance for	Thu Allowance for Freight/Shipping											1										81,000.00						200
In-Shop Repair and Senice #11-1 Labor: Shour	Enter Lator Rate S/hour for in-Shop Repair and Service por Specifications and Requirements. Please enter ace (0) in the Percentage of Discount Offered Off MSRP column.	100 Hour	No B	Pig oN Pig on	Pig ov	No Bid	No Bid No Bid	Pie Bid	No Bid	No Bid No Bid	P B ON	Pig oN	I ON PIG ON	lo Bid No Bid	Pig ov	\$ 100			9 oN 0'000'01	Pig on	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid No Bid	Pig oN	Pig ON
In-Reid Repair and Service Labon: S/Prour	Enter Labor Rate S/hour for In-Field Repair and Service per Specifications and Requirements, Please enter zero (0) in the Percentage of Discours Offered Off MSSP Coham.	300 Hour	2	Pig on Pig on Pig on	98 98 98	No Bid	No Bid No Bid	Pig oN	98 90 20	Pig oN Pig oN	98 ov	Pig on	Pig ov	Pig oN Pig oN	2	818			12,000,0 No Bid	98 ov	No Bid	Pi Bo N	No Bid No Bid	No Big	Pi Bo N	No Bid	No Bid	86 2
In-Field Repair Overtime/After Hours: S/hour	Enter Labor Nate Shour for In-Field Repair Overtime/After Hours per Specifications and Requirements. Please enter zero (1) in the Percentage of Discours Offered Off IMSRP Toolanna.	10 Hour		PIB ON PIB OR	PB 92		PIB ON PIB ON	PIB ON	PIS ON	PIS ON PIS ON	-	PB oN				PH ON	PIB ON	No Bid	B ON	PIS ON	PH ON		No Bid	PBON	PIB ON	No Bid	Pig ov	98 90
OBN/OE Parts and Materials Decount off #11-4 MSRP: % Annual Passer	Enter Facel Percentage Discount Off of MSRP (include percentage Sispu), por Specifications and Requirements, Please enter area (oil) in the Unit Price and Percentage of Price Attributed to Labori Petron Attributed to Labori Petron Specification of Sewice Country and Sewice Country of Sewice Country Allocates of Sewice Country 11.	Percentage	20000 No 8id	Pig on Pig	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid No Bid	P P P P P P P P P P P P P P P P P P P	\$ 20,000,0		- 3	20,000.0 No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Pie Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Pig on	No Bid No Bid	H 98	No Bid
Group 12 - NEW	/ HOLLAND (4) Enter Labor Rate \$/nour for in-Stop Repair and Service per Specifications and Requirements. Please enter zero (0) in the																										_	
#12.1 Labor: S/hour In-Field Repair and Service	column. Enter Labor Rate S/hour for In-Field Repair and Services and Requirement. Please enter area (0) in the Percentage of Discount Offered Off MSRP reviews	2000 Hour	No.	No Bid	DIS 18	No Bid	Dia on Di	Dig No Bid	N 3	DB 3000 PB 300	Dia dia	Dia on	PIE ON SE	No Bid	DB 38	No Bid	2 2	No Bid	Did high	DB 3	No Bid	Dig on se	Dig of S	No Bid	PB 3	Dig on Dig on	PB 38	20 2
200	Enter Labor Rate S/hour for In-Field Repair Overtime/After Hours per Specifications and Requirements. Please enter zero (0) in the Percentage of Discount Offered Off MSRP column.	Hour 100	2	Pig on	38 9	98	DB ON	PiB 9N	38	pig oN pig oN	2	Pig ov	Pigon	Pig oN	2	92	3 2	DB ON	98	2	28 22	28	2	PB 02	9	Dig Ov.	2	2
	Inter Rived Percentage Discount Off of MSRP (Include percentages Vi. 1901, por Spedifications and Requirements. Please erreit zero (ii) in the Unit Director and Percentage of Pint Attributed to Labor 1 Percentage of Pint Attributed to Labor 1	Percentage St	900 No B	No Bid No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid No Bid	Pig ON	No Bid	No Bid	PRQ No BIQ	PI8 ON	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No B	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid No Bid	Pig on	No Bid

\neg	*							
IRACING	EQUIPMENT INC/DBA BOBCAT OF BROWARD			ı	No Bid	No 86	No Bid	PigoN
SMITH BROS CONTRACING	T INC/DBA E			ı	No Bid	No Bid	PI BIN	PIB ON
SMITHB	QUIPMEN			ı	No Bid No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid No Bid
	Φ.			ı	No Bid No Bid	No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bi
	Blower			ı				
	Pat's Pump & Blower			ı	No Bid	NO BIG	PIB ON PI	No Bid
	Par			ı	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	PIBON PIBON	No Bid No Bid
	ح			ı	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Linder Industrial Machinery			ı	No Bid	No Bid	NO BIG	No Bid
es	r Industria			ı	No Bid	No Bid	NO Bid	No Bid
ervic	Linde			ı	No Bid No	No Bid	No Bid No	No Bid No
pair s				ı				
Se Ke	S			ı	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	PI NO BIG
enanc	Kelly Tractor Co				No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
lainte	Kel			ı	No 8id	No 88	No Bid	Pig on
				ı	No Bid	No Big	No Bid	No Bid
arts	ent LLC			ı	No Bid	98 90 N	No Bid	No Bld
Bid Tabulation for TRN2128813B1 - OEM Construction/Heavy Equipment Parts and Maintenance Repair Services	Great Southern Equipment LLC			ı	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
mdin	at Southe			ı	No Bid	No Big	No Bid	No Bid
/y Eq	95			ı	No 8id	No 8id	No Bid	No Bid
Иеа	group			ı	No Bid	No Big	No Bid	No Bid
ction,	Everglades Equipment Group			ı	No Bid	No Bid	No Bld	No Bid
nstru	rglades Ec			ı			Pi Biq	
<u>5</u> 	Eve			ı	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	4 PIB ON	No Bid No Bid
- OE	2			ı	Pi8 oN	Pig on	PIBON	PIB ON
1381	Dobbs Equipment LLC			ı	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1788	Dobbs Eq			ı	No Bid	No BiG	No Bid	No Bid
KINZ L				ı	No Bid No	No Bid	No Bid No	Pig
10r	t Florida		Total Labor Cost	ı	\$ 17,700.0	\$ 19,100.0	0.002/5	N 00'000'08\$
atior	Alta Construction Equipment Florida	\$73,000.00	Percentage of Price Attributed to Labor Portion of Service	ı			-	
apn	struction	\$73,0	Percentage of Discount Offered Off	ı	°	•	0	0
BIG	Alta Co		Price	ı	\$177 0	0 191	\$ 285 0	0 0 0 0
		ual Cost	Annual Experded	ı				30000
		Total Annual Cost	Unit of Measure	ı	Hour	Hour	Hour	Percentage 3
			Quantity	ı	100	100	9 DZ	
				ı			m m	of of MSRP
			ItemDescription	ı	Enter Labor Rate S/hour for In-Shop Repair and Service per Specifications and Requirements. Please enter zero (0) in the Percentage of Oscourt Offered Off MSRP Ochem.	Enter Labor Bate S/hour for In-Tield Repair and Service per Specifications and Requirements. Please enter zero (0) in the percentage of Discount Offered Off MSSP column.	Enter Labor Rate S/hour for In-Held Repair Overtime/After Hours per Specifications and Requirements, Please enter zero (U) in the Percentage of Discount Offered Off MSRP column.	Enter Fleed Percentage Discount Off of MSRP (include percentage N sign), per Specifications and Requirements. Please enter area (of) in the Linit Price and externage of Price Attributed to Labor Portion of Service columns.
			TemDe	ı	oor Rate S/ho ice per Speci nents. Please ge of Discour	oor Rate S/ho ice per Speci nents. Please ge of Discou	oor Rate S/ho a/After Hourn nents. Please ge of Discou	Three Fixed Percentage Discount Include percentage M-8(gn), per Specifications and Requirements, enter zero (0) in the Unit Price an Percentage of Price Attributed to Portion of Service columns.
					Enter Lab and Servi Requirent oe Percental column.		Enter Lab Overtims Requiren Percental column.	Enter Flaed Percentage Niscourt I (Include percentage Nisulty) per Specifications and Requirements, stand enter service (10) in the Unite Price and Percentage of Price Attributed to Percentage of Price Attributed to Per
			Items		tinter Lakor Nate Syhour for In-Skop Repail and Service poet Specifications and Requirements. Please enter zero (0) in the In-Skop Repair and Service Percentage of Discount Officed Off NSSP Column.	in-Field Repair and Service Jabon: S/Pour	In-Field Repair Deerlime/After Hours: 5/hour	OEM/OE Parts and Materials Discount off MSRP: %
					In-Shop Repair Labor: S/hour	In-Field Repair Labor: S/hour	In-Field Repair Overtime/After S/hour	OEM/OE Parts and Materials Discount MSRP: %
			3		N13-1	#13-2	#13-3	\$13.4 \$