

PRICE ANALYSIS
 New Actuators, Actuator Parts,
 Bid #OPN2127978B1 Accessories & Repair Services
 Group 4

Group 4		Instrument Specialties Inc		CS3 Waterworks		Rexa Inc		Estimate based on contract		Percent difference	
Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Price	Total	Price	Total	Price	Total	Price	Percent
OPN2127978B1-04-01	REXA Manufactured New Actuators or Approved Equal: (Discounted Rate):	1	contract	No Bid	No Bid	0%	\$ 70,000.00	0%	\$ 70,000.00		0%
OPN2127978B1-04-02	REXA Actuator or Approved Equal: Parts and Accessories: (Discounted Rate):	1	contract	No Bid	No Bid	0%	\$ 10,000.00	0%	\$ 10,000.00		0%
OPN2127978B1-04-03	REXA Actuator - Testing Calibration Start-up Services	3	lump sum	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 5,000.00	\$15,000.00	\$ 1,700.00	\$ 5,100.00		194%
OPN2127978B1-04-04	REXA Actuator - Testing Calibration Start-up Services	50	hour	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 400.00	\$20,000.00	N/A	N/A		N/A
	Pass Thru Annual Total					\$ 25,000.00	\$ 25,000.00		\$ 35,000.00		
	Initial Term (Two Year) Total					\$ 122,500.00	\$ 122,500.00		\$ 120,100.00		
	Five Year Potential Total					\$ 245,000.00	\$ 245,000.00				
						\$ 612,500.00	\$ 612,500.00				
							AWD				

Price is for the initial 2-year term
 AWD - Awarded Vendor per Group