

OPN2129401B1 - Submersible Lift Station Pumps Parts (Group 1 - 20)									
				Barneys Pumps Incorporated		FJ Nugent and Associates Inc.		Tom Evans Environmental, Inc.	
			Total Cost	\$1,681,132.00		\$1,497,444.38		\$2,070,785.06	
#	Items	Estimated Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Price	TotalCost	Unit Price	TotalCost	Unit Price	TotalCost
1	Group 1 (3)								
#1-1	Submersible Pump Curve #1, 240V, 3 Phase, 3 HP, 4 in. Discharge, 2 in. Guide	1	each	\$6,755.00	\$6,755.00	\$4,619.69	\$4,619.69	\$5,511.34	\$5,511.34
#1-2	Submersible Pump Curve #1, 240V, Single Phase, 3 HP, 4 in. Discharge, 2 in. Guide	1	each	\$7,520.00	\$7,520.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$3,904.24	\$3,904.24
#1-3	Submersible Pump Curve #1, 480V, 3 Phase, 3 HP, 4 in. Discharge, 2 in. Guide	1	each	\$6,755.00	\$6,755.00	\$4,619.69	\$4,619.69	\$5,511.34	\$5,511.34
#2-1	Submersible Pump Curve #2, 240V, 3 Phase, 5 HP, 4 in. Discharge, 2 in. Guide	7	each	\$6,866.00	\$48,062.00	\$4,824.00	\$33,768.00	\$5,908.38	\$41,358.64
#2-2	Submersible Pump Curve #2, 240V, Single Phase, 5 HP, 4 in. Discharge, 2 in.	2	each	\$7,520.00	\$15,040.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$4,281.69	\$8,563.39
#2-3	Submersible Pump Curve #2, 480V, 3 Phase, 5 HP, 4 in. Discharge, 2 in. Guide	1	each	\$6,866.00	\$6,866.00	\$4,824.00	\$4,824.00	\$5,908.38	\$5,908.38
#3-1	Submersible Pump Curve #3, 240V, 3 Phase, 5.5 HP, 4 in. Discharge, 2 in. Guide	8	each	\$7,154.00	\$57,232.00	\$4,824.00	\$38,592.00	\$6,342.45	\$50,739.58
#3-2	Submersible Pump Curve #3, 480V, 3 Phase, 5.5 HP, 4 in. Discharge, 2 in. Guide	1	each	\$7,154.00	\$7,154.00	\$4,824.00	\$4,824.00	\$6,342.45	\$6,342.45
#4-1	Submersible Pump Curve #4, 240V, 3 Phase, 7.5 HP, 4 in. Discharge, 2 in. Guide	7	each	\$7,206.00	\$50,442.00	\$4,999.00	\$34,993.00	\$7,894.89	\$55,264.26
#4-2	Submersible Pump Curve #4, 480V, 3 Phase, 7.5 HP, 4 in. Discharge, 2 in. Guide	2	each	\$7,206.00	\$14,412.00	\$4,999.00	\$9,998.00	\$7,894.89	\$15,789.79
#5-1	Submersible Pump Curve #5, 240V, 3 Phase, 10 HP, 4 in. Discharge, 2 in. Guide	4	each	\$8,420.00	\$33,680.00	\$5,190.00	\$20,760.00	\$9,546.52	\$38,186.07
#5-2	Submersible Pump Curve #5, 480V, 3 Phase, 10 HP, 4 in. Discharge, 2 in. Guide	1	each	\$8,420.00	\$8,420.00	\$5,190.00	\$5,190.00	\$9,546.52	\$9,546.52
#6-1	Submersible Pump Curve #6, 240V, 3 Phase, 10 HP, 4 in. Discharge, 2 in. Guide	20	each	\$8,420.00	\$168,400.00	\$5,190.00	\$103,800.00	\$8,892.00	\$177,840.00
#6-2	Submersible Pump Curve #6, 480V, 3 Phase, 10 HP, 4 in. Discharge, 2 in. Guide	4	each	\$8,420.00	\$33,680.00	\$5,190.00	\$20,760.00	\$8,892.00	\$35,568.00
#7-1	Submersible Pump Curve #7, 240V, 3 Phase, 15 HP, 4 in. Discharge, 2 in. Guide	2	each	\$10,994.00	\$21,988.00	\$8,201.00	\$16,402.00	\$10,506.19	\$21,012.38
#7-2	Submersible Pump Curve #7, 480V, 3 Phase, 15 HP, 4 in. Discharge, 2 in. Guide	1	each	\$10,994.00	\$10,994.00	\$8,201.00	\$8,201.00	\$10,506.19	\$10,506.19
#8-1	Submersible Pump Curve #8, 240V, 3 Phase, 15 HP, 4 in. Discharge, 2 in. Guide	10	each	\$10,994.00	\$109,940.00	\$8,201.00	\$82,010.00	\$11,582.45	\$115,824.47
#8-2	Submersible Pump Curve #8, 480V, 3 Phase, 15 HP, 4 in. Discharge, 2 in. Guide	1	each	\$10,994.00	\$10,994.00	\$8,201.00	\$8,201.00	\$11,582.45	\$11,582.45
#9-1	Submersible Pump Curve #9, 240V, 3 Phase, 15 HP, 4 in. Discharge, 2 in. Guide	1	each	\$10,994.00	\$10,994.00	\$8,201.00	\$8,201.00	\$11,032.24	\$11,032.24
#9-2	Submersible Pump Curve #9, 480V, 3 Phase, 15 HP, 4 in. Discharge, 2 in. Guide	1	each	\$10,994.00	\$10,994.00	\$8,201.00	\$8,201.00	\$11,032.24	\$11,032.24
#10-1	Submersible Pump Curve #10, 240V, 3 Phase, 20 HP, 6 in. Discharge, 2 in. Guide	10	each	\$13,186.00	\$131,860.00	\$8,994.00	\$89,940.00	\$11,793.39	\$117,933.88
#10-2	Submersible Pump Curve #10, 480V, 3 Phase, 20 HP, 6 in. Discharge, 2 in. Guide	10	each	\$13,186.00	\$131,860.00	\$8,994.00	\$89,940.00	\$11,793.39	\$117,933.88
#11-1	Submersible Pump Curve #11, 240V, 3 Phase, 20 HP, 4 in. Discharge, 2 in. Guide	6	each	\$11,219.00	\$67,314.00	\$9,434.00	\$56,604.00	\$11,539.34	\$69,236.05
#11-2	Submersible Pump Curve #11, 480V, 3 Phase, 20 HP, 4 in. Discharge, 2 in. Guide	2	each	\$11,219.00	\$22,438.00	\$9,434.00	\$18,868.00	\$11,539.34	\$23,078.68

OPN2129401B1 - Submersible Lift Station Pumps Parts (Group 1 - 20)									
				Barneys Pumps Incorporated		FJ Nugent and Associates Inc.		Tom Evans Environmental, Inc.	
			Total Cost	\$1,681,132.00		\$1,497,444.38		\$2,070,785.06	
#	Items	Estimated Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Price	TotalCost	Unit Price	TotalCost	Unit Price	TotalCost
1	Group 1 (3)								
#12-1	Submersible Pump Curve #12, 240V, 3 Phase, 25 HP, 4 in. Discharge, 3 in. Guide	2	each	\$17,849.00	\$35,698.00	\$14,540.00	\$29,080.00	\$14,525.27	\$29,050.54
#12-2	Submersible Pump Curve #12, 480V, 3 Phase, 25 HP, 6 in. Discharge, 2 in. Guide	4	each	\$17,849.00	\$71,396.00	\$14,540.00	\$58,160.00	\$14,207.72	\$56,830.87
#13-1	Submersible Pump Curve #13, 240V, 3 Phase, 30 HP, 4 in. Discharge, 3 in. Guide	1	each	\$19,966.00	\$19,966.00	\$12,478.00	\$12,478.00	\$17,918.68	\$17,918.68
#13-2	Submersible Pump Curve #13, 480V, 3 Phase, 30 HP, 6 in. Discharge, 3 in. Guide	6	each	\$19,966.00	\$119,796.00	\$12,478.00	\$74,868.00	\$17,796.07	\$106,776.42
#14-1	Submersible Pump Curve #14, 480V, 3 Phase, 40 HP, 6 in. Discharge, 2 in. Guide	4	each	\$22,109.00	\$88,436.00	\$14,540.00	\$58,160.00	\$25,783.08	\$103,132.33
#15-1	Submersible Pump Curve #15, 480V, 3 Phase, 50 HP, 6 in. Discharge, 3 in. Guide	4	each	\$29,042.00	\$116,168.00	\$22,765.00	\$91,060.00	\$30,975.53	\$123,902.12
#16-1	Submersible Pump Curve #16, 480V, 3 Phase, 60 HP, 6 in. Discharge, 3 in. Guide	2	each	\$29,042.00	\$58,084.00	\$22,668.00	\$45,336.00	\$33,211.08	\$66,422.16
#17-1	Submersible Pump Curve #17, 480V, 3 Phase, Rated 75 HP, 6 in. Discharge, 3 in. Guide	2	each	\$34,186.00	\$68,372.00	\$24,165.00	\$48,330.00	\$36,560.59	\$73,121.18
#18-1	Submersible Pump Curve #18, 480V, 3 Phase, 100 HP, 6 in. Discharge, 3 in. Guide	3	each	\$36,474.00	\$109,422.00	\$38,400.00	\$115,200.00	\$46,018.24	\$138,054.71
#19-1	Submersible Pump No Curve, 240V, 3 Phase, 15 HP, 6 in Discharge	4	each	No Bid	No Bid	\$17,684.00	\$70,736.00	\$12,246.82	\$48,987.29
#19-2	Submersible Pump No Curve, 480V, 3 Phase, 30 HP, 4 in. Discharge	3	each	No Bid	No Bid	\$40,820.00	\$122,460.00	\$15,681.79	\$47,045.36
#19-3	Submersible Pump No Curve, 480V, 3 Phase, 25 HP, 12 in. Discharge	2	each	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$19,407.01	\$38,814.02
#19-4	Submersible Pump No Curve, 480V, 3 Phase, 30 HP 10 in. Discharge	2	each	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$20,215.06	\$40,430.12
#19-5	Submersible Pump No Curve, 460V, 3 Phase, 15 HP, 60Hz, 1750 RPM, Motor Floor Mount	1	each	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,732.21	\$1,732.21
#19-6	Submersible Pump, Drainage (Sump) 115V, 1/2 HP, Stainless Steel, 3350 RPM, Free Passage 0.47 in.	30	each	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,670.00	\$50,100.00	\$724.45	\$21,733.41
#19-7	Submersible Pump, Drainage (Sump) 115V, 1/2 HP, Stainless Steel, 3300 RPM, Free Passage 0.39 in.	8	each	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,220.00	\$9,760.00	\$724.45	\$5,795.58
#19-8	Submersible Pump, Drainage (Sump), 115V, Single Phase, 1/3 HP, Manual with Piggy-Back Float Switch	20	each	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,070.00	\$21,400.00	\$379.84	\$7,596.71
#19-9	Submersible Pump, No Curve, 480V, 3 Phase, 25 HP, 4 in. Discharge, 2 in. Guide	3	each	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$14,078.31	\$42,234.92
#20-1	Onsite Installation/Removal Services	60	hour	No Bid	No Bid	\$100	\$6,000.00	\$600	\$36,000.00
#20-2	Emergency Onsite Installation/Removal Services	50	hour	No Bid	No Bid	\$100	\$5,000.00	\$1,200.00	\$60,000.00
#20-3	Technician Services	60	hour	No Bid	No Bid	\$100	\$6,000.00	\$600	\$36,000.00

OPN2129401B1 - Submersible Lift Station Pumps Parts (Group 21)									
				Barneys Pumps Incorporated		FJ Nugent and Associates Inc		Tom Evans Environmental, Inc.	
			Total Cost	\$80,000.00		\$80,000.00		\$80,000.00	
#	Item Description	Estimated Annual Amount	Unit of Measure	Discount Percentage Amount (Enter number with percentage symbol (%))	Discount Amount	Discount Percentage Amount (Enter number with percentage symbol (%))	Discount Amount	Discount Percentage Amount (Enter number with percentage symbol (%))	Discount Amount
#1-1	Submersible Lift Station Pumps, Not Listed, Percentage Discount Off from List/Catalog	60000	lump sum	10%	\$ 6,000.00	5%	\$ 3,000.00	20%	\$ 12,000.00
#1-2	Repair Parts for Submersible Lift Station Pumps, Percentage Discount Off from	20000	lump sum	10%	\$ 2,000.00	5%	\$ 1,000.00	20%	\$ 4,000.00