



Price Analysis
 Date Bid Posted: November 18, 2022
 Solicitation No.:
 Temporary Personnel Services
 Date Bid Opened: December 9, 2022
 Human Resources Division
 Bid Submit(s): 34
 Duane LeScott
 Purchasing Agent
 Declination: 6

Item No.	Description	Qty	UOM	Previous Pricing Contract No. GEN211872AB1 Awarded In 2020	Enterprise Solutions, Inc. non-CBE LOI with 25% CBE Participation			% Diff to Broward County Contract(s)		
					Price	Total	% CBE Participation	Price	Total	% Diff to Broward County Contract(s)
GEN2124065B1-01-01	Administrative Specialist	15000	hour	19127	\$17.00	\$255,000.00	-12%	\$18.75	\$281,250.00	-3%
GEN2124065B1-01-02	Office Support Specialist	52000	hour	19127	\$17.00	\$884,000.00	-12%	\$18.75	\$979,500.00	-3%
GEN2124065B1-01-03	Date Entry Operator	32000	hour	19127	\$17.00	\$544,000.00	-12%	\$17.50	\$561,600.00	-6%
GEN2124065B1-01-04	Account Clerk	12000	hour	19127	\$18.00	\$216,000.00	-7%	\$18.75	\$225,000.00	-1%
GEN2124065B1-01-05	Customer Services Representative	52000	hour	19127	\$17.20	\$894,400.00	-11%	\$16.25	\$843,000.00	-6%
GEN2124065B1-01-06	Customer Services Representative (Field)	55000	hour	19127	\$17.20	\$946,000.00	-11%	\$16.75	\$921,250.00	-13%
					1 Non-Responsible (No LOI)			\$1,715,875.00		
					1 CBE % Differential:			7%		
					1 CBE % Differential:			12%		
					1 CBE % Differential:			6%		

Item No.	Description	Qty	UOM	Previous Pricing Contract No. GEN211872AB1 Awarded In 2020	Alpha Staffing Search Firm non-CBE LOI with 25% CBE Participation			% Diff to Broward County Contract(s)		
					Price	Total	% CBE Participation	Price	Total	% Diff to Broward County Contract(s)
GEN2124065B1-01-01	Administrative Specialist	15000	hour	19127	\$21.00	\$315,000.00	9%	\$20.00	\$300,000.00	4%
GEN2124065B1-01-02	Office Support Specialist	52000	hour	19127	\$19.50	\$1,014,000.00	1%	\$20.00	\$1,040,000.00	4%
GEN2124065B1-01-03	Date Entry Operator	32000	hour	19127	\$21.00	\$672,000.00	2%	\$20.00	\$640,000.00	4%
GEN2124065B1-01-04	Account Clerk	12000	hour	19127	\$19.75	\$237,000.00	2%	\$19.00	\$228,000.00	-1%
GEN2124065B1-01-05	Customer Services Representative	52000	hour	19127	\$19.75	\$1,027,000.00	2%	\$19.20	\$990,400.00	0%
GEN2124065B1-01-06	Customer Services Representative (Field)	55000	hour	19127	\$21.00	\$1,155,000.00	9%	\$19.50	\$1,072,500.00	21%
					1 CBE % Differential:			6%		
					1 CBE % Differential:			7%		
					1 CBE % Differential:			12%		
					1 CBE % Differential:			6%		

Item No.	Description	Qty	UOM	Previous Pricing Contract No. GEN211872AB1 Awarded In 2020	The Remas Staffing Company LLC non-CBE LOI with 25% CBE Participation			% Diff to Broward County Contract(s)		
					Price	Total	% CBE Participation	Price	Total	% Diff to Broward County Contract(s)
GEN2124065B1-01-01	Administrative Specialist	15000	hour	19127	\$21.24	\$318,600.00	10%	\$21.24	\$318,600.00	10%
GEN2124065B1-01-02	Office Support Specialist	52000	hour	19127	\$21.24	\$1,104,480.00	10%	\$21.24	\$1,104,480.00	10%
GEN2124065B1-01-03	Date Entry Operator	32000	hour	19127	\$21.24	\$679,680.00	10%	\$21.24	\$679,680.00	10%
GEN2124065B1-01-04	Account Clerk	12000	hour	19127	\$21.24	\$254,880.00	10%	\$21.24	\$254,880.00	10%
GEN2124065B1-01-05	Customer Services Representative	52000	hour	19127	\$21.24	\$1,104,480.00	10%	\$21.24	\$1,104,480.00	10%
GEN2124065B1-01-06	Customer Services Representative (Field)	55000	hour	19127	\$21.24	\$1,172,400.00	10%	\$21.24	\$1,172,400.00	10%
					1 CBE % Differential:			7%		
					1 CBE % Differential:			12%		
					1 CBE % Differential:			6%		
					1 CBE % Differential:			7%		

Item No.	Description	Qty	UOM	Previous Pricing Contract No. GEN211872AB1 Awarded In 2020	Tryfacta, Inc. non-CBE LOI with 25% CBE Participation			% Diff to Broward County Contract(s)		
					Price	Total	% CBE Participation	Price	Total	% Diff to Broward County Contract(s)
GEN2124065B1-01-01	Administrative Specialist	15000	hour	19127	\$21.66	\$324,900.00	12%	\$19.75	\$296,250.00	2%
GEN2124065B1-01-02	Office Support Specialist	52000	hour	19127	\$21.00	\$1,092,000.00	1%	\$22.50	\$1,163,000.00	17%
GEN2124065B1-01-03	Date Entry Operator	32000	hour	19127	\$21.30	\$681,600.00	11%	\$18.75	\$600,000.00	-3%
GEN2124065B1-01-04	Account Clerk	12000	hour	19127	\$23.00	\$276,000.00	14%	\$18.75	\$225,000.00	-3%
GEN2124065B1-01-05	Customer Services Representative	52000	hour	19127	\$21.40	\$1,120,800.00	1%	\$21.25	\$1,103,000.00	10%
GEN2124065B1-01-06	Customer Services Representative (Field)	55000	hour	19127	\$21.12	\$1,161,600.00	10%	\$21.25	\$1,168,625.00	10%
					1 CBE % Differential:			1%		
					1 CBE % Differential:			1%		
					1 CBE % Differential:			5%		
					1 CBE % Differential:			7%		

Item No.	Description	Qty	UOM	Previous Pricing Contract No. GEN211872AB1 Awarded In 2020	MSW Staffing non-CBE LOI with 25% CBE Participation			% Diff to Broward County Contract(s)		
					Price	Total	% CBE Participation	Price	Total	% Diff to Broward County Contract(s)
GEN2124065B1-01-01	Administrative Specialist	15000	hour	19127	\$23.85	\$357,750.00	23%	\$23.97	\$359,550.00	24%
GEN2124065B1-01-02	Office Support Specialist	52000	hour	19127	\$23.85	\$1,240,200.00	24%	\$23.97	\$1,240,400.00	24%
GEN2124065B1-01-03	Date Entry Operator	32000	hour	19127	\$23.85	\$763,200.00	18%	\$23.97	\$776,700.00	16%
GEN2124065B1-01-04	Account Clerk	12000	hour	19127	\$24.33	\$291,960.00	26%	\$23.97	\$287,640.00	41%
GEN2124065B1-01-05	Customer Services Representative	52000	hour	19127	\$23.85	\$1,240,200.00	23%	\$23.97	\$1,240,400.00	24%
GEN2124065B1-01-06	Customer Services Representative (Field)	55000	hour	19127	\$23.85	\$1,313,750.00	23%	\$23.97	\$1,318,500.00	24%
					1 Non-Responsible (No LOI)			\$2,212,861.00		
					1 CBE % Differential:			1%		
					1 CBE % Differential:			5%		
					1 CBE % Differential:			7%		

Item No.	Description	Qty	UOM	Previous Pricing Contract No. GEN211872AB1 Awarded In 2020	KeyStaff, Inc. non-CBE LOI with 25% CBE Participation			% Diff to Broward County Contract(s)		
					Price	Total	% CBE Participation	Price	Total	% Diff to Broward County Contract(s)
GEN2124065B1-01-01	Administrative Specialist	15000	hour	19127	\$23.97	\$359,550.00	24%	\$24.14	\$362,100.00	27%
GEN2124065B1-01-02	Office Support Specialist	52000	hour	19127	\$23.97	\$1,240,400.00	24%	\$24.14	\$1,255,280.00	25%
GEN2124065B1-01-03	Date Entry Operator	32000	hour	19127	\$23.97	\$763,200.00	18%	\$24.14	\$778,080.00	16%
GEN2124065B1-01-04	Account Clerk	12000	hour	19127	\$23.97	\$287,640.00	26%	\$24.14	\$292,400.00	41%
GEN2124065B1-01-05	Customer Services Representative	52000	hour	19127	\$23.97	\$1,240,400.00	24%	\$24.14	\$1,255,280.00	25%
GEN2124065B1-01-06	Customer Services Representative (Field)	55000	hour	19127	\$23.97	\$1,318,500.00	24%	\$24.14	\$1,333,380.00	25%
					1 Non-Responsible (No LOI)			\$2,263,613.00		
					1 CBE % Differential:			1%		
					1 CBE % Differential:			5%		
					1 CBE % Differential:			7%		

Item No.	Description	Qty	UOM	Previous Pricing Contract No. GEN211872AB1 Awarded In 2020	MSW Staffing non-CBE LOI with 25% CBE Participation			% Diff to Broward County Contract(s)		
					Price	Total	% CBE Participation	Price	Total	% Diff to Broward County Contract(s)
GEN2124065B1-01-01	Administrative Specialist	15000	hour	19127	\$23.85	\$357,750.00	23%	\$24.50	\$367,500.00	34%
GEN2124065B1-01-02	Office Support Specialist	52000	hour	19127	\$23.85	\$1,240,200.00	24%	\$24.50	\$1,264,400.00	27%
GEN2124065B1-01-03	Date Entry Operator	32000	hour	19127	\$23.85	\$763,200.00	18%	\$24.50	\$787,400.00	28%
GEN2124065B1-01-04	Account Clerk	12000	hour	19127	\$24.33	\$291,960.00	26%	\$24.50	\$294,000.00	38%
GEN2124065B1-01-05	Customer Services Representative	52000	hour	19127	\$23.85	\$1,240,200.00	23%	\$24.50	\$1,264,400.00	27%
GEN2124065B1-01-06	Customer Services Representative (Field)	55000	hour	19127	\$23.85	\$1,313,750.00	23%	\$24.50	\$1,337,950.00	26%
					1 Non-Responsible (No LOI)			\$2,262,076.00		
					1 CBE % Differential:			1%		
					1 CBE % Differential:			5%		
					1 CBE % Differential:			7%		

Item No.	Description	Qty	UOM	Previous Pricing Contract No. GEN211872AB1 Awarded In 2020	Personnel Solutions Plus, LLC non-CBE LOI with 25% CBE Participation			% Diff to Broward County Contract(s)		
					Price	Total	% CBE Participation	Price	Total	% Diff to Broward County Contract(s)
GEN2124065B1-01-01	Administrative Specialist	15000	hour	19127	\$29.71	\$445,650.00	54%	\$28.53	\$394,950.00	37%
GEN2124065B1-01-02	Office Support Specialist	52000	hour	19127	\$29.25	\$1,521,000.00	28%	\$28.53	\$1,480,600.00	40%
GEN2124065B1-01-03	Date Entry Operator	32000	hour	19127	\$29.25	\$948,000.00	28%	\$28.53	\$907,600.00	37%
GEN2124065B1-01-04	Account Clerk	12000	hour	19127	\$29.25	\$351,000.00	28%	\$28.53	\$336,400.00	54%
GEN2124065B1-01-05	Customer Services Representative	52000	hour	19127	\$29.25	\$1,521,000.00	28%	\$28.53	\$1,480,600.00	37%
GEN2124065B1-01-06	Customer Services Representative (Field)	55000	hour	19127	\$29.25	\$1,603,750.00	28%	\$28.53	\$1,563,300.00	45%
					1 Non-Responsible (No LOI)			\$2,358,938.00		
					1 CBE % Differential:			1%		
					1 CBE % Differential:			5%		
					1 CBE % Differential:			7%		

Item No.	Description	Qty	UOM	Previous Pricing Contract No. GEN211872AB1 Awarded In 2020	Personnel Solutions Plus, LLC non-CBE LOI with 25% CBE Participation			% Diff to Broward County Contract(s)		
					Price	Total	% CBE Participation	Price	Total	% Diff to Broward County Contract(s)
GEN2124065B1-01-01	Administrative Specialist	15000	hour	19127	\$29.71	\$445,650.00	54%	\$28.53	\$394,950.00	37%
GEN2124065B1-01-02	Office Support Specialist	52000	hour	19127	\$29.25	\$1,521,000.00	28%	\$28.53	\$1,480,600.00	40%
GEN2124065B1-01-03	Date Entry Operator	32000	hour	19127	\$29.25	\$948,000.00	28%	\$28.53	\$907,600.00	37%
GEN2124065B1-01-04	Account Clerk	12000	hour	19127	\$29.25	\$351,000.00	28%	\$28.53	\$336,400.00	54%
GEN2124065B1-01-05	Customer Services Representative	52000	hour	19127	\$29.25	\$1,521,000.00	28%	\$28.53	\$1,480,600.00	37%
GEN2124065B1-01-06	Customer Services Representative (Field)	55000	hour	19127	\$29.25	\$1,603,750.00	28%	\$28.53	\$1,563,300.00	45%
					1 Non-Responsible (No LOI)			\$2,358,938.00		
					1 CBE % Differential:			1%		
					1 CBE % Differential:			5%		
					1 CBE % Differential:			7%		

GROUP 1 - WHITE COLLAR

GROUP 1 - WHITE COLLAR

GROUP 1 - WHITE COLLAR

GROUP 1 - WHITE COLLAR

GROUP 1 - WHITE COLLAR

GROUP 1 - WHITE COLLAR

GROUP 1 - WHITE COLLAR

GROUP 1 - WHITE COLLAR

Date Bid Posted: November 18, 2022
Date Bid Opened: December 9, 2022
Bid Submission(s): 34
Distinctions: 6

Temporary Personnel Services
Human Resources Division
Dazarena Lescott

Solicitation No.:
Using Agency:
Purchasing Agent:

Item No.	Description	Qty	UOM
GEN2124865B1-02-01	Maintenance Worker	15000	hour
GEN2124865B1-02-02	Shredder	5000	hour
GEN2124865B1-02-03	Animal Care Specialist	500	hour
GEN2124865B1-02-04	Vegetation Operator	500	hour

Item No.	Description	Qty	UOM
GEN2124865B1-02-01	Maintenance Worker	15000	hour
GEN2124865B1-02-02	Shredder	5000	hour
GEN2124865B1-02-03	Animal Care Specialist	500	hour
GEN2124865B1-02-04	Vegetation Operator	500	hour

Item No.	Description	Qty	UOM
GEN2124865B1-02-01	Maintenance Worker	15000	hour
GEN2124865B1-02-02	Shredder	5000	hour
GEN2124865B1-02-03	Animal Care Specialist	500	hour
GEN2124865B1-02-04	Vegetation Operator	500	hour

Item No.	Description	Qty	UOM
GEN2124865B1-02-01	Maintenance Worker	15000	hour
GEN2124865B1-02-02	Shredder	5000	hour
GEN2124865B1-02-03	Animal Care Specialist	500	hour
GEN2124865B1-02-04	Vegetation Operator	500	hour

Item No.	Description	Qty	UOM
GEN2124865B1-02-01	Maintenance Worker	15000	hour
GEN2124865B1-02-02	Shredder	5000	hour
GEN2124865B1-02-03	Animal Care Specialist	500	hour
GEN2124865B1-02-04	Vegetation Operator	500	hour

Item No.	Description	Qty	UOM	Previous Pricing Contract No. GEN211872AB1 Awarded in 2020		% Diff to Broward County Contract(s)	BiosClx, LLC non-CBE		% Diff to Broward County Contract(s)	ZanTech Consulting LLC non-CBE LOI with 25% CBE Participation		% Diff to Broward County Contract(s)	Qualifica, LLC non-CBE		% Diff to Broward County Contract(s)	CareersUSA, Inc. non-CBE LOI with 25% CBE Participation		% Diff to Broward County Contract(s)	
				Price	Total		Price	Total		Price	Total		Price	Total					
				\$24.89	\$374,850.00	30%	\$24.75	\$371,250.00	28%	\$25.74	\$386,700.00	34%	\$27.00	\$405,000.00	40%	\$26.25	\$423,750.00	47%	
				\$24.89	\$172,445.00	30%	\$26.16	\$143,880.00	36%	\$25.74	\$174,570.00	34%	\$23.00	\$137,500.00	30%	\$29.25	\$155,375.00	47%	
				\$24.89	\$172,445.00	30%	\$24.50	\$132,500.00	27%	\$25.74	\$174,570.00	34%	\$22.95	\$141,475.00	19%	\$29.25	\$155,375.00	47%	
				\$24.25	\$172,445.00	26%	\$27.50	\$172,500.00	43%	\$25.74	\$174,570.00	34%	\$27.00	\$172,500.00	40%	\$29.25	\$155,375.00	47%	
				\$529,915.00				\$541,130.00				\$553,410.00				\$567,675.00			
				Non-Responsible (No LOI)															

Item No.	Description	Qty	UOM	Previous Pricing Contract No. GEN211872AB1 Awarded in 2020		% Diff to Broward County Contract(s)	Adams Enterprise USA, Inc. non-CBE		% Diff to Broward County Contract(s)	Moen Tate Inc. non-CBE		% Diff to Broward County Contract(s)	Legacy Professional Solutions LLC non-CBE		% Diff to Broward County Contract(s)	Integrat, Inc non-CBE LOI with 30% CBE Participation		% Diff to Broward County Contract(s)	
				Price	Total		Price	Total		Price	Total		Price	Total					
				\$29.00	\$458,000.00	50%	\$30.00	\$450,000.00	58%	\$28.64	\$429,600.00	49%	\$32.00	\$480,000.00	66%	\$31.68	\$475,200.00	64%	
				\$30.26	\$158,430.00	57%	\$29.00	\$159,500.00	50%	\$35.18	\$158,400.00	83%	\$27.34	\$150,370.00	42%	\$33.00	\$181,500.00	71%	
				\$28.76	\$14,360.00	49%	\$28.00	\$14,500.00	50%	\$31.53	\$15,765.00	64%	\$28.80	\$14,400.00	49%	\$26.40	\$13,200.00	37%	
				\$27.36	\$15,680.00	42%	\$31.00	\$15,500.00	61%	\$28.64	\$13,020.00	35%	\$32.00	\$16,000.00	66%	\$26.40	\$13,200.00	37%	
				\$629,490.00				\$639,500.00				\$651,875.00				\$680,770.00			
				Non-Responsible (No LOI)															

Item No.	Description	Qty	UOM	Previous Pricing Contract No. GEN211872AB1 Awarded in 2020		% Diff to Broward County Contract(s)	MSW Staffing non-CBE		% Diff to Broward County Contract(s)	Just Write, Inc. non-CBE		% Diff to Broward County Contract(s)	StamEZ of Florida non-CBE		% Diff to Broward County Contract(s)	TekPartners Solutions LLC non-CBE		% Diff to Broward County Contract(s)	
				Price	Total		Price	Total		Price	Total		Price	Total					
				\$35.00	\$525,000.00	82%	\$35.00	\$525,000.00	82%	\$36.70	\$550,500.00	90%	\$47.25	\$708,750.00	145%	\$65.00	\$975,000.00	237%	
				\$30.00	\$170,000.00	56%	\$36.45	\$200,475.00	79%	\$34.25	\$158,375.00	79%	\$44.00	\$297,000.00	180%	\$60.00	\$300,000.00	211%	
				\$35.00	\$17,500.00	82%	\$39.15	\$19,575.00	95%	\$30.00	\$15,000.00	56%	\$42.00	\$21,000.00	119%	\$60.00	\$30,000.00	211%	
				\$35.00	\$17,500.00	82%	\$38.15	\$19,575.00	82%	\$34.25	\$15,825.00	78%	\$47.25	\$23,625.00	145%	\$75.00	\$37,500.00	289%	
				\$755,000.00				\$766,125.00				\$771,000.00				\$1,032,500.00			
				Non-Responsible (No LOI)															

Item No.	Description	Qty	UOM	Previous Pricing Contract No. GEN211872AB1 Awarded in 2020		% Diff to Broward County Contract(s)	Rite Software Solutions & Services LLC non-CBE		% Diff to Broward County Contract(s)	SunPlus Data Group, Inc. non-CBE LOI with 25% CBE Participation		% Diff to Broward County Contract(s)	Tech Army LLC CBE		% Diff to Broward County Contract(s)
				Price	Total		Price	Total		Price	Total		Price	Total	
				No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
				No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
				No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
				No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
				NO BID				NO BID				NO BID			

Item No.	Description	Qty	UOM	Previous Pricing Contract No. GEN211872AB1 Awarded in 2020		% Diff to Broward County Contract(s)	Enterprises Solutions, Inc. non-CBE LOI with 25% CBE Participation		% Diff to Broward County Contract(s)	4BB Corp CBE		% Diff to Broward County Contract(s)	Rite Software Solutions & Services LLC non-CBE		% Diff to Broward County Contract(s)	WolfCreek Consulting, Inc. CBE		% Diff to Broward County Contract(s)					
				Price	Total		Price	Total		Price	Total		Price	Total									
				\$20.00	\$200,000.00	-4%	\$20.80	\$208,000.00	0%	\$21.24	\$212,400.00	2%	\$22.00	\$220,000.00	6%	\$24.10	\$241,000.00	16%					
				\$200,000.00	\$200,000.00		\$208,000.00	\$208,000.00		\$212,400.00	\$212,400.00		\$220,000.00	\$220,000.00		\$241,000.00	\$241,000.00						
				Non-Responsible				4BB Corp				PRIMARY				Rite Software Solutions & Services LLC				WolfCreek Consulting, Inc.			
				Non-Responsible				2%				16%				23%				TERTIARY			

Item No.	Description	Qty	UOM
GEN2124865B1-02-01	Accountant	10000	hour

GROUP 2 - BLUE COLLAR	
Initial One-Year Award Amount:	Potential Five (5) Year Award Amount:
\$ 400,125.00	\$ 2,015,625.00
\$ 454,320.00	\$ 2,274,600.00
\$ 431,250.00	\$ 2,168,250.00
\$ 1,288,295.00	\$ 6,468,475.00

GROUP 3 - ACCOUNTANT	
Initial One-Year Award Amount:	Potential Five (5) Year Award Amount:
\$ 400,125.00	\$ 2,015,625.00
\$ 454,320.00	\$ 2,274,600.00
\$ 431,250.00	\$ 2,168,250.00
\$ 1,288,295.00	\$ 6,468,475.00

Item No.	Description	Qty	UOM
GEN2124865B1-02-01	Accountant	10000	hour

Item No.	Description	Qty	UOM
GEN2124865B1-02-01	Accountant	10000	hour



Item No.	Description	Qty	UOM	hour	Accountant	Previous Pricing Contract No. GEN211872481 Awarded in 2020	Price	Total	% Diff. to Broward County Contract(s)	Abacus Corporation non-CBE LOI with 25% CBE Participation	MSW Staffing non-CBE	Alpha Staffing Search Firm non-CBE LOI with 25% CBE Participation	AdvVance Talent Solutions, Inc. non-CBE LOI with 25% CBE Participation
GEN212496581-02-01	Accountant	10000	hour			\$20.80	\$20.80	\$255,000.00	23%	Autentus Staffing LLC CBE	Autentus Staffing LLC CBE	Autentus Staffing LLC CBE	Autentus Staffing LLC CBE

Item No.	Description	Qty	UOM	hour	Accountant	Previous Pricing Contract No. GEN211872481 Awarded in 2020	Price	Total	% Diff. to Broward County Contract(s)	JobSquad Staffing Solutions non-CBE	SunPlus Data Group, Inc. non-CBE LOI with 25% CBE Participation	COCHBHA Enterprises, Inc. CBE	Adams Enterprise USA, Inc. non-CBE
GEN212496581-02-01	Accountant	10000	hour			\$20.80	\$20.80	\$295,000.00	42%	JobSquad Staffing Solutions non-CBE	SunPlus Data Group, Inc. non-CBE LOI with 25% CBE Participation	COCHBHA Enterprises, Inc. CBE	Adams Enterprise USA, Inc. non-CBE

Item No.	Description	Qty	UOM	hour	Accountant	Previous Pricing Contract No. GEN211872481 Awarded in 2020	Price	Total	% Diff. to Broward County Contract(s)	Trydica, Inc. non-CBE LOI with 25% CBE Participation	Compunual Software Group, Inc. non-CBE	Swift Strategic Solutions, Inc. non-CBE	KeySoft, Inc. non-CBE LOI with 25% CBE Participation
GEN212496581-02-01	Accountant	10000	hour			\$20.80	\$20.80	\$250,000.00	54%	Trydica, Inc. non-CBE LOI with 25% CBE Participation	Compunual Software Group, Inc. non-CBE	Swift Strategic Solutions, Inc. non-CBE	KeySoft, Inc. non-CBE LOI with 25% CBE Participation

Item No.	Description	Qty	UOM	hour	Accountant	Previous Pricing Contract No. GEN211872481 Awarded in 2020	Price	Total	% Diff. to Broward County Contract(s)	Staff Today non-CBE	Molan Tale, Inc. non-CBE	Power Resources and Financial Services, Inc. non-CBE	Legacy Professional Solutions LLC non-CBE
GEN212496581-02-01	Accountant	10000	hour			\$20.80	\$20.80	\$390,000.00	68%	Staff Today non-CBE	Molan Tale, Inc. non-CBE	Power Resources and Financial Services, Inc. non-CBE	Legacy Professional Solutions LLC non-CBE

Item No.	Description	Qty	UOM	hour	Accountant	Previous Pricing Contract No. GEN211872481 Awarded in 2020	Price	Total	% Diff. to Broward County Contract(s)	Infipal, Inc. non-CBE LOI with 25% CBE Participation	Just Write, Inc. non-CBE	Tech Amy LLC CBE	ZenTech Consulting LLC non-CBE LOI with 25% CBE Participation
GEN212496581-02-01	Accountant	10000	hour			\$20.80	\$20.80	\$396,000.00	90%	Infipal, Inc. non-CBE LOI with 25% CBE Participation	Just Write, Inc. non-CBE	Tech Amy LLC CBE	ZenTech Consulting LLC non-CBE LOI with 25% CBE Participation

Item No.	Description	Qty	UOM	hour	Accountant	Previous Pricing Contract No. GEN211872481 Awarded in 2020	Price	Total	% Diff. to Broward County Contract(s)	StaffEZ of Florida non-CBE	CareerUSA, Inc. non-CBE LOI with 25% CBE Participation	TekPartners Solutions LLC non-CBE	AP Recruiters & Associates non-CBE
GEN212496581-02-01	Accountant	10000	hour			\$20.80	\$20.80	\$508,000.00	144%	StaffEZ of Florida non-CBE	CareerUSA, Inc. non-CBE LOI with 25% CBE Participation	TekPartners Solutions LLC non-CBE	AP Recruiters & Associates non-CBE

GROUP 3 - ACCOUNTANT			Initial One-Year Award Amount:	Potential Five (5) Year Award Amount:
Primary Vendor: 4BBCorp	\$	212,400.00	\$	1,062,000.00
Secondary Vendor: The Remas Staffing Company LLC	\$	298,000.00	\$	1,040,000.00
Tertiary Vendor: WolfCreek Consulting, Inc.	\$	241,000.00	\$	1,205,000.00
	\$	651,400.00	\$	3,307,000.00



Price Analysis
Solicitation No.: Temporary Personnel Services
Using Agency: Human Resource Division
Purchasing Agent: Chantrelle Elliott
Date Bid Posted: November 18, 2022
Date Bid Opened: December 9, 2022
Bid Submittal(s): 34
Questions: 6

Price Analysis Notes:	
1	This solicitation is reserved for County Business Enterprises (CBE) firms pursuant to the Broward County Business Opportunity Act of 2021, Section 1-31, Code of Ordinances, as amended ("the Business Opportunity Act"). CBEs and non-CBEs may respond to the solicitation.
2	Basis of Award: Vendors must bid on all line items within each group to be considered for award. A bidder may bid on any one Group but must bid on the entire Group (all line items within the Group). Award will be made to the lowest priced, responsive, responsible bidder by total group price (sum of all items in the group). Awards may be made to a maximum of one (1) responsive, responsible vendor per group.
3	The respective vendor requested to amend their submitted unit prices, therefore was nonresponsive to the pricing requirements of the bid.
4	The respective vendor did not provide LOI with 25% CBE Participation, therefore not compliant with the CBE Reserve Program requirements and deemed non-responsive.
5	CBE Monetary Differential: The total Bid of the CBE Presumptive Awarder does not exceed Three Million Dollars (\$3,000,000), and does not exceed the total amount of the lowest responsive and responsible bid, as applicable, from a non-CBE by more than ten percent (10%).
6	Primary Contract Award Amount: The Primary Contracts will be allocated one hundred percent (100%) of the awarded amount for the respective Groups.
7	Secondary Contract Award Amount: Funds from the Primary Contracts award amount will be reallocated to the Secondary Contracts when the Primary Vendor are unable to meet the County's needs.
8	Tertiary Contract Award Amount: Funds from the Primary Contract Award amount will be reallocated to the Tertiary Contracts when the Primary and Secondary Vendors are unable to meet the County's needs.
9	For the purpose of the price analysis and comparison, the unit prices were compared to the unit prices of previous Contract No. 6EN2118724B1.